
5 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Rent, Operate 
and Maintain Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4200 EA $104.03 $436,926.00 $99.12 $416,304.00 $117.23 $492,366.00 $83.00 $348,600.00 

6 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4200 EA $29.92 $125,664.00 $12.23 $51,366.00 $70.97 $298,074.00 $11.00 $46,200.00 

$562,590.00 $467,670.00 $790,440.00 $394,800.00 

Year One / Group One / Southeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:
Year One / Group Two / Southeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

117380

Item # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

L23331 - Close Date: 9/3/2009 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 4 Terra Renewal LLC Merrell Bros. Inc. Ancon Services Synagro
336-918-2993 1-574-699-7782 817-350-3156 713-369-1787

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Onsite Water Treatment Sludge Dewatering and Disposal Services

for
Public Works



7 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4200 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

8 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Operate and 
Maintenance of Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4600 EA $59.21 $272,366.00 $78.56 $361,376.00 $69.60 $320,160.00 $84.25 $387,550.00 

9 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the OFF-SITE 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal including 
tipping fees shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4600 EA $90.34 $415,564.00 $105.49 $485,254.00 $77.78 $357,788.00 $132.75 $610,650.00 

$687,930.00 $846,630.00 $677,948.00 $998,200.00 

10 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4600 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
Year One / Group Four / Northeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:
Year One / Group Three / Northeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:



$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

15 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Rent, Operate 
and Maintain Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4200 EA $107.15 $450,030.00 $100.71 $422,982.00 $116.52 $489,384.00 $83.00 $348,600.00 

16 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4200 EA $30.82 $129,444.00 $12.43 $52,206.00 $70.97 $298,074.00 $11.00 $46,200.00 

$579,474.00 $475,188.00 $787,458.00 $394,800.00 

17 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4200 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
Year Two / Group Three / Northeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:
Year Two / Group One / Southeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:
Year Two / Group Two / Southeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:



18 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Operate and 
Maintenance of Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4600 EA $60.98 $280,508.00 $79.82 $367,172.00 $62.76 $288,696.00 $87.00 $400,200.00 

19 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal including 
tipping fees shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4600 EA $92.73 $426,558.00 $107.18 $493,028.00 $88.15 $405,490.00 $141.00 $648,600.00 

$707,066.00 $860,200.00 $694,186.00 $1,048,800.00 

20 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4600 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

25 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Rent, Operate 
and Maintain Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4200 EA $110.37 $463,554.00 $102.32 $429,744.00 $118.36 $497,112.00 $84.00 $352,800.00 

Sub-Total:
Year Two / Group Four / Northeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:
Year Three / Group One / Southeast Water Purification Plant



26 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4200 EA $31.74 $133,308.00 $12.63 $53,046.00 $70.97 $298,074.00 $11.50 $48,300.00 

$596,862.00 $482,790.00 $795,186.00 $401,100.00 

27 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4200 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

28 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Operate and 
Maintenance of Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4600 EA $62.81 $288,926.00 $81.10 $373,060.00 $64.60 $297,160.00 $90.00 $414,000.00 

Year Three / Group Two / Southeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:
Year Three / Group Three / Northeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:



29 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal including 
tipping fees shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4600 EA $95.10 $437,460.00 $108.89 $500,894.00 $91.88 $422,648.00 $151.75 $698,050.00 

$726,386.00 $873,954.00 $719,808.00 $1,112,050.00 

30 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4600 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

35 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Rent, Operate 
and Maintain Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4200 EA $113.68 $477,456.00 $104.06 $437,052.00 $118.36 $497,112.00 $84.00 $352,800.00 
Year Four (Option Year One) / Group One / Southeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:
Year Three / Group Four / Northeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:



36 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4200 EA $32.69 $137,298.00 $12.84 $53,928.00 $70.97 $298,074.00 $11.50 $48,300.00 

$614,754.00 $490,980.00 $795,186.00 $401,100.00 

37 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4200 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

38 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Operate and 
Maintenance of Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4600 EA $64.70 $297,620.00 $82.48 $379,408.00 $64.60 $297,160.00 $93.25 $428,950.00 

Sub-Total:
Year Four (Option Year One) / Group Two / Southeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:
Year Four (Option Year One) / Group Three / Northeast Water Purification Plant



39 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal including 
tipping fees shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4600 EA $97.49 $448,454.00 $110.74 $509,404.00 $91.88 $422,648.00 $163.75 $753,250.00 

$746,074.00 $888,812.00 $719,808.00 $1,182,200.00 

40 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4600 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

45 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Rent, Operate 
and Maintain Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4200 EA $117.09 $491,778.00 $105.62 $443,604.00 $118.36 $497,112.00 $87.00 $365,400.00 

Year Four (Option Year One) / Group Four / Northeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:
Year Five (Option Year Two) / Group One / Southeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:



46 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4200 EA $33.67 $141,414.00 $13.03 $54,726.00 $70.97 $298,074.00 $12.00 $50,400.00 

$633,192.00 $498,330.00 $795,186.00 $415,800.00 

47 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4200 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

48 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary to Operate and 
Maintenance of Dewatering Systems 
including chemical (polymer) costs. 
The unit pricing shall be bid by the 
DRY TON

4600 EA $66.64 $306,544.00 $83.72 $385,112.00 $64.60 $297,160.00 $97.00 $446,200.00 
Year Five (Option Year Two) / Group Three / Northeast Water Purification Plant

Sub-Total:
Year Five (Option Year Two) / Group Two / Southeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:



49 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off as a truckable 
cake and disposed of at the on-site 
land application area. Costs for 
transport and disposal including 
tipping fees shall be in strict 
accordance with the scope of work 
(Reference Section B). The unit pricing 
shall be bid by the DRY TON.

4600 EA $99.96 $459,816.00 $112.40 $517,040.00 $91.88 $422,648.00 $177.00 $814,200.00 

$766,360.00 $902,152.00 $719,808.00 $1,260,400.00 

50 10020733; DETECTOR, SEWAGE 
TREATING SLUDGE 15FT; Contractor 
shall provide all supervision, labor, 
tools, equipment, permits, parts, 
expendable items, materials and 
supplies necessary for the dewatered 
sludge to be hauled off in form of wet 
slurry using watertight containers. The 
unit pricing shall be bid by the DRY 
TON

4600 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
$6,620,688.00 $6,786,706.00 $7,495,014.00 $7,609,250.00 

Sub-Total:
Year Five (Option Year Two) / Group Four / Northeast Water Purification Plant / Alternate Method of Transporting and Disposal

Sub-Total:
Grand Total:


