
Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note

1 10013083; SEDAN, HYBRID ELECTRIC 
SERIES 358ELEV;

2 EA $23,811.00 $47,622.00 1 $0.00 No Bid $23,370.00 $46,740.00 2 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $37,554.00 $75,108.00 3 $0.00 No Bid $21,945.75 $43,891.50 4 $0.00 No Bid 5 $0.00 No Bid

2 10013084; MAT, FLOOR HYBRID OPT 
238 SERIES 358E;

2 EA $167.00 $334.00 $0.00 No Bid $130.00 $260.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $148.00 $296.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$47,956.00 $0.00 $47,000.00 $0.00 $0.00 $75,108.00 $0.00 $44,187.50 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10013077; SEDAN, 4 DOOR, MID 
SIZE, SERIES 360BLEV;

16 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $21,770.00 $348,320.00 6 $17,944.00 $287,104.00 7 $20,975.00 $335,600.00 8 $17,687.00 $282,992.00 9 $17,652.00 $282,432.00 10 $17,674.00 $282,784.00 11 $19,271.00 $308,336.00 12

2 10013078; MAT, FLOOR, OPTION 238, 
SERIES 360B;

16 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $348,320.00 $287,104.00 $335,600.00 $282,992.00 $282,432.00 $282,784.00 $308,336.00 

1 10030916; SEDAN, HYBRID ELECTRIC 
SERIES 361E-HEV;

3 EA $23,271.00 $69,813.00 13 $26,781.00 $80,343.00 14 $23,960.00 $71,880.00 15 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $27,465.00 $82,395.00 16 $25,780.00 $77,340.00 17 $25,763.00 $77,289.00 18 $27,374.00 $82,122.00 19

2 10034348; MATS, FLOOR OPT 238 
SN361E INTM SEDAN;

3 EA $179.00 $537.00 $0.00 $0.00 $140.00 $420.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$70,350.00 $80,343.00 $72,300.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $82,395.00 $77,340.00 $77,289.00 $82,122.00 

1 10013073; SEDAN, 4 D, FULL SIZE 6 
CYLINDER S372B6;

15 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $18,585.00 $278,775.00 20 $0.00 No Bid $18,244.00 $273,660.00 21 $19,327.00 $289,905.00 22 $19,343.00 $290,145.00 23 $19,573.00 $293,595.00 24 $21,141.00 $317,115.00 25

2 10023963; MATS, FLOOR OPT 238 
SN372B FULL SZ SEDAN;

15 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $278,775.00 $0.00 $273,660.00 $289,905.00 $290,145.00 $293,595.00 $317,115.00 

1 10044097; VEHICLE, UTILITY 1/2TON 
SERIES 650C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $32,058.00 $32,058.00 26 $0.00 No Bid $30,665.00 $30,665.00 27 $27,521.00 $27,521.00 28 $24,448.00 $24,448.00 29 $27,825.00 $27,825.00 30 $40,508.00 $40,508.00 31

2 10044098; VEHICLE, UPGRADE 
OPT210.8 FOR SN650C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $14,642.00 $14,642.00 32 $17,803.00 $17,803.00 33 $14,458.00 $14,458.00 34 $4,535.00 $4,535.00 35

3 10044099; VEHICLE, UPGRADE 
OPT210.9 FOR SN650C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $13,700.00 $13,700.00 36 $0.00 No Bid $14,661.00 $14,661.00 37 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 38 $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $45,758.00 $0.00 $45,326.00 $42,163.00 $42,251.00 $42,283.00 $45,043.00 

1 10013089; VEHICLE, UTLITY 3/4TON 
SERIES 655C;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $32,221.00 $193,326.00 39 $0.00 No Bid $31,945.00 $191,670.00 40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 5 $0.00 No Bid

2 10013094; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 
WINDOW OPT209 S655C;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

3 10013097; SEATING, SPECIAL OPT 
210 SERIES 655C;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

4 10013099; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT213.1 S655C;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $250.00 $1,250.00 $0.00 No Bid $45.00 $225.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

5 10023977; LIGHT, PACKAGE FOR HFD 
OPT224.9 SN655C;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $7,675.00 $38,375.00 41 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

6 10043871; LIGHT, PACKAGE FOR HPD 
OPT225.1 SN655C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $4,998.00 $4,998.00 42 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

7 10023978; BATTERY, ADDITIONAL 
OPT250.1 SN655C UTL;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $450.00 $2,250.00 $0.00 No Bid $440.00 $2,200.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $196,826.00 $0.00 $237,468.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10013111; VEHICLE, UTILITY 
MEDIUM DUTY 2WD S656BLE;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $22,573.00 $90,292.00 43 $0.00 No Bid $21,922.00 $87,688.00 44 $21,812.00 $87,248.00 45 $21,945.00 $87,780.00 46 $23,825.00 $95,300.00 47

2 10013117; SPOTLIGHT, OPT 111A 
SERIES 656B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $367.00 $367.00 48 $0.00 No Bid $367.00 $367.00 48 $342.00 $342.00 49 $327.00 $327.00 50 $367.00 $367.00 51

3 10023981; WARRANTY, EXT 
OPT136.1 SN656B UTL VEHICL;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $950.00 $3,800.00 $0.00 No Bid $815.00 $3,260.00 $815.00 $3,260.00 $1,050.00 $4,200.00 $1,315.00 $5,260.00 

4 10013116; LOCK, SINGLE KEY OPT 
204 SERIES 656B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $60.00 $60.00 $42.00 $42.00 $325.00 $325.00 

5 10013115; DEFROSTER, REAR 
WINDOW OPT 208 S656B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6 10023982; LOCK, POWER 
DOOR/WINDOW OPT209 SN656B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7 10013112; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 
SERIES 656B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $94,459.00 $0.00 $91,315.00 $90,910.00 $92,349.00 $101,252.00 

1 10013118; VEHICLE, UTILITY 4WD 
SERIES 657BLEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $24,284.00 $24,284.00 43 $0.00 No Bid $23,688.00 $23,688.00 52 $23,592.00 $23,592.00 53 $23,765.00 $23,765.00 54 $26,199.00 $26,199.00 55

2 10023990; WARRANTY, EXT 
OPT136.1 SN657B UTL VEHICL;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $950.00 $950.00 $0.00 No Bid $915.00 $915.00 $915.00 $915.00 $1,150.00 $1,150.00 $1,315.00 $1,315.00 

3 10013124; LOCK, SINGLE KEY OPT 
204 SERIES 657B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $45.00 $45.00 $42.00 $42.00 $325.00 $325.00 

4 10013123; DEFROSTER, REAR 
WINDOW OPT 208 S657B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5 10013122; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 
WINDOW OPT209 S657B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

6 10013119; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 
SERIES 657B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

7 10013120; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT213.1 S657B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $619.00 $619.00 $0.00 No Bid $512.00 $512.00 $524.00 $524.00 $536.00 $536.00 $484.00 $484.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $25,853.00 $0.00 $25,115.00 $25,076.00 $25,493.00 $28,323.00 

1 10013101; VEHICLE, UTILITY LIGHT 
DUTY 4WD S661BLEV;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $24,800.00 $49,600.00 56 $0.00 No Bid $18,694.00 $37,388.00 57 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20,919.00 $41,838.00 58 $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $49,600.00 $0.00 $37,388.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $41,838.00 $0.00 

1 10013106; VEHICLE, UTILITY 2WD 
SERIES 663BLEV;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $23,590.00 $141,540.00 59 $0.00 No Bid $17,514.00 $105,084.00 60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $19,379.00 $116,274.00 61 $0.00 No Bid

2 10024028; WARRANTY, EXT 
OPT136.1 SN663B UTL VEHICL;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $660.00 $660.00 $0.00 No Bid $950.00 $950.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,050.00 $1,050.00 $0.00 No Bid

ITEM NO. 8: SERIES 657B MEDIUM DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 4-DOOR AWD

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 9: SERIES 661B LIGHT DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 4-DOOR 4WD

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 10: SERIES 663B UTILITY VEHICLE LIGHT DUTY 4-DOOR 2WD

ITEM NO. 5: SERIES 650C 1/2-TON UTILITY VEHICLE CARRYALL 4-DOOR 2WD

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 6: SERIES 655C 3/4 TON UTILITY VEHICLE CARRYALL 4-DOOR 2WD

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 7: SERIES 656B MEDIUM DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 4-DOOR 2WD

Sub-Total:

ITEM NO. 2: SERIES 360B AUTOMOBILE INTERMEDIATE SIZE 6CYL 4-DOOR SEDAN

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 3: SERIES 361E-HEV HYBRID-ELECTRIC INTERMEDIATE 4-DOOR SEDAN,

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 4: SERIES 372B AUTOMOBILE FWD FULL SIZE 4-DOOR SEDAN

Sub-Total:

Line Total Unit Price Line Total
ITEM NO. 1: SERIES 358E AUTOMOBILE HYBRID ELECTRIC INTERMEDIATE SIZE SEDAN

Sub-Total:

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Automobiles, Vans, Utility Vehicles and Light-Duty Trucks

for
ARA, Airport, Courts, Fire, Fleet, General Services, Parks, Police, Public Works

N24092 - Close Date: 11/10/2011 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

3 10013108; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 
WINDOW OPT209 S663B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

4 10013109; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 
SERIES 663B;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

5 10024045; BAR,LIGHT MINIFREEDOM 
OPT224.8 SN663B UT;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,220.00 $1,220.00 62 $0.00 No Bid $1,359.00 $1,359.00 63 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,257.00 $1,257.00 64 $0.00 No Bid

6 10024046; MATS, FLOOR OPT238 
SN663B UTILITY VEHICL;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $130.00 $260.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $143,680.00 $0.00 $107,393.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $118,581.00 $0.00 

1 10013126; VEHICLE, UTILITY 2WD 
SERIES 665CLEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $28,855.00 $28,855.00 65 $0.00 No Bid $24,245.00 $24,245.00 66 $24,537.00 $24,537.00 67 $24,448.00 $24,448.00 29 $24,590.00 $24,590.00 68 $28,666.00 $28,666.00 69

2 10030562; FLOOR MATS OPTION 238 
SERIES 665C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $154.00 $154.00 $140.00 $140.00 $75.00 $75.00 $79.00 $79.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28,855.00 $0.00 $24,399.00 $24,677.00 $24,523.00 $24,669.00 $28,666.00 

1 10013174; VAN, CARGO FULL SIZE 
SERIES 680CLEV;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $17,691.00 $88,455.00 70 $0.00 No Bid $17,548.00 $87,740.00 71 $0.00 No Bid $16,985.00 $84,925.00 72 $17,337.00 $86,685.00 73 $16,845.00 $84,225.00 74 $17,075.00 $85,375.00 75 $18,953.00 $94,765.00 76

2 10024062; WARRANTY, EXT 
OPT136.1 SN680C FULL CARGO;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $1,420.00 $7,100.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,495.00 $7,475.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,065.00 $5,325.00 $1,010.00 $5,050.00 $1,010.00 $5,050.00 $1,245.00 $6,225.00 $1,510.00 $7,550.00 

3 10013170; GLASS, ALL DOORS OPT 
151 SERIES 680C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $112.00 $224.00 $0.00 No Bid $111.00 $222.00 $108.00 $216.00 $162.00 $324.00 $108.00 $216.00 $380.00 $760.00 

4 10024069; DOOR, SIDE SWING-OUT 
OPT229.1 SN680C FUL;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5 10028790; 
BULKHEAD,PARTITION,SCREEN,SWNG
DOORSN680C; - OPTION 262

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 77 $0.00 No Bid $350.00 $1,750.00 78 $0.00 No Bid $416.00 $2,080.00 79 $0.00 $0.00 80 $0.00 $0.00 81 $54.00 $270.00 82 $359.00 $1,795.00 83

$0.00 $95,555.00 $0.00 $97,189.00 $0.00 $92,552.00 $91,951.00 $89,599.00 $92,086.00 $104,870.00 

1 10013175; VAN, CARGO EXTENDED 
SERIES 685C LEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $18,524.00 $18,524.00 $0.00 No Bid $19,222.00 $19,222.00 84 $0.00 No Bid $18,875.00 $18,875.00 85 $18,116.00 $18,116.00 86 $17,924.00 $17,924.00 87 $18,134.00 $18,134.00 88 $19,758.00 $19,758.00 89

2 10024074; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SN685C-LEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $1,420.00 $1,420.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,495.00 $1,495.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,065.00 $1,065.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,245.00 $1,245.00 $1,510.00 $1,510.00 

3 10024078; LIFTGATE, OPT 214.1 
SN685C-LEV FULL;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $1,850.00 $1,850.00 90 $0.00 No Bid $2,859.00 $2,859.00 91 $0.00 No Bid $2,859.00 $2,859.00 92 $2,859.00 $2,859.00 93 $2,369.00 $2,369.00 94 $2,369.00 $2,369.00 95 $2,369.00 $2,369.00 96

4 10024095; DOORS, SWING-OUT OPT 
229.1 SN685C-LEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $21,794.00 $0.00 $23,576.00 $0.00 $22,799.00 $21,985.00 $21,303.00 $21,748.00 $23,637.00 

1 10013180; VAN, CARGO EXTENDED 
SERIES 687C LEV;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $20,777.00 $62,331.00 97 $0.00 No Bid $20,933.00 $62,799.00 98 $0.00 No Bid $19,875.00 $59,625.00 99 $20,320.00 $60,960.00 100 $20,177.00 $60,531.00 101 $20,201.00 $60,603.00 102 $22,770.00 $68,310.00 103

2 10024098; AIR CONDITIONING, REAR 
OPT 2.1, SN687C;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $750.00 $2,250.00 $0.00 No Bid $795.00 $2,385.00 $0.00 No Bid $795.00 $2,385.00 $685.00 $2,055.00 $685.00 $2,055.00 $685.00 $2,055.00 $685.00 $2,055.00 

3 10043841; LIGHT, LED RED/BLUE 
OPT 224.15 SN 687C;

12 EA $0.00 $0.00 $475.00 $5,700.00 104 $0.00 No Bid $699.00 $8,388.00 105 $0.00 No Bid $409.00 $4,908.00 106 $409.00 $4,908.00 107 $340.00 $4,080.00 108 $369.00 $4,428.00 109 $369.00 $4,428.00 110

4 10043842; LIGHT, LED RED/BLUE 
OPT 224.17 SN 687C;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $468.00 $1,404.00 111 $0.00 No Bid $489.00 $1,467.00 105 $0.00 No Bid $257.00 $771.00 112 $257.00 $771.00 113 $355.00 $1,065.00 114 $489.00 $1,467.00 111 $489.00 $1,467.00 115

5 10024120; COMPARTMENT, PRISON 
TRANSPORT OPT 260;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $6,450.00 $19,350.00 116 $6,450.00 $19,350.00 116 $6,450.00 $19,350.00 117 $6,700.00 $20,100.00 118 $6,850.00 $20,550.00 119

$0.00 $71,685.00 $0.00 $75,039.00 $0.00 $87,039.00 $88,044.00 $87,081.00 $88,653.00 $96,810.00 

1 10013191; VAN, 7-8 PASSENGER, 
SERIES 741B LEV;

3 EA $24,013.00 $72,039.00 120 $0.00 No Bid $24,050.00 $72,150.00 121 $0.00 No Bid $21,790.00 $65,370.00 122 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $23,724.00 $71,172.00 123 $0.00 No Bid 5 $0.00 No Bid

2 10024123; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SN741B;

2 EA $998.00 $1,996.00 $0.00 No Bid $750.00 $1,500.00 $0.00 No Bid $950.00 $1,900.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$74,035.00 $0.00 $73,650.00 $0.00 $67,270.00 $0.00 $0.00 $71,172.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10013203; VAN, 15 PASSENGER, 
SERIES 760C LEV;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $24,839.00 $74,517.00 124 $0.00 No Bid $22,745.00 $68,235.00 125 $22,962.00 $68,886.00 126 $22,722.00 $68,166.00 127 $23,048.00 $69,144.00 128 $25,629.00 $76,887.00 129

2 10024082; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SN760C-LEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,495.00 $1,495.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,065.00 $1,065.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,245.00 $1,245.00 $1,510.00 $1,510.00 

3 10043817; LIGHT,LED RED/BLU OPT 
224.15 SERIES 760C;

8 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $699.00 $5,592.00 130 $0.00 No Bid $409.00 $3,272.00 131 $409.00 $3,272.00 107 $340.00 $2,720.00 132 $369.00 $2,952.00 109 $369.00 $2,952.00 133

4 10043819; LIGHT, LED RED/BLUE 
OPT 224.17 SN 760C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $699.00 $1,398.00 130 $0.00 No Bid $257.00 $514.00 131 $257.00 $514.00 134 $355.00 $710.00 114 $489.00 $978.00 111 $489.00 $978.00 115

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $83,002.00 $0.00 $73,086.00 $73,682.00 $72,606.00 $74,319.00 $82,327.00 

1 10013211; TRUCK, PICKUP 4600 
GVWR SERIES 843B LEV;

1 EA $20,944.00 $20,944.00 135 $0.00 No Bid $21,490.00 $21,490.00 136 $15,369.00 $15,369.00 137 $0.00 No Bid $15,565.00 $15,565.00 138 $0.00 No Bid $16,202.00 $16,202.00 139 $0.00 No Bid 5 $0.00 No Bid

$20,944.00 $0.00 $21,490.00 $15,369.00 $0.00 $15,565.00 $0.00 $16,202.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10013213; TRUCK, PICKUP 6050 
GVWR SERIES 855C LEV;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $16,868.00 $50,604.00 140 $16,622.00 $49,866.00 141 $14,895.00 $44,685.00 142 $14,382.00 $43,146.00 143 $14,308.00 $42,924.00 144 $14,588.00 $43,764.00 145 $16,127.00 $48,381.00 146

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $50,604.00 $49,866.00 $44,685.00 $43,146.00 $42,924.00 $43,764.00 $48,381.00 

1 10013222; TRUCK, PICKUP 1/2TON 
SERIES 861LEV;

20 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $16,839.00 $336,780.00 147 $16,828.00 $336,560.00 141 $14,995.00 $299,900.00 148 $14,658.00 $293,160.00 143 $14,571.00 $291,420.00 149 $14,761.00 $295,220.00 150 $16,760.00 $335,200.00 146

2 10039182; BOX, TOOL LOW PROFILE 
OPTION 123.5 SN861;

7 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $655.00 $4,585.00 151 $655.00 $4,585.00 152 $655.00 $4,585.00 152 $655.00 $4,585.00 152 $622.00 $4,354.00 152 $655.00 $4,585.00 153 $655.00 $4,585.00 152

3 10024160; WARRANTY,EXT OPT 
136.1 SN861C-LEV FUL SZ;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,430.00 $8,580.00 $950.00 $5,700.00 $1,005.00 $6,030.00 $815.00 $4,890.00 $815.00 $4,890.00 $1,050.00 $6,300.00 $1,315.00 $7,890.00 

4 10024157; 
PACKAGE,TRAILERTOWINGOPT213.1 
SN861C-LEV;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20.00 $60.00 $285.00 $855.00 $445.00 $1,335.00 $356.00 $1,068.00 $351.00 $1,053.00 $363.00 $1,089.00 $311.00 $933.00 

5 10043569; LIFT GATE OPTION 214, 
SERIES 861C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,985.00 $1,985.00 154 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 155 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 156 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 156 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 157 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 158 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 157

6 10024152; LINER, TRUCK BED OPT 
216 SN861C-LEV FULL;

3 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $189.00 $567.00 159 $189.00 $567.00 160 $189.00 $567.00 160 $189.00 $567.00 160 $189.00 $567.00 160 $160.00 $480.00 161 $0.00 No Bid

7 10024146; LINER, TRUCK BED SPRAY 
IN OPT 217 SN861C;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $1,300.00 162 $325.00 $1,300.00 163 $325.00 $1,300.00 164 $325.00 $1,300.00 164 $350.00 $1,400.00 165 $310.00 $1,240.00 166 $325.00 $1,300.00 167

8 10013227; BAR, LIGHT OPTION 224.8 
SERIES 861C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,359.00 $1,359.00 105 $1,359.00 $1,359.00 63 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 63 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 63 $775.00 $775.00 168 $1,257.00 $1,257.00 64 $1,359.00 $1,359.00 169

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $355,216.00 $352,911.00 $316,737.00 $308,590.00 $306,444.00 $312,156.00 $353,252.00 

1 10013228; TRUCK, PICKUP, 2WD 
SERIES 862C-LEV;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $19,298.00 $173,682.00 170 $17,596.00 $158,364.00 171 $16,985.00 $152,865.00 172 $16,844.00 $151,596.00 173 $16,755.00 $150,795.00 174 $16,945.00 $152,505.00 175 $23,357.00 $210,213.00 176

2 10013232; ENGINE, DISPLACEMENT 
LARGER OPT49 S862C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $748.00 $748.00 170 $901.00 $901.00 177 $254.00 $254.00 178 $800.00 $800.00 179 $830.00 $830.00 180 $830.00 $830.00 181 $1,000.00 $1,000.00 182

ITEM NO. 20: SERIES 862C PICKUP TRUCK 1/2-TON EXTENDED CAB SHORT BED

ITEM NO. 17: SERIES 843B PICKUP TRUCK COMPACT, EXTENDED CAB, SHORT BED

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 18: SERIES 855C PICKUP TRUCK 1/2-TON REGULAR CAB, SHORT BED

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 19: SERIES 861 PICKUP TRUCK 1/2-TON REGULAR CAB, LONG BED

Sub-Total:

ITEM NO. 14: SERIES 687C CARGO VAN EXTENDED FULL SIZE

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 15: SERIES 741B 7-PASSENGER VAN SMALL EXTENDED VAN

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 16: SERIES 760C 15 PASSENGER VAN FULL SIZE EXTENDED

Sub-Total:

ITEM NO. 11: SERIES 665C UTILITY VEHICLE HEAVY DUTY 4-DOOR 2WD

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 12: SERIES 680C CARGO VAN FULL SIZE 8-CYLINDER GASOLINE

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 13: SERIES 685C CARGO VAN EXTENDED FULL SIZE

Sub-Total:

Sub-Total:



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

3 10043814; DRIVE, FOUR-WHEEL OPT 
52 SERIES 862C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,951.00 $5,902.00 $4,030.00 $8,060.00 $3,031.00 $6,062.00 $2,880.00 $5,760.00 $3,226.00 $6,452.00 $2,910.00 $5,820.00 $160.00 $320.00 

4 10043813; BOX, TOOL LOW PROFILE 
OPT 123.5 SN 862C;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $655.00 $3,275.00 183 $655.00 $3,275.00 152 $655.00 $3,275.00 152 $655.00 $3,275.00 152 $622.00 $3,110.00 152 $655.00 $3,275.00 184 $655.00 $3,275.00 152

5 10013231; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SERIES 862C;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,430.00 $7,150.00 $950.00 $4,750.00 $1,005.00 $5,025.00 $815.00 $4,075.00 $845.00 $4,225.00 $1,050.00 $5,250.00 $1,315.00 $6,575.00 

6 10013236; 
PACKAGE,TRAILERTOWINGOPT213.1 
SN862C-LEV;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20.00 $80.00 $285.00 $1,140.00 $424.00 $1,696.00 $356.00 $1,424.00 $351.00 $1,404.00 $363.00 $1,452.00 $311.00 $1,244.00 

7 10024084; LINER, TRUCK BED OPT 
216 SN862C-LEV FULL;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $189.00 $189.00 159 $189.00 $189.00 160 $189.00 $189.00 160 $189.00 $189.00 160 $189.00 $189.00 160 $160.00 $160.00 161 $0.00 No Bid

8 10013391; LINER,TRUCKBED 
SPRAYIN OPT217SN862C-LEV;

4 BT $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $1,300.00 162 $325.00 $1,300.00 163 $325.00 $1,300.00 164 $325.00 $1,300.00 164 $350.00 $1,400.00 165 $310.00 $1,240.00 166 $325.00 $1,300.00 167

9 10024105; LIGHT, STROBE ROOF 
MOUNTED OPT 224.4 SN8;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $283.00 $1,415.00 185 $239.00 $1,195.00 186 $239.00 $1,195.00 187 $239.00 $1,195.00 188 $180.00 $900.00 189 $239.00 $1,195.00 190 $239.00 $1,195.00 188

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $193,741.00 $179,174.00 $171,861.00 $169,614.00 $169,305.00 $171,727.00 $225,122.00 

1 10030741; TRUCK, PICKUP, CREW 
CAB, SERIES 867C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $22,198.00 $44,396.00 191 $0.00 No Bid $21,225.00 $42,450.00 192 $20,996.00 $41,992.00 193 $20,928.00 $41,856.00 194 $21,048.00 $42,096.00 195 $24,201.00 $48,402.00 196

2 10036603; TOOLBOX OPT 123.1 
SN867C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $649.00 $1,298.00 197 $0.00 No Bid $649.00 $1,298.00 198 $649.00 $1,298.00 198 $622.00 $1,244.00 198 $649.00 $1,298.00 199 $649.00 $1,298.00 198

3 10036606; LOCK, POWER 
DOOR/WINDOW OPT209 SN867C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $652.00 $1,304.00 $0.00 No Bid $652.00 $1,304.00 $884.00 $1,768.00 $917.00 $1,834.00 $896.00 $1,792.00 $917.00 $1,834.00 

4 10036605; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT213.1 SN867C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $406.00 $812.00 $0.00 No Bid $432.00 $864.00 $45.00 $90.00 $40.00 $80.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5 10036610; LINER, TRUCK BED SPRAY 
IN OPT 217 SN867C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $650.00 162 $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $650.00 164 $325.00 $650.00 164 $350.00 $700.00 165 $310.00 $620.00 166 $325.00 $650.00 167

6 10039200; HITCH, COMBINATION 
OPT243 SN867C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $196.00 $392.00 200 $0.00 No Bid $196.00 $392.00 201 $196.00 $392.00 201 $125.00 $250.00 202 $128.00 $256.00 203 $196.00 $392.00 204

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $48,852.00 $0.00 $46,958.00 $46,190.00 $45,964.00 $46,062.00 $52,576.00 

1 10013248; TRUCK, PICKUP 8600 
GVWR SERIES 868CLEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20,378.00 $20,378.00 205 $0.00 No Bid $19,845.00 $19,845.00 206 $19,717.00 $19,717.00 207 $19,639.00 $19,639.00 208 $19,769.00 $19,769.00 209 $21,955.00 $21,955.00 210

2 10039184; BOX, TOOL LOW PROFILE, 
OPT123.5 SN 868C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $655.00 $655.00 183 $0.00 No Bid $655.00 $655.00 152 $655.00 $655.00 152 $622.00 $622.00 152 $655.00 $655.00 184 $655.00 $655.00 152

3 10024018; WARRANTY,EXT OPT 
136.1 SN868C-LEV FULL S;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,430.00 $1,430.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,005.00 $1,005.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,245.00 $1,245.00 $1,510.00 $1,510.00 

4 10013251; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT 213.1 S868C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $407.00 $407.00 $0.00 No Bid $432.00 $432.00 $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 $52.00 $52.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5 10013253; LINER, SPRAY 
BED/TAILGATE OPT217 S868C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $325.00 211 $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $325.00 163 $325.00 $325.00 164 $350.00 $350.00 165 $310.00 $310.00 166 $325.00 $325.00 167

6 10030479; RACK, HEADACHE OPT 
264 SERIES 868C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $395.00 $395.00 212 $0.00 No Bid $395.00 $395.00 213 $395.00 $395.00 213 $290.75 $290.75 214 $352.00 $352.00 215 $395.00 $395.00 216

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23,590.00 $0.00 $22,657.00 $22,147.00 $21,951.75 $22,383.00 $24,840.00 

1 10013256; TRUCK, PICKUP LONGBED 
SERIES 872C LEV;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $18,346.00 $36,692.00 217 $0.00 No Bid $18,558.00 $37,116.00 218 $20,559.00 $41,118.00 219 $17,990.00 $35,980.00 220 $17,788.00 $35,576.00 221 $17,721.00 $35,442.00 222 $17,881.00 $35,762.00 223 $19,967.00 $39,934.00 224

2 10013268; BOX, TOOL, ALUMINUM 
OPT123.1 SERIES 872C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $585.00 $1,170.00 198 $0.00 No Bid $649.00 $1,298.00 197 $649.00 $1,298.00 198 $649.00 $1,298.00 198 $649.00 $1,298.00 198 $622.00 $1,244.00 198 $649.00 $1,298.00 199 $649.00 $1,298.00 198

3 10013258; WARRANTY,EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SERIES 872C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $2,368.00 $2,368.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,430.00 $1,430.00 $950.00 $950.00 $1,005.00 $1,005.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,010.00 $1,245.00 $1,245.00 $1,510.00 $1,510.00 

4 10013259; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT 213.1 S872C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $407.00 $407.00 $0.00 $0.00 $432.00 $432.00 $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 $52.00 $52.00 $0.00 $0.00 

5 10013261; GATE, LIFT OPT 214 
SERIES 872C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $1,995.00 $1,995.00 225 $0.00 No Bid $1,985.00 $1,985.00 154 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 226 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 156 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 156 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 157 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 158 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 157

6 10013263; LINER, BED AND 
TAILGATE OPT 216 S872C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $265.00 $265.00 227 $0.00 No Bid $189.00 $189.00 159 $189.00 $189.00 228 $189.00 $189.00 160 $189.00 $189.00 160 $189.00 $189.00 160 $160.00 $160.00 161 $0.00 No Bid

7 10013266; LINER, SPRAY IN 
BED/TAILGATE OPT 217;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $425.00 $425.00 227 $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $325.00 162 $325.00 $325.00 163 $325.00 $325.00 163 $325.00 $325.00 164 $350.00 $350.00 165 $310.00 $310.00 166 $325.00 $325.00 167

8 10013270; BAR, LIGHT OPTIN 224.8 
SERIES 872C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $1,650.00 $1,650.00 229 $0.00 No Bid $1,114.00 $1,114.00 230 $1,359.00 $1,359.00 231 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 232 $1,035.00 $1,035.00 232 $775.00 $775.00 233 $1,257.00 $1,257.00 64 $1,359.00 $1,359.00 63

9 10024034; HITCH, COMBINATION 
OPT 243 SN872C-LEV;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $195.00 $195.00 234 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $196.00 $196.00 235 $196.00 $196.00 236 $196.00 $196.00 201 $115.00 $115.00 202 $128.00 $128.00 203 $196.00 $196.00 237

10 10024036; CONTROLLER, BRAKE 
ELECT, OPT251 SN872C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $185.00 $185.00 227 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $196.00 $196.00 238 $0.00 $0.00 239 $184.00 $184.00 240 $191.00 $191.00 241 $191.00 $191.00 242 $189.00 $189.00 243

$0.00 $44,945.00 $0.00 $43,864.00 $47,616.00 $42,445.00 $41,843.00 $41,341.00 $42,388.00 $46,796.00 

1 10024232; TRUCK, PICKUP SERIES 
876CLEV FULL SIZE;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $21,375.00 $21,375.00 244 $20,433.00 $20,433.00 245 $20,100.00 $20,100.00 246 $20,239.00 $20,239.00 247 $22,400.00 $22,400.00 248

2 10024243; TOOLBOX, OPT 122.1 
SN876C-LEV FULL SIZE;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $613.00 $613.00 249 $613.00 $613.00 249 $585.00 $585.00 249 $613.00 $613.00 250 $613.00 $613.00 249

3 10024249; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT 213.1 SN876C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 $52.00 $52.00 $0.00 $0.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $22,033.00 $21,091.00 $20,725.00 $20,904.00 $23,013.00 

1 10013273; TRUCK, PICKUP 6 
PASSENGER SERIES 881C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $22,980.00 $22,980.00 251 $21,887.00 $21,887.00 252 $21,733.00 $21,733.00 253 $21,887.00 $21,887.00 254 $0.00 No Bid

2 10013280; COLOR, YELLOW 13507 
OPT 37.4 SERIES 881C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

3 10024222; ENGINE,LARGER 
DISPLACEMENT OPT49 SN881;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid 255 $0.00 $0.00 256 $0.00 No Bid

4 10013274; PACKAGE, TRAILER 
TOWING OPT 213.1 S881C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $45.00 $40.00 $40.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid

5 10024228; LIFTGATE, OPT214 
SN881C-LEV F S PCKUP TR;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,985.00 $1,985.00 156 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 257 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 258 $1,985.00 $1,985.00 158 $0.00 No Bid

6 10024236; LIGHT,STROBE 
LOWPROFILE OPT224.4 SN881C-;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $239.00 $239.00 188 $239.00 $239.00 188 $239.00 $239.00 188 $239.00 $239.00 190 $0.00 No Bid

7 10024238; SPOTLIGHT,OPT224.6 
SN881C-LEV F S PCK TR;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $594.00 $594.00 259 $594.00 $594.00 260 $594.00 $594.00 259 $546.00 $546.00 261 $0.00 No Bid

8 10024240; HITCH,COMBINATION 
OPT243 SN881C-LEV F;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $196.00 $196.00 236 $196.00 $196.00 201 $196.00 $196.00 202 $128.00 $128.00 203 $0.00 No Bid

9 10024245; INVERTER,OPT256 SERIES 
SN881C-LEV F S TR;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $2,575.00 $2,575.00 262 $2,575.00 $2,575.00 262 $2,575.00 $2,575.00 263 $2,575.00 $2,575.00 264 $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $28,614.00 $27,521.00 $27,362.00 $27,360.00 $0.00 

1 10013297; TRUCK, CAB AND 
CHASSIS, SERIES 870C LEV;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $20,531.00 $41,062.00 219 $17,525.00 $35,050.00 220 $17,288.00 $34,576.00 221 $17,721.00 $35,442.00 222 $17,316.00 $34,632.00 265 $19,448.00 $38,896.00 266
ITEM NO. 26: SERIES 870C CAB AND CHASSIS 3/4-TON REGULAR CAB SRW 56CA

ITEM NO. 23: SERIES 872C PICKUP TRUCK 3/4 TON REGULAR CAB LONG BED

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 24: SERIES 876C PICKUP TRUCK 1-TON REGULAR CAB LONG BED DRW

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 25: SERIES 881C PICKUP TRUCK 1-TON CREW CAB 6-PASSENGERS LONG BED SRW

Sub-Total:

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 21: SERIES 867C PICKUP TRUCK 3/4-TON CREW CAB 6 PASSENGER LONG BED

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 22: SERIES 868C PICKUP TRUCK 3/4-TON EXTENDED CAB LONG BED

Sub-Total:



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

2 10013299; TIRE, SPARE W/WHEEL 
OPT 107.1 SN870C-LEV;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $153.00 $306.00 $284.00 $568.00 $236.00 $472.00 $0.00 $0.00 $195.00 $390.00 $0.00 $0.00 

3 10013298; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SERIES 870C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $950.00 $1,900.00 $1,005.00 $2,010.00 $1,010.00 $2,020.00 $1,010.00 $2,020.00 $1,245.00 $2,490.00 $1,510.00 $3,020.00 

4 10013302; LIGHT, STROBE LOW 
PROFILE OP 224.4 S870C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $239.00 $239.00 188 $239.00 $239.00 188 $239.00 $239.00 188 $195.60 $195.60 189 $239.00 $239.00 190 $239.00 $239.00 188

5 10012919; BODY, UTILITY 96" L 56" 
CA SERIES 2001;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 267 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 268 $4,985.00 $9,970.00 268 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 268 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 269 $4,900.00 $9,800.00 268

6 10012925; RACK, LADDER, OPTION 
2.3 SERIES 2001;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 $855.00 $1,710.00 

7 10024887; RACK, VISE, OPT2.5, 
2001S BDY,870C C & C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 $259.00 

8 10024888; BUMPER,REAR, 
8"TRDPLT,OPT2.7,2001SBDY,87;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 $425.00 

9 10024889; BUMPER,REAR, 8"GRP 
STRT,OPT2.8,2001S BDY;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $735.00 $0.00 No Bid

10 10024932; 
SYSTEM,LKG,CNT,OPT2.11,2001SBDY,
870C C&C;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.00 $518.00 $259.00 $518.00 $259.00 $518.00 $259.00 $518.00 $259.00 $518.00 $259.00 $518.00 

11 10024933; 
TREADPLATE,FLR,3/16",OPT2.12,2001
SBDY870;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 $269.00 

12 10012927; CONNECTOR, 6 WAY 
MOUNTED OPT2.19 S2001;

2 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $69.00 $138.00 $69.00 $138.00 $69.00 $138.00 $69.00 $138.00 $69.00 $138.00 $69.00 $138.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $57,361.00 $51,721.00 $51,331.00 $51,511.60 $51,605.00 $55,274.00 

1 10024922; CAB & CHASSIS, 9,900 
GVWR, SRW, 873D LEV;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $32,544.00 $292,896.00 270 $0.00 No Bid $26,141.00 $235,269.00 271 $25,930.00 $233,370.00 272 $26,054.00 $234,486.00 273 $28,929.00 $260,361.00 274

2 10024402; WARRANTY,EXT,OPT 
136.1, SN 873D-LEV C&C;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,310.00 $20,790.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,095.00 $9,855.00 $1,845.00 $16,605.00 $1,940.00 $17,460.00 $2,000.00 $18,000.00 

3 10024403; LIGHT, STROBE LOW 
PROF, OPT 224.4 SN873D;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $239.00 $2,151.00 188 $0.00 No Bid $239.00 $2,151.00 188 $195.60 $1,760.40 189 $239.00 $2,151.00 190 $239.00 $2,151.00 188

4 10024920; 
SERVICEBODY,S2010,REGORSTDTYPE
,108",OPT;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $5,490.00 $49,410.00 275 $0.00 No Bid $5,575.00 $50,175.00 275 $5,490.00 $49,410.00 275 $5,490.00 $49,410.00 276 $5,490.00 $49,410.00 275

5 10024921; 
RACK,LADDERW/CONDUIT,OPT2.3,20
10SBDY873D;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $855.00 $7,695.00 $0.00 No Bid $855.00 $7,695.00 $855.00 $7,695.00 $855.00 $7,695.00 $855.00 $7,695.00 

6 10024408; RACK,VICE,PIPE 
HANG,OPT 2.5,SN 873D-LEV;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $2,331.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 

7 10024409; TOP,TELESCOPING,OPT 
2.6,SN 873D-LEV C&C;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $895.00 $3,580.00 $0.00 No Bid $895.00 $3,580.00 $895.00 $3,580.00 $895.00 $3,580.00 $895.00 $3,580.00 

8 10024411; BUMPER,REAR,8" GROPT 
2.8,SN 873D-LEV C&C;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $735.00 $2,940.00 $0.00 No Bid $735.00 $2,940.00 $735.00 $2,940.00 $735.00 $2,940.00 $735.00 $2,940.00 

9 10024414; SYSTEM, LOCKING,OPT 
2.11,SN 873D-LEV C&C;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $2,331.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 $259.00 $2,331.00 

10 10024415; THREADPLATE,FLOOR, 
3/16",OPT2.12,SN873D-;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $290.00 $2,610.00 $0.00 No Bid $290.00 $2,610.00 $290.00 $2,610.00 $290.00 $2,610.00 $290.00 $2,610.00 

11 10024418; CONNECTOR,6-WAY,OPT 
2.19,SN 873D-LEV C&C;

9 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $69.00 $621.00 $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $621.00 $69.00 $621.00 $69.00 $621.00 $69.00 $621.00 

12 10036968; LIFTGATE, SERVICE BODY 
OPT 2.28;

5 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,390.00 $11,950.00 277 $0.00 No Bid $2,350.00 $11,750.00 278 $2,390.00 $11,950.00 279 $2,390.00 $11,950.00 280 $2,390.00 $11,950.00 281

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $399,305.00 $0.00 $331,308.00 $335,203.40 $337,565.00 $363,980.00 

1 10013307; TRUCK, CAB AND 
CHASSIS, SERIES 875CDRW;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $22,397.00 $22,397.00 270 $19,990.00 $19,990.00 282 $20,331.00 $20,331.00 283 $20,090.00 $20,090.00 284 $20,166.00 $20,166.00 285 $25,066.00 $25,066.00 286

2 10030960; FOUR-WHEEL DRIVE, OPT 
52 SERIES 875C;

1 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,579.00 $2,579.00 $2,864.00 $2,864.00 $2,684.00 $2,684.00 $2,777.00 $2,777.00 $2,576.00 $2,576.00 $160.00 $160.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $24,976.00 $22,854.00 $23,015.00 $22,867.00 $22,742.00 $25,226.00 

1 10023170; TRUCK, CAB/CHASSIS 
SN875D CC60CA 13000;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $35,791.00 $214,746.00 270 $29,990.00 $179,940.00 287 $29,368.00 $176,208.00 288 $29,161.00 $174,966.00 253 $29,445.00 $176,670.00 285 $31,554.00 $189,324.00 289

2 10025564; WARRANTY, EXT 
OPT136.1 SN875D CC60CA;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,310.00 $13,860.00 $1,005.00 $6,030.00 $1,095.00 $6,570.00 $1,845.00 $11,070.00 $1,940.00 $11,640.00 $2,000.00 $12,000.00 

3 10025570; LIGHTBAR, MINIFREE 
OPT224.8 875D CC60;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,359.00 $8,154.00 290 $1,035.00 $6,210.00 291 $1,035.00 $6,210.00 291 $775.00 $4,650.00 292 $1,257.00 $7,542.00 64 $1,359.00 $8,154.00 63

4 10024613; CONTROLLER, BRAKE, 
ELECTRIC, OPT 251;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $196.00 $1,176.00 238 $0.00 $0.00 239 $60.00 $360.00 240 $191.00 $1,146.00 293 $197.00 $1,182.00 242 $189.00 $1,134.00 243

5 10023171; PLATFORM STAKEBODY, 
SN21001;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,590.00 $15,540.00 294 $2,590.00 $15,540.00 294 $2,675.00 $16,050.00 294 $2,590.00 $15,540.00 295 $2,352.00 $14,112.00 296 $2,590.00 $15,540.00 297

6 10025574; RACK,STAKE,OPT1, 
21001,S/P 875D CC60;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,029.00 $6,174.00 $1,029.00 $6,174.00 $1,029.00 $6,174.00 $1,029.00 $6,174.00 $780.00 $4,680.00 $1,029.00 $6,174.00 

7 10025577; GATE, LIFT, OPT 4, 21001 
S/P/STK 875D C;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,036.00 $12,216.00 298 $2,036.00 $12,216.00 299 $2,036.00 $12,216.00 299 $2,036.00 $12,216.00 300 $2,390.00 $14,340.00 301 $2,036.00 $12,216.00 302

8 10025556; BUMPER, ICC,OPT7,21001 
S/P/STK 875D-LEV;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $339.00 $2,034.00 $339.00 $2,034.00 $339.00 $2,034.00 $339.00 $2,034.00 $295.00 $1,770.00 $339.00 $2,034.00 

9 10025559; CONNECTOR,6-
WAY,OPT10, 21001 875D CC60;

6 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $69.00 $414.00 $69.00 $414.00 $69.00 $414.00 $69.00 $414.00 $45.00 $270.00 $69.00 $414.00 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $274,314.00 $228,558.00 $226,236.00 $228,210.00 $232,206.00 $246,990.00 

1 10013327; TRUCK, CAB AND 
CHASSIS, SERIES 930DCC60A;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $39,255.00 $157,020.00 303 $0.00 No Bid $35,297.00 $141,188.00 304 $35,106.00 $140,424.00 305 $35,325.00 $141,300.00 306 $37,698.00 $150,792.00 307

2 10013329; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 
OPT 136.1 SERIES 930D;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,310.00 $9,240.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,095.00 $4,380.00 $2,275.00 $9,100.00 $2,340.00 $9,360.00 $2,000.00 $8,000.00 

3 10013337; CONTROLLER, ELECTRIC 
BRAKE OPT 251 S930D;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $187.00 $748.00 $0.00 No Bid $60.00 $240.00 240 $191.00 $764.00 241 $197.00 $788.00 242 $189.00 $756.00 243

4 10037740; BODY, DUMP TRUCK 
SN4000 2-3CY F/SN930DCC;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $6,590.00 $26,360.00 308 $0.00 No Bid $6,675.00 $26,700.00 309 $6,590.00 $26,360.00 310 $6,590.00 $26,360.00 311 $6,590.00 $26,360.00 312

5 10037741; HITCH, PINTLE OPT1 
SN4000 BODY SN930D-CC;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $590.00 $2,360.00 313 $0.00 No Bid $590.00 $2,360.00 314 $590.00 $2,360.00 315 $590.00 $2,360.00 316 $590.00 $2,360.00 317

6 10037742; LIGHT, STROBE OPT 7 
SN4000 BODY SN930DCC;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $759.00 $3,036.00 318 $0.00 No Bid $759.00 $3,036.00 319 $759.00 $3,036.00 320 $759.00 $3,036.00 321 $759.00 $3,036.00 322

7 10037743; TARP, OPT11 SN4000 
BODY F/SN930D-CC 60CA;

4 EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $959.00 $3,836.00 323 $0.00 No Bid $959.00 $3,836.00 323 $959.00 $3,836.00 324 $959.00 $3,836.00 325 $959.00 $3,836.00 326

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $202,600.00 $0.00 $181,740.00 $185,880.00 $187,040.00 $195,140.00 
$213,285.00 $314,322.00 $407,720.00 $1,908,576.00 $2,207,590.00 $2,281,725.00 $2,607,996.00 $2,734,516.25 $2,793,589.00 $2,879,091.00 

ITEM NO. 29: SERIES 875D CAB AND CHASSIS 1-TON CREW CAB CONFIGURATION DRW 60CA

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 30: SERIES 930D CAB AND CHASSIS 1-1/4-TON CREW CAB CONFIGURATION DRW 60CA

Sub-Total:
Grand Total:

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 27: SERIES 873D CAB AND CHASSIS 1-TON REGULAR CAB SRW 60CA

Sub-Total:
ITEM NO. 28: SERIES 875C CAB AND CHASSIS 1-TON REGULAR CAB DRW 60CA

Sub-Total:



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

91: tommy gate # 650
92: TOMMYGATE #650

93: TOMMYGATE 64P-1036 FII-TP
94: TOMMYGATE 64P-1036F11TP

95: Tommygate # 64P-1036-F11TP
96: TOMMYGATE 64P_1036 F 11 TP

85: CHEVROLET EXPRESS CARGO VAN CG23705
86: FORD ECONOLINE S2E

87: 2012 FORD E250 EXTENDED CARGO VAN
88: 2012 Ford E250 Extended Length Cargo Van (S2E)

89: FORD E250 EXTENDED CARGO VAN S2E
90: Ford E-250 Super Cargo Van S2E

79: ADRIAN
80: 96B

81: 96B FORD ECONO CARGO PACKAGE
82: Leggett & Platt # 96B/163

83: ADRIAN STEEL
84: chevrolet express cg23705

73: FORD ECONOLINE E2E
74: 2012 FORD E250 CARGO VAN

75: 2012 Ford E250 Cargo Van (E2E)
76: FORD E250 CARGO VAN

77: Ford E-250 Cargo Van - E2E
78: adrian bulkhead partition kit

67: FORD EXPEDITION U1F
68: 2012 Ford Expedition XL (U1F)

69: FORD EXPEDITION XL
70: Ford E-250

71: chevrolet express cg23405
72: CHEVROLET EXPRESS CARGO VAN CG23405

61: 2012 Ford Escape XLT (U0D)
62: Whelen light bar model # FT8AAAAP

63: WHELEN FT8AAAAP
64: Whelen Mini-Freedom # FT8AAAAP

65: chevrolet tahoe cc10706
66: CHEVROLET TAHOE CC10706

55: FORD EXPLORER BASE 4X4
56: Toyota Rav4 4x4 V6 model #4433

57: JEEP LIBERTY 4X4
58: 2012 Ford Escape XLT (U9D)

59: Toyota Rav4 V6 2wd model # 4431
60: JEEP LIBERTY

49: UNITY SPOT LIGHT
50: Unity #325
51: UNITY 325

52: FORD EXPLORER K8B
53: 2012 FORD EXPLORER BASE 4WD

54: 2012 Ford Explorer (K8B)

43: DODGE DURANGO
44: FORD EXPLORER K7B

45: 2012 FORD EXPLORER BASE FWD
46: 2012 Ford Explorer (K7B)

47: FORD EXPLORER FWD BASE
48: UNITY

37: LTZ OPTION
38: Not Applicable -- Chevrolet Specific
39: chevrolet suburban 2500 cc20906
40: CHEVROLET SUBURBAN CC20906

41: FLEET SAFETY-HFD SPECIAL
42: FLEET SAFETY-HPD SPECIAL

31: FORD EXPEDITION EL LIMITED
32: LIMITED

33: UPGRADE TO K1K EXPEDITION EL LIMITED
34: 2012 Ford Expedition EL - Limited

35: EQUIPMENT GROUP 301A
36: chevrolet suburban ltz cc10906

25: FORD TAURUS SE
26: chevrolet suburban ls cc10906

27: CHEVROLET SUBURBAN CC10906
28: FORD EXPEDITION XL K1F

29: 2012 FORD EXPEDITION SSV
30: 2012 Ford Expedition EL - XL (K1F)

19: FORD FUSION HYBRID
20: chevrolet impala 1wf19

21: CHEVROLET IMPALA 1WF19
22: FORD TAURUS SE P2D
23: 2012 FORD TAURUS SE

24: 2012 Ford Taurus SE (P2D)

13: Toyota Camry LE Hybrid Model 2559
14: Ford Fusion P0L

15: Toyota Camry Hybrid model #2559
16: FORD FUSION HYBRID P0L

17: 2012 FORD FUSION HYBRID
18: 2012 Ford Fusion Hybrid (P0L)

7: DODGE AVENGER
8: CHEVROLET MALIBU 1ZJ69

9: FORD FUSION SE P0H
10: 2012 FORD FUSION SE

11: 2012 Ford Fusion SE (P0H)
12: FORD FUSION SE

1: Toyota Prius Two Model 1223
2: Toyota Prius (2) model # 1223

3: CHEVROLET VOLT 1RC68
4: 2011 TOYOTA PRIUS MDL#1223

5: NO BID
6: chevrolet malibu 1zj69

Items marked above with a Mfg Note number have the following equivalent Manufacturer's Name, Product Name, and Product Number:



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

193: FORD F250 W2A
194: 2012 FORD F250 CREW CAB

187: 2012HPA ECCC6710A
188: ECCO 6710A

189: WHELEN L21LAP LED BEACON
190: ECCO # 6710A

191: chevrolet 2500 cc20943
192: CHEVROLET 2500HD CREW CAB CC20943

181: Ford 5.0 Ltr V8 Engine (99F)
182: 5.0L V8 FFV
183: rki c63 lpa

184: RKI # C63LPA
185: ecco 6710a

186: ECCO 6710-A

175: 2012 Ford F150 XL Supercab Pickup - SWB (X1C)
176: FORD F150 EXTENDED CAB XL 4X4

177: 4.7 LITER
178: 4.8L V8
179: 5.0L V8

180: 5.0L V8 GASOLINE

169: WHELEN MINI FREEDOM FT8AAAAP
170: chevrolet 1500 cc10753
171: DODGE 1500 QUAD CAB

172: CHEVROLET 1500 EXT CAB CC10753
173: FORD F150 X1C

174: 2012 FORD F150 EXTENDED CAB

163: TUFF
164: TOFF

165: SWD SPRAY IN
166: Tuff-Liner Hi-Pressure

167: TUFF STUFF
168: WHELEN MINI FREEDOM

157: TOMMY GATE 60-1040 F11 TP
158: Tommygate # 60-1040-F11TP

159: rugged liner
160: RUGGED LINER

161: Colonel Mfg
162: tuff liner

151: rki c63lpa
152: RKI C63LPA

153: RKI #C63LPA
154: tommy gate 60-1040 f11 tp

155: TOMMY GATE 60-1040
156: TOMMY GATE 60-1040 FIITP

145: 2012 Ford F150 XL Reg Cab Pickup - SWB (F1C)
146: FORD F150 REGULAR CAB XL

147: chevrolet 1500 cc10903
148: CHEVROLET 1500 REG CAB CC10903

149: 2012 FORD F150 REGULAR CAB LONG BED
150: 2012 Ford F150 Reg Cab Pickup - LWB (F1C)

139: 2012 TOYOTA TACOMA ****4CYL ONLY****
140: chevrolet 1500 cc10703

141: DODGE RAM 1500
142: CHEVROLET 1500 REG CAB CC10703

143: FORD F150 F1C
144: 2012 FORD F150 REGULAR CAB SHORT BED

133: WHELEN M4 M4JC
134: M4LED

135: Toyota Tacoma PreRunner Model 7164
136: Toyota Tacoma Prerunner V6 extended cab model # 7164

137: chevrolet colorado cs15403
138: CHEVROLET COLORADO EXT CAB CS15653

127: 2012 FORD E350 15 PASSENGER VAN
128: 2012 Ford E350 Extended Length 15-Pass Van (S3B)

129: FORD E350 EXTENDED WAGON XLT
130: dual avenger

131: WHELEN
132: WHELEN M4 RED/BLUE

121: Toyota Sienna model # 5328
122: DODGE GRAND CARAVAN

123: 2012 TOYOTA SIENNA MDL 5328
124: chevrolet express cg33706

125: CHEVROLET EXPRESS PASSENGER CG33706
126: FORD ECONOLINE S3B

115: WHELEN AVENGER SERIES
116: DEERSKIN PTV2HM

117: DEERSKIN MFG MODEL # PTV-2HM
118: Deerskin Mfg # PTV-2

119: DEERSKIN PTV-2
120: Toyota Sienna 3.5 V6 Model 5328

109: Whelen # M4-JC
110: WHELEN SERIES M4 M4JC

111: Whelen Avenger
112: WHELEN M4LED

113: AVN2RB
114: WHELEN AVENGER

103: FORD E350 EXTENDED CARGO VAN S3E
104: Whelen M-4

105: whelen
106: WHELEN M4J

107: M4J
108: WHELEN MR RED/BLUE

97: Ford E-250 Cargo Van S3E
98: chevrolet express cg33705

99: CHEVROLET EXPRESS CARGO VAN CG33705
100: FORD ECONOLINE S3E

101: 2012 FORD E350 CARGO VAN
102: 2012 Ford E350 Extended-Length Cargo Van (S3E)



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

289: FORD F350 CREW CAB CHASSIS XL DRW
290: WHELEN MODEL FT8AAAAP

291: FT8AAAAP
292: WHELEN MINIFREEDOM LIGHTBAR

283: FORD F350 F3G
284: 2012 FORD F350 REGULAR CAB AND CHASSIS

285: 2012 Ford F350 XL Reg Cab/Chassis - DRW (F3G)
286: FORD F350 CAB CHASSIS XL DRW

287: CHEVROLET 3500HD CREW CAB CC31043
288: FORD F350 W3G

277: TOMMY GATE 54-1340
278: TOMMYGATE 54-1340 FIITP

279: TOMMY GATE 54-1340 F11 TP
280: Tommygate # 54-1340-F11TP
281: TOMMY GATE 54-1340 F 11 TP

282: CHEVROLET 3500HD REG CAB CC31003

271: FORD F350 F3E
272: 2012 FORD F350 REGULAR CAB AND CHASSIS

273: 2012 Ford F350 XL Reg Cab/Chassis - SRW (F3E)
274: FORD F350 CAB CHASSIS XL SRW

275: KNAPHEIDE 6108FJ
276: Knapheide # 6108FJ

265: 2012 Ford F250 XL Reg Cab/Chassis - 56"CA (F2A)
266: FORD F250 SD REGULAR CAB

267: KNAPHEIDE 696F J40
268: KNAPHEIDE 696FJ40
269: Knapheide # 696FJ40
270: DODGE RAM 3500 C&C

259: GO LIGHT 2020
260: GO LIGHT

261: Go-Light #2020
262: 1400 WATTS W DUAL AUX BATTERIES

263: 1400 WATTS WITH 20 AMPS DUAL BATTERIES
264: Vanner # IT12-1400

253: 2012 FORD F350 CREW CAB
254: 2012 Ford F350 XL Crew Cab Pickup - SRW (W3A)

255: 6.2L IS THE LARGEST GASOLINE DISPLACEMENT AVAIL
256: Ford 6.2 Ltr V8 Engine is Std
257: TOMMYGATE 60-1040 FIITP
258: tommy gate 60-1040 F11 TP

247: 2012 Ford F350 XL Reg Cab Pickup - DRW (F3C)
248: FORD F350 REGULAR CAB XL DRW

249: RKI C63
250: RKI # C63

251: CHEVROLET 3500HD CREW CAB CC30943
252: FORD F350 W3A

241: FORD FACTORY BRAKE CONTROLLER 52B
242: Ford OEM In-Dash
243: TEKONSHA 9035

244: CHEVROLET 3500HD REG CAB CC30903
245: FORD F350 F3C

246: 2012 FORD F350 REGULAR CAB

235: BUYERS PRODUCT
236: PM87 COMBO

237: BUYERS HITCH BH82000
238: MOPAR

239: JL1
240: 52B

229: Whelen Mini-Freedom Bar - FT8AAAAP
230: whelen ft8aaaap

231: WHELEN MODEL FT8AAAP
232: FT8AAAAP LIGHTBAR

233: WHELEN MINIFREEDOM
234: Holland Pintle/Ball Combo

223: 2012 Ford F250 XL Reg Cab Pickup - LWB (F2A)
224: FORD F250 REGULAR CAB XL

225: Tommy Lift
226: TOMMY GATE 60-1040

227: Ford
228: RUGGED

217: Ford F-250 F2A
218: chevrolet 2500 cc20903

219: DODGE RAM 2500
220: CHEVROLET 2500HD REG CAB CC20903

221: FORD F250 F2A
222: 2012 FORD F250 REGULAR CAB

211: tuff lioner
212: rki wg

213: RKI WG
214: RKI HEAD ACHE RACK

215: RKI # WG11
216: RKI WG 11

205: chevrolet 2500 cc20953
206: CHEVROLET 2500HD EXT CAB CC20953

207: FORD F250 X2A
208: 2012 FORD F250 EXTENDED CAB

209: 2012 Ford F250 XL Supercab Pickup - LWB (X2A)
210: FORD F250 XL X2A

199: RKI # C63A
200: buyers bh8200 as specified

201: PM87 HITCH
202: BUYERS PRODUCTS

203: Buyers # BH820000/ PM87/ HP6253-WC
204: BUYERS HITCH HP 6253

195: 2012 Ford F250 XL Crew Cab Pickup - LWB (W2A)
196: FORD F250 SD CREW CAB XL 4X2

197: rki c63a
198: RKI C63A



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note Note NoteLine Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

979-567-6116 409 727 1451 713-802-6645 281- 588-5171
129522 118669 130475 115734 136296 137873

Bids Received: 10 Fred Haas Toyota Country Sam Pack's Five Star Ford Sterling McCall Toyota lone star chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND Caldwell Country Chevrolet Caldwell Country Ford Philpott Ford Tommie Vaughn Motors Inc Sterling McCall Ford
281-374-5191 800-242-6415 7132703954 2815177031 281-388-8406 979-567-6116

325: Donovan # 5000GL
326: DONOVAN 5000GL

319: TECH
320: GENERAL BODY

321: Target Tech # 851 Amber
322: TARGET TECH 851

323: DONOVAN
324: DONOVAN TARP

313: PINTLE MODEL PH-T-60-AOL-8
314: PH-T-60-AOL-8
315: GENRAL BODY

316: Holland # PH-T-60-AOL-8
317: PINTEL PH-T-60-AOL-8

318: TARGET TECH

307: FORD F450 CREW CAB CHASSIS XL
308: RUGBY DU9-3 WITH RUGBY HOIST

309: RUGBY DU9-3 W HOIST HR520
310: RUGBY DU9-3 WITH RUGBY HOIST HR520

311: Rugby # DU9-3 w/ Hoist # HR520
312: RUGBY DU9-3

301: Tommygate # 91-1350-TP36
302: TOMMY GATE 91*1350 TP 36
303: DODGE RAM 4500 CREW CAB

304: FORD F450 W4G
305: 2012 FORD F450 CREW CAB AND CHASSIS

306: 2012 Ford F450 XL Crew Cab/Chassis - DRW (W4G)

295: GENERAL BODY #GBFB9W
296: Batterson Body Co # 21001

297: SERIES 21001 STAKE BODY GBFB9W
298: TOMMY GATE 91-1350

299: TOMMYGATE 91-1350 TP36
300: TOMMY GATE 91-1350 TP36

293: FORD FACTORY OPTION 52B
294: GBFB9W


