City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Automobiles, Vans, Utility Vehicles and Light-Duty Trucks
for
ARA, Airport, Courts, Fire, Fleet, General Services, Parks, Police, Public Works
N24417 - Close Date: 12/6/2012 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 9

Sterling McCall Toyota
713-270-3954

FRIENDLY FORD
281-462-3218

Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc
903-564-1500

Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land
281-491-9000

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

979-567-6116

RON CARTER AUTOLAND
281-388-8406

TOMBALL DODGE INC
281-351-2000

Sterling McCall Ford
281- 588-5171

Caldwell Country Ford
979-567-6116

135782 140871 132488 139321 115734 130475 138879 137873 136296
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
No. Description |Qty ‘U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
Item
NO. 1: SERIES 358E AUTOMOBILE HYBRID ELECTRIC INTERMEDIATE SIZE SEDAN
1 |10013083; SEDAN, HYBRID ELECTRIC 2| EA | $22,755.00 $45,510.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
SERIES 358ELEV;
2 |10013084; MAT, FLOOR HYBRID OPT 2| EA $140.00 $280.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
238 SERIES 358E;
3 |10047406; SYSTEM, NAVIGATION 1| EA $1,206.00 $1,206.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
SERIES 358E, DISPLAY;
Sub-Total: $46,996.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM NO. 2: SERIES 360B AUTOMOBILE INTERMEDIATE SIZE 6CYL 4-DOOR SEDAN
1 |10013077; SEDAN, 4 DOOR, MID 13| EA $0.00 No Bid $20,105.00 $261,365.00 $0.00 No Bid $19,493.75 $253,418.75| 1 $19,240.00 $250,120.00| 2 $15,877.00 $206,401.00| 3 $15,757.00 $204,841.00| 4 $18,737.00 $243,581.00| 5 $17,605.00 $228,865.00| 6
SIZE, SERIES 360BLEV;
2 |10023961; WARRANTY,EXT OPT136.1 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $1,090.00 $9,810.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,080.00 $9,720.00 $575.00 $5,175.00 $950.00 $8,550.00 $1,525.00 $13,725.00 $1,662.00 $14,958.00 $575.00 $5,175.00
SN360B INTMD SEDAN;
3 |10047497; TINT, WINDOW AUTO DK 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $95.00 $855.00 $0.00 No Bid $125.00 $1,125.00 $90.00 $810.00 $125.00 $1,125.00 $200.00 $1,800.00 $185.00 $1,665.00 $90.00 $810.00
OPT140.2 SN360;
4 110013081; KEY, SINGLE LOCKING 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $63.00 $567.00 $0.00 $0.00 $95.00 $855.00 $300.00 $2,700.00 $320.00 $2,880.00 $0.00 $0.00
OPT 204 SN360B M SD;
5 |10047498; LIGHT, LED HIDE-A-WAY 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $879.00 $7,911.00 $0.00 No Bid $779.00 $7,011.00| 7 $400.00 $3,600.00 8 $749.00 $6,741.00| 9 $804.00 $7,236.00 $779.00 $7,011.00 $324.00 $2,916.00| 8
OPT224.11 SN360 SD;
6 |[10013078; MAT, FLOOR, OPTION 238, 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $75.00 $675.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $107.00 $963.00 $83.00 $747.00
SERIES 360B;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $280,616.00 $0.00 $271,841.75 $259,705.00 $223,672.00 $230,302.00 $271,058.00 $238,513.00
ITEM NO. 3: SERIES 655C 3/4 TON UTILITY VEHICLE CARRYALL 4-DOOR 2WD
1 [10013089; VEHICLE, UTLITY 3/4TON 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $32,927.50 $98,782.50( 10 | $32,445.00 $97,335.00( 11 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
SERIES 655C;
2 |10047578; TINT, DARK WINDOW OPT 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $50.00 $150.00 $175.00 $525.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
140.1 SN655C;
3 |10013096; LOCK, SINGLE KEY OPT 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $40.00 $120.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
204 SERIES 655C;
4 ]110013094; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
WINDOW OPT209 S655C;
5 |10013097; SEATING, SPECIAL OPT 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
210 SERIES 655C;
6 |10013090; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
SERIES 655C;
7 |10013099; PACKAGE, TRAILER 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $37.29 $111.87 $80.00 $240.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
TOWING OPT213.1 S655C;
8 |[10023977; LIGHT, PACKAGE FOR HFD 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $9,792.83 $29,378.49( 12 $8,568.00 $25,704.00( 13 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
OPT224.9 SN655C;
9 |10023978; BATTERY, ADDITIONAL 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $506.00 $1,518.00 $440.00 $1,320.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
OPT250.1 SN655C UTL;
10 |10047529; EXTENDER, TRUCK BED 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $3,853.00 $11,559.00( 14 $5,990.00 $17,970.00( 15 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
OPT 268 SN 655C;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $141,619.86 $143,094.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM NO. 4: SERIES 656B MEDIUM DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 4-DOOR 2WD
1 |(10013111; VEHICLE, UTILITY MEDIUM 8| EA $0.00 No Bid $27,214.31 $217,714.48( 16 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $24,788.00 $198,304.00| 17 $24,981.00 $199,848.00| 18 $24,947.00 $199,576.00| 19 $22,646.00 $181,168.00| 20
DUTY 2WD S656BLE;
2 |10023981; WARRANTY, EXT OPT136.1 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $1,090.00 $7,630.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $950.00 $6,650.00 $1,525.00 $10,675.00 $1,662.00 $11,634.00 $575.00 $4,025.00
SN656B UTL VEHICL;
3 |10013116; LOCK, SINGLE KEY OPT 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $85.00 $170.00 $300.00 $600.00 $320.00 $640.00 $0.00 $0.00
204 SERIES 6568B;
4 110013115; DEFROSTER, REAR 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT 208 S656B;
5 [10023982; LOCK, POWER 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
DOOR/WINDOW OPT209 SN656B;
6 |10013112; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 5[ EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 656B;
7 |10013113; PACKAGE, TRAILER 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $497.00 $994.00
TOWING, OPT 213.1 S656B:
Sub-Total: $0.00 $225,344.48 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $205,124.00 $211,123.00 $211,850.00 $186,187.00
ITEM NO. 5: SERIES 657B MEDIUM DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 4-DOOR AWD
1 |10013118; VEHICLE, UTILITY 4WD 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $26,895.00 $80,685.00| 21 $26,780.00 $80,340.00| 22 $24,426.00 $73,278.00| 23
SERIES 657BLEV;
2 |10013125; SPOTLIGHT, OPT 111A 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $404.00 $1,212.00| 24 $379.00 $1,137.00| 24 $380.00 $1,140.00| 24
SERIES 657B;
3 |10023990; WARRANTY, EXT OPT136.1 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,525.00 $4,575.00 $1,662.00 $4,986.00 $675.00 $2,025.00
SN657B UTL VEHICL;
4 110013124; LOCK, SINGLE KEY OPT 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $300.00 $900.00 $320.00 $960.00 $0.00 $0.00
204 SERIES 657B;
5 |10013123; DEFROSTER, REAR 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT 208 S657B;
6 |[10013122; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT209 S657B;
7 |10013119; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 657B;
8 |10013120; PACKAGE, TRAILER 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $497.00 $1,491.00
TOWING OPT213.1 S657B;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $87,372.00 $87,423.00 $77,934.00
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Bids Received: 9

Sterling McCall Toyota
713-270-3954

FRIENDLY FORD
281-462-3218

Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc
903-564-1500

Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land

281-491-9000

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
979-567-6116

RON CARTER AUTOLAND
281-388-8406

TOMBALL DODGE INC
281-351-2000

Sterling McCall Ford
281- 588-5171

Caldwell Country Ford

979-567-6116

135782 140871 132488 139321 115734 130475 138879 137873 136296
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
No. Description |Qty ‘U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note Line Total Note
ITEM NO. 6: SERIES 661B LIGHT DUTY UTILITY VEHICLE 4-DOOR 4WD
1 |[10013101; VEHICLE, UTILITY LIGHT 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $21,156.11 $42,312.22| 25 | $21,245.00 $42,490.00( 26 $18,836.00 $37,672.00| 27 $18,223.00 $36,446.00| 28 $27,347.00 $54,694.00| 29 $22,441.00 $44,882.00| 30
DUTY 4WD S661BLEV;
2 |10024006; KEY,SINGLE LOCKING 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $66.00 $132.00 $0.00 $0.00 $85.00 $170.00 $300.00 $600.00 $320.00 $640.00 $0.00 $0.00
OPT204 SN661B UTL VH;
3 |10013103; DEFROSTER, REAR 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT 208 S 661B;
4 ]110024007; LOCK, PWR 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
DOOR/WINDOW OPT209 SN661B UT;
5 |10013104; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 661B;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $42,444.22 $42,490.00 $37,842.00 $37,046.00 $55,334.00 $44,882.00
ITEM NO. 7: SERIES 663B UTILITY VEHICLE LIGHT DUTY 4-DOOR 2WD
1 |10013106; VEHICLE, UTILITY 2WD 45| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $19,546.11 $879,574.95| 31 | $19,665.00 $884,925.00| 26 $17,425.00 $784,125.00| 27 $17,351.00 $780,795.00| 32 $25,695.00 $1,156,275.00( 33 $20,901.00 $940,545.00| 34
SERIES 663BLEV;
2 |10024028; WARRANTY, EXT OPT136.1 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,045.00 $1,045.00 $575.00 $575.00 $950.00 $950.00 $1,525.00 $1,525.00 $1,662.00 $1,662.00 $575.00 $575.00
SN663B UTL VEHICL;
3 |10024029; KEY, SINGLE LOCKING 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $66.00 $660.00 $0.00 $0.00 $85.00 $850.00 $300.00 $3,000.00 $320.00 $3,200.00 $0.00 $0.00
OPT204 SN663B UTL VH;
4 110013107; DEFROSTER, REAR 11| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT 208 S663B;
5 |10013108; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 13| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT209 S663B;
6 |10013109; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 13| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 663B;
7 |10024045; BAR,LIGHT MINIFREEDOM 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,439.00 $1,439.00( 35 $864.00 $864.00| 36 $1,395.00 $1,395.00| 37 $1,489.00 $1,489.00| 37 $1,439.00 $1,439.00| 38 $864.00 $864.00| 36
OPT224.8 SN663B UT;
8 |10024046; MAT, FLOOR OPT238 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
SN663B UTILITY VEHICL ;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $882,718.95 $886,364.00 $787,320.00 $786,809.00 $1,162,576.00 $941,984.00
ITEM NO. 8: SERIES 665C UTILITY VEHICLE HEAVY DUTY 4-DOOR 2WD
1 |10013126; VEHICLE, UTILITY 2WD 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $25,775.00 $51,550.00( 39 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $25,114.00 $50,228.00| 40
SERIES 665CLEV;
2 |10013139; CONDITIONING, AIR REAR 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
OPT 2.1 S665C;
3 |10013137; DIFFERENTIAL, LIMITED 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $251.00 $502.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
SLIP OPT45 S665C;
4 ]10013133; FOUR WHEEL DRIVE, OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,125.00 $2,125.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,552.00 $2,552.00
52 SERIES 665C;
5 |10013129; SPOLIGHT, DUAL OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $597.00 $597.00| 24 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $760.00 $760.00( 24
111.1 SERIES 665C;
6 |10013145; COOLER, TRANSMISSION 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
OP132.1 SERIES 665C;
7 |10013143; LOCK, SINGLE KEY OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
204 SERIES 665C;
8 |10013095; DEFROSTER, REAR 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT 208 S665C:
9 |10013144; SEATING, SPECIAL OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
210, SERIES 665C;
10 |10013131; PACKAGE, TRAILER 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $359.00 $359.00
TOWING OPT 213.3 665C;
11 |10013138; LOCK, POWER DOOR AND 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
WINDOW OPT209 S665C:
12 |10013127; SEAT, CLOTH OPT 211 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 665C;
13 |10030562; FLOOR MATS OPTION 238 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 665C;
14 |10030185; METER, HOUR OPT 249 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00
SERIES 665C;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $54,774.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $53,899.00
ITEM NO 9: SERIES 668B SMALL SIZE CARGO VAN
1 |10024054; VAN,CARGOSMALL,FRONT 9| EA | $23,465.00 $211,185.00( 41 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20,179.00 $181,611.00| 42 $19,648.00 $176,832.00| 43 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
WHEEL DR,SN668B-LEV;
2 |10024057; LOCK, POWER 9| EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
DOOR/WINDOW OPT209 SN668B:
3 [10024058; DOOR,SLIDINGSIDE 9| EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
OPT229 SN668B SM CARGO;
Sub-Total: $211,185.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $181,611.00 $176,832.00 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM NO. 10: SERIES 680C CARGO VAN FULL SIZE 8-CYLINDER GASOLINE
1 |10013174; VAN, CARGO FULL SIZE 4| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $18,265.00 $73,060.00( 44 | $18,320.00 $73,280.00( 45 $0.00 No Bid $19,485.00 $77,940.00( 46 | $17,341.00 $69,364.00( 47
SERIES 680CLEV:
2 |10024063; GLASS,REAR DOOR OPT 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $51.00 $102.00 $42.00 $84.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $52.00 $104.00
149 SN680C FULL SIZE:
3 [10013170; GLASS, ALL DOORS OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $111.00 $111.00 $95.00 $95.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $111.00 $111.00
151 SERIES 680C:
4 ]10013171; DOOR, SLIDING SIDE OPT 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $128.00 $256.00 $122.00 $244.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $129.00 $258.00
229 SERIES 680C:
5 [10024069; DOOR, SIDE SWING-OUT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
OPT229.1 SN680C FUL:
6 |10028790; 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $413.00 $413.00| 48 $395.00 $395.00| 49 $0.00 No Bid $429.00 $429.00| 50 $413.00 $413.00| 48
BULKHEAD,PARTITION,OPT262,SN680
c:
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $73,942.00 $74,098.00 $0.00 $78,369.00 $70,250.00
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Bids Received: 9

Sterling McCall Toyota
713-270-3954

FRIENDLY FORD
281-462-3218

Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc
903-564-1500

Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land

281-491-9000

Caldwell Country Chevrolet

979-567-6116

RON CARTER AUTOLAND

281-388-8406

TOMBALL DODGE INC
281-351-2000

Sterling McCall Ford
281- 588-5171

Caldwell Country Ford

979-567-6116

135782 140871 132488 139321 115734 130475 138879 137873 136296
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
No. Description |Qty ‘U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note Line Total Note Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note Line Total Note
ITEM NO. 11: SERIES 685C CARGO VAN EXTENDED FULL SIZE
1 |10013175; VAN, CARGO EXTENDED 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $19,739.00 $19,739.00( 44 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20,285.00 $20,285.00| 51 $18,433.00 $18,433.00| 47
SERIES 685C LEV;
2 |10024074; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $585.00 $585.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,762.00 $1,762.00 $770.00 $770.00
OPT 136.1 SN685C-LEV;
3 |10024078; LIFTGATE, OPT 214.1 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $3,149.00 $3,149.00( 52 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,449.00 $2,449.00 $2,449.00 $2,449.00| 52
SN685C-LEV FULL;
4 110024095; DOORS, SWING-OUT OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
229.1 SN685C-LEV;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23,473.00 $0.00 $0.00 $24,496.00 $21,652.00
ITEM NO. 12: SERIES 687C CARGO VAN EXTENDED FULL SIZE
1 |10013180; VAN, CARGO EXTENDED | l‘ EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $20,932.75 $20,932.75| 53 | $20,488.00 $20,488.00( 44 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $22,256.00 $22,256.00| 54 $20,686.00 $20,686.00| 55
SERIES 687C LEV;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $20,932.75 $20,488.00 $0.00 $0.00 $22,256.00 $20,686.00
ITEM NO. 13: SERIES 741B 7-PASSENGER VAN SMALL EXTENDED VAN
1 |10013191; VAN, 7-8 PASSENGER, 1| EA | $23,465.00 $23,465.00( 41 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $20,710.00 $20,710.00| 56 $20,859.00 $20,859.00| 57 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
SERIES 741B LEV;
2 |10024124; DEFROSTER, REAR OPT 1| EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
208 SN741B SMALL;
3 [10024125; LOCK, POWER 1| EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
DOOR/WINDOW OPT 209 SN741B;
4 110013193; DOOR, SLIDING SIDE 1| EA $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
W/WINDOW OPT229 S741B;
Sub-Total: $23,465.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $20,710.00 $20,859.00 $0.00 $0.00
ITEM NO. 14: SERIES 760C 15 PASSENGER VAN FULL SIZE EXTENDED
1 |[10013203; VAN, 15 PASSENGER, 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $23,967.00 $143,802.00| 58 | $23,275.00 $139,650.00| 59 $23,878.00 $143,268.00| 60 $0.00 No Bid $25,190.00 $151,140.00| 61 $23,311.00 $139,866.00| 55
SERIES 760C LEV;
2 |10024082; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,220.00 $1,220.00 $685.00 $685.00 $950.00 $950.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,941.00 $1,941.00 $770.00 $770.00
OPT 136.1 SN760C-LEV;
3 |10024083; PACKAGE, TRAILER 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $253.90 $253.90 $390.00 $390.00 $223.00 $223.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $258.00 $258.00
TOWING OPT 213.1 SN760C;
4 110024085; DOOR, HINGED SIDE OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
229.1 SN760C-LEV;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $145,275.90 $140,725.00 $144,441.00 $0.00 $153,081.00 $140,894.00
ITEM NO. 15: SERIES 861 PICKUP TRUCK 1/2-TON REGULAR CAB, LONG BED
1 [10013222; TRUCK, PICKUP 1/2TON 128 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $17,959.00 $2,298,752.00( 62 $17,315.00 $2,216,320.00| 63 $15,824.00 $2,025,472.00( 64
SERIES 861LEV;
2 |10013224; SPOTLIGHT, OPT 111A 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $404.00 $4,040.00| 24 $379.00 $3,790.00| 24 $380.00 $3,800.00| 24
SERIES 861C;
3 [10013226; BOX, TOOL ALUMINUM 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $710.00 $6,390.00 $685.00 $6,165.00| 65 $645.00 $5,805.00| 66
OPT 123.1 SERIES 861C;
4 110039182; BOX, TOOL LOW PROFILE 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $684.00 $6,840.00 $659.00 $6,590.00| 67 $620.00 $6,200.00| 68
OPTION 123.5 SN861;
5 |10024160; WARRANTY,EXT OPT 136.1 | 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,525.00 $15,250.00 $1,662.00 $16,620.00 $575.00 $5,750.00
SN861C-LEV FUL SZ;
6 |10024159; HITCH, RECEIVER OPT 213 |101| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $75.00 $7,575.00| 69 $360.00 $36,360.00| 70 $334.00 $33,734.00| 71
SN861C-LEV FULL;
7 (10024157, 19| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $75.00 $1,425.00 $360.00 $6,840.00 $334.00 $6,346.00
PACKAGE, TRAILERTOWINGOPT213.1
SN861C-LEV:
8 [10024146; LINER, TRUCK BED SPRAY |120| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $276.00 $33,120.00( 72 $339.00 $40,680.00( 73 $339.00 $40,680.00| 74
IN OPT 217 SN861C;
9 [10013227; BAR, LIGHT OPTION 224.8 | 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $284.00 $2,840.00 $1,439.00 $14,390.00( 38 $864.00 $8,640.00| 36
SERIES 861C:
10 (10024145; HITCH, COMBO OPT 243 110| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $95.00 $10,450.00( 75 $89.00 $9,790.00| 76 $225.00 $24,750.00( 76
SN861C FULL SIZE;
11 (10030174; RACK, HEADACHE OPT 264 [110( EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $429.00 $47,190.00( 75 $419.00 $46,090.00( 77 $356.00 $39,160.00| 78
SERIES 861C:
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $2,433,872.00 $2,403,635.00 $2,200,337.00
ITEM NO. 16: SERIES 862C PICKUP TRUCK 1/2-TON EXTENDED CAB SHORT BED
1 [10013228; TRUCK, PICKUP, 2WD 23| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $19,486.00 $448,178.00| 79 $18,453.00 $424,419.00| 80 $19,684.00 $452,732.00| 81 | $17,628.00 $405,444.00| 64
SERIES 862C-LEV;
2 |10043813; BOX, TOOL LOW PROFILE 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $629.00 $1,887.00| 82 $684.00 $2,052.00| 75 $659.00 $1,977.00| 83 $620.00 $1,860.00| 84
OPT 123.5 SN 862C;
3 [10013231; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $845.00 $2,535.00 $1,525.00 $4,575.00 $1,662.00 $4,986.00 $575.00 $1,725.00
OPT 136.1 SERIES 862C:
4 110013236; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $85.00 $255.00 $0.00 $0.00 $334.00 $1,002.00
PACKAGE, TRAILERTOWINGOPT213.1
SN862C-LEV:
5 |10013391; LINER,TRUCKBED SPRAYIN 3| BT $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00| 85 $276.00 $828.00| 86 $339.00 $1,017.00| 73 $339.00 $1,017.00| 74
OPT217SN862C-LEV;
6 |10024105; LIGHT, STROBE ROOF 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $239.00 $717.00| 75 $284.00 $852.00| 75 $259.00 $777.00( 87 $111.00 $333.00( 88
MOUNTED OPT 224.4 SN8;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $453,317.00 $432,981.00 $461,489.00 $411,381.00
ITEM NO. 17: SERIES 867C PICKUP TRUCK 3/4-TON CREW CAB 6 PASSENGER LONG BED
1 |[10030741; TRUCK, PICKUP, CREW l‘ EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $21,384.00 $21,384.00| 89 $23,556.00 $23,556.00| 90 | $21,516.00 $21,516.00| 91
CAB, SERIES 867C;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $21,384.00 $23,556.00 $21,516.00
ITEM NO. 18: SERIES 868C PICKUP TRUCK 3/4-TON EXTENDED CAB LONG BED
1 |10013248; TRUCK, PICKUP 8600 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $21,242.00 $148,694.00| 92 $0.00 No Bid $23,936.00 $167,552.00| 93 $20,227.00 $141,589.00| 91
GVWR SERIES 868CLEV;
2 |10039184; BOX, TOOL LOW PROFILE, 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $639.00 $4,473.00| 82 $0.00 No Bid $659.00 $4,613.00| 83 $620.00 $4,340.00| 94
OPT123.5 SN 868C;
3 |10024018; WARRANTY,EXT OPT 136.1 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $925.00 $6,475.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,762.00 $12,334.00 $770.00 $5,390.00
SN868C-LEV FULL S;
4 110024017; SEATS, CLOTH OPT 211 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $100.00 $700.00 $85.00 $595.00
SN868C-LEV FULL SIZ;
5 |10013253; LINER, SPRAY 7| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $329.00 $2,303.00| 95 $0.00 No Bid| 96 $339.00 $2,373.00| 73 $339.00 $2,373.00| 74
BED/TAILGATE OPT217 S868C;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $161,945.00 $0.00 $187,572.00 $154,287.00
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Sterling McCall Toyota
713-270-3954

FRIENDLY FORD
281-462-3218

Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc
903-564-1500

Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land
281-491-9000

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
979-567-6116

RON CARTER AUTOLAND
281-388-8406

TOMBALL DODGE INC
281-351-2000

Sterling McCall Ford
281- 588-5171

Caldwell Country Ford
979-567-6116

135782 140871 132488 139321 115734 130475 138879 137873 136296
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
No. Description |Qty ‘U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
ITEM NO. 19 SERIES 868D PICKUP TRUCK 3/4-TON EXTENDED CAB LONG BED
1 |10024305; TRUCK,PICKUP,SERIES 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $27,546.00 $27,546.00| 97 $26,777.00 $26,777.00| 91
868D-LEV F S EXT CAB:
2 |10024314; DRIVE,FOUR 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,583.00 $2,583.00
WHEEL.OPT52, SN868D-LEV F S E;
3 |10024319; WARRANTY, EXT OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,962.00 $1,962.00 $980.00 $980.00
136.1 SN868D-LEV F S E;
4 110024320; SEATS,CLOTH OPT211 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $100.00 $100.00 $85.00 $85.00
SN868D-LEV F S TRUCK;
5 |10024321; PACKAGE,TRAILER 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOWING OPT213.1 SN868D-L;
6 |10024324; LINER, TRUCK BED SPRAY 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $339.00 $339.00| 73 $339.00 $339.00( 74
IN OPT 217 SN868D;
7 |10024327; HITCH, COMBINATION OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $80.00 $80.00| 76 $225.00 $225.00( 76
243 SN855C;
8 |10024330; CONTROLLER, BRAKE 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $189.00 $189.00 $210.00 $210.00
ELECT, OPT251 SN86;
9 |10024331; RACK, HEADACHE OPT 264 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $419.00 $419.00| 77 $419.00 $419.00( 78
SN868D-LEV F S P;
10 |10024332; WINCH,ELECTRIC OPT265 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,849.00 $1,849.00| 98 $1,849.00 $1,849.00| 99
SN868D-LEV F S EXT;
11 |10024333; WINCH,ACCESSORY KIT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $295.00 $295.00| 100 $295.00 $295.00( 101
OPT 265.1 SN868D F S;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $32,779.00 $33,762.00
ITEM NO. 20: SERIES 872C PICKUP TRUCK 3/4 TON REGULAR CAB LONG BED
1 |10013256; TRUCK, PICKUP LONGBED 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $18,958.00 $113,748.00| 102 $0.00 No Bid $20,773.00 $124,638.00| 103 | $21,702.00 $130,212.00| 104 | $18,298.00 $109,788.00| 91
SERIES 872C LEV;
2 |10037556; TOOLBOX, DOUBLE LID 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $555.00 $555.00( 105 $0.00 No Bid $634.00 $634.00| 75 $609.00 $609.00( 106 $555.00 $555.00| 105
FRONT CROSS BOX;
3 |10013268; BOX, TOOL, ALUMINUM 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $645.00 $2,580.00( 66 $0.00 No Bid $710.00 $2,840.00| 75 $685.00 $2,740.00| 107 $645.00 $2,580.00| 66
OPT123.1 SERIES 872C;
4 110013258; WARRANTY,EXTENDED 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $770.00 $3,080.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,525.00 $6,100.00 $1,762.00 $7,048.00 $770.00 $3,080.00
OPT 136.1 SERIES 872C;
5 |10013259; PACKAGE, TRAILER 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $465.00 $2,790.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
TOWING OPT 213.1 S872C;
6 |10013261; GATE, LIFT OPT 214 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,706.00 $10,824.00| 108 $0.00 No Bid $2,199.00 $8,796.00| 75 $2,149.00 $8,596.00| 109 $2,706.00 $10,824.00| 108
SERIES 872C;
7 |10013266; LINER, SPRAY IN 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $339.00 $2,034.00( 74 $0.00 No Bid $404.00 $2,424.00| 110 $339.00 $2,034.00| 73 $339.00 $2,034.00| 74
BED/TAILGATE OPT 217;
8 |10013270; BAR, LIGHT OPTIN 224.8 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $864.00 $3,456.00| 111 $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $1,116.00| 75 $1,439.00 $5,756.00| 112 $864.00 $3,456.00| 111
SERIES 872C;
9 |10024034; HITCH, COMBINATION OPT 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $225.00 $900.00| 76 $0.00 No Bid $99.00 $396.00| 75 $89.00 $356.00( 76 $225.00 $900.00( 76
243 SN872C-LEV;
10 |10013260; RACK, HEADACHE OPT 264 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $419.00 $838.00| 78 $0.00 No Bid $439.00 $878.00| 75 $419.00 $838.00( 77 $419.00 $838.00( 78
SERIES 872C;
11 |10024036; CONTROLLER, BRAKE 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $210.00 $420.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $189.00 $378.00 $210.00 $420.00
ELECT, OPT251 SN872C;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $141,225.00 $0.00 $147,822.00 $158,567.00 $134,475.00
ITEM NO. 21: SERIES 870C CAB AND CHASSIS 3/4-TON REGULAR CAB SRW 56CA
1 |[10013297; TRUCK, CAB AND 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $17,950.78 $53,852.34| 113 $0.00 No Bid $18,647.00 $55,941.00| 102 $0.00 No Bid $20,573.00 $61,719.00| 114 $0.00 No Bid $17,794.00 $53,382.00| 91
CHASSIS, SERIES 870C LEV:
2 |10024885; SPOTLIGHT, OPT111A, 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $648.60 $648.60| 115 $0.00 No Bid $380.00 $380.00| 24 $0.00 No Bid $404.00 $404.00( 24 $0.00 No Bid $380.00 $380.00( 24
870CC & C;
3 |10013302; LIGHT, STROBE LOW 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $399.30 $399.30| 116 $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $259.00( 88 $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $279.00( 75 $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $259.00( 88
PROFILE OP 224.4 S870C;
4 110013298; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,649.60 $2,649.60 $0.00 No Bid $1,480.00 $1,480.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,525.00 $1,525.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,480.00 $1,480.00
OPT 136.1 SERIES 870C;
5 [10013299; TIRE, SPARE W/WHEEL 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $289.80 $289.80 $0.00 No Bid $252.00 $252.00 $0.00 No Bid $125.00 $125.00 $0.00 No Bid $252.00 $252.00
OPT 107.1 SN870C-LEV;
6 |10012919; BODY, UTILITY 96" L 56" 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $5,463.65 $16,390.95| 117 $0.00 No Bid $5,200.00 $15,600.00| 118 $0.00 No Bid $5,250.00 $15,750.00| 119 $0.00 No Bid $5,200.00 $15,600.00| 118
CA SERIES 2001;
7 |10012925; RACK, LADDER, OPTION 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $623.30 $1,869.90 $0.00 No Bid $895.00 $2,685.00 $0.00 No Bid $895.00 $2,685.00 $0.00 No Bid $895.00 $2,685.00
2.3 SERIES 2001;
8 |10024887; RACK, VISE, OPT2.5, 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.90 $519.80 $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $558.00 $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $558.00 $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $558.00
2001S BDY.870C C & C;
9 |[10012930; TOP, TELESCOPING OPT 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,223.60 $3,670.80| 120 $0.00 No Bid $959.00 $2,877.00| 121 $0.00 No Bid $979.00 $2,937.00| 75 $0.00 No Bid $959.00 $2,877.00| 121
2.6 SERIES 2001;
10 |10024888; BUMPER,REAR, 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $470.00 $470.00 $0.00 No Bid $495.00 $495.00 $0.00 No Bid $470.00 $470.00
8"TRDPLT.OPT2.7,2001SBDY.87;
11 |10024889; BUMPER,REAR, 8"GRP 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $443.90 $887.80 $0.00 No Bid $779.00 $1,558.00 $0.00 No Bid $799.00 $1,598.00 $0.00 No Bid $779.00 $1,558.00
STRT.OPT2.8,2001S BDY;
12 |10024932; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $343.85 $1,031.55 $0.00 No Bid $269.00 $807.00 $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $837.00 $0.00 No Bid $269.00 $807.00
SYSTEM,LKG,CNT,0OPT2.11,2001SBDY,
870C C&C:
13 |10024933; 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $188.60 $377.20 $0.00 No Bid $289.00 $578.00 $0.00 No Bid $299.00 $598.00 $0.00 No Bid $289.00 $578.00
TREADPLATE,FLR,3/16",0PT2.12,2001
SBDY870:
14 |10024934; 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $240.35 $480.70 $0.00 No Bid $290.00 $580.00 $0.00 No Bid $299.00 $598.00 $0.00 No Bid $290.00 $580.00
COVERING,FLR,ANTISLIP,0OPT2.13,200
1SBDY.8:
15 |10024935; 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $317.40 $634.80 $0.00 No Bid $607.00 $1,214.00 $0.00 No Bid $627.00 $1,254.00 $0.00 No Bid $607.00 $1,214.00
OVERLAY,TRDPLT,16GA,0PT2.14,2001
SBDY.870:
16 |10012927; CONNECTOR, 6 WAY 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $74.75 $224.25 $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $207.00 $0.00 No Bid $79.00 $237.00 $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $207.00
MOUNTED OPT2.19 S2001;
17 |10012931; MODULE, STORAGE 3 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,010.85 $2,021.70 $0.00 No Bid $1,169.00 $2,338.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,189.00 $2,378.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,169.00 $2,338.00
DRAWER OPT2.25 S2001;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $85,949.09 $0.00 $87,784.00 $0.00 $93,977.00 $0.00 $85,225.00
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Bids Received: 9 Sterling McCall Toyota FRIENDLY FORD Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land Caldwell Country Chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND TOMBALL DODGE INC Sterling McCall Ford Caldwell Country Ford
713-270-3954 281-462-3218 903-564-1500 281-491-9000 979-567-6116 281-388-8406 281-351-2000 281- 588-5171 979-567-6116
135782 140871 132488 139321 115734 130475 138879 137873 136296
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
No. Description |Qty ‘U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
ITEM NO. 22: SERIES 873D CAB AND CHASSIS 1-TON REGULAR CAB SRW 60CA
1 |10024922; CAB & CHASSIS, 9,900 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $27,124.38 $108,497.52| 122 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $26,744.00 $106,976.00| 123
GVWR, SRW, 873D LEV;
2 |10024402; WARRANTY ,EXT,OPT 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,649.60 $10,598.40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,825.00 $7,300.00
136.1, SN 873D-LEV C&C;
3 |10024403; LIGHT, STROBE LOW 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $399.30 $1,597.20| 116 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $1,036.00| 88
PROF, OPT 224.4 SN873D;
4 110024920; 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $6,232.00 $24,928.00| 124 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $5,749.00 $22,996.00| 125
SERVICEBODY,S2010,REGORSTDTYPE,
108".OPT:
5 10024921; 4| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $623.30 $2,493.20 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $895.00 $3,580.00
RACK,LADDERW/CONDUIT,OPT2.3,201
0SBDY873D:
6 |10024408; RACK,VICE,PIPE 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.90 $1,039.60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $1,116.00
HANG.OPT 2.5.SN 873D-LEV;
7 |10024409; TOP,TELESCOPING,OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,320.20 $1,320.20 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $696.00 $696.00
2.6,.SN 873D-LEV C&C:
8 |10024411; BUMPER,REAR,8" GROPT 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $357.65 $1,430.60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $779.00 $3,116.00
2.8,.SN 873D-LEV C&C:
9 |10024414; SYSTEM, LOCKING,OPT 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $412.85 $1,651.40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $269.00 $1,076.00
2.11.SN 873D-LEV C&C;
10 |10024415; THREADPLATE,FLOOR, 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $205.85 $823.40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $1,300.00
3/16",0PT2.12,SN873D-;
11 |10024418; CONNECTOR,6-WAY,OPT 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $74.75 $299.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $276.00
2.19.SN 873D-LEV C&C;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $154,678.52 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $149,468.00
ITEM NO. 23 SERIES 875C-LEV84CA CAB & CHASSIS, REGULAR CAB, 1-TON, 84 INCH CA
1 |10024836; CAB&CHASSIS, GAS, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $20,672.90 $62,018.70| 126 $0.00 No Bid $21,794.00 $65,382.00| 127 $0.00 No Bid $22,769.00 $68,307.00| 128 $0.00 No Bid $20,937.00 $62,811.00| 123
11,200 GVWR, DRW,875C;
2 (10024458; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $373.75 $1,121.25 $0.00 No Bid $336.00 $1,008.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $299.00 $897.00
DIFFERENTIAL,SLIP,LTD,OPT45,4000-
2/3 YD:
3 [10025600; PLATFORM STAKE BODY, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $4,134.25 $12,402.75( 129 $0.00 No Bid $3,595.00 $10,785.00| 130 $0.00 No Bid $3,695.00 $11,085.00( 75 $0.00 No Bid $3,595.00 $10,785.00| 130
SERIES 21004, 144"L;
4 (10024500; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,447.85 $4,343.55 $0.00 No Bid $1,259.00 $3,777.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,259.00 $3,777.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,259.00 $3,777.00
RACK,STAKE,SEC,0PT1,21104PLTFRM/
STK875C:
5 [10024501; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $793.50 $2,380.50 $0.00 No Bid $690.00 $2,070.00 $0.00 No Bid $699.00 $2,097.00 $0.00 No Bid $690.00 $2,070.00
FLOORING,STEEL,OPT2,21104,PLTFRM
/STKBD87:
6 [10024503; GATE,LIFT,OPT 4,21104 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,869.25 $8,607.75| 131 $0.00 No Bid $2,495.00 $7,485.00| 132 $0.00 No Bid $2,595.00 $7,785.00| 75 $0.00 No Bid $2,495.00 $7,485.00| 132
PLTFRM/STKBD 875C:
7 110024438; CONNECTOR,7- 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $79.35 $238.05 $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $207.00 $0.00 No Bid $79.00 $237.00 $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $207.00
WY.RND,OPT11.21104PLTFRM875C:
8 |10024510; BOX, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $825.70 $2,477.10 $0.00 No Bid $359.00 $1,077.00 $0.00 No Bid $369.00 $1,107.00 $0.00 No Bid $359.00 $1,077.00
BED,UNDR,30"X18"X18",0PT12.3,211
9 |(10024512; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $488.75 $1,466.25 $0.00 No Bid $425.00 $1,275.00 $0.00 No Bid $450.00 $1,350.00 $0.00 No Bid $425.00 $1,275.00
COATING,SIDES,UNDR,OPT13,21104P
LTE875C C:
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $95,055.90 $0.00 $93,066.00 $0.00 $95,745.00 $0.00 $90,384.00
ITEM NO. 24: SERIES 875D CAB AND CHASSIS 1-TON CREW CAB CONFIGURATION DRW 60CA
1 |10023170; TRUCK, CAB/CHASSIS 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $29,685.38 $89,056.14( 133 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $29,833.00 $89,499.00( 123
SN875D CC60CA 13000;
2 |10025564; WARRANTY, EXT OPT136.1 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,649.60 $7,948.80 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,825.00 $5,475.00
SN875D CC60CA;
3 [10025570; LIGHTBAR, MINIFREE 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,582.90 $4,748.70| 134 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $864.00 $2,592.00| 36
OPT224.8 875D CC60;
4 ]10024613; CONTROLLER, BRAKE, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $217.35 $652.05 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $210.00 $630.00
ELECTRIC, OPT 251;
5 [10023171; PLATFORM STAKEBODY, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $3,191.25 $9,573.75| 135 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,775.00 $8,325.00| 136
SN21001;
6 |10025574; RACK,STAKE,OPT1, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,253.50 $3,760.50 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,090.00 $3,270.00
21001.S/P 875D CC60:
7 ]10025577; GATE, LIFT, OPT 4, 21001 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,869.25 $8,607.75| 131 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,495.00 $7,485.00| 132
S/P/STK 875D C:
8 [10025556; BUMPER, ICC,0OPT7,21001 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $539.35 $1,618.05 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $469.00 $1,407.00
S/P/STK 875D-LEV:
9 [10025559; CONNECTOR,6- 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $79.35 $238.05 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $207.00
WAY.OPT10, 21001 875D CC60;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $126,203.79 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $118,890.00
ITEM NO. 25 SERIES 875D-LEV84CA CAB & CHASSIS REGULAR CAB, 1-TON, 84 INCH CA, DIESEL
1 [10013306; TRUCK, CAB AND 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $27,045.38 $27,045.38( 137 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $27,329.00 $27,329.00( 123
CHASSIS, SERIES 875DLEV84;
2 [10024761; WARRANTY, EXTND, 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,649.60 $2,649.60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,825.00 $1,825.00
OPT136.1.875D DRW C&C:
3 |10024763; LIGHT, 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $284.90 $284.90| 138 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $259.00 $259.00| 88
STROBE,LOWPRFL,ROOF,0PT224.4,87
5D:
4 110024767; LIGHTBAR, FT8AAAP, OPT 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,582.90 $1,582.90| 134 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $864.00 $864.00( 36
224.8.875D;
5 |10013053; PLATFORM STAKE BODY, 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $4,134.25 $4,134.25| 129 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $3,595.00 $3,595.00| 130
SERIES 21004, 144" ;
6 [10024796; 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,447.85 $1,447.85 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,259.00 $1,259.00
RACK,STAKE,SEC,0OPT1,21004PLTFRM/
STKBD BD:
7 110024799; 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $2,869.25 $2,869.25| 131 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $2,495.00 $2,495.00| 132
GATE,LIFT,OPT4,21004PLTFRM/STKBD
BDY.875:
8 [10024802; 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $412.85 $412.85 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $359.00 $359.00
BUMPER,ICC,OPT5,21004PLTFRM/STK
BDBDY.875:
9 |10024805; 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $79.35 $79.35 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $69.00
CONNECTOR,6WY,RND,OPT10,21004P
LTFRM/STKB:
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $40,506.33 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $38,054.00
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Bids Received: 9 Sterling McCall Toyota FRIENDLY FORD Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land Caldwell Country Chevrolet RON CARTER AUTOLAND TOMBALL DODGE INC Sterling McCall Ford Caldwell Country Ford
713-270-3954 281-462-3218 903-564-1500 281-491-9000 979-567-6116 281-388-8406 281-351-2000 281- 588-5171 979-567-6116
135782 140871 132488 139321 115734 130475 138879 137873 136296
Item | ‘ Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
No. Description Qty |U/M | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
ITEM NO. 26: SERIES 930G-LEV60CA CAB & CHASSIS REGULAR CAB, 1-1/44€“TON, 60 INCH CA
1 |10013344; TRUCK, CAB AND 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $26,568.90 $239,120.10| 139 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $36,552.00 $328,968.00| 140
CHASSIS, 930G LEV 60CA;
2 |10024529; TRANSMISSION, COOLER, 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $920.00 $8,280.00| 141 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00( 142
OPT 132.1 930G DRW;
3 |10013012; TRUCK, BODY 108FT 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $5,967.50 $53,707.50| 143 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $5,590.00 $50,310.00| 144
SERIES 2005 SN930G;
4 110024643; BUMPER, REAR 12" GRIP 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $939.55 $8,455.95 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $995.00 $8,955.00
STRUT, OPT 2.10;
5 |10024644; SYSTEM, LKG, CENTRAL, 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $343.85 $3,094.65 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $269.00 $2,421.00
OPT 2.11, 2005 S;
6 |10024648; OVERLAY, TRDPLT, 16 GA. 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $354.20 $3,187.80 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $659.00 $5,931.00
OPT 2.15, 2005 S;
7 |10024649; COVERING, FLR, ANTISLIP, 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $234.60 $2,111.40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $290.00 $2,610.00
OPT 2.16, 2005;
8 |10024690; CONNECTOR, 6-WAY, 9 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $74.75 $672.75 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $621.00
MNTD, OPT 2.19, 2005 S;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $318,630.15 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $399,816.00
ITEM NO. 27: 930D-LEV-60CA CAB & CHASSIS, REGULAR CAB, 1-1/4-TON, 60 INCH CA DIESEL
1 |[10013332; TRUCK, CAB AND 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $32,183.38 $128,733.52| 145 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $32,797.00 $131,188.00| 140
CHASSIS, SERIES 930DLEV60;
2 |10012977; BODY, TRUCK SERVICE 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $5,967.50 $23,870.00| 143 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $5,590.00 $22,360.00| 144
STANDARD S2005 SN930;
3 (10024597, 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $623.30 $1,869.90 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $949.00 $2,847.00
RACK,LADDER,W/CONDUIT,OPT2.3,20
05 S BDY:
4 [10012984; RACK, VISE W/PIPE S2005 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $259.90 $779.70 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $279.00 $837.00
OPT 2.5 SN930D:
5 10024598; 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $525.00 $525.00
BUMPER,REAR,8"TRDPLT,OPT2.7,2005
SBDY.DRW:
6 [10024599; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $644.00 $1,932.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $910.00 $2,730.00
BUMPER,REAR,8"GRIPSTRUT,OPT2.8,2
005SBDY.:
7 ]10012979; SYSTEM, CENTRAL LOCK 4| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $343.85 $1,375.40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $269.00 $1,076.00
S2005 OPT2.11 SN930:
8 |10024631; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $224.25 $672.75 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $389.00 $1,167.00
TREADPLATE,FLOOR,0PT2.12,2005SB
DY DRW930:
9 |10012978; COVERING, FLOOR S2005 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $247.25 $741.75 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $290.00 $870.00
OPT 2.13 SN930D;
10 |10024632; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $455.40 $1,366.20 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $904.00 $2,712.00
TREADPLATE,OVERLAY,16GA,OPT2.14
2005SBDY:
11 |10024633; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $349.60 $1,048.80 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $659.00 $1,977.00
TREADPLATE,OVERLAY,16GA,0OPT2.15
2005SBDY:
12 |10012982; CONNECTOR, 6 WAY 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $74.75 $224.25 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $69.00 $207.00
S2005 OPT 2.19 SN930D;
13 |10012980; RACK, HEADACHE SERIES 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $852.15 $3,408.60| 146 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $525.00 $2,100.00| 78
2005 SN930D 60 CA;
14 |10024637; 4 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $11,915.55 $47,662.20| 147 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $11,595.00 $46,380.00| 148
CRANE,PLNTRYGEARWINCH,OPT2.23,2
005SBDY D:
15 |10024638; 3| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,010.85 $3,032.55 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,169.00 $3,507.00
MODULE,STORAGE,3DRWR,0PT2.25,2
005 SBDY D:
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $216,717.62 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $220,483.00
ITEM NO. 28 SERIES 930D-LEV-CC60CA CAB & CHASSIS, CREW CAB CONFIGURATION, 1-1/4-TON, 60 INCH CA
1 |[10013327; TRUCK, CAB AND 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $36,118.38 $216,710.28| 149 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $35,742.00 $214,452.00| 140
CHASSIS, SERIES 930DCC60A;
2 |10013329; WARRANTY, EXTENDED 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,825.00 $10,950.00
OPT 136.1 SERIES 930D;
3 |10013337; CONTROLLER, ELECTRIC 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $217.35 $1,304.10 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $210.00 $1,260.00
BRAKE OPT 251 S930D;
4 |10037740; BODY, DUMP TRUCK 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $7,917.75 $47,506.50| 150 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $6,885.00 $41,310.00| 151
SN4000 2-3CY F/SN930DCC;
5 |10037741; HITCH, PINTLE OPT1 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $746.35 $4,478.10| 152 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $649.00 $3,894.00| 153
SN4000 BODY SN930D-CC;
6 |10037742; LIGHT, STROBE OPT 7 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $884.35 $5,306.10| 152 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $789.00 $4,734.00| 154
SN4000 BODY SN930DCC;
7 |10037743; TARP, OPT11 SN4000 6 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $1,321.35 $7,928.10| 155 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1,149.00 $6,894.00| 156
BODY F/SN930D-CC 60CA;
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $283,233.18 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $283,494.00
Grand Total: $281,646.00 $505,960.48 $1,320,974.58 $1,504,833.43 $1,967,130.00 $2,290,080.00 $4,776,124.00 $5,334,041.00 $6,138,453.00
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Bids Received: 9

Sterling McCall Toyota
713-270-3954
135782

FRIENDLY FORD
281-462-3218
140871

Johnson Grayson Automotive Inc
903-564-1500
132488

Classic Chevrolet Sugar Land
281-491-9000
139321

Caldwell Country Chevrolet
979-567-6116
115734

RON CARTER AUTOLAND
281-388-8406
130475

TOMBALL DODGE INC
281-351-2000
138879

Sterling McCall Ford
281- 588-5171
137873

Caldwell Country Ford
979-567-6116
136296
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Unit Price Line Total Note
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Note

Unit Price Line Total
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Note
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Note

Unit Price Line Total

Mfg
Note

Items marked above with a Mfg Note number have the following equivalent Manufacturer's Name, Product Name, and Product Number:

BeeNearwny
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NP O
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: General Motors - Chevrolet Malibu 1GB69
: CHEVROLET MALIBU LS 1GB69

DODGE AVENGER

2013 DODGE, AVENGER SE, JSDH41
FORD FUSION S

2013 FORD FUSION

Whelen Vertex Model VTX609R

: VERTEX SUPER-LED LIGHT RED

GENERAL TRUCK

: General Motors - Chevrolet Suburban CC20906
: CHEVROLET SUBURBAN CC20906

: As Outlined In Spec # 224.9

: HFD PACKAGE

: Extendo Bed Model # EBL-1054/60

: TRUCK BED EXTENDER

: ford,explorer,base

: DODGE DURANGO

: 2013 DODGE, DURANGO SXT, WDDL75
: FORD EXPLORER BASE

: 2013 FORD EXPLORER

: 2013 DODGE, DURANGO SXT AWD

: FORD EXPLORER

: 2013 FORD EXPLORER AWD

: UNITY

: General Motors - Chevrolet Equinox AWD 1LG26
: CHEVROLET EQUINOX

: JEEP PATRIOT

: 2014 JEEP, PATRIOT SPORT 4X4, MKJE74
: FORD ESCAPE AWD

: 2013 FORD ESCAPE 4WD

: General Motors - Chevrolet Equinox FWD 1LF26
: JEEP, PATRIOT SPORT FWD, MKTE74

: FORD ESCAPE FWD

: 2013 FORD ESCAPE

: Whelen Model FTBAAAAP

: MINI FREEDOM

: WHELEN FT8AAAAP

: LIGHT BAR WHELEN FT8AAAAP

: CHEVROLET TAHOE CC10706

: 2013 FORD EXPEDITION

: TOYOTA sienna 5328

: DODGE C/V CARAVAN

: DODGE RAM, C/V, RTKE53

: CHEVROLET EXPRESS CARGO

: CHEVROLET 2500 CG23405

: FORD E250 CARGO VAN

: 2013 FORD E250

: ADRIAN STEEL S1IM2C2FSV BULKHEAD
: ADRIAN

: BULKHEAD WITH HINGE KIT

: FORD E250 SD EXT VAN

: TOMMYGATE 650

: General Motors - Chevrolet Express 3500 Ext. CG33705
: FORD E350 EXT CARGO VAN

: 2013 FORD E350

: DODGE GRAND CARAVAN

: DODGE, GRAND CARAVAN SE, RTKH53
: General Motors - Chevrolet 3500 Express Pass. CG33706
: CHEVROLET EXPRESS PASSENGER

: CHEVROLET 3500 EXPRESS CG33706

: FORD E350 EXTENDED WAGON

: DODGE RAM, 1500, DS1L62

: FORD F150 REG CAB LWB

: 2013 FORD F150

: TOOL BOX ALUMINUM SINGLE LID

: TOOLBOX ALUM SINGLE LID

: TOOL BOX LOW PROFILE ALUM

: TOOLBOX ALUM LOW PROFILE

: DODGE RAM, FACTORY OPTION REMOVE XF8
: RECEIVER HITCH WITH CONNECTOR

: OEM HITCH

: DODGE RAM,FACTORY REMOVE XM9

: SPRAY IN BEDLINER

: RHINO

: GENERAL TRUCK BODY

: COMBO HITCH

: HEADACHE RACK

: RKI

: DODGE 1500 QUAD CAB

: DODGE RAM, 1500, DS1L41

: FORD F150 EXT CAB SWB

: GENERAL TRUCK SUPPLIER

: TOOL BOX LOW PRO

: TOOL BOX ALUM LOW PROF

: DODGE FACTORY SUPPLIED

: DODGE RAM, 1500, FACTORY OPTION REMOVE XF8
: STROBE LIGHT ROOF MOUNT

: MODEL 2015 LOW/AMBER/PERM

: 2013 DODGE RAM, 2500, DJ2L92

: FORD F250 CREW CAB LWB

: 2013 FORD F250

: CHEVROLET 2500 EX-CAB
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93: F250 EXT CAB GAS

94: TOOL BOX ALUM LOW PRO

95: ULTIMATE LINING

ittt

97: FORD F250 EXT CAB 4X4

98: 8000 LB WARN WINCH

99: WARN WINCH

100: WINCH ACCESSORY KIT

101: WINCH ASSESSORY KIT

102: CHEVROLET 2500HD

103: DODGE RAM, 2500, DJ2L62
104: FORD F250 REG CAB RX2

105: TOOLBOX STEEL DOUBLE LID
106: TOOL BOX STEEL DOUBLE LID
107: TOOL BOX FRONT SINGLE LID
108: TOMMY GATE

o LIFT GATE

: DODGE RAM, 2500 FACTORY OPTION XMF
: FREEDOM

: WHELEN MODEL FT8AAAAP

: Ford F-250 F2A

: DODGE RAM, 2500, DJ2L62 BED DELETE
: Unity 325

: Whelen 2015LPA (2012P is no longer available)
: Stahl CST98VVSLT 48.5

: KNAPHEIDE 696FJ40

: 2001 SERVICE BODY GENERAL BODY
: Stahl LSR with locking rear flap
: TELESCOPING TOP

: Ford F-350 F3E

: 2013 FORD F350

: Stahl CST110VVST 48.5

: RKI/KNAPHEIDE

: Ford F-350 F3G Gas

: CHEVROLET 3500HD

: DODGE RAM, 3500 CHASSIS, DD3L64
: General Truck Body GBFB12W
: GBFB12wW

: Tommy Gate 91-1350

: TOMMY

: Ford F-350 W3G

: Whelen FTBAAAAP

: General Truck Body GBFBOW

: GBFBOW

: Ford F-350 F3G

: ECCO 6710A

: Ford F-450 F4G Gas

: 2013 FORD F450

: Ford

: STANDARD

: Stahl CST110VVD 52.5

: KNAPHEIDE 6108D54J

: Ford F-450 FAG

: Stahl Service Body Rack

: Stahl 3200LRX

: AUTO CRANE 3203 PRX15

: Ford F-450 WA4G Diesel

: Rugby DU9-3 (General Truck Body)
: RUGBY DU9-3

: General Truck Body

: PINTLE HITCH

: STROBE TECH AMBER

: Donovan

: DONOVAN TARP
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