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1

VHF Air Band Transceiver, ICOM Inc., Part No. IC-A6, 
including Belt Clip (MB-103) Wall Charger (BC-110AR), 
Antenna (FA-B02AR), NiMH Battery (BP-210N), See 
Technical Specifications 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $241.97  $   6,049.25  $207.50  $    5,187.50  $ 259.00  $   6,475.00  $273.72  $   6,843.00  $ 280.00 

2
Battery, 1650 mAh NiMH, Part No. BP-210N, Standard Item 
for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $  33.69  $      842.25  $  29.85  $       746.25  $   21.70  $      542.50  $  42.40  $   1,060.00  $   43.00 

3 Belt Clip, Part No. MB-103, Standard Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $    7.77  $      194.25  $    6.90  $       172.50  $   10.20  $      255.00  $  10.16  $      254.00  $   11.00 
Wall Charger, 110 VAC, Part No. BC-110AR 
Standard Item for IC-A6

6 Carrying Case, Part No. LC-159,Optional Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $  26.56  $      664.00  $  23.60  $       590.00  $   31.50  $      787.50  $  33.24  $      831.00  $   34.00 

7

Multi-Charger Kit, BC121N A24 which includes: BC121N 
Multi-Charger base, BC-157 02 Power Supply, and six AD 
101 Adapters, Optional Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $        -    No Bid  $300.50  $    7,512.50  $        -    No Bid  $        -    No Bid  $ 425.00 

8
Battery, Nickel Cadmium, 1100 mAh, Part No. BP-209N, 
Optional Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $  27.21  $      680.25  $  24.19  $       604.75  $   30.00  $      750.00  $  34.37  $      859.25  $   36.00 

9
Battery Case for 6 "AA" Alkalines, Part No. BP-208N, 
Optional Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $  12.31  $      307.75  $  11.05  $       276.25  $   16.00  $      400.00  $  15.80  $      395.00  $   15.00 

10
Rapid Desk Charger, 110VAC (Full charge in 1.5 - 2 hours), 
Part No. BC-119N 01, Optional Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $  44.06  $   1,101.50  $  39.15  $       978.75  $   41.35  $   1,033.75  $  56.04  $   1,401.00  $   50.00 
Power Supply for BC-119N 01, Part No. BC-145A
Optional Item for IC-A6

Power Supply for Multi-Charger(Replaces the BC-124/BC-
124E), Part No. BC-157 02
Optional Item for IC-A6
Holster, Belt Loop Style, Leather, Part No. MB-96F
Optional Item for IC-A6
Holster, Swivel, Belt Loop Style, Leather, MB-96N
Optional Item for IC-A6

17
Speaker/Microphone, Slim-line (includes earphone jack & 
transmit indicator), Part No. HM-46L Optional Item for IC-A6 25 EACH 0 No Bid  $  29.16  $      729.00  $  26.40  $       660.00  $   35.00  $      875.00  $  64.20  $   1,605.00  $   38.00 
Cigarette Lighter Adapter, Part No. CP-20
Optional Item for IC-A6
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 $   46.00 $   1,050.00  $  47.96 $   42.00 $       846.25  $   1,199.00  $      939.50 $  33.85 No Bid $  37.58 25 EACH 0

 $  22.72  $      568.00 $   25.50 $      637.50  $   18.00 $       403.75 $  18.14  $      453.50 16 25 EACH 0 No Bid $  16.15 

 $   22.00 $      637.50  $  22.72 $   25.50 $       403.75  $      568.00  $      453.50 $  16.15 No Bid $  18.14 25 EACH 0

 $  93.56  $   2,339.00 $   85.00 $   2,125.00  $   95.00 $    1,687.50 $  74.52  $   1,863.00 14 25 EACH 0 No Bid $  67.50 

 $ 235.00 $   5,500.00  $240.32 $ 220.00 $    4,260.00  $   6,008.00 0  $   4,698.00 $170.40 No Bid $187.92 

 $  15.72  $      393.00 $   13.50 $      337.50  $   16.00 $       276.75 $  12.31  $      307.75 12 25 EACH 0 No Bid $  11.07 

 $   11.00 $      300.00  $  10.44 $   12.00 $       174.75  $      261.00  $      194.25 $    6.99 No Bid $    7.77 

 $  29.24  $      731.00 $  23.32  $      583.00 $   27.00 $  20.75 $       518.75 $      675.00  $   30.00 
 $   20.00 $      840.00  $  34.44 $   33.60 $       632.50  $      861.00 EACH 0 No Bid $  28.51  $      712.75 $  25.30 4 25

5

Adapter for BC-119N 01 (works with BP-209N, BP-210N, BP-
211N), Part No. AD-101; Optional Item for IC-A6g ( g y, p
supply and adapters), Part No. BC-121N; Optional Item for IC-
A6

11

13

15

18

0EACH25

25 EACH 0

25 EACH

Antenna, Standard, Part No. FA-B02AR Item from IC-A6 No Bid
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19

VHF Air Band Transceiver, ICOM, Inc, Part No. IC-A110, 
including Hand Microphone (HM-161),DC Power Cable (OPC-
344), Mounting Bracket Kit (V8000MMB), Microphone Hanger 
Kit (6910004210), and Fuse (5210000070, See Technical 
Specifications 35 EACH 0 No Bid  $778.20  $ 27,237.00  $664.99  $  23,274.65  $ 786.25  $ 27,518.75  $865.40  $ 30,289.00  $ 950.00 

DC Power Cable, Part No. OPC-344, Standard Item
for IC-A110

Mounting Bracket Kit, Part No. V8000MMB Standard Item
for IC-A110

Speaker, External, Part No. SP-5,
Optional Item for IC-A110
K220C,
Optional Item for IC-A110
A6 Service Manual, Book Format, Part No. 97714915
A6 Service Manual, CDROM Format, Part No. 94414904
A110 Service Manual, Book Format, Part No. 97713330

0  $54,076.94  $ 54,365.50  $58,269.50  $64,126.82 

1 CBL, C/H Flex Assy (Dash 1 EACH  $   21.00 -37.5  $      13.13  $  16.20 0  $        16.20  $  15.00 -3  $         14.55  $   12.00 0  $        12.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
2 Battery 1 EACH  $   84.00 -37.5  $      52.50  $  30.59 0  $        30.59  $  45.00 -3  $         43.65  $   21.00 0  $        21.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
3 Astro RF Board VHF 1 EACH  $ 886.20 -37.5  $    553.88  $651.24 0  $      651.24  $579.60 -3  $       562.21  $ 725.00 0  $      725.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
4 UHF Vocon Board 1 EACH  $ 861.00 -37.5  $    538.13  $        -   0  No Bid  $651.00 -3  $       631.47  $ 780.00 0  $      780.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
6 Microphone 1 EACH  $   38.50 -37.5  $      24.06  $  25.11 0  $        25.11  $  23.25 -3  $         22.55  $   30.00 0  $        30.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
7 Hybrid Mode Predriver 1 EACH  $ 232.05 -37.5  $    145.03  $180.30 0  $      180.30  $166.95 -3  $       161.94  $ 195.00 0  $      195.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
9 Mount and Cable, 3/4", 1 EACH  $   15.50 -37.5  $        9.69  $  10.80 0  $        10.80  $  11.00 -3  $         10.67  $   15.00 0  $        15.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18
10 Antenna Kit 1 EACH  $   48.50 -37.5  $      30.31  $  33.48 0  $        33.48  $  34.00 -3  $         32.98  $   42.00 0  $        42.00 0 0 No Bid 0 -18

 $1,366.72  $     947.72  $   1,480.03  $  1,820.00 0

1 Exchange Module XTS3000 UHF, Range 2 Board 1 Each  $ 772.80 -37.5  $    483.00  $589.33 0  $      589.33  $245.00 -2.7  $       238.39  $ 680.00 0  $      680.00 0 0 0 0 -18
2 Vocon UHF Board for the XTS 5000 1 Each  $ 866.00 -37.5  $    541.25  $        -   0  No Bid  $405.00 -2.7  $       394.07  $ 850.00 0  $      850.00 0 0 0 0 -18
3 RF Board UHF, XTS 5000 1 Each  $ 488.00 -37.5  $    305.00  $376.65 0  $      376.65  $305.00 -2.7  $       296.77  $ 435.00 0  $      435.00 0 0 0 0 -18

 $1,329.25  $     965.98  $      929.22  $  1,965.00 0

 $      155.52 $        - 
Sub-Total:

 $      103.11 

Item #30 - Motorola Price and Availability List, Effective August 4, 2007 or latest edition, for any quantity as needed per specifications. Total Estimated Expenditures $5,556,723.25

Sub-Total:
Item #31 - Motorola Price and Availability List, Exchange Program, Effective August 4, 2007 or latest edition, for any quantity as needed per specifications.

Sub-Total:

$   35.00 $              -  $   33.00 $      105.00  $  34.37 No Bid $  51.84 29 3 EACH 0

 $  34.37  $      103.11 $   31.50 $        94.50  $   33.00 $              - $  51.84  $      155.52 28 3 EACH 0 No Bid $        - 

 $   35.00 $   1,225.00  $  39.93 $   35.00 $       855.75  $   1,397.55  $      952.35 $  24.45 No Bid $  27.21 27 35 EACH 0

 $  48.40  $   1,694.00 $   49.00 $   1,715.00  $   48.00 $    1,204.00 $  38.23  $   1,338.05 26 35 EACH 0 No Bid $  34.40 

 $ 122.00 $   2,760.00  $118.40 $ 120.00 $    1,974.55  $   2,723.20 $  85.85 No Bid $  95.25 25 23 EACH 0
 $    2.80  $        28.00 $    1.45 $         14.50 $    2.00 $        20.00  $    3.00 

 $    4.00 $        30.00  $    4.29 $    3.00 $         19.90  $        42.90  $        29.90 $    1.99 No Bid $    2.99 23 10 EACH 0

 $  23.32  $      233.20 $   24.00 $      240.00  $   25.00 $       167.50 $  18.79  $      187.90 22 10 EACH 0 No Bid $  16.75 

 $   11.00 $      115.00  $  11.15 $   11.50 $         75.50  $      111.50  $        84.20 $    7.55 No Bid $    8.42 21 10 EACH 0

 $  35.00  $   1,225.00 $   35.00 $   1,225.00  $   35.00 $       846.65 $  27.21  $      952.35 20 35 EACH 0 No Bid $  24.19 

Fuse, Part No. 5210000070; Standard Item from IC-A110p p
A110

A110 Service Manual, CDROM Format, Part No. 94413329

$    1.99  $        19.90 
 $   2,190.75 

Hand Microphone, Part No. HM-161, Standard Item for IC-
A110

Microphone Hanger Kit, Part No.6910004210 Standard Item 
for IC-A110

No Bid0EACH1024
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1

Should you be awarded ALL ITEMS you bid, what percent 
additional discount (if any) would be deducted from each item 
bid? 1 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0.1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

0 0 0 0 0

1

For any item listed in this Award what additional discount, if 
any, would you give for items picked up at your location by 
the City? 1 Each 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0.1 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0 0

0 0 0 0 0

Non-Responsible:  Did Not
Provide Price List 

CITY'S OPTION:

Sub-Total:

CITY PICK UP OPTION:

Sub-Total:

Motorola:  1 thru 11: Motorola, Inc is the manufacturer responding to this bid. We will have an online parts catalogue available to the City of Houston to enter its own parts orders at the designated parts discounts along 
direct delivery to the specified City location. Motorola direct is the nly one allowed to delivery directly from our Motorola parts facility to a customer location. Motorola does not offer additional discounts for being awarded
products (only a small amount of the contract) and parts will be delivered directly to the City so they will not need to picked up and incur an additional cost to the City.

$                                 55,990.64  $                           $                                 2,695.97Grand Total: $                                   56,774.74 $                                 62,054.50  $                                 64,126.82
Non-Responsible:  Did Not

Provide Price List 
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0
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