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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

Copy Paper and Miscellaneous Paper Products

for

ARA, HAS, City Secretary, Controller, Council, Courts, Finance, Fire, GSD, Health, HEC, Housing, HR, IT, Legal, Library, Mayor, Parks, Planning, Police, Public Works, Solid Waste
S22834 - Close Date: 4/7/2011 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 5

Office Effects
713-957-4700

110157

Unisource worldwide
713-744-5643

109903

Olmsted-kirk paper co.

7138681531
116206

Rita's Tape Media LLC., CompuPro

Global

713-934-9633

123394

Officemax Inc
713-849-8600

132491

Item
H

Description

Qty U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Group I, Letter size recycled and virgin cop

paper

10002303; PAPER, RECYCLED BOND #4
8-1/2 X 11 WHITE; 20lb, 92 brightness

392,390 RM

$4.01

$1,573,483.90

$3.07

$1,204,637.30

$3.41

$1,338,049.90

$3.33

$1,305,089.14

$3.17

$1,243,876.30

10039551 ; PAPER, RECYCLED BOND,
PULP, 8-1/2" X 11"; Pallet of 40 cases,
20Ilb, 92 brightness

219( PAL

$1,604.80

$351,451.20

$1,209.00

$264,771.00

$1,364.00

$298,716.00

$1,264.86

$277,003.68

$1,169.00

$256,011.00

10039529; BOND, RECYCLED 8-1/2" X
11", NO. 4, 20LB; Truckload pricing per
pallet of 40 cases, 20Ib, 92 brightness
(ordered 21 pallets at a time)

861] PAL

$0.00

No Bid

$1,148.00

$988,428.00

$1,334.00

$1,148,574.00

$1,198.98

$1,032,321.78

$1,169.00

$1,006,509.00

4

10018944 ; PAPER, BOND NO 1 &-
1/2X11 NO 4 SULPHITE; Each = one
ream, 92 brightness, 20lb

94,399 EA

$0.00

No Bid

$2.80

$264,317.20

10

$3.06

$288,860.94

11

$2.99

$282,064.21

12

$2.98

$281,309.02

13

Sub-Total:

$1,924,935.10

$2,722,153.50

$3,074,200.84

$2,896,478.82

$2,787,705.32

Group 11, Virgin White Paper

1

10011587; PAPER, BOND 8-1/2 X 11 IN
WHITE SUB 24; Virgin Pulp

1,200 RM

$0.00

No Bid

$3.40

$4,080.00

14

$3.82

$4,584.00

15

$4.51

$5,406.00

16

$4.65

$5,580.00

17

T10011617; PAPER, COPIER 8-172 X 11
IN BRIGHT WHITE; Virgin Pulp, 32Ib, 92
brightness

7,860 RM

$3.42

$26,881.20

18

$2.88

$22,636.80

19

$6.67

$52,426.20

20

$8.51

$66,849.30

21

$3.88

$30,496.80

22

T0011616; PAPER, BOND NO 4, 11" X
17" 20 LBS WHITE; Virgin Pulp, Dual
Purpose

2,510 RM

$0.00

No Bid

$6.20

$15,562.00

23

$6.67

$16,741.70

24

$6.59

$16,538.39

25

$7.74

$19,427.40

26

T0011619; PAPER, COPIER 1T X 17 TN
BRIGHT WHITE; Virgin Pulp, 32Ib,
Minimum Brightness 98

1,591 RM

$0.00

No Bid

$22.19

$35,304.29

27

$13.33

$21,208.03

28

$16.90

$26,879.95

21

$14.00

$22,274.00

29

10002504 ; PAPER, BOND RECY NO 4 &-
1/2X14 WHITE LON; 20lb, Brightness
target 92 or better

20,474 RM

$5.40

$110,559.60

30

$4.30

$88,038.20

31

$5.06

$103,598.44

32

$4.57

$93,525.23

25

$5.22

$106,874.28

33

10011600; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
IN WHT PUNCHED; Pre-drilled 3 hole
virgin paper, 20lb, 92 brightness

5,196] RM

$3.89

$20,212.44

34

$3.03

$15,743.88

35

$3.26

$16,938.96

36

$3.36

$17,448.17

25

$3.88

$20,160.48

37

TO0011607T; PAPER, COPIER 8-17Z2 X 11
IN PHOTOWHITE; 28lb Virgin Pulp Photo-|
White

4,063 RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.14

$29,009.82

38

$7.00

$28,441.00

39

$7.46

$30,322.17

40

$8.47

$34,413.61

41

1UUL10U/7, CARD STUCLNKN, o-172 A11
HIGH GLOSS 1 SIDE; Reference Xerox
3R11793, Color supreme, high gloss
coated one-sided cover, mirror finish,
250 sheets = ream

103| RM

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$15.00

$1,545.00

42

$0.00

No Bid

43

$0.00

No Bid

10006270; PAPER, COPY WHITE GLOSS

8-1/2" X 11"; virgin, text-coated 32lb

124 RM

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$8.32

$1,031.18

44

$10.18

$1,262.32

45
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Bids Received: 5 Rita's Tape Media LLC., CompuPro
Office Effects Unisource worldwide Olmsted-kirk paper co. Global Officemax Inc
713-957-4700 713-744-5643 7138681531 713-934-9633 713-849-8600
110157 109903 116206 123394 132491
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
H Description Qty U/M | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
10011618; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 14
IN BRIGHT WHITE; Virgin Pulp 28Lb, 92
10|brightness 1,046] RM $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $8.90 $9,309.40( 46 $9.45 $9,887.84| 44 $11.17 $11,683.82| 47
100252 79; PAPER, COPY 8-1/2X11
28/70 ACID FREE; Ref Hammermill
11]10246-7, each = one ream 1,825| EA $8.40 $15,330.00( 48 $0.00 No Bid $7.00 $12,775.00| 49 $7.46 $13,619.98| 44 $8.94 $16,315.50| 50
10025282; PAPER, COPY, 11X17 28770
ACID FREE; Reference Hammermill
12|10254-1, each = one ream 150| EA $16.59 $2,488.50| 51 $0.00 No Bid $14.00 $2,100.00f 52 $14.80 $2,220.00( 44 $17.67 $2,650.50| 53
10018950; PAPER, BOND 25% COTTON
13|8-1/2X11 24LB WHI; 3,350| EA $0.00 No Bid $10.10 $33,835.00| 54 $9.34 $31,289.00| 55 $13.59 $45,523.15| 56 $14.20 $47,570.00| 57
10039988; PAPER, VIRGIN PULP, BOND,
DUAL PURPOSE,; Pallet of 30 cases, 8
14|1/2 x 14 paper, 20lb, 92 brightness 95| PAL $0.00 No Bid $1,050.00 $99,750.00| 58 $1,243.50 $118,132.50| 59 $1,196.33 $113,651.35| 25 $816.30 $77,548.50| 60
Sub-Total: $175,471.74 $343,959.99 $419,089.23 $442,902.70 $396,257.21
Group 111, Recycled Copy Paper
10002307; PAPER, BOND NO 4 20LB
1|DUAL 11X17 WHITE; Recycled, 20Ib 2,175 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.65 $14,463.75| 61 $7.95 $17,291.25| 62 $7.12 $15,477.30| 63 $8.19 $17,813.25| 64
10011614; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 14
IN WHITE; Recycled, 20Ib, Brightness
2192 16,818 RM $4.97 $83,585.46( 65 $4.30 $72,317.40( 66 $5.06 $85,099.08| 32 $4.57 $76,824.62| 67 $5.22 $87,789.96| 68
10025597; PAPER, XEROGRAPH,
RECYCLED,8.5"x11",20LB; Recycled,
3|20Ib 3 hole punched 6,870 RM $5.02 $34,487.40| 69 $3.38 $23,220.60| 70 $0.00 No Bid $3.65 $25,096.11| 67 $4.10 $28,167.00|] 71
10025614;
PAPER,XEROGRAPHIC,RECYCLED,11"x1
7",70LB; Recycled, offset-woven finish,
4|Product Reference Williamsburg Collage 2,680 RM $0.00 No Bid $15.25 $40,870.00| 72 $0.00 No Bid $22.45 $60,174.04| 73 $0.00 No Bid
10039987; PAPER, RECYCLED BOND,
DUAL PURPOSE 11"X; Pallet of 40 cases
5[(200 reams) 11x17, 20lb, 92 brightness 61| PAL $0.00 No Bid $1,320.00 $80,520.00| 74 $1,590.00 $96,990.00( 62 $1,399.65 $85,378.83| 75 $1,638.64 $99,957.04| 76
Sub-Total: $118,072.86 $231,391.75 $199,380.33 $262,950.91 $233,727.25
Group 1V Color Paper
10016954 ; PAPER, BOND NO 4 20LB
DUAL 8-1/2X11 BUFF; Color: Buff, each
1|= one ream 2,450 EA $4.84 $11,858.00( 77 $3.90 $9,555.00| 78 $3.59 $8,795.50| 79 $3.98 $9,748.55| 16 $4.15 $10,167.50| 80
10002305; PAPER, BOND NO 4 20LB 8-
2|1/2"X11" YELLOW; Color: Canary, 20lb 34,455 RM $4.84 $166,762.20] 81 $3.90 $134,374.50| 82 $3.59 $123,693.45| 83 $3.98 $137,096.45| 16 $4.15 $142,988.25| 84
10011586; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 14
3|IN CANARY; Color: Canary, 20lb 1,871 RM $6.49 $12,142.79| 85 $5.28 $9,878.88| 86 $4.81 $8,999.51| 87 $3.98 $7,444.71| 16 $5.27 $9,860.17| 88
10011615; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
4{IN GREY; Color:Grey, 20lb 2,644 RM $4.84 $12,796.96| 89 $3.90 $10,311.60| 90 $3.59 $9,491.96| 91 $3.98 $10,520.48| 16 $4.15 $10,972.60| 92
10011589; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
5/IN GREEN; Color: Green, 20Ib 4,704 RM $4.84 $22,767.36[ 93 $3.90 $18,345.60| 94 $3.59 $16,887.36 95 $3.98 $18,717.22| 16 $4.15 $19,521.60| 96
10018965; PAPER, BOND NO 4 20LB 8-
6|1/2X11"; Color: lvory, each = 1 ream 1,460 EA $4.84 $7,066.40| 97 $3.90 $5,694.00| 98 $3.59 $5,241.40| 99 $3.98 $5,809.34| 16 $4.15 $6,059.00| 100
10011588; PAPER, BOND LILAC 8-1/2" x
7]11"; Color: Orchid, 20Ilb 1,271 RM $4.84 $6,151.64| 101 $3.90 $4,956.90( 102 $3.59 $4,562.89( 103 $3.98 $5,057.31f 16 $4.15 $5,274.65| 104
10011592; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
8|IN PINK; Color: Pink, 20lb 2,411 RM $4.84 $11,669.24| 105 $3.90 $9,402.90[ 106 $3.59 $8,655.49( 107 $3.98 $9,593.37 16 $4.15 $10,005.65| 108
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Bids Received: 5 Rita's Tape Media LLC., CompuPro
Office Effects Unisource worldwide Olmsted-kirk paper co. Global Officemax Inc
713-957-4700 713-744-5643 7138681531 713-934-9633 713-849-8600
110157 109903 116206 123394 132491
Item Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
H Description Qty U/M | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
10005726; PAPER, BOND NO 4 20LB
9|DUAL 8-1/2X14 PINK; Color: Pink 550 RM $6.51 $3,580.50| 109 $5.28 $2,904.00] 110 $4.81 $2,645.50] 111 $3.98 $2,188.45| 16 $5.27 $2,898.50| 112
10011585; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
10|IN SALMON; Color: Salmon, 20Ib 4,234 RM $4.84 $20,492.56| 113 $3.90 $16,512.60| 114 $3.59 $15,200.06| 115 $3.98 $16,847.09] 16 $4.15 $17,571.10| 116
10011606; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
11|IN TAN; Color:Tan, 20Ib 3,015| RM $4.84 $14,592.60| 117 $3.90 $11,758.50 $3.59 $10,823.85| 118 $3.98 $11,996.69| 16 $4.15 $12,512.25| 119
10011593; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2" X 11"
12|BLUE, 20 LB.; Color Blue 11,605 RM $4.84 $56,168.20| 120 $3.90 $45,259.50| 121 $3.59 $41,661.95| 122 $3.98 $46,176.30| 16 $4.15 $48,160.75| 123
10005727; PAPER, BOND NO 4 20LB
13|DUAL 8-1/2X14 BLUE; Color: Blue 1,800 RM $6.51 $11,718.00| 124 $5.28 $9,504.00] 125 $4.81 $8,658.00] 126 $5.03 $9,057.60| 16 $5.27 $9,486.00| 127
10005814 ; PAPER, BONG NO 4 20LB
14|DUAL 8-1/2X14 GROD; Color: Goldenrod 2,450 RM $0.00 No Bid $5.28 $12,936.00| 128 $4.81 $11,784.50| 129 $5.03 $12,328.40| 16 $4.15 $10,167.50( 130
10005728; PAPER, BOND NO4 20LB
15|DUAL 8-1/2X14 GREEN; Color: Green 900 RM $6.51 $5,859.00| 131 $5.28 $4,752.00] 132 $4.81 $4,329.00] 133 $5.03 $4,528.80| 16 $5.27 $4,743.00| 134
10011596; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
TERRA GREEN; 60Ilb, Terra Green,
16|product reference WAU 858A 405| RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $2,531.25| 135 $6.23 $2,523.15| 136 $6.84 $2,771.01| 137 $10.10 $4,090.50| 138
10011593; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2" X 11"
17|BLUE, 20 LB.; Blue 993| RM $0.00 No Bid $4.91 $4,875.63] 139 $3.59 $3,564.87| 122 $3.98 $3,951.15| 16 $4.15 $4,120.95| 123
10032464 ; PAPER, 8 1727 X 11 ULTRA
SMOOTH LEMON, 2; 20Ib, Ultra Lemon
18| Smooth, Mohawk Brue Hue or similar 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 140 $5.08 $762.00| 141 $7.19 $1,078.35] 142 $6.15 $922.50| 143
10032504 ; PAPER, 8 1/27 X 11, SEMI-
VELLUM, YELLOW; 60lb, Yellow semi-
19|vellum, Mohawk Brite Hue or similar 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 144 $6.23 $934.50| 145 $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $14.21 $2,131.50| 146
10032495; PAPER,s 1/2™ X 11,5EMI-
VELLUM,SUN YELLOW; Sun Yellow Semi-
20]Vellum 60lb 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 147 $6.23 $934.50| 148 $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $10.10 $1,515.00| 149
10032505; PAPER, 8 1727 X 11, SEMI-
VELLUM, GOLD; Gold, Mohawk Brite Hue
21]or similar, 60lb 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 150 $6.23 $934.50| 151 $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $14.21 $2,131.50| 146
10052496; PAPER, 8 1/27 X 11, SEMI-
VELLUM, ORANGE; Orange, Sem-Vellum
22]60Ib 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 152 $6.23 $934.50| 153 $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $14.21 $2,131.50| 154
10032506; PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11, SEMI-
23|VELLUM, BLUE; Blue semi-vellum 60Ib 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 155 $6.23 $934.50| 156 $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $10.10 $1,515.00| 157
TO032497; PAPER,B 172 XIT,SENMT-
VELLUM,MEADOW GREEN; Meadow
Green Semi-Vellum, Mohawk Britehue or
24|similar, 65Ib 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 158 $6.17 $925.50| 159 $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $10.10 $1,515.00| 138
10032503; PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11 ULTRA
SMOOTH ORANGE; Ultra Orange Smooth
25]20lb, Mohawk Britehue or similar 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 160 $5.08 $762.00| 161 $7.19 $1,078.35] 142 $6.15 $922.50| 162
10032494 ; PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11 ULTRA
SMOOTH LIME; Ultra Lime Smooth,
26|20lb, Mohawk Britehue or similar 150( RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 163 $5.08 $762.00| 164 $7.19 $1,078.35| 142 $6.15 $922.50| 165
10032507; PAPER,8 1/2™ X 11,S5EMI-
VELLUM,ULTRA LAVA; Ultra lava semi-
27|vellum 60lb text 150 RM $0.00 No Bid $6.25 $937.50| 166 $0.00 No Bid $6.84 $1,026.30] 137 $14.21 $2,131.50| 167
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Bids Received: 5

Office Effects
713-957-4700

110157

Unisource worldwide
713-744-5643

109903

Olmsted-kirk paper co.
7138681531
116206

Rita's Tape Media LLC., CompuPro

Global

713-934-9633

123394

Officemax Inc
713-849-8600

132491

Item

Description

Qty

Uus/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

28

TOU32498; PAPER, 8 172" X 11, COVER,
ULTRA LEMON; Ultra Lemon Smooth,
65lb, Mohawk Britehue or similar, one
ream = 250 sheets

150

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$6.96

$1,044.00

168

$6.17

$925.50

169

$6.78

$1,016.85

137

$10.10

$1,515.00

149

29

10032499, PAPER, 8 1/27 X 11, COVER,
YELLOW; Yellow Semi-Vellum, 65lb
cover, one ream = 250 sheets

150

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$6.96

$1,044.00

170

$6.17

$925.50

171

$6.78

$1,016.85

137

$7.10

$1,065.00

146

30

10032510; PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11, COVER,
SUN YELLOW; Sun Yellow Semi-Vellum
65Ilb cover, one ream = 250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

172

$6.17

$185.10

173

$6.78

$203.37

137

$5.05

$151.50

149

31

10032511; PAPER, 68 1/27 X 11, COVER,
GOLD; Gold Semi-vellum 65Ilb cover
stock, one ream =250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

174

$6.17

$185.10

175

$6.78

$203.37

137

$7.10

$213.00

146

32

T0032512; PAPER, 8 172" X 11, COVER,
ORANGE; Orange Semi-Vellum 65Ib
cover, one ream = 250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

176

$6.17

$185.10

177

$6.78

$203.37

137

$7.10

$213.00

154

33

10032513; PAPER, 8 1/27 X 11, COVER,
BLUE; Blue Semi-Vellum 65 cover stock,
one ream = 250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

178

$6.17

$185.10

179

$6.78

$203.37

137

$5.05

$151.50

157

34

TOU3Z2514; PAPER, 8 172" X 11, COVER,
MEADOW GREEN; Meadow Green Semi-
Vellum 65Ib cover, one ream = 250
sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

180

$6.17

$185.10

181

$6.78

$203.37

137

$5.05

$151.50

138

35

T10032515; PAPER, 8 172" X 11, COVER,
ULTRA ORANGE; Ultra Orange 65Ib
cover, one ream = 250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

176

$6.17

$185.10

182

$6.78

$203.37

137

$7.10

$213.00

154

36

10032516; PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11, COVER,
ULTRA LIME; Ultra Lime-Semi Vellum 65
Ib cover, one ream = 250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

183

$6.17

$185.10

184

$6.78

$203.37

137

$7.10

$213.00

185

37

10032517; PAPER, 8 1/2" X 11, COVER,
ULTRA LAVA; Ultra Lava semi-vellum
65lb cover, one ream = 250 sheets

30

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$238.80

186

$0.00

No Bid

$6.78

$203.37

137

$7.10

$213.00

187

38

10011604; PAPER, COPIER 8-1/2 X 11
IN PEACH; Color: Peach, 20Ilb

75

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$3.90

$292.50

188

$0.00

No Bid

$3.98

$298.43

16

$0.00

No Bid

39

TOUI1599, CARD STOCK, 8-172" X 11
65# BRIGHT RED; 65Ilb Bright Red
Cardstock, one ream = 250 sheets,
virgin, #1 offset

57

RM

$0.00

No Bid

$7.96

$453.72

189

$6.17

$351.69

190

$6.78

$386.40

137

$7.10

$404.70

191

Sub-Total:

$363,625.45

$327,672.48

$298,900.83

$328,597.53

$348,942.67

Group V Card Stock & Cover

TOUI8662; CARD, INDEX STOCK 8-
1/2"x 11" BUFF NO 4; 110Lb , product
reference Springhill Index, 250 sheets
pkg

1,531

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$6.10

$9,339.10

192

$5.25

$8,037.75

193

$5.73

$8,771.10

194

$5.45

$8,343.95

195

TOUIB8663; CARD, INDEX STOCK 8-172
X 11 CANARY NO 4; 110Ib, product
reference Springhill Index Plus, color
canary, 250 sheets pkg

2,021

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$6.10

$12,328.10

196

$5.25

$10,610.25

197

$5.73

$11,578.31

194

$5.45

$11,014.45

198
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Bids Received: 5 Rita's Tape Media LLC., CompuPro
Office Effects Unisource worldwide Olmsted-kirk paper co. Global Officemax Inc
713-957-4700 713-744-5643 7138681531 713-934-9633 713-849-8600
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10018670; CARD, 8-1/2X11IN WHT
2PLY 50% RECY FIBER; 110Ib 2 ply
3|Index card stock, white, 250 sheets pkg 7,741 EA $0.00 No Bid $5.85 $45,284.85| 199 $5.46 $42,265.86| 200 $5.73 $44,348.19| 194 $0.00 No Bid
1001151 7; CARD STOCK, s8-1/2" X11"
65# BRIGHT WHITE; 65Ib, white, 250
4|sheets/pkg 308| PAC $0.00 No Bid $5.10 $1,570.80| 201 $4.38 $1,349.04| 202 $4.82 $1,484.87| 203 $5.05 $1,555.40| 204
Sub-Total: $0.00 $68,522.85 $62,262.90 $66,182.47 $20,913.80
Group VI, Miscellaneous Paper Products
10025289;
SHEETS,STEEL,COLDROLLED18GA,48"x
1{120",2; 30", 40Ib roll 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid| 43 $0.00 No Bid
100169356; CHIPBOARD, 8-/12 IN X 11
IN X .022 ROCK; 960 pcs bundle,
2|product reference: Rock-Tenn 155 EA $0.00 No Bid $28.00 $4,340.00| 205 $27.75 $4,301.25| 206 $24.94 $3,865.24| 207 $0.00 No Bid
10018937; CHIPBOARD, 8-/12 IN X 14
3|IN X .022 ROCK; 757 pcs bundle 35| EA $0.00 No Bid $28.00 $980.00| 208 $27.75 $971.25( 209 $24.94 $872.80( 207 $0.00 No Bid
10018938; CHIPBOARD, 11 IN X 17 IN
4[X .022 ROCK; 481 pcs bundle 25| EA $0.00 No Bid $27.50 $687.50| 210 $27.75 $693.75| 211 $24.94 $623.43| 207 $0.00 No Bid
10025613; BOX,CARDBOARD 17-
1/2"x11-1/4"x10-3/4",25; 17 1/2" x 11
5[1/4" x 10 3/4", 25 boxes a case 260| BOX $0.00 No Bid $17.50 $4,550.00| 212 $0.00 No Bid $9.66 $2,512.38| 213 $23.95 $6,227.00| 214
10035969; PAPER, PERFORATED,
WHITE, 8-1/2 X 11; perforated 3 5/8 up
6|from bottom of page 8,200| RM $0.00 No Bid $6.00 $49,200.00| 215 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $4.40 $36,080.00| 216
10035990; PAPER, PERFORATED,
CANARY, 8-1/2 X 11; perforated 3 5/8
7|up from bottom of page 1,540| RM $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
10035991 ; PAPER, PERFORATED, PINK,
8-1/2 X 11; perforated 3 5/8 up from
8|bottom of page 325 RM $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
10018974 ; PAPER, CARBONLESS 8-
9|1/2X11 2 PART REVERS; each = ream 4,000 EA $0.00 No Bid $5.95 $23,800.00| 217 $6.10 $24,400.00| 218 $10.47 $41,896.00| 219 $20.24 $80,960.00| 220
10018978; PAPER, CABONLESS 8-
10[{1/2X11 3 PART PINK; each = ream 4,000| EA $0.00 No Bid $6.40 $25,600.00| 221 $6.85 $27,400.00| 222 $12.13 $48,504.00( 219 $70.39 $281,560.00| 223
10018981; PAPER, CARBONLESS 8-
11{1/2X14 4 PART GOLDNE; each = ream 4,000 EA $0.00 No Bid $8.50 $34,000.00| 224 $9.31 $37,240.00| 225 $16.55 $66,188.00( 219 $119.50 $478,000.00| 226
10018672; CARD, INDEX STOCK 22-1/2
12|X 35 WHITE; 110#, ream of 250 250| EA $0.00 No Bid $46.00 $11,500.00| 227 $46.50 $11,625.00f 228 $49.30 $12,323.75| 194 $0.00 No Bid
Sub-Total: $0.00 $154,657.50 $106,631.25 $176,785.59 $882,827.00
Grand Total: $2,582,105.15 $3,848,358.07 $4,160,465.38 $4,173,898.00 $4,670,373.25

Items marked above with a Mfg Note number have the following equivalent Manufacturer's Name, Product Name, and Product Number:

1: Willcopy 651001
2: GP Spectrum recycled 30% 999916

3: 20T IP-Great White 3490.053150 subject to availability

4: GP SPECTRUM
5: Boise Aspen 30% Recycled P1054901

6: Same as above

7: 20T-IP Great White 3490.053150 subject to availability

8: Boise Aspen 30% Recycled P1054901SKD
9: 20T IP Great White 3490.053150 subject to availability
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10: GP Econosource bond 22108192

11: 20T Tidal IP 3490.041220

12: LASERX

13: BOISE X-9 COPY PAPER P10X9001

14: GP Spectrum 999707

15: Suzanno Report 6417.851124

16: IP HAMMERMILL FORE

17: BOISE CASCADE XEROGRAPHIC PAPER P1CC2241
18: Universal 9520

19: GP Econosource 22108192

20: IP Hammermill Laser 3490.058360
21: HAMMERMILL COLOR COPY
22: BOISE CASCADE MULTIPURPOSE P1MP1050

23: GP Econosource 2218300

24: Suzanno Report 6417.851720

25: GP VECTOR

26: BOISE CASCADE X9000 COPY PAPER 11X17 P10X9007

27: Domtar Cougar 687000

28: IP Hammermill Laser 3490.058370

29: BOISE CASCADE 11X17 LASER PAPER 32LB P1BPL0O219
30: Willcopy 654001

31: GP Spectrum recycled 999918

32: Wausau Exact Eco 7199.032519

33: BOISE CASCADE CASCADE ASPEN RECYC PAPER P1054904
34: Willcopy 851031

35: GP Econosource 307358

36: IP Tidal 3490.041250
37: BOISE CASCADE PPR X-9 20# 8.5X11 3HP P10X9001P
38: Domtar Cougar 2826
39: IP - Hammermill Color Copy 3490.039100
40: HAMMERMILL COPY PAPER
41: BOISE CASCADE 8.5X11 COLOR COPY PAPER P1BCP2811
42: 10 pt. Mohawk Kromekote Laser Gloss 4488.017921

43: NEED ADDITIONAL INFORMATION ON THIS ITEM

44: HAMMERMILL COLOR COPY PAPER

45: BOISE CASCADE LSR GLSY #32 8.5X11 P1GLP3211
46: IP Hammermill Color Copy 3490.059115

47: BOISE CASCADE 28 LB COLOR COPIER PPR P1BCP2814
48: Hammermill 10246-7

49: IP Hammermill 3490.039100 price is per ream

50: BOISE CASCADE OMX COLOR COPIER REAM P10M44125
51: Hammermill 10254-1

52: IP Hammermill 3490.039120 price is per ream

53: BOISE CASCADE 11X17 COLOR COPY PAPER P1BCP2817

54: Neenah Gold Crest 00379

55: Neenah Atlas 4715.154710 price is per ream

56: GILBERT

57: SOUTHWORTH LTR SIZE FINE BUSINESS PAPER P1404C
58: GP Econosource 307259 ( 8.5x14 20#)
59: IP Tidal 3490.041230

61: GP Spectrum 999919
62: Wausau Exact Eco 7199.032517

63: GP /VECTOR/SPECTRUM

60: BOISE CASCADE X-9 COPY PAPER 8.5X11" RM WE P10X9001
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64: BOISE 11X17 BOISE ASPEN RECYC P1054907
65: Willcopy 854001

66: GP Spectrum 999918
67: GP/ VECTOR/SPECTRUM
68: BOISE CASCADE ASPEN RECYC PAPER P1054904

69: Willcopy 651031

70: GP Spectrum 999917
71: BOISE ASPEN 30 -HP 8.5X11" REAM P1054901P
72: Domtar Cougar 2828

73: IP/WILLIAMSBURG

74: GP Spectrum 999919 (11x17 20#)

75: GP/VECTOR/SPECTRUM

76: BOISE PPR,ASPEN, 17" SKD P1054907SKD
77: Universal 11206

78: Domtar Colors 81204

79: IP Fore MP 3490.008825 price is per ream

81: Universal 11201

82: Domtar Colors 81196
83: IP Fore MP 3490.008830

80: BOISE MP COLORS 8.5X11 BUFF P1IMP2201BF

84: BOISE CASCADE COPY PAPER P1MP2201CY
85: Universal 11221

86: Domtar Colors 81098

87: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.010130
88: BOISE P1-MP2204-CY LEGAL P1MP2204CY
89: Universal 11209

90: Domtar Colors 81195

91: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.008890
92: BOISE CASCADE COPY PAPER P1MP2201GY
93: universal 11203

94: Domtar Colors 81197

95: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.008840
96: BOISE CASCADE COPY PAPER P1MP2201GN
97: Universal 11208

98: Domtar Colors 81201
99: IP Fore MP 3490.008850

100: BOISE FRWX FLASHING IVORY 20# REAM P1MP22011Y

101: Universal 11212
102: Domtar Colors 81200

103: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.008855
104: BOISE CASCADE COPY PAPER P1MP22010R

105: Universal 11204
106: Domtar Colors 81198

107: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.008810
108: BOISE FRWX POWDER PINK 20# REAM P1MP2201PK

109: Universal 11224
110: Domtar Colors 81090
111: IP Fore MP 3490.010110

112: BOISE CASCADE MP COLORS LEGAL P1MP2204PK

113: Universal 11210
114: Domtar Colors 81206

115: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.008860
116: BOISE FRWX JAMMIN' SALMON 20# REAM P1MP2201SN

117: Universal 11207
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118: IP Fore MP 20T 3490.008870

119: BOISE CASCADE TAN COPY PAPER P1MP2201TN

120: Universal 11202

121: Domtar Colors 81199
122: IP Fore MP 3490.008820

123: BOISE FRWX BOTTLEROCKET BLUE 20# RM P1MP2201BE
124: Universal 11222

125: Domtar Colors 81091
126: IP Fore MP 3490.010120

127: BOISE FRWX BTLE RKT BLUE 14" 20# RM P1MP2204BE

128: Domtar Colors 81093
129: IP Fore MP 3490.010180

130: BOISE FRWX GOLDEN GLIMMER 20# REAM P1MP2201GRP
131: Universal 11223

132: Domtar Colors 81089
133: IP Fore MP 3490.010140

134: BOISE CASCADE MP COLORS LEGAL P1MP2204GN

135: Domtar Hots Lime 81322

136: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159580
137: ASTROBRIGHT
138: BOISE MULTIP COVER PAPER(GREEN) P1MP2651GN

139: Domtar Opaque 81071

140: Mohawk Brite Hue 104956
141: Wausau Exact Brights 7199.026701

142: MOHAWK

143: BOISE 24 LB 8.5 X 11 BOISEMPBRT P1MP2241LN
144: Domtar Hots Yellow 81305
145: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159530

146: BOISE 65LB 81 2X11 BOISE MP B P1IMP2651BA

147: Domtar Hots Daffodil 81302
148: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159570
149: BOISE FRWX CRACKLN CANARY 65# 250CT P1MP2651CY

150: Domtar Hots Gold 81313

151: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159340
152: Domtar Hots Deep Orange 81356
153: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159450

154: BOISE 65LB 81 2X11 BOISE MP B P1MP2651TE
155: Domtar Hots Blue 81332

156: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159300
157: BOISE MULTIP. COVER PAPER(BLUE) P1MP2651BE
158: Domtar Hots Green 81319
159: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159680
160: Mohawk Britehue orange 102442
161: Wausau Exact Brights 7199.026721

163: Mohawk Brite Hue
164: Wausau Exact Brights 7199.026791
165: BOISE FRWX LIGHTNING LIME 24# REAM P1MP2241LE
166: Domtar Hots orange 81352
167: BOISE 65 LB 8 1 2X11 BOISE MP 8 P1IMP2651RY
168: Domtar Hots lemon 81366
169: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159710
170: Domtar Hots yellow 81363
171: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159830

162: BOISE FRWX COMBUSTIBLE ORANGE 24# REAM P1MP2241TE
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172: Domtar Hots Daffodil 81360
173: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159870
174: Domtar Hots Gold 81368
175: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159670
176: Domtar Hots Orange 81400
177: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159760
178: Domtar Hots Blue 81384
179: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159620
180: Domtar Hots Emerald 81371
181: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159680
182: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159630
183: Domtar Hots Lime 81376
184: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159880

186: Domtar Hots Deep Orange 81402
188: Domtar Colors Peach 20#

189: Domtar Hots Red 81391
190: Wausau Astrobright 7199.159820

185: BOISE 65LB 81 2X11 BOISE MP B P1IMP2651LE

187: BOISE 65LB 81 2X11 BOISE MP B P1IMP2651RY

191: BOISE 65 LB 8 1 2X11 BOISE MP 8 P1IMP2651RY

192: Domtar Index 81059
193: IP Springhill 3490.132430
194: IP SPRINGHILL

195: BOISE FIREWORX 110# INDEX 1Y 8.5X11 P1MP11011Y

196: Domtar Index 81050

197: IP Springhill 3490.132440 per package

198: BOISE FIREWORX 110# INDEX 1Y 8.5X11 P1IMP1101CY

199: Domtar Index 81038

200: Wausau Exact 30% Recy 7199.158871 per package

201: Starbrite U21772

203: IP ACCENT

202: IP Accent Opaque 3490.016360 per package

204: BOISEFRWX DYNAMITE WHITE 65# 250CT P1MP2651BW

205: Bocks Board 10209682 bundle

207: ATVANTAGE
208: Bocks Board 10221650 bundle

210: Bocks Board 10207678 bundle

213: VICTORY PACKAGE

206: Manchester OKCO Chipboard 4282.146210

209: Manchester OKCO Chipboard 4282.146215

211: Manchester OKCO Chipboard 4282.146217
212: Tharco 25 per bundle priced per bundle

214: BOISE CRRUGTD BOX BRN 17.25X11.25X10 N9171110

215: Enterprise 24# standard perfed paper

216: ENTERPRISE CUSTOM LASER SHEETS P10M98178

217: NCR 5887
218: Appleton Superior 0470.005887
219: GLADFELTER

220: BOISE PAPER CARBONLESS 2-PT WHT CAN P13R12420

221: NCR 5909
222: Appleton Superior 0470.005900

224: NCR 5917
225: Appleton Superior 0470.005917

223: BOISE PPRCRBNLSS3PART8.5X11 P13R12426
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226: BOISE PAPER 4-PART CARBONLESS P13R12430

227: Domtar Index 81106
228: IP Springhill 3490.132360
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