
Percent Mfg Percent Mfg Percent Mfg Percent Mfg
Change Note Change Note Change Note Change Note

1 Fire American Lever Drain 1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $96.37 -13 $83.84 2 $102.18 0 $102.18 4
2 Fire American Seat B-62-B Old 

Style
1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $143.28 -13 $124.65 2 $160.79 0 $160.79 4

3 Fire American Kit Repair 1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $145.82 -13 $126.86 2 $98.36 0 $98.36 4
4 Fire American Nozzle Hose Old 

Style
1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $58.33 -13 $50.75 2 $65.46 0 $65.46 4

$0.00 $0.00 $386.11 $426.79 

1 Hydrant Wrench Fire Seat Removal 1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $130.60 -13 $113.62 $204.91 0 $204.91 6

2 Valve, Amer Darling 1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $50.72 -13 $44.13 $49.58 0 $49.58 6
3 Hydrant, Fire American Nozzle 

Hose Old Style
1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $58.33 -13 $50.75 $65.46 0 $65.46 6

4 Hydrant, Fire American Seat Old 
Style

1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid 1 $138.85 -13 $120.80 $155.82 0 $155.82 6

$0.00 $0.00 $329.30 $475.77 

1 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Nut Operating 1 EA $95.00 0 $95.00 $78.20 0 $78.20 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $94.17 0 $94.17 8

2 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Nut Hold 
Down (improved)

1 EA $36.44 0 $36.44 $28.00 0 $28.00 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $29.92 0 $29.92 8

3 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Valve Plate 1 EA $90.00 0 $90.00 $81.50 0 $81.50 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $90.38 0 $90.38 8
4 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Stem Upper 

New Style
1 EA $86.75 0 $86.75 $68.40 0 $68.40 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $87.24 0 $87.24 8

5 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Extension Kit 
Improved and New Style

1 EA $215.00 0 $215.00 $233.00 0 $233.00 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $221.61 0 $221.61 8

6 Extension Kit 6 in 5-1/4 in Kennedy 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $169.95 0 $169.95 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $191.92 0 $191.92 8

$523.19 $659.05 $0.00 $715.24 

1 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Extension Kit 
12 Hydraflo 1421-12" (still makes 
for the City.

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $268.00 0 $268.00 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $259.91 0 $259.91 9

2 Hydrant, Fire Mueller Seat Ring 
Centurion

1 EA $122.15 0 $122.15 $107.50 0 $107.50 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $119.28 0 $119.28 9

$122.15 $375.50 $0.00 $379.19 

1 Hydrant, Fire Kennedy Repair Kit 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $90.00 0 $90.00 10 $0.00 0 No Bid $95.96 0 $95.96 11
2 Hydrant, Fire Kennedy Plate Upper 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $75.50 0 $75.50 10 $0.00 0 No Bid $38.24 0 $38.24 11

3 Extension Kit 6 in 5-1/4 in Kennedy 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $169.95 0 $169.95 10 $0.00 0 No Bid $191.92 0 $191.92 11

4 Hydrant, Fire Kennedy Valve Main 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $41.00 0 $41.00 10 $0.00 0 No Bid $55.74 0 $55.74 11

$0.00 $376.45 $0.00 $381.86 

1 Extension Kit 6in 5-1/4 in M & H 
Model 129

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $155.50 0 $155.50 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $191.92 0 $191.92 9

2 Dresser M & H Drain Valve No 129 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $87.70 0 $87.70 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $130.51 0 $130.51 9

3 Hydrant, Fire Dresser operating 
lock nut (O-ring Type M&H #8 
Hydraflo 1541

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $47.58 0 $47.58 7 $0.00 0 No Bid $3.43 0 $3.43 9

$0.00 $290.78 $0.00 $325.86 

1 10032665; HYDRANT, FIRE AMER 
LEVER DRAIN HVY DTY; level drain 
B-62B

254 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $83.84 $21,295.36 12 $102.18 $25,953.72 13

2 10032666; HYDRANT, FIRE AMER 
NOZZLE, MANGANESE; hose nozzle 
84-20-3 manganese Amlok

122 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $50.75 $6,191.50 14 $61.84 $7,544.48 15

$0.00 $0.00 $27,486.86 $33,498.20 
$645.34 $1,701.78 $28,202.26 $36,202.91 

Group VII Line Items

Sub-Total:
Grand Total:

V. Discount proposed from Kennedy Price List-9102, dated June, 2004 for K81, K81A, A.W.W.A., ULFM and Guardian Fire or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed, per Specifications. Total estimated expenditure for the 60 month period for Group No. V is $33,506.68. NOTE: Page number fo

Sub-Total:
VI. Discount proposed from Hydraflo Price List 11197 for Stylie 129 Traffic Model dated June 2004 or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed, per Specifications. Total estimated expenditure for the 60 month period for Group No. VI is $50,205.45. NOTE: Page number for referenced sample item(s

Sub-Total:

III. Discount proposed from Hydraflo Form Price List 10397, dated June, 2004 or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed, per Specifications. Total estimated expenditure for the 60 month period for Group No. III is $430,016.34. NOTE: Page number for referenced sample item(s) should be liste

Sub-Total:
IV. Discount proposed from Hydraflo Form Price List 120297 for Centurion Fire Hydrants, dated June 2004 or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed, per Specifications. Total estimated expenditure for the 60 month period for Group No. IV is $45,494.16. NOTE: Page number for referenced sampl

Sub-Total:

I. Discount proposed from American-Darling B-62-B Traffic Model, A-D Price List, dated February 26, 2001 or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed, per Specifications. Total estimated expenditure for the 60 month period for Group No. 1 is $181,000.00. NOTE: Page number for referenced

Sub-Total:
II. Discount proposed from American-Darling B-84-B Traffic Model, A-D Price List, dated January 31, 2005 or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed, per Specifications. Total estimated expenditure for the 60 month period for Group No. II is $168,500.00. NOTE: Page number for reference

Sub-Total:

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M

409-276-1319 713-672-1472
111830

for
Public Works

S23393 - Close Date: 2/25/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 4 FERGUSON WATERWORKS Hydraflo, Inc. Quality Hydrant Co., LLC HD Supply Waterworks
713-433-6098 409-838-3624

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Fire Hydrant Repair Parts


