City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

Ambulance, Pumper and Ladder Truck Replacement Parts
for the
Fire Department

S23402 - Close Date: 10/29/2009 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 2

Pearland Alternator Company, Inc
281-485-8871

Homer J. Wood dba Wood
Alternator & Starter Service

281-448-0445

Percent Mfg Percent
ltem # Description Qty |U/M | Unit Price | Change Line Total Note [ Unit Price | Change Line Total
KEI Alternators
1/10030849; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 270 AMPS INTERNA; Part# 35 EA $472.00 $16,520.00( 1 $648.71 $22,704.85
KJ270LI - new, as per specification or approved equal
2/10030850; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 270 AMPS INTERNA; Part# 35 EA $472.00 $16,520.00| 2 $648.71 $22,704.85
KJ270LII - new, as per specification or approved equal
3/10030852; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 270 AMPS INTERNA; Part# 35 EA $472.00 $16,520.00( 3 $713.71 $24,979.85
KP270I1 - new, as per specification or approved equal
4110030853; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 270 AMPS INTERNA; Part# 35 EA $472.00 $16,520.00| 4 $648.71 $22,704.85
KJ270SI - new, as per specification or approved equal
5/10030854; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 270 AMPS INTERNA; Part# 35 EA $472.00 $16,520.00f 5 $648.71 $22,704.85
KJ270SIIRS - new, as per specification or approved equal
6/10030880; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, MOUNT WIDE 340A; Part# 40| EA $740.00 $29,600.00| 6 $778.70 $31,148.00
KJ340LI - new, as per specification or approved equal
7110030881 ; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY PAD MOUNT BRACKET; Part# | 40| EA $740.00 $29,600.00( 7 $843.70 $33,748.00
KP340I - new, as per specification or approved equal
8/10030858; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 270 AMPS ALTERNA; Part 40| EA $517.00 $20,680.00| 8 $843.70 $33,748.00
#KP270TXRX - new, as per specifications or approved equal
9/10030859; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 340 AMPS ALTERNA; Part 40| EA $517.00 $20,680.00( 8 $973.70 $38,948.00
#KP340TXRX - new, as per specifications or approved equal
10/10030851; ALTERNATOR, HEAVY-DUTY, 340 AMPS INTERNA; Part 35 EA $472.00 $16,520.00| 9 $713.71 $24,979.85
#KP2701 - new, as per specification or approved equal
Sub-Total: $199,680.00 $278,371.10




Bids Received: 2

281-485-8871

Pearland Alternator Company, Inc

Homer J. Wood dba Wood
Alternator & Starter Service
281-448-0445

Percent Mfg Percent
Item # Description Qty |U/M | Unit Price | Change Line Total Note [ Unit Price | Change Line Total
KUSSMAUL Electronics Co., Inc. (Fire and Emergency Products) lastest edition or approved equal - Total Estimated Expenditures $115,508.45
1|Auto Eject WP - 20 Amp -Automatic Power Line Disconnect 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $184.00 $174.80
2|Air Eject - 12V - Automatic Air Line Disconnect 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $190.00 $180.50
3|Super Auto Eject - 20 Amp - Deluxe Automatic Power Line Disconnect 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $230.00 $218.50
4|Kussmaul Charging Inducator 1[ EA $0.00 No Bid $93.00 $88.35
5|Auto Charge Remote 1200 - High Output Automatic Battery with build 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $727.00 $690.65
in_Indicator Charger
6(Pump Plus 1200 - Air Compressor/High Output Battery Charger 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $1,072.00 $1,018.40
7|Auto Pump 12V - Air Brake Leakage Compensator 1| EA $0.00 No Bid $418.00 $397.10
Sub-Total: $0.00 $2,768.30
C. E. Niehoff & Co BRUSHLESS ALTERNATORS, Catalog #LI1T-BPS09, Effective June 22, 2009 latest edition or approved equal - Total Estimated Expenditures
$155,661.35
1|Alternator 1] EA $1,919.90 -16.8 $1,597.36| 10 $1,919.90 -17 $1,593.52
2|Regulator 1] EA $182.91 -16.8 $152.18| 10 $182.91 -17 $151.82
3|Control Assembly Alternator Part 1[ EA $543.47 -16.8 $452.17( 10 $543.47 -17 $451.08
4[Stators Assembly 1] EA $709.07 -16.8 $589.95| 10 $709.07 -17 $588.53
Sub-Total: $2,791.65 $2,784.94
City Option
1|Should you be awarded ALL ITEMS you bid what percent additional 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
discount (if any) would be deducted from each item bid?
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00
City Pick Up Option
1|For any item listed in this Award, what additional discount, if any, 1 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
would you give for items picked up at your location by the City.
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00
Grand Total: $202,471.65 $283,924.34

Date: 12/16/08




