City of Houston Bid Tabulation Sheet

Electrical Switchgear and Motor Controls for Various Departments
For Various Departments
S23457 - Close Date: 4/29/2010 10:30:00 AM

Chavez Service Companies,

amerimex motor and

Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc .
Inc controls,inc
Group No. 1 - Square D Company
Alpha Numeric Price Book. Est. % % % % %
60-month exp. is $287,099.30 Unit Price | chg |Line Total] Unit Price [ chg | Line Total | Unit Price | chg | Line Total | Unit Price |% chg| Line Total § Unit Price |chg [ Line Total | Unit Price |chg| Line Total
1|Circuit Breaker, 1-pole, 1|EA $39.80( -60 $15.92 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No BidI $39.80( -56.2 $17.43 $23.20( -20 $18.56 $39.80 O $39.80
20 amp
2|Ground bar kit 1|EA $11.70[ -60 $4.68 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No BidI $11.70( -56.2 $5.12 $6.83| -20 $5.46 $11.70f O $11.70
3|Safety switch, 240 volt, 1 (EA] $1,289.00( -60 $515.60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No BidI $1,289.00| -56.2 $564.58 $728.29| -20 $582.63] $1,289.00 0| $1,289.00
200 amp
4|Circuit breaker, 2-pole, 1|EA $67.00( -60 $26.80 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid] $67.00 -56.2 $29.35 $39.13| -20 $31.30 $67.00] O $67.00
40 amp
Sub-Total: $563.00 $0.00 $0.00 $616.49 $637.96 $1,407.50
Group No. 2 - Eaton Cutler ; ; ;
Hammer Price Book PAD. Est. 60 Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc Chavez Serv:ﬁi Companies, ame:gwnetfor;ﬁsoitr:)(: and
month exp. is $471,587.30. '
1|Lighting Contactor, 3- 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid $684.00| -40 $410.40 $684.00| -50 $342.00 $684.00 -33 $458.28 $648.00| -20 $518.40 $684.00 O $684.00
pole
2|Lighting Contactor, 3- 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid $422.00| -40 $253.20 $422.00| -50 $211.00 $422.00 -33 $282.74 $422.00| -20 $337.60 $422.001 O $422.00
pole, 30 amp
Sub-Total: $0.00| $663.60 $553.00 $741.02 $856.00 $1,106.00
Group No. 3 - Eaton Cutler . . .
Hammer Price Book. Schedule Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc Chavez Service Companies, amerimex mo.tor and
220D Inc controls,inc
1|Circuit Breaker, 1-pole, 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid $27.75( -40 $16.65 $27.75| -70 $8.33 $27.75 -81 $5.27 $16.65( -20 $13.32 $27.75| O $27.75
20 amp
2|Single Phase Load 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid $227.00 -40 $136.20 $227.00| -70 $68.10 $227.00 -81 $43.13 $227.00| -20 $181.60 $227.00 O $227.00
Center
3|Circuit Breaker, 2-pole, 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid $193.00| -40 $115.80 $193.00| -70 $57.90 $193.00 -81 $36.67 $115.80| -20 $92.64 $193.00 O $193.00
100 amp
Sub-Total: $0.00 $268.65 $134.33 $85.07 $287.56 $447.75
Group No. 4 - Eaton Cutler . ’ !
Hammer Price Book. Schedule Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc Chavez Service Companies, amerimex mo.tor and
1CD-1 Inc controls,inc
1{Size 5 Vacuum Contactor| 1 [EA $0.00 0 No Bid] $8,170.00 -40| $4,902.00] $8,170.00| -35 $5,310.50] $8,170.00 -33| $5,473.90] $8,170.00| -20f $6,536.00] $8,170.00f O $8,170.00
Non-Reversable Type
600V
2|Size 1 Full Voltage A/IC 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid $643.00| -40 $385.80 $643.00| -35 $417.95 $643.00 -33 $430.81 $643.00| -20 $514.40 $643.00 O $643.00
Contactor
3|Size 2 Full Voltage A/IC 1|EA $0.00 0 No Bid] $1,177.00| -40 $706.20] $1,177.00| -35 $765.05] $1,177.00 -33 $788.59) $1,177.00( -20 $941.60] $1,177.00| 0| $1,177.00
Contactor
Sub-Total: $0.00| $5,994.00 $6,493.50 $6,693.30 $7,992.00 $9,990.00
Group No. 5 - General Electric
Consumer & Industrial
Distribution, GEP-1100R 2007 or : ; ;
latest edition. Estimated 60- Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc Chavez Serv:ﬁi Companies, ame:?nifoloit:(: and
month expenditure is '
$283,595.40. Schedule No. GO-
135S
1|Rating Plug, 2-pole, 300 | 1 [EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid]  $106.00 -43 $60.42 $106.00| -38 $65.72 $106.00 O $106.00
amp
Sub-Total: $0.00] $0.00] $0.00] $60.42 $65.72 $106.00




Group No. 6 - General Electric
Consumer & Industrial

Chavez Service Companies,

amerimex motor and

Distribution, GEP-1100R 2007 or Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc | trols.i
latest edition. Schedule No. GO- ne controls,inc
135B
1(Circuit Breaker, 120/240 | 1 [EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $43.50| -25 $32.63 $43.50| -38 $26.97 $43.50| O $43.50
VAC, Internal Common
Trip
2|Circuit Breaker 1(EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $534.001 -25 $400.50 $534.00| -38 $331.08 $534.00 O $534.00
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $433.13 $358.05 $577.50
Group No. 7 - GE Control
Catalog, General Purpose . . . . Chavez Service Companies, amerimex motor and
GEP1260Q dated 2008. Schedule Graybar elliott electric Summit Electric Supply Turtle and Hughes Inc Inc controls.inc
GO-10H
1{3 Pole Overload Relay 1(EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $54.00( 32.7 $71.66 $54.00| -38 $33.48 $54.000 O $54.00
Block
2|3 Pole Overload Relay 1(EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $54.00( 32.7 $71.66 $54.00| -38 $33.48 $54.00) O $54.00
Block
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $143.32 $66.96 $108.00
Grand Total: $563.00 $6,926.25 $7,180.83 $8,772.74 $10,264.25 $13,742.75




