City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

Various Departments

for

S23548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Dviersified Chemical and Supply

Inc

713 461-9610

108989

AVM Enterprises Inc
480-440-6529

133629

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Central Poly Corporation
908-862-7570

109312

Interboro Packaging Corporation
845 457 2700

110388

Item #

Description

Qty

U/M

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

1

10032241; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 17X17
IN. BL/BR 4 GAL; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.36 Mil, Size: 17 in x 17 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 4 Gal, 1000 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed iin Box,

944

Cs

$7.70

$7,268.80

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$9.10

$8,590.40

$7.98

$7,533.12

10002447; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 24X23
IN. 8-10 GAL; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: .36 Mil,
Size: 24 in x 23 in , Container Size: 8-
10 Gal., Color: Black, 500 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.:
Heritage D4823RD or Equal

1460

Cs

$16.26

$23,739.60

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$8.90

$12,994.00

$6.82

$9,957.20

10005985; BAG, POLYETHYLENE
GAUGE 1MIL 24 X 30 IN.; Liner, Refuse
Transparent, Star Sealed, Bottom

Gauge: 1 Mil, Size: 24 in x 30 in, Color:

Clear, Container Size: 8-10 Gal Wi,

610

CS

$12.14

$7,405.40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$34.10

$20,801.00

$44.48

$27,132.80

10005084 ; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 24X32 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.35 Mil, Size: 24i n x 32 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr Pitt Plastics Blackstar

5470

CSs

$19.62

$107,321.40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$8.40

$45,948.00

$9.48

$51,855.60

10029462; BAG, POLY 24 X 32 WHITE
25% RECYCLED; Liner,w/minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.46 Mil, Size: 24 in x 32 in, Color:
White, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in

11252

Cs

$11.76

$132,323.52

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$12.60

$141,775.20

$11.98

$134,798.96

10002448; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X39 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 33 in x 39 in, Color: Brown,
Container Size: 32 Gal, Wt., 250 Per
Case @32 Ibs., Folded Flat and Packed

3378

CSs

$13.69

$46,244.82

$36.47

$123,195.66

$25.76

$87,017.28

$23.80

$80,396.40

$21.98

$74,248.44
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
Various Departments

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Best Products Company, Inc
817 467-5146

Hudson Plastic
845-517-0600
133760

LoneStar Plastics, Inc.
972-880-8287
131556

Unipak Corp
888-808-5120
124103

Supreme Supply
713-688-3373

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Percent
Change

Percent

Change Line Total Unit Price Line Total Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

1

10032241; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 17X17
IN. BL/BR 4 GAL; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.36 Mil, Size: 17 in x 17 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 4 Gal, 1000 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed iin Box,

$8.43

$7,957.92

$7.14 $6,740.16 $7.00 $6,608.00| $23.75 $22,420.00

$16.09

$15,188.96

10002447; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 24X23
IN. 8-10 GAL; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: .36 Mil,
Size: 24 in x 23 in , Container Size: 8-
10 Gal., Color: Black, 500 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.:
Heritage D4823RD or Equal

$16.24

$23,710.40

$12.84 $18,746.40 $6.85 $10,001.00| $22.36 $32,645.60

$14.85

$21,681.00

10005985; BAG, POLYETHYLENE
GAUGE 1MIL 24 X 30 IN.; Liner, Refuse
Transparent, Star Sealed, Bottom

Gauge: 1 Mil, Size: 24 in x 30 in, Color:

Clear, Container Size: 8-10 Gal Wi,

$16.10

$9,821.00

$40.02 $24,412.20| $23.60 $14,396.00| $65.28 $39,820.80

$0.00

No Bid

10005084 ; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 24X32 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.35 Mil, Size: 24i n x 32 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr Pitt Plastics Blackstar

$11.33

$61,975.10

$8.86 $48,464.20 $9.40 $51,418.00| $32.64 $178,540.80

$16.09

$88,012.30

10029462; BAG, POLY 24 X 32 WHITE
25% RECYCLED; Liner,w/minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.46 Mil, Size: 24 in x 32 in, Color:
White, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in

$11.33

$127,485.16

$11.39 $128,160.28| $11.30 $127,147.60| $32.74 $368,390.48

$17.75

$199,723.00

10002448; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X39 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 33 in x 39 in, Color: Brown,
Container Size: 32 Gal, Wt., 250 Per
Case @32 Ibs., Folded Flat and Packed

$21.68

$73,235.04

$28.13 $95,023.14| $24.70 $83,436.60| $25.36 $85,666.08

$0.00

No Bid
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
ARA

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Buckeye Cleaning Center- Houston

281-873-4200
108915

Projan Janitorial Supplies

832 731-7270
113079

Element Solutions International LLC

832-755-0116
133393

Consolidated Eng and Testing

823-785-2300
133581

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

1

10032241; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 17X17
IN. BL/BR 4 GAL; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.36 Mil, Size: 17 in x 17 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 4 Gal, 1000 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed iin Box,

$9.65

$9,109.60

$10.17

$9,600.48

$20.62

$19,465.28

$37.69

$35,579.36

10002447; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 24X23
IN. 8-10 GAL; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: .36 Mil,
Size: 24 in x 23 in , Container Size: 8-
10 Gal., Color: Black, 500 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.:
Heritage D4823RD or Equal

$8.56

$12,497.60

$9.72

$14,191.20

$19.67

$28,718.20

$37.69

$55,027.40

10005985; BAG, POLYETHYLENE
GAUGE 1MIL 24 X 30 IN.; Liner, Refuse
Transparent, Star Sealed, Bottom

Gauge: 1 Mil, Size: 24 in x 30 in, Color:

Clear, Container Size: 8-10 Gal Wi,

$22.50

$13,725.00

$28.55

$17,415.50

$45.12

$27,523.20

$37.69

$22,990.90

10005084 ; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 24X32 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.35 Mil, Size: 24i n x 32 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr Pitt Plastics Blackstar

$9.65

$52,785.50

$13.59

$74,337.30

$10.81

$59,130.70

$46.19

$252,659.30

10029462; BAG, POLY 24 X 32 WHITE
25% RECYCLED; Liner,w/minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.46 Mil, Size: 24 in x 32 in, Color:
White, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in

$11.78

$132,548.56

$14.60

$164,279.20

$23.55

$264,984.60

$46.19

$519,729.88

10002448; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X39 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 33 in x 39 in, Color: Brown,
Container Size: 32 Gal, Wt., 250 Per
Case @32 Ibs., Folded Flat and Packed

$34.94

$118,027.32

$37.55

$126,843.90

$42.47

$143,463.66

$24.99

$84,416.22
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City of Houston

Bid Tabulation

for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

Various Departments

S23548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

for

Bids Received: 17

Dviersified Chemical and Supply

Inc

713 461-9610

108989

AVM Enterprises Inc
480-440-6529
133629

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Central Poly Corporation
908-862-7570

109312

Interboro Packaging Corporation
845 457 2700

110388

Item #

Description

Qty

U/M

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

7

10032242; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X45 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 33 in x 45 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 32 Gal, 250 Per

4420

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$31.56

$139,495.20

$26.08

$115,273.60

$21.85

$96,577.00

$19.32

$85,394.40

e

10005986; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 37X50 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color Black,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

725

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$15.73

$11,404.25

$0.00

No Bid

$12.60

$9,135.00

$12.74

$9,236.50

©

10029455; BAG, POLY 37 X 50 BLACK
25% RECYCLED; Liner, w/minimum
25% Recycled Material Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1.5 Mil,
Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

20183

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$15.73

$317,478.59

$13.04

$263,186.32

$11.20

$226,049.60

$12.34

$249,058.22

10

10029461 ; BAG, POLY 37 X 50 CLEAR
25% RECYCLED; Liner, w/minimum
25% Recycled Material Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1.5 Mil,
Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

5168

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$15.73

$81,292.64

$0.00

No Bid

$13.40

$69,251.20

$14.20

$73,385.60

11

10005698; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE 38X63
IN., IMIL GAUGE; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color:
Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100
Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

4990

Cs

$18.65

$93,063.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$14.90

$74,351.00

$13.34

$66,566.60

12

10032243; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE 38
X63 IN., CLEAR; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color:
Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr: Dyna Pak D3863 or Equal

14195

Cs

$18.54

$263,175.30

$0.00

No Bid

$25.54

$362,540.30

$21.40

$303,773.00

$22.84

$324,213.80
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Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for

for

Various Departments

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Best Products Company, Inc

817 467-5146

LoneStar Plastics, Inc.
972-880-8287

131556

Unipak Corp
888-808-5120
124103

Hudson Plastic
845-517-0600
133760

Supreme Supply
713-688-3373

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent

Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent

Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent

Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

7

10032242; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X45 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 33 in x 45 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 32 Gal, 250 Per

$30.08

$132,953.60

$29.21

$129,108.20

$24.90

$110,058.00

$22.82

$100,864.40

$18.20

$80,444.00

e

10005986; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 37X50 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color Black,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$18.33

$13,289.25

$14.73

$10,679.25

$25.25

$18,306.25

$11.26

$8,163.50

$16.88

$12,238.00

©

10029455; BAG, POLY 37 X 50 BLACK
25% RECYCLED; Liner, w/minimum
25% Recycled Material Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1.5 Mil,
Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$18.09

$365,110.47

$14.71

$296,891.93

$12.40

$250,269.20

$10.58

$213,536.14

$17.40

$351,184.20

10

10029461 ; BAG, POLY 37 X 50 CLEAR
25% RECYCLED; Liner, w/minimum
25% Recycled Material Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1.5 Mil,
Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$18.09

$93,489.12

$15.94

$82,377.92

$16.10

$83,204.80

$14.23

$73,540.64

$19.46

$100,569.28

11

10005698; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE 38X63
IN., IMIL GAUGE; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color:
Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100
Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

$12.55

$62,624.50

$13.90

$69,361.00

$14.40

$71,856.00

$13.38

$66,766.20

$21.27

$106,137.30

12

10032243; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE 38
X63 IN., CLEAR; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color:
Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr: Dyna Pak D3863 or Equal

$33.25

$471,983.75

$26.91

$381,987.45

$27.70

$393,201.50

$23.06

$327,336.70

$25.58

$363,108.10

5 of
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
ARA

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Buckeye Cleaning Center- Houston
281-873-4200

108915

Projan Janitorial Supplies
832 731-7270

113079

Element Solutions International LLC
832-755-0116

133393

Consolidated Eng and Testing
823-785-2300

133581

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

7

10032242; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X45 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 33 in x 45 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 32 Gal, 250 Per

$26.66

$117,837.20

$33.07

$146,169.40

$36.76

$162,479.20

$24.99

$110,455.80

e

10005986; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 37X50 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color Black,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$13.97

$10,128.25

$16.93

$12,274.25

$18.32

$13,282.00

$25.47

$18,465.75

©

10029455; BAG, POLY 37 X 50 BLACK
25% RECYCLED; Liner, w/minimum
25% Recycled Material Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1.5 Mil,
Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$14.28

$288,213.24

$16.93

$341,698.19

$16.28

$328,579.24

$25.47

$514,061.01

10

10029461 ; BAG, POLY 37 X 50 CLEAR
25% RECYCLED; Liner, w/minimum
25% Recycled Material Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1.5 Mil,
Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$16.06

$82,998.08

$21.18

$109,458.24

$18.32

$94,677.76

$23.22

$120,000.96

11

10005698; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE 38X63
IN., IMIL GAUGE; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color:
Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100
Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

$15.03

$74,999.70

$18.41

$91,865.90

$15.80

$78,842.00

$31.97

$159,530.30

12

10032243; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE 38
X63 IN., CLEAR; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color:
Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr: Dyna Pak D3863 or Equal

$30.09

$427,127.55

$32.90

$467,015.50

$30.32

$430,392.40

$39.69

$563,399.55
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City of Houston

Bid

Tabulation
for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

Various Departments

S23548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

for

Bids Received: 17

Dviersified Chemical and Supply

Inc

713 461-9610

108989

AVM Enterprises Inc
480-440-6529

133629

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Central Poly Corporation
908-862-7570

109312

Interboro Packaging Corporation
845 457 2700

110388

Item #

Description

Qty

U/M

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

13

10029471; BAG, POLY 38 x 63 CLEAR
25% RECYCLED; Liner w/minimum
25% Recycled Material, Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes,
Mfr: Dyna Pak 3863XHC or Equal

8658

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$25.54

$221,125.32

$21.80

$188,744.40

$24.34

$210,735.72

14

10029460; BAG, POLY 40 X 46 BLACK
25% RECYCLED; Line w/minimum 25%
Recycled Material, Refuse, Opaque, Flat
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 40
in x 46 in, Color: Black, Container Size:
40-45 Gal, Wt. 60 Ibs., 250 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

402

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$38.00

$15,276.00

$19.84

$7,975.68

15

10032244; BAG, SAND
POLYPROPYLENE 18X30IN, 6MIL; Liner,
Sand, Filled, Polyprophylene, Bottom
Gauge: 6 Mil Size: 18 in x 30 in, 70Lb
w/Tie Attached to Each Bag, 50 Per

1778

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

16

10032245; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 30X36
BLACK 20-30 GAL; Liner, Refuse
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.65 Mil, Size: 30 in x 36 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 20-30 Gal Wt.,
250 Per Case @ 11.7 Ibs., Folded Flat

3500

CSs

$10.42

$36,470.00

$9.95

$34,825.00

$0.00

No Bid

$10.90

$38,150.00

$12.72

$44,520.00

17

10005987; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X44 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Gusseted, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 33 in x 44 in, Color: White,
Container Size: 32 Gal. Wt. 250 Per

510

CSs

$15.38

$7,843.80

$41.14

$20,981.40

$0.00

No Bid

$33.70

$17,187.00

$24.32

$12,403.20

18

10031734; BAG, POLY 30" X 36",
BLACK 25% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1 Mil,
Color: Black, Size: 30 in. x 36 in.,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, 250 Per

2145

CS

$9.98

$21,407.10

$15.30

$32,818.50

$0.00

No Bid

$12.90

$27,670.50

$15.48

$33,204.60
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
Various Departments

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Best Products Company, Inc LoneStar Plastics, Inc. Unipak Corp Hudson Plastic Supreme Supply
817 467-5146 972-880-8287 888-808-5120 845-517-0600 713-688-3373
131556 124103 133760
Unit Percent Unit Percent Percent Unit Percent Unit Percent
Iltem # Description Price Change Line Total Price Change Line Total Unit Price] Change Line Total Price Change Line Total Price Change Line Total
Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene
13(10029471; BAG, POLY 38 x 63 CLEAR $12.55 $108,657.90| $25.11 $217,402.38| $28.00 $242,424.00| $22.16 $191,861.28 $0.00 No Bid

25% RECYCLED; Liner w/minimum
25% Recycled Material, Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes,
Mfr: Dyna Pak 3863XHC or Equal

14(10029460; BAG, POLY 40 X 46 BLACK $0.00 No Bid| $18.26 $7,340.52| $20.00 $8,040.00| $33.96 $13,651.92| $23.69 $9,523.38
25% RECYCLED; Line w/minimum 25%
Recycled Material, Refuse, Opaque, Flat
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 40
in x 46 in, Color: Black, Container Size:
40-45 Gal, Wt. 60 Ibs., 250 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

15|10032244; BAG, SAND $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid| No Bid No Bid $6.96 $12,374.88 $0.00 No Bid
POLYPROPYLENE 18X30IN, 6MIL; Liner,
Sand, Filled, Polyprophylene, Bottom
Gauge: 6 Mil Size: 18 in x 30 in, 70Lb
w/Tie Attached to Each Bag, 50 Per

16]/10032245; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 30X36 | $13.40 $46,900.00| $11.33 $39,655.00| $10.00 $35,000.00| $16.01 $56,035.00| $16.67 $58,345.00
BLACK 20-30 GAL; Liner, Refuse
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.65 Mil, Size: 30 in x 36 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 20-30 Gal Wt.,
250 Per Case @ 11.7 Ibs., Folded Flat

17110005987; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW $19.70 $10,047.00| $37.18 $18,961.80( $37.20 $18,972.00| $35.29 $17,997.90| $56.69 $28,911.90
DENSITY 33X44 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Gusseted, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 33 in x 44 in, Color: White,
Container Size: 32 Gal. Wt. 250 Per

18]|10031734; BAG, POLY 30" X 36", $13.40 $28,743.00| $13.83 $29,665.35| $15.90 $34,105.50| $16.08 $34,491.60| $26.59 $57,035.55
BLACK 25% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1 Mil,
Color: Black, Size: 30 in. x 36 in.,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, 250 Per

8 of 18




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

for
ARA

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Buckeye Cleaning Center- Houston
281-873-4200

108915

Projan Janitorial Supplies
832 731-7270

113079

Element Solutions International LLC
832-755-0116

133393

Consolidated Eng and Testing
823-785-2300

133581

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

13

10029471; BAG, POLY 38 x 63 CLEAR
25% RECYCLED; Liner w/minimum
25% Recycled Material, Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes,
Mfr: Dyna Pak 3863XHC or Equal

$30.09

$260,519.22

$35.32

$305,800.56

$31.60

$273,592.80

$39.69

$343,636.02

14

10029460; BAG, POLY 40 X 46 BLACK
25% RECYCLED; Line w/minimum 25%
Recycled Material, Refuse, Opaque, Flat
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 40
in x 46 in, Color: Black, Container Size:
40-45 Gal, Wt. 60 Ibs., 250 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$25.80

$10,371.60

$22.16

$8,908.32

$60.72

$24,409.44

$31.97

$12,851.94

15

10032244; BAG, SAND
POLYPROPYLENE 18X30IN, 6MIL; Liner,
Sand, Filled, Polyprophylene, Bottom
Gauge: 6 Mil Size: 18 in x 30 in, 70Lb
w/Tie Attached to Each Bag, 50 Per

$0.00

No Bid

$12.02

$21,371.56

$37.50

$66,675.00

$0.00

No Bid

16

10032245; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 30X36
BLACK 20-30 GAL; Liner, Refuse
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.65 Mil, Size: 30 in x 36 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 20-30 Gal Wt.,
250 Per Case @ 11.7 Ibs., Folded Flat

$12.77

$44,695.00

$13.52

$47,320.00

$16.15

$56,525.00

$46.19

$161,665.00

17

10005987; BAG, POLYEHTYLENE LOW
DENSITY 33X44 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Gusseted, Bottom Gauge: 2
Mil, Size: 33 in x 44 in, Color: White,
Container Size: 32 Gal. Wt. 250 Per

$40.64

$20,726.40

$50.37

$25,688.70

$53.24

$27,152.40

$18.11

$9,236.10

18

10031734; BAG, POLY 30" X 36",
BLACK 25% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1 Mil,
Color: Black, Size: 30 in. x 36 in.,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, 250 Per

$18.79

$40,304.55

$16.55

$35,499.75

$17.82

$38,223.90

$33.03

$70,849.35

9 of 18




City of Houston

Bid Tabulation

for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

Various Departments

S23548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

for

Bids Received: 17

Dviersified Chemical and Supply

Inc

713 461-9610

108989

AVM Enterprises Inc
480-440-6529
133629

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Central Poly Corporation
908-862-7570
109312

Interboro Packaging Corporation
845 457 2700

110388

Item #

Description

Qty

U/M

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent

Change Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

19

10031735; BAG, POLY 30" X 36",
CLEAR 25 % RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1 Mil, Color: Clear, Size: 30 in.
X 36 in., Container Size: 20-30 Gal Wt.,

4190

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$17.64

$73,911.60

$0.00

No Bid

$13.10 $54,889.00

$15.48

$64,861.20

20

10032001; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
6MIL, 38"X63"; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 6 Mil, Size:
38 in x 63 in, Color: Black, Container
Size: 55-60 Gal, 50 Per Case @ 47 lbs.;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.
Dyna Pak D3863 or Equal

1000

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$33.14

$33,140.00

$28.20 $28,200.00

$33.98

$33,980.00

21

10032002; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
6MIL, 38"X63",; Liner w/Minimum 25%
Recycled Material, Refuse, Opaque, Flat
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 6 Mil, Size: 38
in x 63 in, Color: Black, Container Size:
55-60 Gal, 50 Per Case; Folded Flat and
Packed in Boxes

10

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$29.80 $298.00

$49.82

$498.20

22

10032000; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
1MIL, 38"X63" L; Liner, w/Minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1
Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

10

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$14.20 $142.00

$24.98

$249.80

23

10031979; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
.65MIL, 30"X36"; Liner, w/Minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed Bottom, Gauge:
.65 Mil, Size 30 in x 36 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, Wt. 250 Per
Case @ 11.7 lbs, Folded Flat and

2230

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$9.95

$22,188.50

$0.00

No Bid

$11.60 $25,868.00

$12.48

$27,830.40

10 of 18




Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

for

Various Departments

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Best Products Company, Inc
817 467-5146

LoneStar Plastics, Inc.
972-880-8287

131556

Unipak Corp

888-808-5120

124103

Hudson Plastic
845-517-0600

133760

Supreme Supply
713-688-3373

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

19

10031735; BAG, POLY 30" X 36",
CLEAR 25 % RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1 Mil, Color: Clear, Size: 30 in.
X 36 in., Container Size: 20-30 Gal Wt.,

$13.22

$55,391.80

$14.53

$60,880.70

$15.90

$66,621.00

$15.83

$66,327.70

$26.82

$112,375.80

20

10032001; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
6MIL, 38"X63"; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 6 Mil, Size:
38 in x 63 in, Color: Black, Container
Size: 55-60 Gal, 50 Per Case @ 47 lbs.;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.
Dyna Pak D3863 or Equal

$12.71

$12,710.00

$36.11

$36,110.00

$33.00

$33,000.00

$26.43

$26,430.00

$51.16

$51,160.00

21

10032002; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
6MIL, 38"X63",; Liner w/Minimum 25%
Recycled Material, Refuse, Opaque, Flat
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 6 Mil, Size: 38
in x 63 in, Color: Black, Container Size:
55-60 Gal, 50 Per Case; Folded Flat and
Packed in Boxes

$21.54

$215.40

$36.78

$367.80

$33.00

$330.00

$27.21

$272.10

$51.16

$511.60

22

10032000; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
1MIL, 38"X63" L; Liner, w/Minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1
Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$12.71

$127.10

$11.39

$113.90

$15.00

$150.00

$13.58

$135.80

$0.00

No Bid

23

10031979; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
.65MIL, 30"X36"; Liner, w/Minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed Bottom, Gauge:
.65 Mil, Size 30 in x 36 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, Wt. 250 Per
Case @ 11.7 lbs, Folded Flat and

$13.40

$29,882.00

$9.62

$21,452.60

$10.00

$22,300.00

$16.31

$36,371.30

$18.67

$41,634.10
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
ARA

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Buckeye Cleaning Center- Houston
281-873-4200

108915

Projan Janitorial Supplies
832 731-7270

113079

Element Solutions International LLC
832-755-0116

133393

Consolidated Eng and Testing
823-785-2300

133581

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

19

10031735; BAG, POLY 30" X 36",
CLEAR 25 % RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1 Mil, Color: Clear, Size: 30 in.
X 36 in., Container Size: 20-30 Gal Wt.,

$19.87

$83,255.30

$20.16

$84,470.40

$17.82

$74,665.80

$33.03

$138,395.70

20

10032001; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
6MIL, 38"X63"; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 6 Mil, Size:
38 in x 63 in, Color: Black, Container
Size: 55-60 Gal, 50 Per Case @ 47 lbs.;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.
Dyna Pak D3863 or Equal

$37.56

$37,560.00

$41.59

$41,590.00

$38.30

$38,300.00

$0.00

No Bid

21

10032002; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
6MIL, 38"X63",; Liner w/Minimum 25%
Recycled Material, Refuse, Opaque, Flat
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 6 Mil, Size: 38
in x 63 in, Color: Black, Container Size:
55-60 Gal, 50 Per Case; Folded Flat and
Packed in Boxes

$37.56

$375.60

$41.59

$415.90

$50.21

$502.10

$0.00

No Bid

22

10032000; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
1MIL, 38"X63" L; Liner, w/Minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1
Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Clear,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 100 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$15.03

$150.30

$18.41

$184.10

$16.76

$167.60

$32.00

$320.00

23

10031979; POLYETHYLENE, BAG LINER,
.65MIL, 30"X36"; Liner, w/Minimum
25% Recycled Material, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed Bottom, Gauge:
.65 Mil, Size 30 in x 36 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, Wt. 250 Per
Case @ 11.7 lbs, Folded Flat and

$12.77

$28,477.10

$13.52

$30,149.60

$14.86

$33,137.80

$18.11

$40,385.30
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City of Houston

Bid Tabulation

for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

Various Departments

for

S23548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Dviersified Chemical and Supply

Inc

713 461-9610

108989

AVM Enterprises Inc
480-440-6529
133629

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Central Poly Corporation
908-862-7570

109312

Interboro Packaging Corporation
845 457 2700

110388

Item #

Description

Qty

U/M

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

24

10032042; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE
38"X63", 10% RECY; Liner, w/Minimum
10% Recycyled Material, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed Bottom,
Guage: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in. x 63 in.,
Color: Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal.
Wt., 100 Per Case @32 Lbs., Static
Load: Dry Wt. 100 Ibs. Wet Wt. 70 obs,
Folded flat and packed in boxes.

13000

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$25.52

$331,760.00

$21.70

$282,100.00

$24.32

$316,160.00

25

10031383; BAG,POLYETHYLENE 3 MIL
GAUGE,38"X63",BLK; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size: 38
in x 63 in, Color: Black, 50 Per Case,
Fold Flat and Packed in Boxes

2400

CS

$0.00

No Bid

$20.35

$48,840.00

$0.00

No Bid

$15.30

$36,720.00

$18.82

$45,168.00

26

10031483; BAG,TRASH,BLACK 3 MIL
GAUGE, 33" X 39"; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size 33
in x 39 in, Color: Black, 100 Per Case,
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

600

CS

$0.00

No Bid

$21.88

$13,128.00

$0.00

No Bid

$17.90

$10,740.00

$14.98

$8,988.00

27

10032485; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,24 in.
X 23 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material;
Refuse, Opaque, Stat Sealed Bottom
Guage: .36 Mil, Size: 24 in. x 23 in.,
Container Size: 8-10 Gal., Color: Black,
500 Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

2250

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$8.90

$20,025.00

$6.82

$15,345.00

28

10032486; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,33 in.
X 39 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed, Botton
Guage: 2 Mil., Size: 33 in. x 39 in.,
Color: Brown, Container Size: 32 Gal.,
250 Per Case @ 43 Ibs., Folded Flat and

3378

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$42.04

$142,011.12

$0.00

No Bid

$24.80

$83,774.40

$21.98

$74,248.44

29

10032487; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,43 in.
X 47 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom
Guage: 1.16 Mil, Size: 43 in. x 47 in.,
Color: Gray, Container Size: 56 Gal.,
100 Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

5364

CSs

$16.22

$87,004.08

$13.28

$71,233.92

$11.72

$62,866.08

$11.20

$60,076.80

$11.98

$64,260.72

13 of 18




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
Various Departments

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Best Products Company, Inc LoneStar Plastics, Inc. Unipak Corp Hudson Plastic Supreme Supply
817 467-5146 972-880-8287 888-808-5120 845-517-0600 713-688-3373
131556 124103 133760
Unit Percent Unit Percent Percent Unit Percent Unit Percent
Iltem # Description Price Change Line Total Price Change Line Total Unit Price] Change Line Total Price Change Line Total Price Change Line Total
Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene
24]/10032042; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE $12.55 $163,150.00| $23.47 $305,110.00| $27.84 $361,920.00| $22.66 $294,580.00( $25.58 $332,540.00

38"X63", 10% RECY; Liner, w/Minimum
10% Recycyled Material, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed Bottom,
Guage: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in. x 63 in.,
Color: Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal.
Wt., 100 Per Case @32 Lbs., Static
Load: Dry Wt. 100 Ibs. Wet Wt. 70 obs,
Folded flat and packed in boxes.

25/10031383; BAG,POLYETHYLENE 3 MIL $12.71 $30,504.00| $19.43 $46,632.00| $16.60 $39,840.00| $13.62 $32,688.00| $29.44 $70,656.00
GAUGE,38"X63",BLK; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size: 38
in x 63 in, Color: Black, 50 Per Case,
Fold Flat and Packed in Boxes

26/10031483; BAG,TRASH,BLACK 3 MIL $19.70 $11,820.00| $19.11 $11,466.00| $17.20 $10,320.00 $8.34 $5,004.00| $30.79 $18,474.00
GAUGE, 33" X 39"; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size 33
in x 39 in, Color: Black, 100 Per Case,
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

27|10032485; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,24 in. $16.25 $36,562.50| $12.96 $29,160.00 $7.50 $16,875.00| $16.88 $37,980.00| $14.85 $33,412.50
X 23 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material;
Refuse, Opaque, Stat Sealed Bottom
Guage: .36 Mil, Size: 24 in. x 23 in.,
Container Size: 8-10 Gal., Color: Black,
500 Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

28(10032486; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,33 in. $25.84 $87,287.52| $31.53 $106,508.34 $36.95 $124,817.10| $25.86 $87,355.08 $44.15 $149,138.70
X 39 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed, Botton
Guage: 2 Mil., Size: 33 in. x 39 in.,
Color: Brown, Container Size: 32 Gal.,
250 Per Case @ 43 Ibs., Folded Flat and

29|10032487; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,43 in. $19.78 $106,099.92| $13.12 $70,375.68| $14.50 $77,778.00| $13.06 $70,053.84| $23.61 $126,644.04
X 47 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom
Guage: 1.16 Mil, Size: 43 in. x 47 in.,
Color: Gray, Container Size: 56 Gal.,
100 Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density
for
ARA

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Buckeye Cleaning Center- Houston
281-873-4200

108915

Projan Janitorial Supplies
832 731-7270

113079

Element Solutions International LLC
832-755-0116

133393

Consolidated Eng and Testing
823-785-2300

133581

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

24

10032042; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE
38"X63", 10% RECY; Liner, w/Minimum
10% Recycyled Material, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed Bottom,
Guage: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in. x 63 in.,
Color: Clear, Container Size: 55-60 Gal.
Wt., 100 Per Case @32 Lbs., Static
Load: Dry Wt. 100 Ibs. Wet Wt. 70 obs,
Folded flat and packed in boxes.

$29.03

$377,390.00

$35.32

$459,160.00

$30.32

$394,160.00

$31.97

$415,610.00

25

10031383; BAG,POLYETHYLENE 3 MIL
GAUGE,38"X63",BLK; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size: 38
in x 63 in, Color: Black, 50 Per Case,
Fold Flat and Packed in Boxes

$21.26

$51,024.00

$21.67

$52,008.00

$22.50

$54,000.00

$28.99

$69,576.00

26

10031483; BAG,TRASH,BLACK 3 MIL
GAUGE, 33" X 39"; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size 33
in x 39 in, Color: Black, 100 Per Case,
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes

$21.97

$13,182.00

$23.23

$13,938.00

$24.20

$14,520.00

$25.47

$15,282.00

27

10032485; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,24 in.
X 23 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material;
Refuse, Opaque, Stat Sealed Bottom
Guage: .36 Mil, Size: 24 in. x 23 in.,
Container Size: 8-10 Gal., Color: Black,
500 Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

$8.56

$19,260.00

$9.72

$21,870.00

$19.67

$44,257.50

$37.69

$84,802.50

28

10032486; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,33 in.
X 39 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed, Botton
Guage: 2 Mil., Size: 33 in. x 39 in.,
Color: Brown, Container Size: 32 Gal.,
250 Per Case @ 43 Ibs., Folded Flat and

$34.94

$118,027.32

$37.55

$126,843.90

$42.47

$143,463.66

$33.03

$111,575.34

29

10032487; BAG,POLYETHYLENE,43 in.
X 47 in., 10% RECYCLED; Liner
w/Minimum 10% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom
Guage: 1.16 Mil, Size: 43 in. x 47 in.,
Color: Gray, Container Size: 56 Gal.,
100 Per Case, Folded Flat and Packed in

$17.07

$91,563.48

$16.90

$90,651.60

$16.01

$85,877.64

$28.99

$155,502.36

15 of 18




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

Various Departments

S23548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

for

Bids Received: 17

Dviersified Chemical and Supply

Inc

713 461-9610
108989

AVM Enterprises Inc
480-440-6529
133629

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Central Poly Corporation
908-862-7570
109312

Interboro Packaging Corporation
845 457 2700
110388

Item #

Description

oty [urm

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

30

10005083; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 40 IN. X 46 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Guage:
2.0 Mil, Size: 40 in. x 46 in., Color:
Black, 40-45 Gal., 100 Per Case, Folded
Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfg. Product

6875| CS

$14.66

$100,787.50

$0.00

No Bid

$17.30

$118,937.50

$14.95

$102,781.25

$12.72

$87,450.00

31

10032119; BAG, 30 in. x 36 in. CLEAR,
.60 MIL, 30 GAL; Liner, Flat Bottom,
Bottom Guage: 0.60 Mil, Size: 30 in. x
36 in., Color: Clear, 30 Gal., 250 Per
Case, Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes,
Mfg. Product Ref.: Pro-Source #WEBBC-
37, Item #56554447

500| Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$10.58

$5,290.00

$0.00

No Bid

$12.40

$6,200.00

$9.84

$4,920.00

Sub-Total:

$894,973.10

$1,138,094.38

$1,517,496.40

$2,010,621.35

$2,083,459.20

City Pic

k-Up Option

2

For any item listed in this Award, what
additional discount, if any, would you
give for items picked up at your
location by the City?

1| EA

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 [¢]

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Sub-Total:

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

City Options

3

Should you be awarded ALL ITEMS you
bid, what percent additional discount (if
any) would be deducted from each item

bid?

1| EA

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 [¢]

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Sub-Total:

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

Grand Total:

$894,973.10

$1,138,094.38

$1,517,496.40

$2,010,621.35

$2,083,459.20
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Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for

for

Various Departments

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Best Products Company, Inc

LoneStar Plastics, Inc.

817 467-5146

972-880-8287

131556

Unipak Corp
888-808-5120

124103

Hudson Plastic
845-517-0600

133760

Supreme Supply
713-688-3373

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Li

near Low Density Polyethylene

30

10005083; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 40 IN. X 46 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Guage:
2.0 Mil, Size: 40 in. x 46 in., Color:
Black, 40-45 Gal., 100 Per Case, Folded
Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfg. Product

$17.95

$123,406.25

$17.59

$120,931.25

$16.90

$116,187.50

$16.01

$110,068.75

$23.69

$162,868.75

31

10032119; BAG, 30 in. x 36 in. CLEAR,
.60 MIL, 30 GAL; Liner, Flat Bottom,
Bottom Guage: 0.60 Mil, Size: 30 in. x
36 in., Color: Clear, 30 Gal., 250 Per
Case, Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes,
Mfg. Product Ref.: Pro-Source #WEBBC-
37, Item #56554447

$21.14

$10,570.00

$10.43

$5,215.00

$10.40

$5,200.00

$15.65

$7,825.00

$19.46

$9,730.00

$2,230,789.10

$2,329,451.05

$2,337,295.95

$2,540,387.29

$2,534,244.41

City Pic

k-Up Option

2

For any item listed in this Award, what
additional discount, if any, would you
give for items picked up at your
location by the City?

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 2

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

City Options

3

Should you be awarded ALL ITEMS you
bid, what percent additional discount (if
any) would be deducted from each item

bid?

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00 2

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$2,230,789.10

$2,329,451.05

$2,337,295.95

$2,540,387.29

$2,534,244.41
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Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for

for
ARA

523548 - Close Date: 1/28/2010 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 17

Buckeye Cleaning Center- Houston
281-873-4200
108915

Projan Janitorial Supplies
832 731-7270
113079

Element Solutions International LLC
832-755-0116
133393

Consolidated Eng and Testing
823-785-2300
133581

Item #

Description

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Unit
Price

Percent
Change

Line Total

Bags, Linear Low Density Polyethylene

30

10005083; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 40 IN. X 46 IN.; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Guage:
2.0 Mil, Size: 40 in. x 46 in., Color:
Black, 40-45 Gal., 100 Per Case, Folded
Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfg. Product

$20.12

$138,325.00

$21.75

$149,531.25

$25.76

$177,100.00

$23.22

$159,637.50

31

10032119; BAG, 30 in. x 36 in. CLEAR,
.60 MIL, 30 GAL; Liner, Flat Bottom,
Bottom Guage: 0.60 Mil, Size: 30 in. x
36 in., Color: Clear, 30 Gal., 250 Per
Case, Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes,
Mfg. Product Ref.: Pro-Source #WEBBC-
37, Item #56554447

$13.45

$6,725.00

$16.75

$8,375.00

$14.86

$7,430.00

$30.89

$15,445.00

$2,578,051.47

$2,979,617.26

$3,098,289.42

$4,116,003.04

City Pic

k-Up Option

2

For any item listed in this Award, what
additional discount, if any, would you
give for items picked up at your
location by the City?

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

City Options

3

Should you be awarded ALL ITEMS you
bid, what percent additional discount (if
any) would be deducted from each item

bid?

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$0.00

$2,578,051.47

$2,979,617.26

$3,098,289.42

$4,116,003.04

Buyer: %,_’/'7'/ ?&m._..j/,,g o
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