City of Houston City of Houston City of Houston

Bid Tabulation Bid Tabulation Bid Tabulation
for for for
Traffic Signal Control Hardware Traffic Signal Control Hardware Traffic Signal Control Hardware
for for for
Public Works Public Works Public Works
S24062 - Close Date: 3/15/2012 10:30:00 AM S24062 - Close Date: 3/15/2012 10:30:00 AM S24062 - Close Date: 3/15/2012 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 10 Tagalucci Group, LLC Leotek Electronics USA Corp TEXAS HIGHWAY PRODUCTS | General Traffic EQuipment Corp. Republic Intelligent TransportationServices Paradigm Traffic Systems Inc McCain Inc Globe Electric Supply Inc Traffic Parts Inc. ROB MAC INDUSTRIESRMI
404-478-6494 408-380-1788 512-255-7633 8455699000 817-633-5300 817-831-9406 281-332-8822 281-933-0909 2812920066 2815412573
110216 116342 110941 117808 109675 110493 110944 109146 139114
Mfg Unit Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Item # Description Qty |U/M | Unit Price Line Total Note | Price Line Total Note |Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note Unit Price Line Total Note |Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
Group 1 - Signal Diodes and Lamps - Specification 16718 Group 1 - Signal Diodes and Lamps - Specification 16718 Group 1 - Signal Diodes and Lamps - Specification 16718
1/10000296; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 1250| EA $0.00 No Bid $23.40 $29,250.00( 1 $56.25 $70,312.50( 2 $34.00 $42,500.00( 3 1/10000296; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 1250| EA $25.60 $32,000.00( 4 $39.00 $48,750.00 $40.25 $50,312.50( 5 1/10000296; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 1250| EA $55.99 $69,987.50( 6 $45.05 $56,312.50( 7 $64.40 $80,500.00
BALL TSL-12G-LX-1L1; SAP Material BALL TSL-12G-LX-1L1; SAP Material BALL TSL-12G-LX-1L1; SAP Material
#10000296 #10000296 #10000296
2|10000294; LED DIODES RED 12" BALL | 1500| EA $0.00 No Bid $21.00 $31,500.00( 8 $41.45 $62,175.00( 9 $29.00 $43,500.00( 10 2|10000294; LED DIODES RED 12" BALL |1500| EA $27.26 $40,890.00( 11 $35.00 $52,500.00 $43.70 $65,550.00( 12 2|10000294; LED DIODES RED 12" BALL | 1500| EA $40.99 $61,485.00| 13 $38.95 $58,425.00( 14 $47.00 $70,500.00
TSL-12R-LX-1L1; SAP Mtl #10000294 TSL-12R-LX-1L1; SAP Mtl #10000294 TSL-12R-LX-1L1; SAP Mtl #10000294
3|10000295; LED DIODES YLW 12" BALL | 750| EA $0.00 No Bid $24.49 $18,367.50| 15 $56.25 $42,187.50| 16 $33.00 $24,750.00( 10 3/10000295; LED DIODES YLW 12" BALL | 750| EA $33.36 $25,020.00| 17 $41.00 $30,750.00 $55.60 $41,700.00| 18 3|10000295; LED DIODES YLW 12" BALL | 750| EA $43.99 $32,992.50| 19 $42.25 $31,687.50| 20 $50.60 $37,950.00
TSL-12Y-LX-1L1; SAP Mtl #10000295 TSL-12Y-LX-1L1; SAP Mtl #10000295 TSL-12Y-LX-1L1; SAP Mtl #10000295
4(10000297; LED DIODES, YLW 12" R/L 400| EA $0.00 No Bid $23.95 $9,580.00| 21 $62.75 $25,100.00| 22 $30.00 $12,000.00( 10 4(10000297; LED DIODES, YLW 12" R/L 400| EA $32.52 $13,008.00| 23 $33.00 $13,200.00 $40.25 $16,100.00| 24 4(10000297; LED DIODES, YLW 12" R/L 400| EA $40.99 $16,396.00| 25 $42.60 $17,040.00| 26 $47.00 $18,800.00
ARROW TSL-12YA; SAP Mtl ARROW TSL-12YA; SAP Mtl #10000297 ARROW TSL-12YA; SAP Mtl
#10000297 #10000297
5/10000298; LED DIODES, GRN 12" R/L 500| EA $0.00 No Bid $24.45 $12,225.00( 27 $47.35 $23,675.00| 28 $45.00 $22,500.00| 10 5/10000298; LED DIODES, GRN 12" R/L 500| EA $34.14 $17,070.00| 29 $37.00 $18,500.00 $52.90 $26,450.00| 30 5/10000298; LED DIODES, GRN 12" R/L 500| EA $52.99 $26,495.00| 31 $45.25 $22,625.00| 32 $60.95 $30,475.00
ARROW; SAP Mtl #10000298 ARROW; SAP Mtl #10000298 ARROW; SAP Mtl #10000298
Sub-Total: $0.00 $100,922.50 $223,450.00 $145,250.00 Sub-Total: $127,988.00 $163,700.00 $200,112.50 Sub-Total: $207,356.00 $186,090.00 $238,225.00
Group 2 - Signal Heads & Signal Mount Assemblies Etc. - Specification 16715 Group 2 - Signal Heads & Signal Mount Assemblies Etc. - Specification 16715 Group 2 - Signal Heads & Signal Mount Assemblies Etc. - Specification 16715
1/10045097; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 500| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $180.00 $90,000.00( 33 1{10045097; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 500| EA $79.35 $39,675.00| 34 $308.00 $154,000.00 $104.50 $52,250.00| 35 1{10045097; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 500| EA $105.99 $52,995.00| 36 $141.00 $70,500.00( 37 $121.90 $60,950.00
VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl
#10045097 Section Head Signal #10045097 Section Head Signal #10045097 Section Head Signal
W/Back Plate, Flat Black W/Back Plate. Flat Black W/Back Plate. Flat Black
2|10045098; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 1500| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $186.00 $279,000.00 2|10045098; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 1500| EA $79.35 $119,025.00 $308.00 $462,000.00 $122.00 $183,000.00 2|10045098; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 1500| EA $121.99 $182,985.00 $141.00 $211,500.00 $140.30 $210,450.00
VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mmtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl
#10045098 Section Head Signal #10045098 Section Head Signal #10045098 Section Head Signal
W/Back Plate, Federal Yellow W/Back Plate, Federal Yellow W/Back Plate, Federal Yellow
3/10031749; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 100| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $86.00 $8,600.00| 33 3/10031749; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 100| EA $53.49 $5,349.00| 38 $44.00 $4,400.00 $34.00 $3,400.00| 39 3/10031749; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 100| EA $33.99 $3,399.00| 40 $66.50 $6,650.00| 41 $39.10 $3,910.00
BACKPLATE; SAP Mtl #10031749 BACKPLATE; SAP Mtl #10031749 BACKPLATE; SAP Mtl #10031749
Tagalucci Leotek TX Highway General Traffic Republic Intelligent Paradigm McCain Inc. Globe Electric Traffic Parts Rob-Mac Ind.
Mfg Unit Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Iltem # Description Qty [U/M [ Unit Price Line Total Note | Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note |ltem # Description Qty [U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note |ltem # Description Qty |U/M| Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
Group 2 - Signal Heads & Signal Mount Assemblies Etc. - Specification 16715 (CONT.) Group 2 - Signal Heads & Signal Mount Assemblies Etc. - Specification 16715 (CONT.) Group 2 - Signal Heads & Signal Mount Assemblies Etc. - Specification 16715 (CONT.)
4(10030660; BACKPLATE, 5-SECT 50| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 No Bid $94.00 $4,700.00| 42 4(10030660; BACKPLATE, 5-SECT 50| EA $56.79 $2,839.50| 43 $55.00 $2,750.00 $40.00 $2,000.00| 44 4(10030660; BACKPLATE, 5-SECT 50| EA $39.99 $1,999.50| 45 $76.00 $3,800.00| 46 $46.00 $2,300.00
LOUVERED,BLACK, SIGNAL; SAP Mtl LOUVERED,BLACK, SIGNAL; SAP mtl LOUVERED,BLACK, SIGNAL; SAP mtl
#10030660 #10030660 #10030660
5/10045101; SIGNAL, 1-SECTION, 250| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $112.00 $28,000.00( 33 5/10045101; SIGNAL, 1-SECTION, 250| EA $105.82 $26,455.00| 47 $195.00 $48,750.00 $95.00 $23,750.00| 48 5/10045101; SIGNAL, 1-SECTION, 250| EA $94.99 $23,747.50| 49 $142.00 $35,500.00( 50 $109.25 $27,312.50
VEHICLE SIGNAL HEAD W; SAP mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HEAD W; SAP mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HEAD W; SAP Mmtl
#10045101 Section Signal W/Back #10045101 Section Signal W/Back #10045101 Section Signal W/Back
Plate W/12 VDC LED Amber Plate W/12 VDC LED Amber Plate W/12 VDC LED Amber
6/10000317; LAMP, TRAFFIC SIGNAL 1000| EA $0.00 No Bid $25.75 $25,750.00( 51 $0.00 No Bid $78.00 $78,000.00( 52 6/10000317; LAMP, TRAFFIC SIGNAL 1000| EA $76.93 $76,930.00| 53 $61.00 $61,000.00 $52.00 $52,000.00| 54 6/10000317; LAMP, TRAFFIC SIGNAL 1000| EA $52.99 $52,990.00| 49 $62.25 $62,250.00( 55 $60.95 $60,950.00
300MM 12VDC AMBER; SAP Mtl 300MM 12VDC AMBER; SAP Mtl 300MM 12VDC AMBER; SAP Mtl
#10000317 #10000317 #10000317
7110045091 ; BRACKET, 3-SECTION, 1250| EA $115.06 $143,825.00| 56 $0.00 No Bid $108.50 $135,625.00| 57 $77.50 $96,875.00| 33 7110045091 ; BRACKET, 3-SECTION, 1250| EA $109.06 $136,325.00| 58 $112.00 $140,000.00 $106.00 $132,500.00( 59 7110045091; BRACKET, 3-SECTION, 1250 EA $109.99 $137,487.50| 60 $81.90 $102,375.00| 61 $126.50 $158,125.00
HORIZON MAST ARM; SAP Mtl HORIZON MAST ARM; SAP Mtl HORIZON MAST ARM; SAP Mtl
#10045091 MAST ARM BRACKET, 3 #10045091 MAST ARM BRACKET, 3 #10045091 MAST ARM BRACKET, 3
SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC
ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT
BRACKET ASSEMBILY BRACKET ASSEMBLY BRACKET ASSEMBLY
8|10045092; BRACKET, 4-SECTION, 250( EA $122.00 $30,500.00| 62 $0.00 No Bid $116.95 $29,237.50| 63 $79.50 $19,875.00( 33 8/10045092; BRACKET, 4-SECTION, 250| EA $113.47 $28,367.50| 64 $115.00 $28,750.00 $114.00 $28,500.00| 65 8|10045092; BRACKET, 4-SECTION, 250( EA $114.99 $28,747.50| 66 $87.50 $21,875.00| 67 $132.25 $33,062.50
HORIZONTAL MAST ASM; SAP Mtl HORIZONTAL MAST ASM; SAP Mtl HORIZONTAL MAST ASM; SAP Mtl
#10045092 MAST ARM BRACKET, 4 #10045092 MAST ARM BRACKET, 4 #10045092 MAST ARM BRACKET, 4
SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC
ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT
BRACKET ASSEMBILY BRACKET ASSEMBILY BRACKET ASSEMBILY
9|10045093; BRACKET, 5-SECTION, 100| EA $185.54 $18,554.00| 68 $0.00 No Bid $120.70 $12,070.00| 69 $82.50 $8,250.00| 33 9|10045093; BRACKET, 5-SECTION, 100| EA $121.17 $12,117.00| 70 $119.00 $11,900.00 $118.00 $11,800.00( 71 9|10045093; BRACKET, 5-SECTION, 100| EA $119.99 $11,999.00| 72 $92.95 $9,295.00| 73 $138.00 $13,800.00
HORIZONTAL MAST ARM; SAP Mtl HORIZONTAL MAST ARM; SAP Mtl HORIZONTAL MAST ARM; SAP Mtl
#10045093 MAST ARM BRACKET, 5 #10045093 MAST ARM BRACKET, 5 #10045093 MAST ARM BRACKET, 5
SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC SECTION WITH ASTRO BRAC
ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT ARTICULATED TENON MOUNT
BRACKFT ASSEMBIY BRACKET ASSEMBILY BRACKFET ASSEMBILY
Sub-Total: $192,879.00 $25,750.00 $176,932.50 $613,300.00 Sub-Total: $447,083.00 $913,550.00 $489,200.00 Sub-Total: $496,350.00 $523,745.00 $570,860.00

TRAFFIC SIGNAL CONTROL HARDWARE BidTab-524062 1 Close Date 03/15/2012 10:30AM



Tagalucci Leotek TX Highway General Traffic Republic Intelligent Paradigm McCain Inc. Globe Electric Traffic Parts Rob-Mac Ind.
Mfg Unit Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Item # Description Qty |U/M | Unit Price Line Total Note | Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note |ltem # Description Qty |U/M Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note |ltem # Description Qty [U/M] Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
Group 3 - Fittings, Housings & Suspensions - Specification 16716 Group 3 - Fittings, Housings & Suspensions - Specification 16716 Group 3 - Fittings, Housings & Suspensions - Specification 16716
1{10000153; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 2000( EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $8.55 $17,100.00( 74 $7.00 $14,000.00( 33 1/10000153; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 2000| EA $8.64 $17,280.00| 75 $8.75 $17,500.00 $15.50 $31,000.00| 76 1/10000153; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 2000( EA $15.99 $31,980.00( 77 $12.25 $24,500.00( 78 $18.40 $36,800.00
ALUMINUM 1-1/2" X 12"; SAP Material ALUMINUM 1-1/2" X 12"; SAP Material ALUMINUM 1-1/2" X 12"; SAP Material
#10000153 #10000153 #10000153
2|10045096; NIPPLE, ALUMINUM NPS 1- | 1250| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $13.20 $16,500.00| 79 $12.00 $15,000.00 80 2|10045096; NIPPLE, ALUMINUM NPS 1- [1250| EA $13.32 $16,650.00 81 $13.00 $16,250.00 $16.50 $20,625.00| 82 2|10045096; NIPPLE, ALUMINUM NPS 1- | 1250| EA $16.99 $21,237.50| 77 $16.60 $20,750.00| 83 $19.55 $24,437.50
1/2" X 24"; SAP Mtl #10045096 1/2" X 24"; SAP Mtl #10045096 1/2" X 24"; SAP Mtl #10045096
3/10000302; TEE, SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-1/2| 750| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $13.10 $9,825.00| 84 $8.95 $6,712.50| 33 3/10000302; TEE, SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-1/2| 750| EA $14.42 $10,815.00( 85 $20.00 $15,000.00 $9.00 $6,750.00| 86 3/10000302; TEE, SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-1/2| 750| EA $9.99 $7,492.50| 77 $8.95 $6,712.50| 87 $11.50 $8,625.00
IN, ALUMINUM; SAP Mtl #10000302 IN, ALUMINUM; SAP Mtl #10000302 IN, ALUMINUM; SAP Mtl #10000302
4110000319; EYE SUSPENSION, 1-1/2IN | 400| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $4.65 $1,860.00| 33 4({10000319; EYE SUSPENSION, 1-1/2IN | 400| EA $5.62 $2,248.00| 88 $8.50 $3,400.00 $5.75 $2,300.00| 89 4(10000319; EYE SUSPENSION, 1-1/2IN | 400| EA $5.99 $2,396.00| 77 $4.49 $1,796.00| 90 $7.00 $2,800.00
REF DRW C-1765; SAP Mtl #10000319 REF DRW C-1765; SAP Mtl #10000319 REF DRW C-1765; SAP Mtl #10000319
5110018381; ASSEMBLY, SIGNAL PED 500| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $138.00 $69,000.00( 33 5/10018381; ASSEMBLY, SIGNAL PED 500( EA $149.78 $74,890.00| 91 $165.00 $82,500.00 $133.00 $66,500.00( 92 5/10018381; ASSEMBLY, SIGNAL PED 500| EA $134.99 $67,495.00( 93 $155.00 $77,500.00| 94 $80.50 $40,250.00
CLAMSHELL W/0O COUNT; SAP Mtl CLAMSHELL W/O COUNT; SAP Mtl CLAMSHELL W/O COUNT; SAP Mtl
#10018381 PED W/Side of Pole Mount #10018381 PED W/Side of Pole Mount #10018381 PED W/Side of Pole Mount
6/10000301; CROSS SIGNAL, CAST 1250| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $19.05 $23,812.50| 95 $15.95 $19,937.50( 80 6/10000301; CROSS SIGNAL, CAST 1250| EA $22.37 $27,962.50( 96 $28.00 $35,000.00 $11.50 $14,375.00( 97 6/10000301; CROSS SIGNAL, CAST 1250| EA $11.99 $14,987.50| 77 $11.25 $14,062.50( 98 $88.55 $110,687.50
ALUM 1-1/2 CF-260; SAP mtl ALUM 1-1/2 CF-260; SAP mtl ALUM 1-1/2 CF-260; SAP mtl
#10000301 #10000301 #10000301
7110000300; PLATE, POLE CAST ALUM 1250| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $10.75 $13,437.50| 99 $6.95 $8,687.50| 80 7/10000300; PLATE, POLE CAST ALUM 1250| EA $10.85 $13,562.50( 100 $11.00 $13,750.00 $7.00 $8,750.00| 101 7/10000300; PLATE, POLE CAST ALUM 1250| EA $7.99 $9,987.50| 77 $6.95 $8,687.50| 102 $9.20 $11,500.00
PELCO SE4071 P34; SAP Mtl # PELCO SE4071 P34; SAP Mtl # PELCO SE4071 P34; SAP Mtl #
10000300 10000300 10000300
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $80,675.00 $135,197.50 $163,408.00 $183,400.00 $150,300.00 $155,576.00 $154,008.50 $235,100.00
Group 4 - Programmable Signal Heads - Specification 16717 Group 4 - Programmable Signal Heads - Specification 16717 Group 4 - Programmable Signal Heads - Specification 16717
1/10045099; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 25| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 1/10045099; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 25| EA $316.51 $7,912.75| 103 $0.00 No Bid $1,524.00 $38,100.00| 104 1/10045099; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 25| EA | $1,549.99 $38,749.75( 105 | $1,905.00 $47,625.00| 105 | $1,782.50 $44,562.50
VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl
#10045099 3-Section Head Signal #10045099 3-Section Head Signal #10045099 3-Section Head Signal
Proarammable, Flat Black Proarammable. Flat Black Proarammable. Flat Black
2|10045100; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 50| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 2|10045100; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 50| EA $320.91 $16,045.50( 103 $0.00 No Bid $1,533.00 $76,650.00| 106 2|10045100; SIGNAL, 3-SECTION, 12" 50| EA | $1,549.99 $77,499.50( 107 | $1,916.25 $95,812.50( 108 | $1,782.50 $89,125.00
VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mmtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl VEHICLE SIGNAL HE; SAP Mtl
#10045100 3-Section Head Signal #10045100 3-Section Head Signal #10045100 3-Section Head Signal
Proarammable, Federal Yellow Proarammable, Federal Yellow Proarammable, Federal Yellow
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $23,958.25 $0.00 $114,750.00 $116,249.25 $143,437.50 $133,687.50
Group 5 - Pedestrian LED Countdown Module - Specification 16719 Group 5 - Pedestrian LED Countdown Module - Specification 16719 Group 5 - Pedestrian LED Countdown Module - Specification 16719
1/10022626; SIGNAL, LED PED, 16X18 750| EA $0.00 No Bid $97.00 $72,750.00( 109 | $177.50 $133,125.00| 110 $135.00 $101,250.00| 111 1/10022626; SIGNAL, LED PED, 16X18 750| EA $119.77 $89,827.50( 112 $173.00 $129,750.00 $160.00 $120,000.00| 113 1/10022626; SIGNAL, LED PED, 16X18 750| EA $164.99 $123,742.50| 114 $137.50 $103,125.00| 115 $189.75 $142,312.50
IN COUNTDOWN; SAP Mtl #10022626 IN COUNTDOWN; SAP Mtl #10022626 IN COUNTDOWN; SAP Mtl #10022626
Sub-Total: $0.00 $72,750.00 $133,125.00 $101,250.00 $89,827.50 $129,750.00 $120,000.00 $123,742.50 $103,125.00 $142,312.50
Tagalucci Leotek TX Highway General Traffic Republic Intelligent Paradigm McCain Inc. Globe Electric Traffic Parts Rob-Mac Ind.
Mfg Unit Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Item # Description Qty |U/M | Unit Price Line Total Note | Price Line Total Note |Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note |ltem # Description Qty |U/M Unit Price Line Total Note |Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note |ltem # Description Qty |U/M| Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note | Unit Price Line Total Note
Group 6 - Pedestrian Signal Push Button & CPU - Specification 16750 Group 6 - Pedestrian Signal Push Button & CPU - Specification 16750 Group 6 - Pedestrian Signal Push Button & CPU - Specification 16750
1/10045094; BUTTON, ACCESSIBLE 500| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 1{10045094; BUTTON, ACCESSIBLE 500| EA $401.79 $200,895.00| 116 $0.00 No Bid $401.50 $200,750.00| 117 1{10045094; BUTTON, ACCESSIBLE 500| EA $404.99 $202,495.00| 118 $468.75 $234,375.00| 119 $465.75 $232,875.00
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL- PU; SAP Mtl PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL- PU; SAP Mtl PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL- PU; SAP Mtl
#10045094 WHEN ORDERING, DEPT #10045094 WHEN ORDERING, DEPT #10045094 WHEN ORDERING, DEPT
TO SPECIFY FLAT BLACK OR FEDERAL TO SPECIFY FLAT BLACK OR FEDERAL TO SPECIFY FLAT BLACK OR FEDERAL
YELLOW YELLOW YELLOW
2|10045095; BOARD, ACCESSIBLE 50| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid 2|10045095; BOARD, ACCESSIBLE 50| EA $2,421.19 $121,059.50| 120 $0.00 No Bid $2,425.50 $121,275.00| 121 2|10045095; BOARD, ACCESSIBLE 50| EA | $2,499.99 $124,999.50| 122 | $2,887.50 $144,375.00| 123 | $2,875.00 $143,750.00
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL- CPU; SAP Mtl PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL- CPU; SAP Mtl PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL- CPU; SAP Mtl
#10045095 #10045095 #10045095
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $321,954.50 $0.00 $322,025.00 $327,494.50 $378,750.00 $376,625.00
Grand Total: $192,879.00 $199,422.50 $614,182.50 $994,997.50 Grand Total: $1,174,219.25 $1,390,400.00 $1,396,387.50 Grand Total: $1,426,768.25 $1,489,156.00 $1,696,810.00
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