
1 10012740 3 EA No Bid  $                  -   $5,500.00 $16,500.00 $55,000.00 $165,000.00 
2 10021252 5 EA $32,122.98  $     160,614.90 $3,000.00 $15,000.00 $25,000.00 $125,000.00 
3 10012730 6 EA $3,515.00  $       21,090.00 $2,800.00 $16,800.00 $2,350.00 $14,100.00 
4 10012727 5 EA $12,810.47  $       64,052.35 $1,500.00 $7,500.00 $5,500.00 $27,500.00 
5 10021254 5 EA $7,830.13  $       39,150.65 $2,313.00 $11,565.00 $3,850.00 $19,250.00 
6 10012718 10 EA $5,920.00  $       59,200.00 $585.00 $5,850.00 $695.00 $6,950.00 
7 10012717 10 EA $18,453.38  $     184,533.80 $585.00 $5,850.00 $695.00 $6,950.00 
8 10012736 20 EA $773.30  $       15,466.00 $522.50 $10,450.00 $499.00 $9,980.00 
9 10012719 25 EA $2,201.50  $       55,037.50 $2,288.00 $57,200.00 $2,350.00 $58,750.00 

10 10012725 2 EA No Bid  $                  -   $3,458.00 $6,916.00 No Bid $0.00 
11 10021256 2 EA $12,210.47  $       24,420.94 $1,750.00 $3,500.00 $3,250.00 $6,500.00 
12 10012737 10 EA $4,347.50  $       43,475.00 $2,850.00 $28,500.00 $4,990.00 $49,900.00 
13 10012722 10 EA $5,507.60  $       55,076.00 $897.00 $8,970.00 $1,500.00 $15,000.00 
14 10012734 3 EA No Bid  $                  -   $425.00 $1,275.00 No Bid $0.00 
15 10012723 5 EA No Bid  $                  -   $3,500.00 $17,500.00 $4,250.00 $21,250.00 
16 10012729 6 EA No Bid  $                  -   $977.50 $5,865.00 No Bid $0.00 
17 10012720 2 EA No Bid  $                  -   $22,500.00 $45,000.00 No Bid $0.00 
18 10012721 3 EA $0.00  $                  -   $2,990.00 $8,970.00 No Bid $0.00 
19 10029528 7 EA $188,756.85  $  1,321,297.95 $47,000.00 $329,000.00 $80,000.00 $560,000.00 
20 10029529 10 EA $16,853.64  $     168,536.40 $2,000.00 $20,000.00 $7,500.00 $75,000.00 
21 10029530 3 EA No Bid  $                  -   $605.00 $1,815.00 No Bid $0.00 
22 10012735 10 EA $10,009.04  $     100,090.40 $1,000.00 $10,000.00 $4,500.00 $45,000.00 
23 10012738 3 EA No Bid  $                  -   $2,000.00 $6,000.00 No Bid $0.00 
24 10021258 20 EA $3,097.81  $       61,956.20 $550.00 $11,000.00 $895.00 $17,900.00 
25 10012726 5 EA $5,106.29  $       25,531.45 $800.00 $4,000.00 $1,895.00 $9,475.00 
26 10012733 30 EA $19,139.49  $     574,184.70 $1,800.00 $54,000.00 $1,895.00 $56,850.00 
27 10012741 5 EA No Bid  $                  -   $2,500.00 $12,500.00 No Bid $0.00 
28 10045787 20 EA $15,969.51  $     319,390.20 $550.00 $11,000.00 $895.00 $17,900.00 

$3,293,104.44 $732,526.00 $1,308,255.00 

1 10022029; LABOR, PER HOUR 500 HR $0.00 No Bid $42.50 $21,250.00 $7,500.00 $3,750,000.00 
2 10022029; LABOR, PER HOUR 

      
500 HR $0.00 No Bid $42.50 $21,250.00 $7,500.00 $3,750,000.00 

3 10022029; LABOR, PER HOUR 
      

500 HR $0.00 No Bid $42.50 $21,250.00 $75.00 $37,500.00 
4 10022029; LABOR, PER HOUR 

      
500 HR $0.00 No Bid $42.50 $21,250.00 $75.00 $37,500.00 

5 10022029; LABOR, PER HOUR 500 HR $0.00 No Bid $42.50 $21,250.00 $0.00 $0.00 
$0.00 $106,250.00 $7,575,000.00 

$3,293,104.44 $838,776.00 $8,883,255.00 

HELI-MART, INC
714-755-2999

110096

Bids Received: 3 Precision Aviation Group
404-626-2122

132891

Heli-Tech, Inc.
850-763-9000

108917

Police
S24223 - Close Date: 4/26/2012 10:30:00 AM

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Helicopter Components Overhaul / Exchange

for

GROUP A: THE FOLLOWING LINE ITEMS ARE TO BE BID PER SPECIFICATIONS. OEM PARTS ONLY

Sub-Total:
GROUP B: THE FOLLOWING LABOR COMPONENT PER YEAR IS FOR THE OVERHAUL OF HELICOPTER PARTS: please indicate below your company's flat rate for 

Sub-Total:
Grand Total:
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