City of H

ouston

Bid Tabulation

for

Security Badging Equipment and Accessories for Various Departments

for

Airport, General Services, Police
S24299 - Close Date: 7/26/2012 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 8 The Urban Circle LLC Newbart Products The IRIS Companies ldentiSys
7132268720 281-561-5557 610-944-8588 713-791-4077
— 139079 140393 140310 122357
Iltem # Description Qty U/M | Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
Group | - Magicard Tango +L and Prima 4
1/10011527; RIBBON, 113| EA $0.00 No Bid $67.31 $7,606.03 $78.00 $8,814.00 $72.25 $8,164.25
2110011528; CLEANING KIT, 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $26.26 $262.60 $27.00 $270.00 $33.00 $330.00
3/10023637; 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid| $3,025.00 $6,050.00| $3,297.00 $6,594.00
4(10022984; FILM, 128|ROL $0.00 No Bid $42.57 $5,448.96 $46.50 $5,952.00 $59.46 $7,610.88
5/10009386; FILM, 18|ROL $0.00 No Bid $69.42 $1,249.56 $75.00 $1,350.00 $97.85 $1,761.30
6/10038847; RIBBON, 263|ROL $0.00 No Bid $257.42 $67,701.46 $274.00 $72,062.00 $241.39 $63,485.57
7110033745; PRINTER, ALL 1 EA $0.00 No Bid| $2,917.10 $2,917.10| $3,650.00 $3,650.00( $3,297.00 $3,297.00
8/10033745; PRINTER, ALL 1| EA $0.00 No Bid| $1,596.31 $1,596.31| $1,980.00 $1,980.00| $1,701.90 $1,701.90
9110033745; PRINTER, ALL 53| EA $0.00 No Bid $258.63 $13,707.39 $295.00 $15,635.00 $241.00 $12,773.00
10{10033745; PRINTER, ALL 40| EA $0.00 No Bid $81.00 $3,240.00 $84.00 $3,360.00 $88.70 $3,548.00
11/10033745; PRINTER, ALL 20| EA $0.00 No Bid $355.54 $7,110.80 $320.00 $6,400.00 $209.00 $4,180.00
12110033745; PRINTER, ALL 10| EA $0.00 No Bid $55.73 $557.30 $56.00 $560.00 $52.50 $525.00
Sub-Total: $0.00 $111,397.51 $126,083.00 $113,970.90
Group Il - Fargo Ultra Card *This group will not have approved equals, supplies are for existing equipment*
1/10022823; 2| EA $0.00 No Bid| $1,667.28 $3,334.56| $1,475.00 $2,950.00| $1,558.60 $3,117.20
2/10013404; RIBBON, 75| EA $0.00 No Bid $43.94 $3,295.50 $47.00 $3,525.00 $42.95 $3,221.25
3/10013404; RIBBON, 200( EA $0.00 No Bid $112.15 $22,430.00 $115.00 $23,000.00 $107.55 $21,510.00
4(10014611; CARD, PVC 45000( EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.07 $3,105.00 $0.16 $6,975.00
5/10026494; CARD, FARGO 45000( PAA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.10 $4,275.00 $0.20 $9,000.00
6/10014611; CARD, PVC 13500 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.06 $810.00 $0.05 $702.00 $0.10 $1,350.00
Sub-Total: $0.00 $29,870.06 $37,557.00 $45,173.45
Group 1l - Badging Accessories
1/10013398; CLIP, ID CARD 161000| EA $0.37 $59,570.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.05 $7,728.00 $0.07 $10,465.00
2|10038805; LANYARDS,3/8" 984| EA $1.61 $1,584.24 $0.00 No Bid $0.35 $344.40 $0.27 $265.68
3/10038805; LANYARDS,3/8" 984| EA $2.61 $2,568.24 $0.00 No Bid $0.98 $964.32 $1.05 $1,033.20
4(10012184; CLIP, NAME 1700| EA $1.71 $2,907.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.39 $663.00 $0.41 $697.00
5/10013400; CARD, ID 500| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.18 $90.00 $0.19 $95.00
6/10013398; CLIP, ID CARD 1700| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.05 $81.60 $0.09 $153.00
7110012184; CLIP, NAME 2700 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.47 $1,269.00 $0.00 No Bid
8/10012183; LANYARD, ID 1920| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1.13 $2,169.60 $8.49 $16,300.80
9110012182; LANYARD, ID 840( EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $1.13 $949.20 $0.00 No Bid
10{10038848; FILM, BADGE 351|ROL $0.00 No Bid $89.42 $31,386.42 $94.50 $33,169.50 $88.70 $31,133.70
11/10045509; CLEANER, 40( SET $0.00 No Bid $47.56 $1,902.40 $50.50 $2,020.00 $52.50 $2,100.00
Sub-Total: $66,629.48 $33,288.82 $49,448.62 $62,243.38
Group IV - EDI Secure 9300 Re-Transfer Printer, Non Locking Version
1(10044518; PRINTER, 2| EA $0.00 No Bid| $5,032.57 $10,065.14| $5,180.00 $10,360.00| $4,247.50 $8,495.00
2110014612; COMPONENTS, 2| EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid| $1,198.00 $2,396.00| $1,105.00 $2,210.00
Sub-Total: $0.00 $10,065.14 $12,756.00 $10,705.00
Grand Total: $66,629.48 $184,621.53 $225,844.62 $232,092.73




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

Security Badging Equipment and Accessories for Vario

for

Airport, General Services, Police
S24299 - Close Date: 7/26/2012 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 8 ColorID LLC PLASTIC CARD SYSTEMS Cerberus Star Enterprises ASAP Security Services
704-987-2238 800-742-2273 7134875542 713-373-0753
140318 110317 136329 131047
Iltem # Description Qty Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
Group | - Magicard Tango +L and Prima 4
1{10011527; RIBBON, 113 $76.25 $8,616.25 $91.00 $10,283.00 $75.00 $8,475.00 $116.53 $13,167.89
2110011528; CLEANING KIT, 10 $27.25 $272.50 $32.00 $320.00 $35.43 $354.30 $45.60 $456.00
3/10023637; 2| $4,155.00 $8,310.00| $5,935.00 $11,870.00( $3,647.00 $7,294.00| $4,002.00 $8,004.00
4(10022984; FILM, 128 $43.80 $5,606.40 $51.35 $6,572.80 $57.00 $7,296.00 $77.27 $9,890.56
5110009386; FILM, 18 $72.10 $1,297.80 $84.50 $1,521.00 $90.00 $1,620.00 $120.00 $2,160.00
6/10038847; RIBBON, 263 $332.00 $87,316.00 $282.00 $74,166.00 $0.00 No Bid $531.00| $139,653.00
7|10033745; PRINTER, ALL 1| $3,019.00 $3,019.00| $3,840.00 $3,840.00| $3,647.00 $3,647.00( $6,620.00 $6,620.00
8|10033745; PRINTER, ALL 1| $1,655.00 $1,655.00| $2,095.00 $2,095.00| $2,047.00 $2,047.00| $3,489.00 $3,489.00
9|10033745; PRINTER, ALL 53 $265.00 $14,045.00 $282.00 $14,946.00 $322.25 $17,079.25 $534.00 $28,302.00
10/10033745; PRINTER, ALL 40 $83.25 $3,330.00 $105.00 $4,200.00 $90.15 $3,606.00 $114.00 $4,560.00
11|10033745; PRINTER, ALL 20 $319.75 $6,395.00 $297.50 $5,950.00 $360.00 $7,200.00 $600.00 $12,000.00
12|10033745; PRINTER, ALL 10 $57.14 $571.40 $65.00 $650.00 $62.89 $628.90 $78.00 $780.00
Sub-T] $140,434.35 $136,413.80 $59,247.45 $229,082.45
Group |l - Fargo Ultra Card *This group will not have
1/10022823; 2| $1,315.00 $2,630.00( $1,590.00 $3,180.00( $1,447.00 $2,894.00| $2,148.00 $4,296.00
2/10013404; RIBBON, 75 $42.10 $3,157.50 $51.00 $3,825.00 $62.00 $4,650.00 $74.22 $5,566.50
3/10013404; RIBBON, 200 $106.50 $21,300.00 $121.00 $24,200.00 $115.00 $23,000.00 $174.81 $34,962.00
4/10014611; CARD, PVC 45000 $0.19 $8,550.00 $0.11 $4,950.00 $0.00 No Bid $2.32( $104,400.00
5110026494 ; CARD, FARGO 45000 $0.23 $10,350.00 $0.21 $9,450.00 $0.00 $0.00 $1.56 $70,200.00
6/10014611; CARD, PVC 13500 $0.06 $823.50 $0.09 $1,215.00 $29.50 $398,250.00 $1.04 $14,040.00
Sub-T] $46,811.00 $46,820.00 $428,794.00 $233,464.50
Group |11 - Badging Accessories
1{10013398; CLIP, ID CARD 161000 $0.07 $11,270.00 $0.10 $16,100.00 $0.12 $18,515.00 $0.10 $16,100.00
2|10038805; LANYARDS,3/8" 984 $0.24 $240.00 $0.50 $492.00 $0.00 No Bid $1.10 $1,082.40
3/10038805; LANYARDS,3/8" 984 $0.82 $804.91 $1.50 $1,476.00 $0.00 No Bid $2.10 $2,066.40
4110012184; CLIP, NAME 1700 $0.42 $714.00 $1.14 $1,938.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.78 $1,326.00
5/10013400; CARD, ID 500 $0.19 $95.00 $0.45 $225.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.51 $255.00
6/10013398; CLIP, ID CARD 1700 $0.08 $136.00 $0.15 $255.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.10 $170.00
7110012184; CLIP, NAME 2700 $3.18 $8,586.00 $1.14 $3,078.00 $0.00 No Bid $10.65 $28,755.00
8/10012183; LANYARD, ID 1920 $4.45 $8,544.00 $5.27 $10,118.40 $0.00 No Bid $16.00 $30,720.00
9/10012182; LANYARD, ID 840 $4.45 $3,738.00 $5.27 $4,426.80 $0.00 No Bid $16.00 $13,440.00
10/10038848; FILM, BADGE 351 $73.75 $25,886.25 $105.00 $36,855.00 $0.00 No Bid $167.20 $58,687.20
11|10045509; CLEANER, 40 $0.00 No Bid $65.00 $2,600.00 $0.00 No Bid $100.32 $4,012.80
Sub-T| $60,014.16 $77,564.20 $18,515.00 $156,614.80
Group IV - EDI Secure 9300 Re-Transfer Printer, Non
1/10044518; PRINTER, 2| $2,945.00 $5,890.00| $5,525.00 $11,050.00 $0.00 No Bid| $3,860.00 $7,720.00
2|10014612; COMPONENTS, 2| $1,900.00 $3,800.00( $1,299.00 $2,598.00 $0.00 No Bid| $1,350.00 $2,700.00
Sub-T| $9,690.00 $13,648.00 $0.00 $10,420.00
Grand T $256,949.51 $274,446.00 $506,556.45 $629,581.75
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