CITY OF HOUSTON
BID TABULATION
SECURITY BADGING EQUIPMENT AND ACCESSORIES

FOR

VARIOUS DEPARTMENTS
CLOSED 04/21/2016 10:30 AM

Bids Received: 7

Newbart Products
281-561-5557
140393

Progressive Systems
7133950800
142818

SouthEast ID
8007490514
135435

IdentiSys, Inc. Bid No. 1
2814157533
122357

IdentiSys, Inc. Bid No. 2
2814157533
122357

IdentiSys, Inc. Bid No. 3
2814157533
122357

Iris Ltd, Inc.
610-944-8588
140310

ltem #

Description

Qty U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Group |, Security Badging Equipment and Accessories *This is a

group award and the City shall make an award based

on the overall

bid amount*

1

10049338; PRINTER, MAGICARD, PRIMA 4 DUO
REVERSE; Magicard Prima 4 Duo ID Card Pinter
Dual-Sided - Configurable or an approved equal

41 EA

$2,989.00

$11,956.00

$4,286.00

$17,144.00

$3,999.00

$15,996.00

$3,299.00

$13,196.00

$3,299.00

$13,196.00

$3,299.00

$13,196.00

$3,410.00

$13,640.00

10054425; PRINTER, MAGICARD, SINGLE-SIDED
LAMINATO; Single-Sided Lamination Module for
Prima 4 UNO or warranty 3 years Magicard Prima
451 UNO or an approved equal

$1,782.00

$7,128.00

$2,336.00

$9,344.00

$2,000.00

$8,000.00

$1,899.00

$7,596.00

$0.00

NO BID

$0.00

NO BID

$1,839.00

$7,356.00

10038847; RIBBON, BADGE UV PRINT 750
IMAGE COLOR; Magicard Prima434 Color Ribbon
YMCK-UV - 750 prints or an approved equal

240| ROL

$288.00

$69,120.00

$307.00

$73,680.00

$289.00

$69,360.00

$291.00

$69,840.00

$291.00

$69,840.00

$291.00

$69,840.00

$264.00

$63,360.00

10038848; FILM, BADGE REVERSE TRANSFER
1,000 PRINT; Magicard Prima436 Re-Transfer film -
1000 prints or an approved equal

164| ROL

$87.36

$14,327.04

$95.00

$15,580.00

$87.00

$14,268.00

$90.00

$14,760.00

$90.00

$14,760.00

$90.00

$14,760.00

$92.00

$15,088.00

10011528; CLEANING KIT, ID BADGE; Magicard
Prima491 Complete Cleaning Kit for All Prima
Printers -Swabs, Tissue & Cards or an approved
equal

40| EA

$59.77

$2,390.80

$63.00

$2,520.00

$60.00

$2,400.00

$55.50

$2,220.00

$55.50

$2,220.00

$55.50

$2,220.00

$53.00

$2,120.00

10014611; CARD, PVC 30MIL NO. 81754 FARGO;
Fargo 81754 CR80.30Mil Graphic Quality PVC
cards - 500 per box white 3.375" x 2.125" or an
approved equal

20000| EA

$0.08

$1,600.00

$0.08

$1,520.00

$0.06

$1,200.00

$0.045

$900.00

$0.045

$900.00

$0.045

$900.00

$0.048

$960.00

10013402; CARD, ID W/ CHIP PVC 26 BIT CARD;
HID 1386 I1SO Prox Il PVC Cards Programmed 100
per box Configuration 1386LGGMV Houston Police
Department Quantity 74,000 each or an approved
equal

74000| EA

$1.42

$105,080.00

$3.97

$293,780.00

$1.44

$106,560.00

$1.34

$99,160.00

$2.25

$166,500.00

$1.49

$110,260.00

$1.49

$110,260.00

10012183; LANYARD, ID BADGE, SPORT PLUS
BLACK; EK Lanyard Plus, color black SKU 10028B
or an approved equal

800 EA

$0.00

No Bid

$6.10

$4,880.00

$0.37

$296.00

$0.75

$600.00

$0.75

$600.00

$0.75

$600.00

$1.22

$976.00

10

10012184; CLIP, NAME BADGE RETRACTABLE;
Deluxe Retractable, reel extends up to 24" with
chrome split ring and metal clip SKU 10463B or an
approved equal

2000 EA

$0.00

No Bid

$4.20

$8,400.00

$0.49

$980.00

$0.47

$940.00

$0.47

$940.00

$0.47

$940.00

$0.57

$1,140.00

11

10038225; PRINTER, RETRANSFER, SINGLE OR
DOUBLE; ISG RTX6000 Duplex Re-Transfer
Printer or an approved equal *No extended service
warranty*

20 EA

$2,413.79

$48,275.80

$0.00

No Bid

$4,632.00

$92,640.00

$3,549.00

$70,980.00

$3,549.00

$70,980.00

$3,549.00

$70,980.00

$4,170.00

$83,400.00

12

10013398; CLIP, ID CARD BADGE STAINLESS
STEEL; ID strap clip adapter, 25 per pack, clear
color Baumgartens BAU68010 or an approved
equal

2E+05] EA

$0.10

$15,000.00

$0.08

$11,340.00

$0.06

$9,000.00

$0.05

$7,500.00

$0.05

$7,500.00

$0.05

$7,500.00

$0.055

$8,250.00

13

10038847; RIBBON, BADGE UV PRINT 750
IMAGE COLOR; EDisecure DIC10313 Color
Ribbon YMCK-UV-750 Prints or an approved equal

130| ROL

$287.36

$37,356.80

$0.00

No Bid

$283.00

$36,790.00

$239.99

$31,198.70

$239.99

$31,198.70

$239.99

$31,198.70

$264.00

$34,320.00

14

10054701; RIBBON, UV FLUORESCENT COLOR
3.78"X825"; Peak RTX1022 YMCK-UV Color &
Fluorescent Ribbon 750 Images per roll For use in
Peak re-transfer ID card printers

300 EA

$202.30

$60,690.00

$0.00

No Bid

$283.00

$84,900.00

$209.00

$62,700.00

$209.00

$62,700.00

$209.00

$62,700.00

$264.00

$79,200.00

15

10054700; RIBBON, RE-TRANSFER FILM 3.78" X
229" Peak RTX Re-transfer ribbon to be used in

the ISG RTX6000 printer

300| ROL

$67.84

$20,352.00

$0.00

No Bid

$99.00

$29,700.00

$71.00

$21,300.00

$71.00

$21,300.00

$71.00

$21,300.00

$90.70

$27,210.00

Sub-Total:

$393,276.44

$438,188.00

$472,090.00

$402,890.70

$462,634.70

$406,394.70

$447,280.00

Grand Total:

$393,276.44

$438,188.00

$472,090.00

$402,890.70

$462,634.70

$406,394.70

$447,280.00




	BidTab-S25713

