
Will not award

Testing Nov. / Dec.

1 10040463; SHELL, SHOTGUN, 12GA, RIFLED SLUG; 
#10040463 12 GA. SLUG TACTICAL 2 3/4" EQUAL TO: 
WIN. RA12RS15

18 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $600.00 $10,800.00 $0.00 No Bid

2 10040464; SHELL, SHOTGUN, 12GA, OO BUCKSHOT; 
#10040464 12 GA. OO BUCKSHOT EQUAL TO: WIN. 
RA12OO

25 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $410.00 $10,250.00 $0.00 No Bid

3 10040465; SHELL,SHOTGUN,12GA,OO BUCKSHOT,HI-
VELO; #10040465 12 GA. OO BUCKSHOT HIGH 
VELOCITY EQUAL TO: WIN. RA12OOHD

1 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $410.00 $410.00 $0.00 No Bid

4 10021345; AMMUNITION 22 CAL, LONG RIFLE STD 
VELOC; #10021345 22 CAL. LONG RIFLE STD. VEL. 
EQUAL TO: REM. TB22A

50 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $185.00 $9,250.00 $0.00 No Bid

5 10021362; AMMUNITION, 380 CAL 95 GRAIN FMJ; 
#10021362 380 CAL. 95 GR. CLEAN FIRE FMJ EQUAL 
TO: REM LL380AP2

173 TS $280.00 $48,440.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $189.00 $32,697.00 

6 10021341; AMMUNITION 9MM, 124 GRAIN FMJ CLEAN 
FIRE; #10021341 9MM 124 GR. FMJ CLEAN FIRE 
EQUAL TO: WIN WC92

340 TS $283.53 $96,400.20 $0.00 No Bid $252.00 $85,680.00 $195.00 $66,300.00 

7 10040466; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 38 SPECIAL 
158GR; #10040466 38 CAL. 158 GR. CLEAN FIRE 
EQUAL TO: SPEER 53899

327 TS $301.18 $98,485.86 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

8 10019549; AMMUNITION .40 CAL 180 GRAIN; 
#10019549 40 CAL. 180 GR. CLEAN FIRE EQUAL TO: 
SPEER 53880

7295 TS $318.82 $2,325,791.90 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $235.00 $1,714,325.00 

9 10021372; AMMUNITION, 45 AUTO 230 GRAIN FMJ 
CLEAN; #10021372 45 ACP FMJ CLEAN FIRE EQUAL 
TO: SPEER 53885

817 TS $395.29 $322,951.93 $0.00 No Bid $378.00 $308,826.00 $276.00 $225,492.00 
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Bid #2 137739

Pierce Munitions LLC Lone Star Uniforms, Inc. Grace Ammo LLC

City of Houston Bid Tabulation
for Ammunition & Accessories for Various Departments

for Fire, Police
S23774 - Close Date: 6/23/2011 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 9 Bailey's House Of Guns, Inc.
713-433-2475 7168220617 832-237-8000 970-471-2253



GROUP 1 - CONTINUED Bailey's #2 Pierce Munitions Lone Star Grace Ammo
10 10040467; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, .223CAL 

55GRAIN; #10040467 223 CAL. 55 GR. FMJ (EQUAL 
TO AE223 OR XM193)

1600 TS $317.65 $508,240.00 $355.00 $568,000.00 $287.00 $459,200.00 $285.00 $456,000.00 

11 10042480; SHELL, SHOTGUN 12GA, 1-1/8OZ #9 SHOT; 
#10042480 12 GA. 2 3/4" #9 SHOT EQUAL TO: FED 
T1159

332 TS $302.35 $100,380.20 $0.00 No Bid $256.00 $84,992.00 $0.00 No Bid

12 10042481; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 44 SPECIAL 
246GR; #10042481 44 SPECIAL 246 GR. CANNOT BE 
BELOW 240 GR. EQUAL TO: WIN. X44SP (240-246 GR. 
IS ACCEPTABLE)

10 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

13 10042470; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 45 LONG 
COLT; #10042470 45 LONG COLT 250 GR. EQUAL TO: 
REM. R45C OR WIN. X45CBTR (230-250 GR. IS 
ACCEPTABLE)

8 TS $0.00 No Bid $364.00 $2,912.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

14 10021342; AMMUNITION 10 MM, CALIBER 180 GRAIN; 
#10021342 10MM 180 GR. FMJ EQUAL TO: REM. 
L10MM6 OR FED. AE10A (180-200 GR. IS 
ACCEPTABLE)

8 TS $0.00 No Bid $354.00 $2,832.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$3,500,690.09 $573,744.00 $969,408.00 $2,494,814.00 

1 10042471; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 308CAL, 
168GR; #10042471 308 CAL. 168 GR. SIERRA 
MATCHKING BTHP 7.62 X 51MM (GM308M) NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

20 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10042472; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 9MM 124GR; 
#10042472 9MM(+P) 124 GR. JACKETED HP SPEER 
53617 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

12 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

3 10042473; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 40 S&W 
155GR; #10042473 40 CAL. S&W 155 GR. JACKETED 
HP SPEER 53961 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

27 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

4 10042474; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 45 ACP 230GR; 
#10042474 45 ACP 230 GR. JACKETED HP SPEER 
53966 OR REM. GSB45APB NO SUBSTITUTIONS

12 TS $441.18 $5,294.16 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

5 10021360; AMMUNITION .308 CAL 165 GRAIN 
TROPHY BON; #10021360 308 CAL. 165 GR. BONDED 
SOFT POINT FEDERAL LE308T1 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

6 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
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GROUP 2 - CONTINUED Bailey's #2 Pierce Munitions Lone Star Grace Ammo
6 10042284; AMMUNITION, 308 HORNADY 110 GR. TAP 

URBA; #10042284 .308 HORNADY 100 GR. URBAN 
TAP NO SUBSTITUTIONS

120 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

7 10042475; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 40 S&W 
180GR; #10042475 40 S&W 180 GR. GDHP SPEER 
#53962 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

2 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

8 10042427; AMMUNITION, .223 CAL. (5.56MM) 55 GR. 
HI; #10042427 .223 55 GR. HI-SHOK SP FEDERAL 
T223A NO SUBSTITUTIONS

50 TS $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$5,294.16 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10040508; GRENADE, SAF-SMOKE TEAR GAS, 
TRIPLE CHAS; #10040508 GRENADE, SAF-SMOKE 
TEAR GAS, TRIPLE CHASER

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10040503; GUN, 40MM TEAR GAS LAUNCHER, MUST 
BE COM; #10040503 40MM TEAR GAS LAUNCHER, 
MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH DEF-TECH MUNITIONS, 
SINGLE OR DOUBLE ACTION, ONE-PIECE

5 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

3 10021266; GRENADES, CS TEAR GAS TRIPLE 
CHASERS; #10021266 GRENADES, TEAR GAS, CS 
37MM MULTI-CHAMBER LAUNCHABLE

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

4 10019555; KIT, TRAINING AMMUNITION 40MM 
ROUND; #10019555 TRAINING KITS, EXACT IMPACT 
SPONGE 40MM, ROUND, CTS NO. 6325, 24 SHOT/KIT

5 KIT $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10040509; GUN, PEPPERBALL, SEMI-AUTOMATIC, 
HIGH PR; #10040509 GUN, PEPPERBALL, SEMI-
AUTOMATIC, HIGH PRESSURE AIR 3000 PSI, 
HOPPER CAPACITY 160 PROJECTILES, 8.5 IN., 2.9 
LBS W/O AIR BOTTLE, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH

5 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10038977; ROUND, PEPPERBALL, POWDER 
PROJECTILES, R; #10038977 ROUND, PEPPERBALL, 
POWDER PROJECTILES, RED, LIVE AGENT, HOT 
PAVA, 375/BOX

5 BOX $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
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Bailey's #2 Pierce Munitions Lone Star Grace Ammo
1 10040504; PROJECTILE, SKAT SHELLS, 40 MM, CS 

SMOKE; #10040504 PROJECTILES, SKAT SHELLS 40 
MM, CS SMOKE, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH DEF-
TECH GAS GUN/LAUNCHER

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10040506; PROJECTILE, SKAT SHELLS, 40 MM, SAF-
SMOK; #10040506 PROJECTILES, SKAT SHELLS 40 
MM, SAF-SMOKE, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH DEF-
TECH GAS GUN/LAUNCHER

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

3 10040520; EXTINGUISHER, RIOT, MK-46, NON-
FLAMMABLE; #10040520 EXTINGUISHER, RIOT, 
INCLUDING REFILLS AND ACCESSORIES MK-46, NON-
FLAMMABLE, NON-TOXIC, FOOD GRADE, 18 
BURSTS, 14-1/4 IN. X 4.5 IN., 46 OZ

5 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

4 10039194; REFILL, RIOT EXTINGUISHER, 46OZ, 18 
BURS; #10039194 EXTINGUISHER, RIOT, INCLUDING 
REFILLS REFILL, 46 OZ, 18 BURSTS, NON-
FLAMMABLE, NON-TOXIC

15 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Disposable DD - Non reloadable flashbang 
Def Tec 8901NR

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10021269; DISTRACTION DEVICE COMMAND, 
INITIATED RE; #25 Reload Def Tec 7001

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

3 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Practice #25 Reload Case of 24 Def Tec 
7007

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

4 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Practice #25 Gun Steel Body Def Tec 7000

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

5 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Standard Wallbanger Def Tec 1008

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

6 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Shock Tube 1000 Feet Def Tec 150944

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

7 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Shock Cord Splicers 30Pak Def Tec 7023

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

8 10021268; DISTRACTION DEVICE DEFTECH NO 7001; 
#25 Reload Command Initiation Def Tec 7001 CI

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
PAGE 4 (LEFT) $3,505,984.25 $573,744.00 $969,408.00 $2,494,814.00 
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Award Items

Unit Price Line Total

1 10040463; SHELL, SHOTGUN, 12GA, RIFLED SLUG; 
#10040463 12 GA. SLUG TACTICAL 2 3/4" EQUAL TO: 
WIN. RA12RS15

18 TS $466.40 $8,395.20 $411.80 $7,412.40 $378.35 $6,810.30 $0.00 No Bid $469.99 $8,459.82 

2 10040464; SHELL, SHOTGUN, 12GA, OO BUCKSHOT; 
#10040464 12 GA. OO BUCKSHOT EQUAL TO: WIN. 
RA12OO

25 TS $373.26 $9,331.50 $372.30 $9,307.50 $411.34 $10,283.50 $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $8,125.00 

3 10040465; SHELL,SHOTGUN,12GA,OO BUCKSHOT,HI-
VELO; #10040465 12 GA. OO BUCKSHOT HIGH 
VELOCITY EQUAL TO: WIN. RA12OOHD

1 TS $390.46 $390.46 $394.80 $394.80 $367.78 $367.78 $0.00 No Bid $325.00 $325.00 

4 10021345; AMMUNITION 22 CAL, LONG RIFLE STD 
VELOC; #10021345 22 CAL. LONG RIFLE STD. VEL. 
EQUAL TO: REM. TB22A

50 TS $39.60 $1,980.00 $42.60 $2,130.00 $40.21 $2,010.50 $0.00 No Bid $36.00 $1,800.00 

5 10021362; AMMUNITION, 380 CAL 95 GRAIN FMJ; 
#10021362 380 CAL. 95 GR. CLEAN FIRE FMJ EQUAL 
TO: REM LL380AP2

173 TS $255.28 $44,163.44 $184.80 $31,970.40 $275.18 $47,606.14 $326.98 $56,567.54 $230.00 $39,790.00 

6 10021341; AMMUNITION 9MM, 124 GRAIN FMJ CLEAN 
FIRE; #10021341 9MM 124 GR. FMJ CLEAN FIRE EQUAL 
TO: WIN WC92

340 TS $194.80 $66,232.00 $188.20 $63,988.00 $248.45 $84,473.00 $321.62 $109,350.80 $210.00 $71,400.00 

7 10040466; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 38 SPECIAL 
158GR; #10040466 38 CAL. 158 GR. CLEAN FIRE EQUAL 
TO: SPEER 53899

327 TS $254.72 $83,293.44 $209.80 $68,604.60 $263.92 $86,301.84 $353.79 $115,689.33 $245.00 $80,115.00 

8 10019549; AMMUNITION .40 CAL 180 GRAIN; #10019549 
40 CAL. 180 GR. CLEAN FIRE EQUAL TO: SPEER 53880

7295 TS $220.70 $1,610,006.50 $219.80 $1,603,441.00 $279.38 $2,038,077.10 $375.23 $2,737,302.85 $256.00 $1,867,520.00 

9 10021372; AMMUNITION, 45 AUTO 230 GRAIN FMJ 
CLEAN; #10021372 45 ACP FMJ CLEAN FIRE EQUAL TO: 
SPEER 53885

817 TS $283.46 $231,586.82 $255.80 $208,988.60 $346.39 $283,000.63 $455.63 $372,249.71 $274.99 $224,666.83 
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ALS Technologies
870-445-8746

Bitterroot Valley Ammunition Co.
406-777-2641

110505 Bid #1 136426
662-756-2810 521-451-8298 713-433-2475

Precision Delta Corp GT Distributors, Inc. Bailey's House Of Guns, Inc.

Item # Description Qty



GROUP 1 - CONTINUED Precision Delta GT Dist. Bailey's #1 ALS Technologies Bitterroot Valley
10 10040467; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, .223CAL 

55GRAIN; #10040467 223 CAL. 55 GR. FMJ (EQUAL TO 
AE223 OR XM193)

1600 TS $358.02 $572,832.00 $369.80 $591,680.00 $284.21 $454,736.00 $633.59 $1,013,744.00 $318.00 $508,800.00 

11 10042480; SHELL, SHOTGUN 12GA, 1-1/8OZ #9 SHOT; 
#10042480 12 GA. 2 3/4" #9 SHOT EQUAL TO: FED 
T1159

332 TS $293.16 $97,329.12 $333.60 $110,755.20 $264.95 $87,963.40 $0.00 No Bid $179.99 $59,795.68 

12 10042481; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 44 SPECIAL 
246GR; #10042481 44 SPECIAL 246 GR. CANNOT BE 
BELOW 240 GR. EQUAL TO: WIN. X44SP (240-246 GR. IS 
ACCEPTABLE)

10 TS $524.00 $5,240.00 $0.00 No Bid $390.72 $3,907.20 $0.00 No Bid $389.00 $3,890.00 

13 10042470; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 45 LONG COLT; 
#10042470 45 LONG COLT 250 GR. EQUAL TO: REM. 
R45C OR WIN. X45CBTR (230-250 GR. IS ACCEPTABLE)

8 TS $734.00 $5,872.00 $574.20 $4,593.60 $429.90 $3,439.20 $0.00 No Bid $425.00 $3,400.00 

14 10021342; AMMUNITION 10 MM, CALIBER 180 GRAIN; 
#10021342 10MM 180 GR. FMJ EQUAL TO: REM. 
L10MM6 OR FED. AE10A (180-200 GR. IS ACCEPTABLE)

8 TS $0.00 No Bid $321.60 $2,572.80 $327.84 $2,622.72 $0.00 No Bid $295.00 $2,360.00 

$2,736,652.48 $2,705,838.90 $3,111,599.31 $4,404,904.23 $2,880,408.33 

1 10042471; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 308CAL, 168GR; 
#10042471 308 CAL. 168 GR. SIERRA MATCHKING BTHP 
7.62 X 51MM (GM308M) NO SUBSTITUTIONS

20 TS $0.00 No Bid $699.80 $13,996.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10042472; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 9MM 124GR; 
#10042472 9MM(+P) 124 GR. JACKETED HP SPEER 
53617 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

12 TS $0.00 No Bid $315.10 $3,781.20 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

3 10042473; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 40 S&W 155GR; 
#10042473 40 CAL. S&W 155 GR. JACKETED HP SPEER 
53961 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

27 TS $0.00 No Bid $338.80 $9,147.60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

4 10042474; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 45 ACP 230GR; 
#10042474 45 ACP 230 GR. JACKETED HP SPEER 
53966 OR REM. GSB45APB NO SUBSTITUTIONS

12 TS $0.00 No Bid $369.80 $4,437.60 $394.74 $4,736.88 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

5 10021360; AMMUNITION .308 CAL 165 GRAIN TROPHY 
BON; #10021360 308 CAL. 165 GR. BONDED SOFT 
POINT FEDERAL LE308T1 NO SUBSTITUTIONS

6 TS $0.00 No Bid $1,273.80 $7,642.80 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
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GROUP 2 - CONTINUED Precision Delta GT Dist. Bailey's #1 ALS Technologies Bitterroot Valley
6 10042284; AMMUNITION, 308 HORNADY 110 GR. TAP 

URBA; #10042284 .308 HORNADY 100 GR. URBAN TAP 
NO SUBSTITUTIONS

120 TS $0.00 No Bid $859.80 $103,176.00 $903.80 $108,456.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

7 10042475; CARTRIDGE, AMMUNITION, 40 S&W 180GR; 
#10042475 40 S&W 180 GR. GDHP SPEER #53962 NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

2 TS $0.00 No Bid $339.20 $678.40 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

8 10042427; AMMUNITION, .223 CAL. (5.56MM) 55 GR. HI; 
#10042427 .223 55 GR. HI-SHOK SP FEDERAL T223A NO 
SUBSTITUTIONS

50 TS $0.00 No Bid $469.20 $23,460.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $166,319.60 $113,192.88 $0.00 $0.00 

1 10040508; GRENADE, SAF-SMOKE TEAR GAS, TRIPLE 
CHAS; #10040508 GRENADE, SAF-SMOKE TEAR GAS, 
TRIPLE CHASER

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $35.90 $8,975.00 $0.00 No Bid $38.75 $9,687.50 $0.00 No Bid

2 10040503; GUN, 40MM TEAR GAS LAUNCHER, MUST BE 
COM; #10040503 40MM TEAR GAS LAUNCHER, MUST 
BE COMPATIBLE WITH DEF-TECH MUNITIONS, SINGLE 
OR DOUBLE ACTION, ONE-PIECE

5 EA $0.00 No Bid $798.80 $3,994.00 $0.00 No Bid $1,016.58 $5,082.90 $0.00 No Bid

3 10021266; GRENADES, CS TEAR GAS TRIPLE 
CHASERS; #10021266 GRENADES, TEAR GAS, CS 
37MM MULTI-CHAMBER LAUNCHABLE

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $37.20 $9,300.00 $0.00 No Bid $24.11 $6,027.50 $0.00 No Bid

4 10019555; KIT, TRAINING AMMUNITION 40MM ROUND; 
#10019555 TRAINING KITS, EXACT IMPACT SPONGE 
40MM, ROUND, CTS NO. 6325, 24 SHOT/KIT

5 KIT $0.00 No Bid $267.44 $1,337.20 $0.00 No Bid $409.25 $2,046.25 $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $23,606.20 $0.00 $22,844.15 $0.00 

1 10040509; GUN, PEPPERBALL, SEMI-AUTOMATIC, HIGH 
PR; #10040509 GUN, PEPPERBALL, SEMI-AUTOMATIC, 
HIGH PRESSURE AIR 3000 PSI, HOPPER CAPACITY 160 
PROJECTILES, 8.5 IN., 2.9 LBS W/O AIR BOTTLE, MUST 
BE COMPATIBLE WITH

5 EA $0.00 No Bid $537.80 $2,689.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

2 10038977; ROUND, PEPPERBALL, POWDER 
PROJECTILES, R; #10038977 ROUND, PEPPERBALL, 
POWDER PROJECTILES, RED, LIVE AGENT, HOT PAVA, 
375/BOX

5 BOX $0.00 No Bid $1,453.65 $7,268.25 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $9,957.25 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
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Precision Delta GT Dist. Bailey's #1 ALS Technologies Bitterroot Valley
1 10040504; PROJECTILE, SKAT SHELLS, 40 MM, CS 

SMOKE; #10040504 PROJECTILES, SKAT SHELLS 40 
MM, CS SMOKE, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH DEF-
TECH GAS GUN/LAUNCHER

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $27.90 $6,975.00 $0.00 No Bid $24.11 $6,027.50 $0.00 No Bid

2 10040506; PROJECTILE, SKAT SHELLS, 40 MM, SAF-
SMOK; #10040506 PROJECTILES, SKAT SHELLS 40 MM, 
SAF-SMOKE, MUST BE COMPATIBLE WITH DEF-TECH 
GAS GUN/LAUNCHER

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $26.74 $6,685.00 $0.00 No Bid $24.11 $6,027.50 $0.00 No Bid

3 10040520; EXTINGUISHER, RIOT, MK-46, NON-
FLAMMABLE; #10040520 EXTINGUISHER, RIOT, 
INCLUDING REFILLS AND ACCESSORIES MK-46, NON-
FLAMMABLE, NON-TOXIC, FOOD GRADE, 18 BURSTS, 
14-1/4 IN. X 4.5 IN., 46 OZ

5 EA $0.00 No Bid $318.60 $1,593.00 $0.00 No Bid $215.34 $1,076.70 $0.00 No Bid

4 10039194; REFILL, RIOT EXTINGUISHER, 46OZ, 18 
BURS; #10039194 EXTINGUISHER, RIOT, INCLUDING 
REFILLS REFILL, 46 OZ, 18 BURSTS, NON-FLAMMABLE, 
NON-TOXIC

15 EA $0.00 No Bid $61.50 $922.50 $0.00 No Bid $87.06 $1,305.90 $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $16,175.50 $0.00 $14,437.60 $0.00 

1 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Disposable DD - Non reloadable flashbang Def 
Tec 8901NR

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $39.53 $39.53 $0.00 No Bid $31.05 $31.05 $0.00 No Bid

2 10021269; DISTRACTION DEVICE COMMAND, INITIATED 
RE; #25 Reload Def Tec 7001

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $26.97 $26.97 $0.00 No Bid $25.01 $25.01 $0.00 No Bid

3 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Practice #25 Reload Case of 24 Def Tec 7007

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $27.60 $27.60 $0.00 No Bid $300.72 $300.72 $0.00 No Bid

4 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Practice #25 Gun Steel Body Def Tec 7000

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $46.68 $46.68 $0.00 No Bid $46.25 $46.25 $0.00 No Bid

5 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Standard Wallbanger Def Tec 1008

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $1,511.60 $1,511.60 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

6 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Shock Tube 1000 Feet Def Tec 150944

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $174.40 $174.40 $0.00 No Bid $140.91 $140.91 $0.00 No Bid

7 10021267; DISTRACTION DEVICE, STELL BODY 
DEFTECH; Shock Cord Splicers 30Pak Def Tec 7023

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $9.00 $9.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

8 10021268; DISTRACTION DEVICE DEFTECH NO 7001; 
#25 Reload Command Initiation Def Tec 7001 CI

1 EA $0.00 No Bid $33.30 $33.30 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

$0.00 $1,869.08 $0.00 $543.94 $0.00 
PAGE 4 (RIGHT) $2,736,652.48 $2,923,766.53 $3,224,792.19 $4,442,729.92 $2,880,408.33 

Sub-Total:
Grand Total

Group 6 - Other Noise Producing Distraction Devices - Mtl Grp 68008
Sub-Total:

Group 5 - SKAT Shells - Mtl Grp 68084
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