
City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Traffic Signal System Parts
for
Public Works
N23849 - Close Date: 6/9/2011 10:30:00 AM

Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note Note

1 10000294; LED DIODES RED 12" 
BALL TSL-12R-LX-1L1; LED DIODES 
RED BALL 12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

2950 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $21.95 $64,752.50 1 $29.68 $87,556.00 2 $30.00 $88,500.00 3 $26.95 

2 10000295; LED DIODES YLW 12" 
BALL TSL-12Y-LX-1L1; LED DIODES 
YELLOW BALL 12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

2950 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 $0.00 $29.65 $87,467.50 8 $35.28 $104,076.00 9 $35.00 $103,250.00 10 $33.00 

3 10000296; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 
BALL TSL-12G-LX-1L1; LED DIODES 
GREEN BALL 12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

2950 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $28.50 $84,075.00 13 $34.48 $101,716.00 14 $34.00 $100,300.00 15 $25.30 

4 10000298; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 
R/L ARROW; LED DIODES GREEN R/L 
ARROW 12", PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION 16715.

800 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $29.45 $23,560.00 18 $38.58 $30,864.00 19 $35.00 $28,000.00 20 $33.78 

5 10031761; DIODES, LED RED 12" 
R/L ARROW; LED DIODES RED R/L 
ARROW 12", PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION 16715.

1600 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $25.25 $40,400.00 23 $28.88 $46,208.00 24 $28.80 $46,080.00 25 $27.35 

6 10000297; LED DIODES, YLW 12" 
R/L ARROW TSL-12YA; LED DIODES 
YELLOW R/L ARROW12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

800 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $27.75 $22,200.00 28 $29.00 $23,200.00 29 $29.00 $23,200.00 30 $32.18 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $322,455.00 $393,620.00 $389,330.00 

1 10000301; CROSS SIGNAL, CAST 
ALUM 1-1/2 CF-260; CAST 
ALUMINUM CROSS SIGNAL, PER CITY 
OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

110 EA $0.00 No Bid $10.00 $1,100.00 33 $26.50 $2,915.00 34 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $26.00 

2 10022626; SIGNAL, LED PED, 16X18 
IN COUNTDOWN; COUNTDOWN 
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL LED MODULE, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

2510 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $102.75 $257,902.50 38 $102.68 $257,726.80 39 $112.00 $281,120.00 40 $107.87 

3 10000310; HOUSING PEDESTRIAN 
SIGNAL FLAT BLACK; HOUSING, 
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL, LESS LED 
MODULE, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

350 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $87.00 $30,450.00 44 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $99.00 

4 10031749; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 
BACKPLATE; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 
BACKPLATE, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION.

50 EA $0.00 No Bid $69.25 $3,462.50 48 $45.00 $2,250.00 49 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $46.00 

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

Sub-Total:

Unit PriceUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

R
81

TraStar, Inc.
972-480-0888

119244

Leotek Electronics USA Corp
408-380-1788

110216

Paradigm Traffic Systems Inc
817-831-9406

Excellence Opto. Inc.
909-784-3333

Bids Received: 10 Endeavor Concepts LLC
8179099489

137437

Traffic Parts Inc.
2812920066

109146

TRAFFIC SIGNAL "LED DIODES"

TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS & ACCESSORIES



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note NoteUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

R
81

TraStar, Inc.
972-480-0888

119244

Leotek Electronics USA Corp
408-380-1788

110216

Paradigm Traffic Systems Inc
817-831-9406

Excellence Opto. Inc.
909-784-3333

Bids Received: 10 Endeavor Concepts LLC
8179099489

137437

Traffic Parts Inc.
2812920066

109146

5 10000291; LOUVER, PROGRAMMABLE 
12IN BLACK; GEOMETRICALLY 
PROGRAMMED LOUVRES (GPL), 
GL101008-P34, PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

25 EA $124.00 $3,100.00 54 $0.00 No Bid 55 $138.00 $3,450.00 56 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $132.00 

6 10030658; SIGNAL, TRAFFIC, 12" 
TYPE D 3, YELLOW; 3-SECTION 
YELLOW 12â€� ARM MOUNT 
HORIZONTAL TRAFFIC SIGNAL 
ASSEMBLY (THE VEHICLE SIGNAL 
HEADS W/O LED MODULES SHALL 
CONSIST OF ATTACHED MOUNTING 
HARDWARE, AND UNATTACHED 
VISORS AND LOUVERED 
BACKPLATES) PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $245.45 $61,362.50 60 $352.00 $88,000.00 61 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $240.00 

$3,100.00 $65,925.00 $127,065.00 $257,902.50 $257,726.80 $281,120.00 

1 10000009; BRACKET BAND-IT, 
BANDING BACK D021 2104; 
BRACKET BAND-IT, 8 BOXES, , PER 
CITY OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

8 EA $0.00 No Bid $110.00 $880.00 65 $154.00 $1,232.00 66 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $147.00 

2 10000303; BRACKET, SIGNAL 
HANGING ARM KIT; BRACKET 
SIGNAL HANGING ARM KIT, PER CITY 
OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

100 EA $0.00 No Bid $20.85 $2,085.00 70 $43.00 $4,300.00 71 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $42.00 

3 10033678; BRACKET, MAST ARM 
MOUNT CONTINUOUS 30"; MAST 
ARM SIGN HANGER KIT FOR 24"X30" 
SIGN, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

25 EA $0.00 No Bid $82.50 $2,062.50 75 $96.00 $2,400.00 76 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $66.00 

4 10000153; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 
ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 12 IN; NIPPLE, 
CONDUIT ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 12 IN, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

50 EA $0.00 No Bid $11.15 $557.50 79 $8.45 $422.50 80 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $9.00 

5 10000151; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 
ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 6 IN; NIPPLE, 
CONDUIT ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 6 IN, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

200 EA $0.00 No Bid $9.55 $1,910.00 84 $7.40 $1,480.00 85 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $7.00 

6 10000300; PLATE, POLE CAST ALUM 
PELCO SE4071 P34; PLATE, POLE 
CAST ALUM PELCO SE4071 P34, PER 
CITY OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

110 EA $0.00 No Bid $5.85 $643.50 89 $10.75 $1,182.50 90 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $13.00 

7 10000302; TEE, SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-
1/2 IN, ALUMINUM; TEE, 
SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-1/2 IN, 
ALUMINUM, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $8.00 $2,000.00 94 $10.95 $2,737.50 95 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $13.00 

8 10000070; WASHER, FLAT STEEL 
5/16IN PLATED FW516; WASHER, 
FLAT STEEL 5/16IN PLATED FW516, 
P/BOX, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

8 BOX $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $35.00 $280.00 99 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $9.28 

Sub-Total:
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MOUNTING HARDWARE



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note NoteUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

R
81

TraStar, Inc.
972-480-0888

119244

Leotek Electronics USA Corp
408-380-1788

110216

Paradigm Traffic Systems Inc
817-831-9406

Excellence Opto. Inc.
909-784-3333

Bids Received: 10 Endeavor Concepts LLC
8179099489

137437

Traffic Parts Inc.
2812920066

109146

9 10000318; WIRE, SPAN SUSPENSION 
CLAMP ASSY C-1765; WIRE, SPAN 
SUSPENSION CLAMP ASSY C-1765, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

150 EA $0.00 No Bid $10.85 $1,627.50 103 $15.70 $2,355.00 104 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $12.10 

10 10000319; EYE SUSPENSION, 1-
1/2IN REF DRW C-1765; EYE 
SUSPENSION, 1/1/2", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

250 EA $0.00 No Bid $4.80 $1,200.00 108 $8.00 $2,000.00 109 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $5.50 

11 10000145; CONDUIT, GALV 1-
1/2INX10FT W/COUPLING; CONDUIT, 
GALVANIZED, RIGID, HOT DIP, 
W/COUPLING 1-1/2 IN. X 10 FT.

25 EA $0.00 No Bid $60.00 $1,500.00 113 $44.50 $1,112.50 114 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $37.84 

$0.00 $14,466.00 $19,502.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 
$3,100.00 $80,391.00 $146,567.00 $580,357.50 $651,346.80 $670,450.00 

36: GTE Corp CF-260-B-HOUS
37: Traffic Parts, #5860

38: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRP-C45D3154C10
39: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 16"X 18" Countdown Ped, JXM-400VIEIL

40: Leotek, 16"X18" Countdown, TSL-PED-16-CIL-9
41: DIALIGHT, 430-6479-001X

30: Leotek, 12" R/L Yellow Arrow, TSL-12YA-LD-A1
31: DIALIGHT, 431-3334-901XOD

32: Leotek; TSL-12YA-LD-A1
33: Chapel Hill #1188 (TP # is same)

34: Pelco SE-4038-M
35: PELCO, SE-4038

24: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 12" Red LED Arrow, JXJ300-07R03
25: Leotek, 12" R/L Red Arrow, TSL-12RA-LD-A1

26: DIALIGHT, 432-1314-001XOD
27: Leotek; TSL-12RA-LD-A1

28: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRA-Y12DG-IN2
29: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 12" Yellow LED Arrow, JXJ300-07Y03

19: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 12" Green LED Arrow, JXJ300-07G03
20: Leotek, 12" R/L Green Arrow, TSL-12GA-LD-A1

21: DIALIGHT, 432-2324-001XOD
22: Leotek; TSL-12GA-LD-A1

23: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRA-R12DG-IN

12: Leotek; TSL-12Y-LX-IL3-A1
13: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRV-G12SG-D2T

14: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 12" Green LED Ball, JXC300-HFG-C
15: Leotek, 12" Green Ball, TSL-12G-LX-IL3-A1

16: DIALIGHT, 433-2220-001XL
17: Leotek; TSL-12G-LX-IL3-A1

10: Leotek, 12" Yellow Ball, TSL-12Y-LX-IL3-A1-C
11: DIALIGHT, 433-3230-901XL

Items marked above with a Mfg Note number have the following equivalent Manufacturer's Name, Product Name, and Product Number:

1: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRV-R12SG-D2T
2: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 12" Red LED Ball, JXC300-HFR-C

3: Leotek, 12" Red Ball, TSL-12R-LX-IL3-A1
4: DIALIGHT, 433-1210-003XL

5: Siemens Republic

18: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRV-G12DG-IN

6: Dialight or GE
7: Leotek; TSL-12R-LX-IL3-A1

8: EXCELLENCE OPTO, INC. (EOI) TRV-Y12SG-D1T
9: TraStar, Inc. DURALIGHT 12" Yellow LED Ball, JXC300-HFY-C

Grand Total:
Sub-Total:



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note NoteUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

R
81

TraStar, Inc.
972-480-0888

119244

Leotek Electronics USA Corp
408-380-1788

110216

Paradigm Traffic Systems Inc
817-831-9406

Excellence Opto. Inc.
909-784-3333

Bids Received: 10 Endeavor Concepts LLC
8179099489

137437

Traffic Parts Inc.
2812920066

109146

102: Traffic Parts #5152
103: Chapel Hill # 2544 (TP # is the same)

96: PELCO, SE-0474-P33
97: GTE Corp TF-250RR
98: Traffic Parts #110

99: Pelco FS-4101-SS Washer, Flat, 5/16" x .750OD 100 ct in Box
100: FASTENAL, S/S FW 5/16x3/4 o.d.

101: FW-312

90: Pelco SE-4071-PNC Universal Hub Plate
91: PELCO, SE-4071-P34
92: GTE Corp PBH-425
93: Traffic Parts #1178

94: Chapel Hill #110 (TP # is the same)
95: Pelco SE-0474-P33 Alum Tee, Black

84: Chapel Hill # NIPL-A06-T1T-1NN (TP # is the same)
85: Pelco SE-0436-06-P29 6" Nipple, Yellow

86: PELCO, SE-0436-6-P29
87: PN-150-A-6-TBE

88: Traffic Parts #4533
89: Chapel Hill #1178 (TP # is the same)

78: Traffic Parts #EZSIGN-E32-NS
79: Chapel Hill # NIPL-A12-T1T-1NN (TP # is the same)

80: SE-0484-12-PNC
81: PELCO, SE-0436-12-P29

82: PN-150-A-12-TBE
83: Traffic Parts #4510

72: PELCO, AB-4006
73: RM-AK-2TS-100

74: Traffic Parts #EZBRC-ITS-346-61N-NNS
75: Chapel Hill #EZBRC-877-G28-C1N-NNS (TP # is the same)

76: Pelco AS-0144-24-96-PN Astro Stellar Sign Mount, 24" ctc, 96" Cables
77: PELCO, AS-0105-24-48-SS, E-32NS

66: Pelco US-8120-21 Flared Leg Bracket (50/box)
67: BAND-IT, US-80120-21

68: PBH-420
69: Traffic Parts #2441

70: Two of Chapel Hill #7642 (is two of TP # 7642X - two arms, we delete one plastic plug and add one TP # 5200 metal cgb)
71: Pelco AB-4006 Arm Kit, 8 1/2" ctc tapped for 1" CGB

60: Chapel Hill #SIG-TPY-30X-TTN-EHN-ON with #5626 backplate with stainless attaching screws and washers and mast arm mount #HORIZ-46N-NT1-AG7-NN
61: Econolite TP31HJFV0000

62: SIEMENS, SG203A1C11YYY30
63: T30H-POLY-N-YLV EMPTY-N-T-Y-Y-Y

64: McCain; M66158, M19275, M17910; Pelco; AB-0149-3
65: Band-It #D021 (TP # is 2441) 50 to a box, box price above

54: Pelco GL-1010-08-P34
55: no bid this item

56: Pelco GL-1010-08-P34
57: PELCO, GL-1010

58: Pelco GL101008-P34
59: Pelco; GL-1010-08-P34

48: Chapel Hill 5627 + attaching screws (same as furnished Jan 2011) (TP # is the same)
49: Econolite E1692P44-14
50: SIEMENS, BPA504ANL

51: McCain
52: GTE Corp PB-A1004-LV

53: McCain; M17975

42: GTE Corp or Dialight
43: M31825; McCain M27168 McCain; Leotek; TSL-PED-16-CIL-9

44: McCain 34-M31826
45: SIEMENS, SG7M02201FFF10-49

46: GTE Corp P7-H/M-EMPTY-B-SAML-HOUS
47: McCain; M31825; McCain M27168



Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note Note NoteUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalItem # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total
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114: Pelco SE-0484-120-PNC 120" Support Tube
115: WHEATLAND, 112G

116: COND-50-10-S
117: Traffic Parts #2175

108: Chapel Hill #1533 (TP # is the same)
109: Pelco SE-0371 Span Wire Adapter

110: CHAPEL HILL, DRW C-1765
111: GTE Corp. ME-500
112: Traffic Parts #1533

113: Chapel Hill # NIPL-S120-T1T-1NN with # 2780 coupling (TP # is the same)

104: Pelco SE-0321 Span Wire Clamp
105: CHAPEL HILL, ASSY C-1765

106: GTE Corp SWC-375A
107: Traffic Parts #2544



City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Traffic Signal System Parts
for
Public Works
N23849 - Close Date: 6/9/2011 10:30:00 AM

1 10000294; LED DIODES RED 12" 
BALL TSL-12R-LX-1L1; LED DIODES 
RED BALL 12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

2950 EA

2 10000295; LED DIODES YLW 12" 
BALL TSL-12Y-LX-1L1; LED DIODES 
YELLOW BALL 12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

2950 EA

3 10000296; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 
BALL TSL-12G-LX-1L1; LED DIODES 
GREEN BALL 12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

2950 EA

4 10000298; LED DIODES, GRN 12" 
R/L ARROW; LED DIODES GREEN R/L 
ARROW 12", PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION 16715.

800 EA

5 10031761; DIODES, LED RED 12" 
R/L ARROW; LED DIODES RED R/L 
ARROW 12", PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION 16715.

1600 EA

6 10000297; LED DIODES, YLW 12" 
R/L ARROW TSL-12YA; LED DIODES 
YELLOW R/L ARROW12", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION 16715.

800 EA

1 10000301; CROSS SIGNAL, CAST 
ALUM 1-1/2 CF-260; CAST 
ALUMINUM CROSS SIGNAL, PER CITY 
OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

110 EA

2 10022626; SIGNAL, LED PED, 16X18 
IN COUNTDOWN; COUNTDOWN 
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL LED MODULE, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

2510 EA

3 10000310; HOUSING PEDESTRIAN 
SIGNAL FLAT BLACK; HOUSING, 
PEDESTRIAN SIGNAL, LESS LED 
MODULE, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

350 EA

4 10031749; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 
BACKPLATE; 4- SECTION LOUVERED 
BACKPLATE, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION.

50 EA

Sub-Total:

Item # Description Qty U/M

Bids Received: 10

TRAFFIC SIGNAL "LED DIODES"

TRAFFIC SIGNAL PARTS & ACCESSORIES

Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note Note

$79,502.50 4 $28.00 $82,600.00 5 $45.00 $132,750.00 6 $29.90 $88,205.00 7

$97,350.00 11 $34.30 $101,185.00 5 $50.00 $147,500.00 6 $31.00 $91,450.00 12

$74,635.00 16 $26.30 $77,585.00 5 $55.00 $162,250.00 6 $33.00 $97,350.00 17

$27,024.00 21 $35.10 $28,080.00 5 $55.00 $44,000.00 6 $33.00 $26,400.00 22

$43,760.00 26 $28.40 $45,440.00 5 $40.00 $64,000.00 6 $27.25 $43,600.00 27

$25,744.00 31 $33.50 $26,800.00 5 $40.00 $32,000.00 6 $29.00 $23,200.00 32

$348,015.50 $361,690.00 $582,500.00 $370,205.00 

$2,860.00 35 $27.00 $2,970.00 5 $13.50 $1,485.00 36 $12.10 $1,331.00 37

$270,753.70 41 $112.30 $281,873.00 5 $142.00 $356,420.00 42 $239.00 $599,890.00 43

$34,650.00 45 $103.00 $36,050.00 5 $143.00 $50,050.00 46 $108.00 $37,800.00 47

$2,300.00 50 $28.40 $1,420.00 51 $85.00 $4,250.00 52 $27.00 $1,350.00 53

Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceLine Total

General Traffic Equipment Corp.
8455699000

110941

McCain Inc.
760-734-5060

Republic ITS
17-633-5300

Globe Electric Supply Inc
281-933-0909

110944



Item # Description Qty U/M

Bids Received: 10

5 10000291; LOUVER, PROGRAMMABLE 
12IN BLACK; GEOMETRICALLY 
PROGRAMMED LOUVRES (GPL), 
GL101008-P34, PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

25 EA

6 10030658; SIGNAL, TRAFFIC, 12" 
TYPE D 3, YELLOW; 3-SECTION 
YELLOW 12â€� ARM MOUNT 
HORIZONTAL TRAFFIC SIGNAL 
ASSEMBLY (THE VEHICLE SIGNAL 
HEADS W/O LED MODULES SHALL 
CONSIST OF ATTACHED MOUNTING 
HARDWARE, AND UNATTACHED 
VISORS AND LOUVERED 
BACKPLATES) PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATIONS

250 EA

1 10000009; BRACKET BAND-IT, 
BANDING BACK D021 2104; 
BRACKET BAND-IT, 8 BOXES, , PER 
CITY OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

8 EA

2 10000303; BRACKET, SIGNAL 
HANGING ARM KIT; BRACKET 
SIGNAL HANGING ARM KIT, PER CITY 
OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

100 EA

3 10033678; BRACKET, MAST ARM 
MOUNT CONTINUOUS 30"; MAST 
ARM SIGN HANGER KIT FOR 24"X30" 
SIGN, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

25 EA

4 10000153; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 
ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 12 IN; NIPPLE, 
CONDUIT ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 12 IN, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

50 EA

5 10000151; NIPPLE, CONDUIT 
ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 6 IN; NIPPLE, 
CONDUIT ALUMINUM 1-1/2 X 6 IN, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

200 EA

6 10000300; PLATE, POLE CAST ALUM 
PELCO SE4071 P34; PLATE, POLE 
CAST ALUM PELCO SE4071 P34, PER 
CITY OF HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

110 EA

7 10000302; TEE, SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-
1/2 IN, ALUMINUM; TEE, 
SLIPXSLIPXSLIP 1-1/2 IN, 
ALUMINUM, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

250 EA

8 10000070; WASHER, FLAT STEEL 
5/16IN PLATED FW516; WASHER, 
FLAT STEEL 5/16IN PLATED FW516, 
P/BOX, PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

8 BOX

Sub-Total:
TRAFFIC SIGNAL MOUNTING HARDWARE

Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note NoteLine TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceLine Total

General Traffic Equipment Corp.
8455699000

110941

McCain Inc.
760-734-5060

Republic ITS
17-633-5300

Globe Electric Supply Inc
281-933-0909

110944

$3,300.00 57 $129.40 $3,235.00 51 $145.00 $3,625.00 58 $123.00 $3,075.00 59

$60,000.00 62 $246.00 $61,500.00 51 $298.00 $74,500.00 63 $209.00 $52,250.00 64

$373,863.70 $387,048.00 $490,330.00 $695,696.00 

$1,176.00 67 $153.00 $1,224.00 5 $60.00 $480.00 68 $110.00 $880.00 69

$4,200.00 72 $43.75 $4,375.00 5 $26.00 $2,600.00 73 $133.00 $13,300.00 74

$1,650.00 77 $68.75 $1,718.75 5 $122.00 $3,050.00 $60.00 $1,500.00 78

$450.00 81 $9.45 $472.50 5 $9.75 $487.50 82 $11.00 $550.00 83

$1,400.00 86 $7.36 $1,472.00 5 $7.00 $1,400.00 87 $10.00 $2,000.00 88

$1,430.00 91 $13.60 $1,496.00 5 $8.00 $880.00 92 $7.00 $770.00 93

$3,250.00 96 $13.60 $3,400.00 5 $9.50 $2,375.00 97 $9.00 $2,250.00 98

$74.24 100 $9.75 $78.00 5 $25.00 $200.00 101 $5.00 $40.00 102



Item # Description Qty U/M

Bids Received: 10

9 10000318; WIRE, SPAN SUSPENSION 
CLAMP ASSY C-1765; WIRE, SPAN 
SUSPENSION CLAMP ASSY C-1765, 
PER CITY OF HOUSTON 
SPECIFICATION

150 EA

10 10000319; EYE SUSPENSION, 1-
1/2IN REF DRW C-1765; EYE 
SUSPENSION, 1/1/2", PER CITY OF 
HOUSTON SPECIFICATION.

250 EA

11 10000145; CONDUIT, GALV 1-
1/2INX10FT W/COUPLING; CONDUIT, 
GALVANIZED, RIGID, HOT DIP, 
W/COUPLING 1-1/2 IN. X 10 FT.

25 EA

Grand Total:
Sub-Total:

Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note NoteLine TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceLine Total

General Traffic Equipment Corp.
8455699000

110941

McCain Inc.
760-734-5060

Republic ITS
17-633-5300

Globe Electric Supply Inc
281-933-0909

110944

$1,815.00 105 $12.70 $1,905.00 5 $11.00 $1,650.00 106 $12.00 $1,800.00 107

$1,375.00 110 $5.75 $1,437.50 5 $4.50 $1,125.00 111 $5.80 $1,450.00 112

$946.00 115 $39.80 $995.00 5 $56.00 $1,400.00 116 $40.00 $1,000.00 117

$17,766.24 $18,573.75 $15,647.50 $25,540.00 
$739,645.44 $767,311.75 $1,088,477.50 $1,091,441.00 



Item # Description Qty U/M

Bids Received: 10

Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note NoteLine TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceLine Total

General Traffic Equipment Corp.
8455699000

110941

McCain Inc.
760-734-5060

Republic ITS
17-633-5300

Globe Electric Supply Inc
281-933-0909

110944

NX (TP # is the same)



Item # Description Qty U/M

Bids Received: 10

Mfg Mfg Mfg Mfg
Note Note Note NoteLine TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit PriceLine Total

General Traffic Equipment Corp.
8455699000

110941

McCain Inc.
760-734-5060

Republic ITS
17-633-5300

Globe Electric Supply Inc
281-933-0909

110944


