
Percent Percent Percent Percent

Change Change Change Change

1 Mini Hand Clappers, plastic, assorted 

colors 3 1/2"

1 DZ $4.99 -5 $4.74 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $4.49 -25 $3.37 

2 Leis, poly fringed, assorted colors, 34" 

leis, box of 100

1 BOX $19.99 -5 $18.99 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $36.99 -25 $27.74 

3 Multi-porcupine balls, assorted colors 1 

1/4" (32mm) 36 PER UNIT

1 BAG $7.99 -5 $7.59 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $27.79 -25 $20.84 

$31.32 $0.00 $0.00 $51.95 

1 BLANK SCRAPBOOKS, 24 PACK Spiral-

bound scrapbooks have ready-to-

1 PAC $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $31.19 -25 $23.39 

2 MINERAL MOSAICS CRAFT KIT, 32 1 KIT $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $16.99 -25 $12.74 
3 DISPOSABLE PLASTIC APRONS, 100 

PACK Full-size bib style. Apron length is 

1 PAC $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $14.49 -25 $10.87 

4 NEON FACE PAINT STICK, PACK OF 6 1 PAC $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $4.29 -25 $3.22 

5 BUTTERFLY, FLOWER & LADYBUG 

PINWHEELS CRAFT KIT, 12 PACK 

1 PAC $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $15.99 -25 $11.99 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $62.21 

1 Paint brush School jumbo pack, shed- 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 $0.00 $12.49 -25 $9.37 

2 Classic Bingo Game Up to 50 players, 8 

Â½â€• dia. Cage, master board, (75) 

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 $0.00 $55.99 -25 $41.99 

3 Yarn, 100% polyester 3-ply in various 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 $0.00 $2.29 -25 $1.72 
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $53.08 

1 Crayola Large Crayon Classpack 4â€• x 

7/16â€• with 8 various colors in bright 

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $49.49 -0.1 $49.44 $0.00 0 No Bid $71.99 -25 $53.99 

2 Elmers Glue all, 1 gallon container 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $11.69 -0.1 $11.68 $0.00 0 No Bid $12.99 -25 $9.74 

3 Color Splash super foam shapes, 

alphabet with adhesive.

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $8.99 -25 $6.74 

$0.00 $61.12 $0.00 $70.48 

1 RUG, Fun w/ Phonics Rug - Rectangle 

(8' 4" W x 13' 4" L)

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $469.95 -5 $446.45 $469.95 -25 $352.46 

2 RUG, Discover America Rug (8' 4" W x 

11' 8" L)

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $449.95 -5 $427.45 $449.95 -25 $337.46 

3 RUG, Mt. St. Helens Rug - Rectangle (8' 

4" W x 12' L)

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $229.95 -5 $218.45 $229.95 -25 $172.46 

$0.00 $0.00 $1,092.36 $862.39 

1 Paint, pint size, medium SaxÂ® True 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $3.59 -0.1 $3.59 $0.00 0 No Bid $3.49 -25 $2.62 

2 School Smart Classroom Bead 

Assortment

1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $42.61 -0.1 $42.57 $0.00 0 No Bid $41.19 -25 $30.89 

3 12 x 18, 20 Assorted Fadeless® 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $4.49 -0.1 $4.49 $0.00 0 No Bid $11.99 -25 $8.99 
$0.00 $50.64 $0.00 $42.50 

1 BELTS, UNIVERSAL SIZING BELTS, ONE 1 DZ $0.00 0 $0.00 $31.49 -0.1 $31.46 $0.00 0 No Bid $19.99 -25 $14.99 

2 BALLS, UNCOATED FOAM, VOLLEY, 7" 1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $8.99 -0.1 $8.98 $0.00 0 No Bid $15.99 -25 $11.99 

3 UltraHoops 30" Set of 6 1 SET $0.00 0 $0.00 $59.39 -0.1 $59.33 $0.00 0 No Bid $54.99 -25 $41.24 
$0.00 $99.77 $0.00 $68.23 

1 CONES, COLORED, SET OF 10 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 $0.00 $12.99 -25 $9.74 

2 ROPE, PLASTIC JUMP, SET OF 10 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $2.79 -25 $2.09 

3 HOPPER, WHOOPER, 18" INCH 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 -0.1 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $18.99 -25 $14.24 
$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $26.08 

$31.32 $211.53 $1,092.36 $1,236.92 
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Recreational, Educational and Miscellaneous Supplies (i.e. Arts, Crafts and Games)

for
Parks

Sub-Total:

Group III Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to S&S Primelife Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as needed per specifications not to exceed $15,000.00

Grand Total:

Sub-Total:

Group IV Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to S&S Education Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as needed per specifications not to exceed $32,500.00

Sub-Total:

Group V Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to Carpet for Kids Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as needed per specifications not to exceed $2,500.00

Sub-Total:

Group VI Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to School Specialty Sax Arts Price List dated 2010 or latest edition) for any quantity as needed per specifications not to exceed $5,000.00

Sub-Total:

Group VII Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to Sportime Physical Education Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as needed per specifications not to exceed 

Sub-Total:

Group VIII Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to Discount School Supply Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as need per specifications not to exceed $7,500.00

Sub-Total:

Unit Price Line Total

Group I Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to Oriental Trading Company Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as need per specifications not to exceed $12,500.00

Sub-Total:

Group II Proposed Percentage Plus or Minus Applied to S&S Recreation Price List dated 2010 (or latest edition) for any quantity as needed per specifications not to exceed $292,500.00

Item # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

A 2 Z Educational Supplies

281-540-6001

137447

Line Total Unit Price Line Total

S&S WORLDWIDE INC

800-243-9232

109136

Bids Received: 4 Oriental Trading Company, 

4025961200

111606

School Specialty

8883883224

123351

Verified by:  L. Marquez

05/03/2011


