City of Houston Bid Tabulation Sheet
Chemicals, Lawn, Garden and Insecticides

For Various Departments
Close Date: 5/16/2013 10:30:00 AM

S32-S24242

Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

Group
No. 1
Fungicid
es

Qty

UM

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit
Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

10023253

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID N-
ALKYL;
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

18

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023254

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID
ALKYL
POLYOXY
ETHELEN
E; 1 GAL.
CONT.

600

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

60.25

©

$ 36,150.00

$7.50

$4,500.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

25.38

©

$ 15,228.00

$25.00

$15,000.00

10023257

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID
COPPER
AS
ELEMEN
T; 1 GAL.
CONT.

40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

76.26

@

$  3,050.40

$0.00

No Bid

$ 24.00

960.00

$23.24

$929.60

20.89

@

$ 835.60

$22.00

$880.00

10019498

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID
DACONIL
2.5GAL.
CONT.

65

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$142.50

$9,262.50

©*»

142.50

$ 9,262.50

$71.80

$4,667.00

$ 142.50

9,262.50

$145.50

$9,457.50

142.50

©*»

$ 9,262.50

$152.00

$9,880.00

10019499

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID
DACONIL
2.5 GAL
CONT.

50

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

116.75

©»

$ 5,837.50

$69.75

$3,487.50

$ 116.75

5,837.50

$116.75

$5,837.50

116.75

©

$ 5,837.50

$124.50

$6,225.00

10023259

FUNGICI
DE, DRY
6 |ZINC
IRON
MANGAN
ESE; 2LB
BAG

13

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

&+

16.00

$ 208.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$8.34

$108.42

49.26

&+

$ 640.38

$51.25

$666.25

10019500

FUNGICI
DE,LIQUI
D
HERITAG
E1LB
CONT.

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$317.00

$951.00

317.00

@+

$ 951.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 509.00

1,527.00

$509.00

$1,527.00

317.00

@

$ 951.00

$338.50

$1,015.50

10019501

FUNGICI
DE,

8 |LIQUID
PROSTA
R WDG, 3
POUND
CONT.

42

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$168.50

$7,077.00

©*

172.00

$ 7,224.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 183.82

7,720.44

$187.21

$7,862.82

158.72

©*

$ 6,666.24

$163.00

$6,846.00




Alligare, LLC Pro Alliance Target Specialty Products Agrium Advanced Technology Red River Specialties, Inc. BWI-Schulenburg John Deere Landscapes Winfield Environmental Sorbents LLC

10019502

FUNGICI
DE,LIQUI
D
RUBIGAN
1 GAL
CONT.

25 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $ 340.00( $ 8,500.00 $335.00 $8,375.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

10023333

FUNGICI
DE,

10 [LIQUID 38 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
DIMETHY
LBENZYL,
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

&+

8175 $ 3,106.50 $0.00 No Bid

1UUZ3534

FUNGICI

11 |DE, 4 |C91 so000 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $3,530.00 $14,120.00 || $ 3,530.00 | $ 14,120.00 $0.00 No Bid $ 1,41520( $ 5660.80|| $3,530.00 $14,120.00
LIQUID
PYRACL

OCSTDAORI

©*

3,530.00( $ 14,120.00 $3,730.00 $14,920.00

10019495

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID
BANOL 1
GALI/CON
T

12 7 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $400.00 $2,800.00

©

37540 $  2,627.80 $0.00 No Bid

©

415.02| $ 2,905.14 $369.20 $2,584.40

©

35219 | $ 2,465.33 $376.00 $2,632.00

10019496

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID,
CHIPCO
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

13 10 EA $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $318.50 $3,185.00

©*

142.00| $  1,420.00 $100.00 $1,000.00

©*

348.00| $ 3,480.00 $102.00 $1,020.00

©*

29255( $ 2,925.50 $312.00 $3,120.00

10023336

FUNGICI
DE, DRY
14 |CHLORO 10 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $69.50 $695.00
THALONI
L;5
POUND
CONT.

©*»

59.75| $ 597.50 $24.50 $245.00

©*»

60.90| $ 609.00 $78.75 $787.50

©*»

5155| $ 515.50 $55.00 $550.00

10023338

FUNGICI
DE,

15 (LIQUID 15 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
THIOPHA
NTE, 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

©
©
©

250.00| $  3,750.00 $170.00 $2,550.00 232.00| $ 3,480.00 $171.00 $2,565.00 256.75| $ 3,851.25 $274.00 $4,110.00

10048533

FUNGICI
DE, COo . .
LIQUID, 175 N $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $132.00 $23,100.00
BAYLETO
N, 22 oz.

CONT.

16

@
»
©»

136.25 | $ 23,843.75 $0.00 No Bid 135.00| $ 23,625.00 $146.50 $25,637.50 123.42( $ 21,598.50 $148.00 $25,900.00

10048534

17 |FERTILIZ | 250 BA $0.00 No Bid $46.40 $11,600.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
ER 50 Ib.

bag

10048535

18 E:Ng_%l_ 320 B(? $0.00 No Bid $44.60 $14,272.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
5,50 Ib.

bag

Sub-Total Group 1: $0.00 $25,872.00 $61,190.50 $ 109,042.45 $16,449.50 $ 73,567.38 $80,812.24 $ 88,003.80 $91,744.75

Group No. 2 . . i . o . - . o . o .
P Qty |U/M| Unit Price | Line Total UT‘” Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total
Herbicides Price

Unit Price Line Total I Unit Price Line Total | Unit Price Line Total |




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

10002656

HERBICID
E,
LIQUID,
VANQUIS
H, 30
GAL.
DRUM

220

DR

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

©*»

1,763.70

388,014.00

$1,800.00

$396,000.00

10002658

HERBICID
E,
PENDUL
UM

340

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 78.75

$ 26,775.00

$136.00

$46,240.00

$

80.00

27,200.00

$71.25

$24,225.00

©

75.80

25,772.00

$80.00

$27,200.00

10031154

HERBICID
E,LIQUID,
ROUNDU
P, 30
GAL.
CONT.

300

DR

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$759.00

$227,700.00

$0.00

No Bid

$830.50

$249,150.00

&+

802.50

240,750.00

$830.00

$249,000.00

10047028

HERBICID
E,
GLYPHO
SATE; 30
GAL.
DRUM

150

DR

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$480.00

$72,000.00

$0.00

No Bid

$388.00

$58,200.00

©

426.30

63,945.00

$443.00

$66,450.00

10002284

HERBICID
E,
AQUAMA
STER, 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

78

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 74.37

$

5,800.86

$49.50

$3,861.00

$

50.00

3,900.00

$53.00

$4,134.00

©*

44.30

3,455.40

$46.00

$3,588.00

10002655

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
PLATEAU
, 1 GAL.
CONT.

178

$112.00

$19,936.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$116.80

$20,790.40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

©*

166.30

29,601.40

$183.00

$32,574.00

10011381

HERBICID
E,
RODEO;
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

2973

BT

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$50.00

$148,650.00

$0.00

No Bid

$34.95

$103,906.35

&+

55.83

165,982.59

$58.00

$172,434.00

10031283

HERBICID
E,

LIQUID,
ROUNDU
P, 1.67
GAL.

1650

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$45.34

$74,811.00

$0.00

No Bid

$50.61

$83,506.50

@+

47.00

77,550.00

$48.00

$79,200.00

10038338

HERBICID
E,
SAHARA,
10LB
BAG

80

BA

$80.00

$6,400.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$97.50

$7,800.00

$

118.75

9,500.00

$115.00

$9,200.00

©*»

96.00

7,680.00

$100.00

$8,000.00

10

10023526

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
PICLORA
M; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

582

$110.00

$64,020.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$197.50

$114,945.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

©»

186.10

108,310.20

$194.00

$112,908.00

11

10023341

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
ACID
BLUE NO
3;1 GAL.
CONT.

20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$44.00

$880.00

$0.00

No Bid

$35.80

$716.00

@+

34.50

690.00

$35.75

$715.00




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

12

10023345

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
DIPOTAS
SIUM
SALT; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

50

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

©*

15354 $ 7,677.00

$161.88 $8,094.00

13

10023347

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
ISOPROP
YLAMINE;
30 GAL.
DRUM

DR

$1,500.00 $9,000.00

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$1,620.00 $9,720.00

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

©*»

2,006.40( $ 12,038.40

$2,000.00 $12,000.00

14

10019520

HERBICID
E, DRY
SYNGEN
TA, 10
POUND
BOX

300

EA

$100.00 $30,000.00

$0.00 No Bid

$171.25

$51,375.00

$ 187.80| $ 56,340.00

$94.80 $28,440.00

©“

17471 $ 52,413.00

$202.50 $60,750.00

©

166.00 | $ 49,800.00

$177.00 $53,100.00

15

10019534

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
WEED

BASAGR
AN 1GAL

10

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 103.15( $ 1,031.50

$0.00 No Bid

©*»

11493| $ 1,149.30

$126.00 $1,260.00

@

97.17| $ 971.70

$103.00 $1,030.00

16

10023348

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
TRICLOP
YR; 1 GAL
CONT.

20

CO

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$57.00 $1,140.00

©*

138.00( $ 2,760.00

$128.50 $2,570.00

©*

12338 $ 2,467.60

$132.00 $2,640.00

17

10002657

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
ENDURA
NCE 10
LB.

1145

$100.00 | $114,500.00

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 160.00 | $ 183,200.00

$0.00 No Bid

©*»

110.28] $ 126,270.60

$105.00 $120,225.00

©*»

108.00| $ 123,660.00

$110.00 $125,950.00

18

10023350

PREVEN
TER DRY
BENEFIN;
50
POUND
BAG

1145

BA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

©*»

48.62| $ 55,669.90

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

19

10019514

HERBICID
E, DRY
DERRING
ER 2.5
GAL.

55

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$202.00 $11,110.00

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

20

10019515

HERBICID
E, DRY
FUSILAD
E. 1 GAL.
CONT.

60

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$61.50

$3,690.00

$ 69.05| $ 4,143.00

$0.00 No Bid

$ 66.99| $ 4,019.40

$270.00 $16,200.00

©*

59.34 | $ 3,560.40

$65.00 $3,900.00

21

10048552

HERBICID
E, PRE-
EMERGE
NT. 85
OUNCE
CASE

250

CSs

$0.00 No Bid

$122.50 | $30,625.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

22

10019525

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
ILOXAN

IN 1 GAL.

20

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$239.50

$4,790.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

255.95

5,119.00

$250.00

$5,000.00

©

24280 | $

4,856.00

$270.00

$5,400.00

23

10034657

HERBICID
E,
CHEMICA
L-
MONUME
NT2, 5X5
GRAM
PACKETS

45

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$230.00

$10,350.00

$ 240.00

$ 10,800.00

$0.00

No Bid

$

215.00

9,675.00

$240.00

$10,800.00

&+

240.00 | $

10,800.00

$256.00

$11,520.00

24

10023356

HERBICID
E, DRY
METHYL,
1.33
OUNCE
BOTTLE

400

BT

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$62.00

$24,800.00

$ 60.16

$ 24,064.00

$82.00

$32,800.00

$

69.00

27,600.00

$69.90

$27,960.00

&+

71441 %

28,576.00

$75.00

$30,000.00

25

10019517

HERBICID
E, DRY
OuUSsT
WEED
KILLER. 3
POUND
CONT.

10

EA

$88.50

$885.00

$0.00

No Bid

$396.00

$3,960.00

$0.00

No Bid

$93.00

$930.00

$0.00

No Bid

$280.00

$2,800.00

©

161.88 | $

1,618.80

$170.00

$1,700.00

26

10002658

HERBICID
E,
PENDUL
UM, 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

490

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$136.00

$66,640.00

$

72.00

35,280.00

$71.25

$34,912.50

©*

108.65( $

53,238.50

$118.00

$57,820.00

27

10048553

HERBICID
E,
PENDUL
UM
HERBICID
E
GRANUL
AR; 40LB
BAG

50

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$55.00

$2,750.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

55.72

2,786.00

$58.50

$2,925.00

©*

54.00| $

2,700.00

$58.20

$2,910.00

28

10019518

HERBICID
E, DRY
SIMTROL.
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

75

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$56.25

$4,218.75

$0.00

No Bid

$

43.97

3,297.75

$45.00

$3,375.00

©*

4445 $

3,333.75

$48.50

$3,637.50

29

10019521

HERBICID
E, DRY
SYNGEN
TA
REWARD
AQUATIC;
1 GAL.
CONT.

200

EA

$49.00

$9,800.00

$0.00

No Bid

$86.50

$17,300.00

$0.00

No Bid

$47.00

$9,400.00

$

86.00

17,200.00

$94.00

$18,800.00

©*

79.00 | $

15,800.00

$84.00

$16,800.00

30

10023287

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
ROTENO
NE/PYRE
THRUM; 1
GAL.
CONT.

55

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$80.94

$4,451.70

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

©*

7222 $

3,972.10

$75.00

$4,125.00




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

31

10019537

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
ROUNDU
P PRO.
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

1296

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$41.25 $53,460.00

$0.00

No Bid

$34.95 $45,295.20

©*»

52.03( $

67,430.88

$43.50

$56,376.00

32

10002654

HERBICID
E,
ROUNDU
P PRO;
30 GAL.
DRUM

90

DR

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$ 60.00 | $ 5,400.00

$480.00 $43,200.00

$0.00

No Bid

$388.00 $34,920.00

©*»

606.30 | $

54,567.00

$518.00

$46,620.00

33

10019531

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
SURFLAN
. 2.5 GAL.
CONT.

60

EA

$100.00 $6,000.00

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$130.00 $7,800.00

$

117.00

7,020.00

$120.00 $7,200.00

&+

136.40( $

8,184.00

$124.00

$7,440.00

34

10019526

HERBICID
E,
GRANUL
E IMAGE
70DG
11.40Z;

89

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$ 87.00 $ 7,743.00

$0.00 No Bid

$

94.00

8,366.00

$94.50 $8,410.50

©*

79.98 | $

7,118.22

$81.00

$7,209.00

35

10019528

HERBICID
E,

LIQUID,
MANOR 2
0Z./BTL.

500

BT

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$22.50 $11,250.00

$ 88.00 ( $ 44,000.00

$16.00 $8,000.00

$

13.96

6,980.00

$18.70 $9,350.00

&+

4210 $

21,050.00

$42.00

$21,000.00

36

10019538

HERBICID
E,LIQUID
ROUNDU
P PRO
CONCEN
TRATE;
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

1200

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$42.35 $50,820.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

©*

52.03( $

62,436.00

$54.00

$64,800.00

37

10019536
y WEED
KILLER,
ROUNDU
P PRO
CONCEN
TRATE;
30 GAL.
DRUM

90

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$494.40 $44,496.00

$0.00

No Bid

$512.00 $46,080.00

©*

606.30 | $

54,567.00

$633.00

$56,970.00

38

10019529

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
MESAMA
TE 600,
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

1500

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$ 65.87 | $ 98,805.00

$0.00 No Bid

$

60.00

90,000.00

$58.50 $87,750.00

&+

5460 | $

81,900.00

$57.50

$86,250.00

39

10023527

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
AMINOPY
RALID,
2.5-GAL.
CONT.

60

CO

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$749.33 $44,959.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

©*»

74933 $

44,959.80

$794.00

$47,640.00

40

10019513

SURFAC
TANT,
SURFAC
820 NON-
IONIC, 1
GAL.

1300

EA

$8.00 $10,400.00

$0.00 No Bid

$15.00 $19,500.00

$0.00 No Bid

$7.50 $9,750.00

$

10.00

13,000.00

$14.50 $18,850.00

©*»

2960 | $

38,480.00

$23.33

$30,329.00
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10023510

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
41 |SULFOS
ULFURO
N; 1.25
OUNCE
BOTTLE

20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$89.50

$1,790.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 89.00

$ 1,780.00

$76.76

$1,535.20

79.78

©*

$ 1,595.60

$78.00

$1,560.00

10027330

HERBICID
E, LIQUID
TRANSLI
NE
CLOPYR
ALID; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

42

$295.00

$1,180.00

$0.00

No Bid

$461.70

$1,846.80

$0.00

No Bid

$372.50

$1,490.00

$0.00

No Bid

$552.50

$2,210.00

©*

348.80

$ 1,395.20

$372.00

$1,488.00

10048536

FUNGICI
43 |DE,
SPECTIC
LE, 17.5
0z pouch

25

oz

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

472.50

©*»

$ 11,812.50

$500.00

$12,500.00

10048537

FUNGICI
DE,
LIQUID,
SPECTIC
LE FLO
20%; 1
GAL.
CONT.

44

35

GAL

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$1,400.00

$49,000.00

$ 1,400.00

$ 49,000.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 1,400.00

$ 49,000.00

$1,400.00

$49,000.00

©*»

1,400.00

$ 49,000.00

$1,484.00

$51,940.00

10048432

HERBICID
E,CELSIU
S 10 oz.
CONT.

45

85

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$87.55

$7,441.75

$ 87.55

$ 7,441.75

$0.00

No Bid

$ 87.55

$ 7,441.75

$85.00

$7,225.00

©

87.55

$ 7,441.75

$92.00

$7,820.00

10048435

HERBICID
46 |E,
REVOLV
ER, 87
0z. CONT.

85

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$540.00

$45,900.00

$ 540.00

$ 45,900.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 540.00

$ 45,900.00

$540.00

$45,900.00

©*

540.00

$ 45,900.00

$570.00

$48,450.00

10048436

HERBICID
47 |E,
TRIBUTE,
6 oz.
CONT.

85

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$309.00

$26,265.00

$ 309.00

$ 26,265.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 309.00

$ 26,265.00

$300.00

$25,500.00

©*

309.00

$ 26,265.00

$327.00

$27,795.00

10048437

HERBICID
48 |E,
RONSTA
R, G 50
LB. BAG

500

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$74.00

$37,000.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 77.12

$ 38,560.00

$57.85

$28,925.00

67.00

©

$ 33,500.00

$70.00

$35,000.00

10023511

HERBICID
49 |E, LIQUID
FOAM
SULFUR
ON: 32

30

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

Sub-Total Group 2:

$272,121.00

$30,625.00

$319,008.55

$ 600,927.86

$1,135,174.60

$ 678,152.70

$1,269,876.25

$ 2,054,423.79

$2,099,882.50

Group No. 3
Fertilizer

Qty

Um

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit
Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total I Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

10012214

FERTILIZ
ER SLOW
1 |RELEASE
OSMOCO
TE50LB;
10LB

BAG

80

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 17.65

$ 1,412.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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10016519

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
MIRACLE-
GRO, 10-
1 POUND
BAG/10
POUND
BOX

122

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

21.04

2,566.88

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10016561

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
46-0-0
50LB
BAG

492

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$18.20

$8,954.40

26.00

12,792.00

$27.00

$13,284.00

10016494

FERTILIZ
ER
BLEND
DRY 13-
13-13-
50LB/BA
G

300

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

13.00

3,900.00

$13.00

$3,900.00

20.18

6,054.00

$21.18

$6,354.00

10048555

FERTILIZ
ER
PUTTING
GREEN
21-3-14 IN
50LB/BA
G.

70

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$28.50

$1,995.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10016549

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
19-0-19
50LB/BA
G

70

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$43.75

$3,062.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023503

FERTILIZ
ER
WATER
SOL 20-
20-20 IN
25LB/BA
G

270

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$24.25

$6,547.50

25.40

$ 6,858.00

$0.00

No Bid

$

60.00

16,200.00

$31.50

$8,505.00

27.37

7,389.90

$29.00

$7,830.00

10016535

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
13-0-44
25LB/BA
G

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$32.00

$1,120.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10016575

FERTILIZ
ER
WATER
SOLUABL
E 15-0-15
25LB.

25

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$19.50

$487.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$27.00

$675.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10

10016526

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
6-2-4
ORGANIC
;IN 40
POUND
BAG

250

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

16.69

4,172.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

11

10016539

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
15-5-10 IN
50LB/BA
G

300

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$19.95

$5,985.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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12

10016570

FERTILIZ
ER SLOW
RELEASE
16-4-10
50LB
BAG

250

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$21.50

$5,375.00

19.62 | $

4,905.00

$20.00

$5,000.00

13

10016544

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
16-4-10
50.
PARTICL
E SIZE
125-230
SGN.

60

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

939.80 | $

56,388.00

$990.00

$59,400.00

14

10016533

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
10-18-22
50LB
BAG

120

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$18.50

$2,220.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

15

10016545

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
16-0-16,
50LB/BA
G

300

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$21.50

$6,450.00

1991 $

5,973.00

$20.91

$6,273.00

16

10023491

FERTILIZ
ER SLOW
RELEASE
16-0-16;
PARTICL
E SIZE
125-230
SGN.

TO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

951.40| $

5,708.40

$1,000.00

$6,000.00

17

10016568

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 12-19-
14
20LB/BA
G

325

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$21.50

$6,987.50

21.00 | $

6,825.00

$22.00

$7,150.00

18

10023490

FERTILIZ
ER SLOW
RELEASE
10-4-12 IN
20LB/BA
G.

35

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

7.00

245.00

$21.00

$735.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

19

10016567
; MEAL,
BONE
BLOOD
19-13-6
25LB/BA
G

45

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

30.00

1,350.00

$18.00

$810.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

20

10016569

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 14-14-
14
20LB/BA
G

15

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$22.00

$330.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

21

10019481

FUNGICI
DE, DRY,
50 LB.
BAG

125

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

2024 $

2,530.00

$21.24

$2,655.00
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22

10016550

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
20-0-10

160

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

23

10016547

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
18-4-10.
PARTICL
E SIZE
125-230
SGN

175

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$799.50

$139,912.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

24

10023417

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
SULFUR,
25
GALI/CON
T.

60

GAL

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

25

10016589

CONDITI
ONER,
SOIL
SULFUR
GRANUL
AR 50LB.

150

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

26

10048556

FERTILIZ
ER
PUTTING
SURFAC
E
ORGANIC
; 1 GAL.
CONT.

140

GAL

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

27

10016499

FERTILIZ
ER
BLEND
DRY 22-0-
22
50LB/BA
G

90

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 32.56

$

2,930.40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

28

10016522

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
1-1-1,1
GAL.
CONT.

150

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

29

10016521

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
0-0-1,5
GAL.

95

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$19.50

$1,852.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

30

10023414

FERTILIZ
ER 16-8-
12, PAKG
1000/CAS
E; 7.5
GRAMS
TABLET

20

CS

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

31

10048557

FERTILIZ
ER
BLOOD
MEAL, 20
LB/BAG

20

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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32

10016517

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
MEDINA
PLUS
1GAL.

70

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

12.00

840.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

33

10016523

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
0-0-22,
50LB/BA
G

250

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 17.35

$

4,337.50

$0.00

No Bid

$

17.50

4,375.00

$0.00

No Bid

2119 $

5,297.50

$22.19

$5,547.50

34

ERVVERe}ele]e]

CONDITI
ONER,
SOIL
INNOCUL
ANT

AMICDO

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

35

10016584

CONDITI
ONER,
SOIL
ACTIVAT
OR
AMENDM
ENT; 7.5
POUND
PACKAG
E

60

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$227.00

$13,620.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

36

10016527

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
6-3-0
50LB/BA
G

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

37

10016563

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
INOCULA
NTS
SOIL; 7.5
GAL./CO
NT.

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$424.50

$14,857.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

38

10016564

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE,
7.5
GAL/CON
T.

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$417.00

$14,595.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

39

10016565

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
ROOT
ENHANC
ER; 30
LB.
CASE.

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$318.00

$11,130.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

40

10016566

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
ROOT

ENHANC
ER; 30LB
CASE

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$328.00

$11,480.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

41

10016577

FERTILIZ
ER
WATER
SOLUABL
E HUMIC
ACID;
7.5LB/CO
NT.

35

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$287.00

$10,045.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$58.00

$2,030.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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10016491

AMMONI
A
SULFATE
, 21-0-0,
50
POUND
BAG

140

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

11.95

$

1,673.00

$0.00

No Bid

$

12.00

1,680.00

$10.50

$1,470.00

20.18( $

2,825.20

$21.18

$2,965.20

43

10023372

LIMESTO
NE AGRI,
DOLOMIT
IC LIME,
50
POUND
BAG

95

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

8.00

$

760.00

$0.00

No Bid

7.50

712.50

$7.25

$688.75

15.00 | $

1,425.00

$15.75

$1,496.25

44

10023371

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID 4-
0-0,1
GAL.
CONT.

25

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$7.80

$195.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

45

10023370

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID 4-
0-20.1
GAL.
CONT.

25

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

46

10023346

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID 0-
0-30.1
GAL.
CONT.

20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$37.00

$740.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$9.40

$188.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

47

10016509

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID 4-
0-0.1
GAL.
CONT.

25

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

48

10016508

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID 3-
0-0.1
GAL.
CONT.

25

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

49

10016548

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
18-4-10.
50
POUND
BAG.

265

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

50

10016553

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
20-4-20.
50
POUND
BAG.

230

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

51

10016495

FERTILIZ
ER
BLEND
DRY
13.75-0-
46.50
POUND
BAG.

60

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

36.00

2,160.00

$0.00

No Bid

3950 | $

2,370.00

$41.50

$2,490.00
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10016498

FERTILIZ
ER
BLEND
DRY 20-5-
20
50LB/BA
G

45

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$43.00

$1,935.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

53

10018508
; .FOOD,
PLANT,
LIQ IRON
SEA
HUMUS 5
GAL.

12

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$99.50

$1,194.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

54

10048559

FERTILIZ
ER
ORGANIC
GRO
AQUEOU
s
SOLUTIO
N; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

450

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

55

10023328

FERTILIZ
ER
MICRON
UTRUIEN
T 1GAL.
CONT.

25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

56

10023323

FERTILIZ
ER 25
GAL.
CONT.

25

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$44.00

$1,100.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

57

10023324

FERTILIZ
ER 25
GAL.
CONT.

25

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

58

10023322

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N, FERTI-
LOME
ROSE
FOOD; 4
POUND
CONT.

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

59

10027340

FERTILIZ
ER 15-15-
15;
40LB/BA
G

600

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

11.76

7,056.00

$14.00

$8,400.00

18.44

11,064.00

$19.25

$11,550.00

60

10023321

FERTILIZ
ER
STABILIZ
ER
LIQUID
SULFUR
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

35

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

61

10023320

FERTILIZ
ER
FORMUL
ATN 38-0-
0 PRE-
EMERGE
NT 50LB.
BAG

100

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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10016530

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
10-0-20
50LB/BA
G

200

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

63

10023317

FERTILIZ
ER 21-3-
16.50
POUND
BAG

100

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

64

10UL6550

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
21-3-16,

COlLR/IBA

100

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$19.90

$1,990.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

65

10023314

FERTILIZ
ER 12-2-
24
GREENS
GRADE;
50
POUND
BAG

45

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 35.50

$

1,597.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

66

10023313

FERTILIZ
ER 18-3-
18,50
POUND
BAG

40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$43.00

$1,720.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

67

10023311

FERTILIZ
ER
STARLIN
E25
GAL.
CONT.

25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 112.50

$

2,812.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

68

10023310

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 14-2-14
STARLIN
E;25
GAL.
CONT.

40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 45.00

$

1,800.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

69

10016513

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID 18
3-625
GAL.
CONT.

45

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$38.00

$1,710.00

$ 33.15

$

1,491.75

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

39.88| %

1,794.60

$42.00

$1,890.00

70

10023565

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N CORON
28-0-0
LIQUID;
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

15

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$37.25

$558.75

$ 33.75

$

506.25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

3750 | $

562.50

$38.50

$577.50

71

10023307

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 02-0-26
STARLIN
E; 25
GAL.
CONT.

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 52.50

$

787.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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10023306

FERRILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N
FEATURE
PRO; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 65.00

$

975.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

73

10023305

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 4-0-2
ALPHAN
OVA 25
GAL.
CONT.

50

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 130.00

$

6,500.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

74

10023304

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 18-3-1
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

40

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

75

10023303

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 2%
AMMONI
ACAL 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 87.50

$

1,750.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

76

10023302

FERTILIZ
ER
FORMUL
ATION C-
ALPHA
FOLIAR;
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 112.50

$

2,812.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

77

10023301

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 17-0-11,
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

20

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 87.50

$

1,750.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

78

10023300

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 25-0-0
SPICA 2.5

25

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 62.50

$

1,562.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

79

10048560

FERTILIZ
ER 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 87.50

$

1,312.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

80

10023248

FERTILIZ
ER
NITROGE
N 3-0-5,
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

81

10048438

FERTILIZ
ER
PROSPE
CT, 6-0-1,
2.5
GAL/CON

75

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 87.50

$

6,562.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid
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10048439

FERTILIZ
ER
RADIATE
1 GAL.
CONT.

20

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$ 245.00

$ 4,900.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$122.50 $2,450.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

83

10048440

FERTILIZ
ER
GREENS,
18-4-18,
50 Ib. bag

325

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$41.50 $13,487.50

$ 34.50

$ 11,212.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$43.00 $13,975.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

84

10048441

FERTILIZ
ER

FAIRWAY
, 18-4-18,
50 Ib. bag

500

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$ 19.00

$ 9,500.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

1850 ( $

9,250.00

$19.50

$9,750.00

85

10048442

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
10%
CALCIUM
, 2.5 GAL.

60

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$19.50 $1,170.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

86

10048443

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
4% MG.,
25
GAL/CON

60

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

46.00

2,760.00

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

87

10048444

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
5% MN,
25
GAL/CON

60

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$44.00 $2,640.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

48.00

2,880.00

$17.00 $1,020.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

88

10048445

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
7% ZN,
25
GAL/CON

60

CO

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

89

10048446

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID, 0-
0-30, 2.5
GAL/CON

60

CO

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$36.50 $2,190.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

42.00

2,520.00

$23.50 $1,410.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

90

10048447

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID, 0-
0-20, 2.5
GAL/CON

65

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$36.50 $2,372.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

42.00

2,730.00

$23.50 $1,527.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

91

10048448

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
HUMIC
ACID. 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

60

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology I Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg ||

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

92

10048449

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID IN-
CYTE
PLANT
GROWTH
; 2.5 GAL.
CONT.

60

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

93

10048450

FERTILIZ
ER
GREENS,
13-2-13,
50 LB.
BAG

300

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

34.00

10,200.00

$31.50

$9,450.00

42.00

12,600.00

$44.00

$13,200.00

94

10048451

FERTILIZ
ER

FAIRWAY
, 22-0-22,
50 Ib. bag

450

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

44.80

20,160.00

$47.00

$21,150.00

95

10048452

FERTILIZ
ER
FAIRWAY
, 19-0-19,
50 LB.
BAG

250

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

37.40

9,350.00

$39.40

$9,850.00

96

10048453

FERTILIZ
ER 5-3-2,
50 Ib. bag

175

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

21.35

3,736.25

$22.35

$3,911.25

97

10048454

FERTILIZ
ER 20-0-
20, 150
SGN, 50
LB. BAG

175

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

44.00

7,700.00

$27.50

$4,812.50

49.50

8,662.50

$52.50

$9,187.50

98

10048456

FERTILIZ
ER 24-6-
12, 50%

UFLEXX,
50 Ib. bag

175

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

22.00

3,850.00

$19.90

$3,482.50

30.50

5,337.50

$32.33

$5,657.75

99

10048457

FERTILIZ
ER
GREENS/
TEE, 11-2-
9, 50 Ib.
bag

350

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$37.90

$13,265.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

100

10048458

FERTILIZ
ER
GREENS/
TEE, 6-12-
12,50 Ib.
bag

175

$0.00

No Bid

$41.85

$7,323.75

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

101

10048459

FERTILIZ
ER
GREENS/
TEE, 15-0-
0, 50 Ib.
bag

350

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$39.45

$13,807.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

102

10048455

FERTILIZ
ER
GREENS,
24-0-18,
50 LB.
BAG; 50
POUND
BAG

150

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$43.75

$6,562.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC Pro Alliance Target Specialty Products Agrium Advanced Technology Red River Specialties, Inc. BWI-Schulenburg John Deere Landscapes Winfield Environmental Sorbents LLC

Sub-Total Group 3: $0.00 $259,067.75 $32,953.75 $ 74,391.90 $0.00 $ 79,309.88 $114,476.15 $ 203,000.35 $213,168.95

Pro Alliance Winfield Environmental Sorbents LLC

Alligare, LLC

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Group No. 4
Insecticides

Qty

U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit
Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

10019507

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
SUBDUE
MAXX 1
GAL.

10

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$506.00

$5,060.00

$ 506.00

$ 5,060.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 506.00

5,060.00

$506.00

$5,060.00

&+

506.00

5,060.00

$536.00

$5,360.00

10019509

PESTICID
E,
COPPER
SULFATE
50 LB.
BAG

122

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 87.95

10,729.90

$48.50

$5,917.00

&+

114.00

13,908.00

$120.00

$14,640.00

10019491

INSECTIC
IDE DRY
3 |HELENA
SOAKER
MAXX G;
1 GAL.
CONT.

25

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 10.00

250.00

$27.00

$675.00

©*

29.60

740.00

$24.00

$600.00

10019484

INSECTIC
IDE
AWARD,
FIRE ANT
4 [BAIT
25LB,;
AWARD
FIRE ANT
BAIT
25LB
BAG

75

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$325.50

$24,412.50

$ 233.00

$ 17,475.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 256.00

19,200.00

$0.00

No Bid

204.75

&+

15,356.25

$196.00

$14,700.00

10019483

INSECTIC
IDE
FIREANT
5 |[GRANUL
AR
SYNGEN
TA; 3
POUND
BAG

75

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$37.25

$2,793.75

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

©*»

25.23

1,892.25

$26.23

$1,967.25

10023246

INSECTIC
6 |IDE
LIQUID
BACILLU
S, 1 GAL

25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

@+

13.37

334.25

$14.00

$350.00

10019503

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
DISTANC
E 25LB
CONT.

25

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$195.00

$4,875.00

©*»

176.75

4,418.75

$186.00

$4,650.00

10023244

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID M-
PEDE; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

25

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 74.67

1,866.75

$68.89

$1,722.25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023292

INSECTIC
IDE

9 [LiQuiD
OFTANO
L;25
GAL.
CONT.

18

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

10

10023291

INSECTIC
IDE

ORGANIC
POWDER

ORGANIC
PLUS
FIRE ANT
KILLER. 5
LB BAG.

35

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

11

10023290

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
ORGANIC
A NEEM

25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

12

10019492

INSECTIC
IDE DRY
ORTHEN
E TURF &
TREE
1LB

100

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

9.97

997.00

$6.35

$635.00

9.71

971.00

$10.15

$1,015.00

13

10023289

FUNGICI
DE, DRY
ORTHO; 1
POUND
BAG

25

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

9.71

242.75

$10.15

$253.75

14

10023288

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
SEVIN
SL; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

75

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$112.00

$8,400.00

$ 102.50 | $ 7,687.50

$0.00

No Bid

$

95.00

7,125.00

$92.50

$6,937.50

86.28

6,471.00

$90.28

$6,771.00

15

10023286

FUNGICI
DE DRY
BENOMY
L;
10LB/BA
G

20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

16

10UZ3Z285

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
HORTICU
LTURE; 1

25

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 1165| $ 291.25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

44.55

1,113.75

$46.55

$1,163.75

17

GAl
10023284

FUNGICI
DE, DRY
PROCIDE
G; 40
POUND

20

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

18

10023283

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
GNATRO
L;
2.5GAL.

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

295.20

1,771.20

$312.00

$1,872.00

19

10023282

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
DEADLIN
E
1QT/CON
T

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

20

10019487

INSECTIC
IDE DRY
BAYER
TOPCHOI
CE
GRANUL
AR; 50
POUND
BAG

500

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$137.50

$68,750.00

$ 137.50

$ 68,750.00

$0.00 No Bid

$

137.50

68,750.00

$137.50

$68,750.00

©*»

13750 $ 68,750.00

$145.00 $72,500.00

21

10000344

INSECTIC
IDE 1 LB.
CAN,
AMDRO,
FIRE ANT
BAIT

100

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

22

10002283

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
MALATHI
ON 575, 1
GAL.

30

CO

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$

46.78

1,403.40

$0.00

No Bid

©

3298 $ 989.40

$34.97 $1,049.10

23

10019485

INSECTIC
IDE DRY
AMDRO
25LB.
BAG

1100

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$203.00

$223,300.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$

197.74

217,514.00

$0.00

No Bid

©

186.25| $ 204,875.00

$190.00 $209,000.00

24

10023267

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
DIMILIN; 1
GAL.
CONT.

100

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

25

10023266

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID
ALLECTU
S1GAL.
CONT.

40

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

©“

121.35( $ 4,854.00

$128.35 $5,134.00

26

10023265

PESTICID
E BAIT,
DUPNT
ADVION
MOLECRI
CKET,; 50
POUND
BAG

25

BA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$

57.69

1,442.25

$0.00

No Bid

&+

50.00 | $ 1,250.00

$52.00 $1,300.00

27

10048460

INSECTIC
IDE.
DYLOX
420SL,
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

145

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$

167.24

24,249.80

$160.50

$23,272.50

146.58  $ 21,254.10

$154.00 $22,330.00

28

10048461

INSECTIC
IDE 1
GAL.
CONT.

30

GAL

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$292.50

$8,775.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$

318.16

9,544.80

$100.80

$3,024.00

©*

266.13| $ 7,983.90

$281.00 $8,430.00

29

10048462

INSECTIC
IDE 12-0-
10, 50 Ib.

bag

325

$0.00 No Bid

$48.45

$15,746.25

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

30

10048463

INSECTIC
IDE 16-0-
8
FERTILIZ
ER MINI-
PRIL; 50
Ib. bag

300

BA

$0.00 No Bid

$53.50

$16,050.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

10048562

FERTILIZ
ER
FAIRWAY
GRADE,
31 [ACTIVE
INGREDI
ENT
CARBAR
YL-25
GAL.
CONT.

273

BA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$93.75 $25,593.75

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

Sub-Total Group 4:

$0.00

$31,796.25

$341,491.25

$ 99,263.75

$0.00

$ 368,132.90

$146,462.00

$ 362,235.60

$373,085.85

Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

Group No. 5
Aquatic
Cleaners
Specialties
Ground Covers
Protectors

Qty

UM

Unit Price Line Total

Unit
Price

Line Total

Unit Price Line Total

Unit Price Line Total

Unit Price Line Total

Unit Price Line Total

Unit Price Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price Line Total

10020594

MICROBE
, WATER
TREATM
ENT
POND
CLEANIN
G; 3 GAL.
CASE

80

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$198.00

$15,840.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10020593

CLEANIN
G
SYSTEM,
WATER
TREATM
ENT
POND;
5GAL/KIT

30

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$244.00

$7,320.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023264

CLARIFIE
R,
ORGANIC
POND, 1
POUND
CONT.

100

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023263

CHEMICA
L,
WATER D
TOX
CHARCO

20

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$ 56.14

$ 1,122.80

$43.00 $860.00

$

57.93

$ 1,158.60

$60.55

$1,211.00

10013601

CLEANE
R,
CLEARY
TANK 1

340

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$6.32 $2,148.80

$ 5.50

$ 1,870.00

$4.80 $1,632.00

$

13.95

$ 4,743.00

$14.00

$4,760.00

10019511
; DYE,
HERBICID
E 1 GAL
BLUE
SPRAY
INDICATO
R

240

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$33.00

$7,920.00

$0.00

No Bid

$38.00 $9,120.00

$ 36.00

$ 8,640.00

$17.00 $4,080.00

$

95.00

$ 22,800.00

$99.00

$23,760.00

10023262
; DYE,
HERBICID
E BLUE
SPRAY
PATTERN
; 25 PER
BOTTLE

80

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology I

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

10019510

ADDITIVE
,HERBICI
DE
COLORA
NT
SPRAY
2.5GAL

420

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$59.90

$25,158.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

84.01

35,284.20

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023261
; POISON,
SURFAC
TANT,
OASIS XL
SOIL; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

30

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

&+

215.00

6,450.00

$215.00

$6,450.00

10

10048565

PROTEC
TOR
CLOUD
COVER
PLANT, 1
GAL/CON
T

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$33.00

$495.00

©*

36.70

550.50

$38.70

$580.50

11

10012210

HYDROM
ULCH,
PALLETIZ
ED PRO-
MAT 50

750

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

6,615.00

$7.50

$5,625.00

&+

15.00

11,250.00

$0.00

No Bid

12

10048566
MATTING

STANDA
RD

EXCELSI
OR MAT

60

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

13

10023260

FERTILIZ
ER
WETTING
AGENT,
2.5GAL

45

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 150.00

$

6,750.00

$0.00

No Bid

$

158.75

7,143.75

$67.50

$3,037.50

©*

215.00

9,675.00

$214.25

$9,641.25

14

10023238

WETTING
AGENT,
AGRI 2.5
GAL

70

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$364.17

$25,491.90

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

317.50

22,225.00

$0.00

No Bid

©*

158.75

11,112.50

$160.00

$11,200.00

15

10016572

FERTILIZ
ER
SPECIAL
TY
GROWTH
REGULA
TOR; 1
GAL.
CONT.

30

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$283.00

$8,490.00

$ 185.00

$

5,550.00

$0.00

No Bid

$

188.45

5,653.50

$283.00

$8,490.00

©

283.00

8,490.00

$299.00

$8,970.00

16

10023237

FERTILIZ
ER ROOT
STIMULA
NT 5-12-
3, 1GAL

15

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

17

10019512

SURFAC
TANT,
SPRED
R20
ENCAPS
ULATOR
2.5GAL

42

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$96.25

$4,042.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

@

70.00

2,940.00

$73.50

$3,087.00




Alligare, LLC

Pro

Alliance

Target Special

Ity Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Sp

ecialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Win

field

Environmental

Sorbents LLC

10027375

FERTILIZ
ER
DEFOAM
ER, 1
GAL.
CONT.

18

1000

CO

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 45.00

$ 45,000.00

$18.46

$18,460.00

$ 5.50

$

5,500.00

$7.50

$7,500.00

$

48.95

$ 48,950.00

$49.00

$49,000.00

10048567

INDICATO
R GREEN
SPRAY
PATTERN
1 GAL.
CONT.

19

100

GAL

$0.00 No Bid

$32.20

$3,220.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 100.00

$

10,000.00

$24.60

$2,460.00

38.00

$ 3,800.00

$40.00

$4,000.00

10048568
s ALGAE
CONTRO
L,
FORMUL
AF-3,1
GAL.
CONT.

20

25

GAL

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10048554

HERBICID
21 |E QUIK
PRO 1.5
OUNCES
PACKET

20000

PAC

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$1.32

$26,400.00

$ 155

$

31,000.00

$0.00

No Bid

$ 29,400.00

$2.00

$40,000.00

10048464

WETTING
AGENT,
22 |PRO-
WET
BLUE, 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

60

$0.00 No Bid

$165.00

$9,900.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10048465

WETTING
AGENT,
23 |PRO-
WET
GREEN,
2.5 GAL.
CONT.

85

$0.00 No Bid

$160.00

$13,600.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

Sub-Total Group 5:

$0.00

$79,080.50

$41,901.90

$ 57,300.00 I

$56,128.80

$

135,054.25

$34,179.50

$ 161,319.60

$162,659.75

Alligare, LLC

Pro

Alliance

Target Specia

Ity Products

Agrium Advanced Technology

Red River Sp

ecialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

field

Environmental

Sorbents LLC

Group No. 6
Misc.

Qty

U/M

Unit Price Line Total

Unit
Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

Unit Price

Line Total

10016518

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
1 [moLass
ES
UNPAST
EURIZE;
1GAL/CO
NT.

250

EA

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10048570
; FOOD
PLANT,
HYDRO-
HUME
PLUS, 1
GAL.
CONT.

20

GAL

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023235

INSECTIC
IDE
LIQUID

3 |BLACKJA
CK
TWENTY
ONE; 1
GAL.
CONT.

120

$0.00 No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 9.65

$

1,158.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC

Pro Alliance

Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology I

Red River Specialties, Inc.

BWI-Schulenburg

John Deere Landscapes

Winfield

Environmental Sorbents LLC

10048572
: SOIL
AMENDM
ENT,
FISH
EMULSIO
N, 1GAL

120

GAL

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$

12.55

1,506.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10016516

FERTILIZ
ER
LIQUID
SoIL
AMENDM
ENT-1

120

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10023560

CONDITI
ONER
INFIELD
CALCINE
D CLAY;
50
POUND
BAG

80

CO

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$ 11.00

$

880.00

$0.00

No Bid

$

10.00

800.00

$0.00

No Bid

12.02

961.60

$12.50

$1,000.00

10023561
; SOIL
AMENDM
NT

250

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10016503

FERTILIZ
ER
STIMULA
TOR
ROOT
HUMIC
ACID; 2.5
GAL.
CONT.

80

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$89.50

$7,160.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10016562

FERTILIZ
ER GOLF
COURSE
ACTIVAT
OR SOIL;
2.5
GAL/CON
T.

100

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$56.50

$5,650.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

10

10016585

CONDITI
ONER,
SOIL
CLINOLIT
E
AMENDM
ENT. 50
POUND
BAG.

450

EA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

13.74

6,183.00

$14.56

$6,552.00

11

10023562

FERTILIZ
ER ECO-
MIN
GOLF
COURSE
40LB/BA
G

120

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

12

10023566

CONDITI
ONER,
SOIL WS-
70
ORGANIC
.10
POUNDS
PER
CASE.

20

BA

$0.00

No Bid

$129.00

$2,580.00

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

13

10048571

CONDITI
ONER
ACCELE
RATOR,
WASH
RACKI/LIF
T 1GAL.
CONT.

50

GAL

$0.00

No Bid

$89.85

$4,492.50

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid




Alligare, LLC Pro Alliance Target Specialty Products

Agrium Advanced Technology I Red River Specialties, Inc. BWI-Schulenburg John Deere Landscapes Winfield Environmental Sorbents LLC

10048561

FERTILIZ
ER

14 |CORON, | 10 [cAL] s$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $ 3750 | $ 375.00 $39.50 $395.00
18-3-6
LIQUID, 1
GAL.
CONT.

10048573

INOCULA
NT
MICROM
15 |ATE 100 |GAL] s$0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid
LIQUID
HUMATE
solL 1
GAL.
CONT.

10048466

16 45 EA $0.00 No Bid $546.00 | $24,570.00 $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid $0.00 No Bid

MATTING
, SAND

Sub-Total Group 6: $0.00 $44,452.50 $0.00 $880.00 $0.00 $ 3,464.00 $0.00 $ 7,519.60 $7,947.00

Grand Total: $272,121.00 $470,894.00 $796,545.95 $941,805.96 $1,207,752.90 $ 1,337,681.11 $1,645,806.14 $ 2,876,502.74 $2,948,488.80
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