City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Paint, Street Marking
for
Public Works
$25125 - Close Date: 4/30/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received:5 Trantex Transportation Products of Ennis Paint Inc. Allstates Coatings Co. Globe Electric Supply Inc PITTSBURGH PAINT
2814487711 800-331-8118 903-845-6436 281-933-0909 713-694-4262
109105 109380 136280 110944 111671
Percent Mfg Percent Mfg Percent Mfg Percent Mfg Percent Mfg
Item # Description Qty 1U/M | Unit Price | Change | Line Total | Note | Unit Price | Change Line Total Note | Unit Price | Change Line Total Note | Unit Price | Change Lirne Total Note | Unit Price | Change Line Total Note
Street Marking Paint. Estimated Expenditure
1110018886, PAINT, TRAFFIC MARK 400! EA $0.00 No Bid $440.00 $176,000.001 1 $458.70 $183,480.00] 2 $679.00 $271,600.00 $680.77 $272,308.00f 5
LATEX WHITE 55GAL/DM,; White Paint
55/GAL/DRUM
2110018888; PAINT, TRAFFIC MARK 500 EA $0.00 No Bid $440.00 $220,000.00{ 6 $465.30 $232,650.00) 7 $679.00 $339,500.00 $689.43 $344,715.00; 10
LATEX YELLOW S55GAL; Yellow Paint
SSIGALIDRUM
3110034965; COMPOUND, 25| BAG $26.00 $650.00] 11 $30.00 $750.00] 12 $0.00 No Bid $38.55 $963.75 $0.00 No Bid
THERMOPLASTIC, 50 LB BAG; 50/LB
BAG
Sub-Total: $650.00 $396,750.00 $416,130.00 $612,063.75 $617,023.00
City’'s Option
11Should you be awarded ALL Items 1 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 g $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00
you bid, what percent additional
discount {if any would be deducted
from each item hid?
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
City Pick Up Option
1|For any item listed in this Award, 1 $0.00 ] $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 3 $0.00
what additional discount, if any,
would you give for items picked up at
vour lncatinn by the citu?
Sub-Total: $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00
Grand Total: $650.00 $396,750.00 $416,130.00 $612,063.75 $617,023.00

Iterns marked above with a Mfg Note number have the following equivalent Manufacturer’s Name, Product Name, and Product Number:

1:
2:

Ennis Paint, EF Series, 985301
Alistates Coatings Co ALT-732 Insta-Dri

5: PPG 72W-A089
6: Ennis Paint, EF Series, 985302
7: Alistates Coatings Co ALT-733 Insta-Dri

10: PPG 72Y-A086
11: CK29
12: Ennis Paint, PaveMark, 884490
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