
Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change

1 CONVENIENCE BAGS, white with 
       

1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $16.05 -21 $12.68 $25.69 -30 $17.98 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 BIOHOOP COLLECTION BAGS, no 

       
1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $22.50 -21 $17.78 $25.29 -30 $17.70 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 RED BIOHAZARD BAGS, 4 gallon 
        

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $51.40 -21 $40.61 $95.00 -30 $66.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
4 MICROFLEX DIAMOND GRIP 

  
1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $14.65 -21 $11.57 $16.49 -30 $11.54 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $82.63 $113.73 $0.00 $0.00 

1 AMBU SPUR RESUSCITATOR, 
    

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $14.65 -24 $11.13 $17.79 -30 $12.45 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 KING LTS-D, SIZE 3 YELLOW 

 
1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $469.50 -24 $356.82 $473.90 -30 $331.73 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 KING LT-D, SIZE 2, GREEN, 
 

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $425.00 -24 $323.00 $430.90 -30 $301.63 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $690.95 $645.81 $0.00 $0.00 

1 CPAP COMBO KIT, O2-RESQ 
    

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $68.75 -22 $53.63 $84.69 -35 $55.05 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 O2-RESQ DISPOSABLE CPAP 

     
1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $62.25 -22 $48.56 $65.29 -35 $42.44 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 WHISPERPAK CPAP KITS, 
    

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $46.37 -22 $36.17 $47.40 -35 $30.81 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $138.35 $128.30 $0.00 $0.00 

1 LAERDAL SUCTION UNIT LSU 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $979.25 -17 $812.78 $995.00 -30 $696.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 COMPACT SUCTION UNIT 4 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $567.95 -17 $471.40 $97.90 -30 $68.53 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 ULTRALITE II SUCTION UNIT 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $752.35 -17 $624.45 $979.19 -30 $685.43 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $1,908.63 $1,450.46 $0.00 $0.00 

1 CURITY ABDOMINAL ABD PADS, 
         

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $96.25 -30 $67.38 $125.88 -37 $79.30 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 CURITY MULTI-TRAUMA 

      
1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $66.75 -30 $46.73 $259.50 -37 $163.49 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 CURITY WET DRESSINGS, 4" X 8" 
       

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $158.69 -30 $111.08 $216.96 -37 $136.68 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $225.18 $379.47 $0.00 $0.00 

440-257-9010

139787

DIXON SHANE, LLC

800-626-0208

145400

Item # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

Bound Tree Medical, LLCBound Tree 

800.533.0523

110142

Smith Medical Partners LLC

6307736256

Global Protection Corp

617-946-2800

123379

Emergency Medical Products Inc

800-558-6270

108902

Bids Received: 6 AMERISOCHI, INC.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Airway & Oxygen Delivery" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Oxygen Equipment" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Suction" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total

GROUP I - Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Infection Control" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term not to exceed an overall amount of $4,400,100.00 Note: Sample items listed for 
bid evaluation purposes. GROUP ONE WILL BE AWARDED TO OVERALL LOW BIDDER FOR PRODUCT CATALOG

Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Wound Care" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM



Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change
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Bids Received: 6 AMERISOCHI, INC.

Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM

1 SMALL FIRST AID KIT 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $22.29 -30 $15.60 $22.69 -35 $14.75 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 ALCOHOL PREPS, 200 PER BOX 

   
1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $3.25 -30 $2.28 $3.66 -35 $2.38 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 TONGUE DEPRESSORS NON 
      

1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $5.25 -30 $3.68 $11.29 -35 $7.34 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $21.55 $24.47 $0.00 $0.00 

1 LINEN PACKS, 25 PER CASE 1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $99.95 -22 $77.96 $93.99 -30 $65.79 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 DISPOSABLE PATIENT QUILT, 10 

 
1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $79.50 -22 $62.01 $107.09 -30 $74.96 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 UNDERPADS, 200 PER CASE 1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $44.11 -22 $34.41 $62.00 -30 $43.40 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $174.38 $184.16 $0.00 $0.00 

1 AMU HEAD WEDGE, 10 PER 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.35 -22 $4.95 $5.89 -35 $3.83 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 AMBU PERFIT ACE, 30 PER CASE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $9.35 -22 $7.29 $8.99 -35 $5.84 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 AMBU PERFIT, 50 PER CASE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.95 -22 $5.42 $7.74 -35 $5.03 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $17.67 $14.70 $0.00 $0.00 

1 RESCUE BAG 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $105.95 -24 $80.52 $198.89 -30 $139.22 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 OXY SLEEVE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $25.95 -24 $19.72 $33.69 -30 $23.58 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 RESPONDER KIT 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $285.25 -24 $216.79 $369.19 -30 $258.43 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $317.03 $421.24 $0.00 $0.00 

1 LATEX TOURNIQUET, 10 PER 
    

1 BAG $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $3.69 -27 $2.69 $2.46 -37 $1.55 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 PROTECTIV PLUS IV 

   
1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $678.30 -27 $495.16 $738.00 -37 $464.94 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 NEEDLE FREE SYRINGES, 400 
 

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $224.20 -27 $163.67 $332.00 -37 $209.16 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $661.52 $675.65 $0.00 $0.00 

1 EPIPEN 2-PAK 0.3 MG AUTO 
    

1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $442.29 -15 $375.95 $619.99 -10 $557.99 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 DEXTROSE 10% 250ML 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.35 -15 $5.40 $6.59 -10 $5.93 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 ADENOCARD 12MG, 10 PER BOX 

    
1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $110.25 -15 $93.71 $108.99 -10 $98.09 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $475.06 $662.01 $0.00 $0.00 

1 BLOOD PRESSURE BULB 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $4.49 -17 $3.73 $3.25 -35 $2.11 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 3M LITTMANN SELECT 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $56.29 -17 $46.72 $79.59 -35 $51.73 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 THERMOMETER SHEATHS, 100 

      
1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $2.79 -17 $2.32 $4.83 -35 $3.14 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $52.76 $56.99 $0.00 $0.00 

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Splinting & Immobilization" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Equipment Bags" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "IV Products & Blood Collection" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Trauma Kits and First Aid" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Patient Handling" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Pharmaceuticals" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Diagnostics" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:



Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change
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Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM

1 DISPOSABLE C02 SAMPLING 
   

1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $969.00 -18 $794.58 $1,049.00 -37 $660.87 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 DISPOSABLE CO2 SAMPLING 

   
1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $1,195.00 -18 $979.90 $1,363.00 -37 $858.69 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 DISPOSABLE C02 SAMPLING 
    

1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $367.25 -18 $301.15 $404.75 -37 $254.99 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $2,075.63 $1,774.55 $0.00 $0.00 

1 HEMOSTATS, KELLY FORCEPS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $1.94 -28 $1.40 $4.56 -35 $2.96 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 MAGILL FORCEPS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.75 -28 $4.86 $7.69 -35 $5.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 MAGILL FORCEPS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.75 -28 $4.86 $7.69 -35 $5.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $11.12 $12.96 $0.00 $0.00 

1 BARRIER TAPE 1 ROL $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $14.50 -17 $12.04 $17.59 -35 $11.43 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 SPECIALTY VESTS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $26.25 -17 $21.79 $30.89 -35 $20.08 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 SPECIALTY VESTS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $26.50 -17 $22.00 $30.89 -35 $20.08 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $55.82 $51.59 $0.00 $0.00 

1 AMBU PERFIT ACE, 30 PER CASE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $9.35 -22 $7.29 $10.49 -40 $6.29 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 HEAD WEDGE, 10 PER CASE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $5.75 -22 $4.49 $6.89 -40 $4.13 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 PERFIT ACE & HEAD WEDGE 

    
1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $18.75 -22 $14.63 $21.69 -40 $13.01 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $26.40 $23.44 $0.00 $0.00 

1 CPR MASK 10 PER CASE 1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $4.45 -15 $3.78 $7.59 -20 $6.07 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 ONE WAY VALVE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $7.25 -15 $6.16 $7.35 -20 $5.88 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 FILTER 1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $2.45 -15 $2.08 $2.40 -20 $1.92 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $12.03 $13.87 $0.00 $0.00 

1 EMS FIELD GUIDE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $25.95 -18 $21.28 $25.79 -35 $16.76 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 EMS FIELD GUIDE ALS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $25.95 -18 $21.28 $25.79 -35 $16.76 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 EMERGENCY CRITICAL CARE 

 
1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $25.95 -18 $21.28 $28.39 -35 $18.45 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $63.84 $51.98 $0.00 $0.00 

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Instruments & Personal Items" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Triage" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Tactical" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Monitoring & Defibrillation" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Training & Simulation" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Reference & Reporting" in Bound Tree's Emergency Medical Product Catalog dated 2015 or online catalog OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:



Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change
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City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM

1 ENDOTRACHEAL TUBE HOLDER 
  

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $79.59 -24 $60.49 $88.00 -30 $61.60 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 STANDARD TUBE HOLDER, 10 

 
1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $34.80 -24 $26.45 $6.31 -30 $4.42 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 THOMAS ET TUBE HOLDER, 100 
 

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $431.65 -24 $328.05 $88.00 -30 $61.60 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $414.99 $127.62 $0.00 $0.00 

1 MINI NEBULIZER WITH MASK 
   

1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $77.10 -22 $60.14 $75.00 -30 $52.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 MINI NEBULIZER WITH MASK 1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $91.65 -22 $71.49 $65.00 -30 $45.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 TOTAL NONBREATHING MASK, 

   
1 CS $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $81.95 -22 $63.92 $115.00 -30 $80.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $195.55 $178.50 $0.00 $0.00 

1 BAYER CONTOUR BLOOD 
  

1 EA $0.00 0 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $29.95 -20 $23.96 $0.00 -35 $0.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 CONTOUR MICROFILL, TEST 

 
1 BOX $16.25 0 $16.25 $0.00 0 No Bid $52.95 -20 $42.36 $41.99 -35 $27.29 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 CONTOUR CONTROL SOLUTION, 1 EA $4.25 0 $4.25 $0.00 0 No Bid $10.95 -20 $8.76 $10.00 -35 $6.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$20.50 $0.00 $75.08 $33.79 $0.00 $0.00 

1 3M LITTMANN STETHOSCOPES 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $85.25 -17 $70.76 $120.39 -35 $78.25 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 3M LITTMANN STETHOSCOPES, 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $101.39 -17 $84.15 $1.23 -35 $0.80 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 PRO 4000 TYMPANIC 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $213.95 -17 $177.58 $248.89 -35 $161.78 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $332.49 $240.83 $0.00 $0.00 

1 PERFIT ACE EXTRICATION 
 

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $9.35 -22 $7.29 $8.99 -35 $5.84 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 MINI PERFIT ACE EXTRICATION 

  
1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $9.35 -22 $7.29 $8.99 -35 $5.84 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 PERFIT EXTRICATION COLLAR 
    

1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $36.39 -22 $28.38 $44.19 -35 $28.72 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $42.97 $40.41 $0.00 $0.00 

1 PATIENT MEDICATION BAG 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $1.39 -22 $1.08 $112.99 -30 $79.09 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 REDI RITE CLIPBOARD 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $31.95 -22 $24.92 $44.39 -30 $31.07 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 DISPOSABLE FITTED COT 

 
1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $47.69 -22 $37.20 $4.30 -30 $3.01 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $63.20 $113.18 $0.00 $0.00 

1 ULTRA BACK PACK TRAUMA 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $537.95 -24 $408.84 $319.29 -30 $223.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 BLS BACK PACK TRAUMA 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $224.25 -24 $170.43 $244.79 -30 $171.35 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 BREATHSAVER PLUS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $276.09 -24 $209.83 $299.89 -30 $209.92 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $789.10 $604.78 $0.00 $0.00 

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Breathing & Respiratory Equipment" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Diabetic Supplies" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Diagnostic Equipment" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

GROUP II - Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Airway Maintenance" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term not to exceed an overall amount of $669,260.00 Note: Sample items 
listed for bid evaluation purposes. GROUP TWO WILL BE AWARDED TO OVERALL LOW BIDDER FOR PRODUCT CATALOG

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Immobilization & Extrication" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Patient Transportation Equipment" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Equipment Bags and Cases" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:



Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change

440-257-9010

139787

DIXON SHANE, LLC

800-626-0208

145400

Item # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

Bound Tree Medical, LLCBound Tree 

800.533.0523

110142

Smith Medical Partners LLC

6307736256

Global Protection Corp

617-946-2800

123379

Emergency Medical Products Inc

800-558-6270

108902

Bids Received: 6 AMERISOCHI, INC.

Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM

1 SAFE TOUCH POWDER FREE 
  

1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $7.85 -21 $6.20 $28.59 -30 $20.01 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 PURELL HAND SANITIZER 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $4.69 -21 $3.71 $2.49 -30 $1.74 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 CAVICIDE METREX 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $29.15 -21 $23.03 $7.99 -30 $5.59 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $32.94 $27.35 $0.00 $0.00 

1 2-SHELF INDUSTRIAL FIRST AID 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $90.95 -30 $63.67 $138.69 -35 $90.15 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 ALL PURPOSE FIRST AID KIT 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $2.89 -30 $2.02 $15.09 -35 $9.81 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 CPR ONE-WAY FACESHIELD 1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $4.90 -30 $3.43 $19.57 -35 $12.72 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $69.12 $112.68 $0.00 $0.00 

1 ELASTIC BANDAGE , 3 INCHES X 
 

1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $17.35 -30 $12.15 $14.70 -37 $9.26 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 MICROPORE PAPER TAPE, 3M 1 

      
1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $10.55 -30 $7.39 $16.79 -37 $10.58 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

3 GAUZE SPONGES 3 X 3 NON-
    

1 BAG $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $3.15 -30 $2.21 $2.96 -37 $1.86 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $21.74 $21.70 $0.00 $0.00 

1 ANTISEPTIC TOWLETTES - HLT 1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $2.99 -25 $2.24 $4.27 -10 $3.84 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 TOURNIQUETS, LATEX FREE 1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $2.75 -25 $2.06 $1.96 -10 $1.76 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 MULTI SAMPLE NEEDLES 1 BOX $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $15.85 -25 $11.89 $19.39 -10 $17.45 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
4 HYDROGEN PEROXIDE 1 BT $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $1.19 -25 $0.89 $2.79 -10 $2.51 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
5 ACETAMINOPHEN 325MG 250 2- 1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $15.65 -25 $11.74 $13.49 -10 $12.14 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $28.82 $37.71 $0.00 $0.00 

1 PRACTIMAN, SINGLE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $99.95 -15 $84.96 $0.00 -20 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 PRACTIMAN, 4 PACK 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $399.79 -15 $339.82 $0.00 -20 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 LUNG BAG, 24 PACK 1 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $15.49 -15 $13.17 $9.91 -20 $7.93 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $437.95 $7.93 $0.00 $0.00 

1 RING CUTTER, STAINLESS 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $13.25 -27 $9.67 $4.39 -35 $2.85 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 REPLACEMENT BLADE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.05 -27 $4.42 $7.74 -35 $5.03 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 WINDOW PUNCH , PRESSURE 1 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $6.59 -27 $4.81 $11.19 -35 $7.27 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $18.90 $15.16 $0.00 $0.00 

Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Infection Control" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "First Aid Kits" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Wound Care" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "I.V. and Pharmaceuticals" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Medical Education and Training" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.

Sub-Total:
Discount Percent Proposed to Category Labeled "Fire and Rescue Equipment" in Emergency Medical Products, Inc.'s Medical Equipment & Supply Catalog dated 2015 OR AN APPROVED EQUAL CATALOG for a 60-month term. Note: Sample items listed for bid evaluation purposes.



Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change

440-257-9010

139787

DIXON SHANE, LLC

800-626-0208

145400

Item # Description Qty U/M Unit Price Line Total

Bound Tree Medical, LLCBound Tree 

800.533.0523

110142

Smith Medical Partners LLC

6307736256

Global Protection Corp

617-946-2800

123379

Emergency Medical Products Inc

800-558-6270

108902

Bids Received: 6 AMERISOCHI, INC.

Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM

1 10005993; DRUG, EHTINYL 
    

3800 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $82.53 0 $313,614.00 $22.07 0 $83,866.00 
2 10005996; DRUG, NONOXYNOL 9 

   
500 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $8.57 0 $4,285.00 $8.57 0 $4,285.00 

3 10006047; CONDOM, 
    

20016 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.06 0 $1,160.93 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $57.00 0 $1,140,912.00 $0.00 0 No Bid
4 10006050; DRUG, 

  
16300 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $22.46 0 $366,098.00 $28.95 0 $471,885.00 

5 10022188; RING, NUVA, VAGINAL 
   

1395 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $13.59 0 $18,958.05 $42.83 0 $59,747.85 
6 10042083; DRUG, 

  
370 CAR $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $32.02 0 $11,847.40 $33.79 0 $12,502.30 

7 10042600; DRUG, ETHINYL 
   

4650 CAR $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $17.25 0 $80,212.50 $18.21 0 $84,676.50 
8 10045493; IMPLANT, 

  
790 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

9 10005991; CONTRACEPTIVE, 
  

790 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $328.83 0 $259,775.70 $0.00 0 No Bid
10 10042601; DRUG, TRI-CYCLEN LO 

     
7160 CAR $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $1.67 0 $11,957.20 $1.76 0 $12,601.60 

11 10027880; SUBDERMAL IMPLANT 
  

1470 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $234.66 0 $344,950.20 $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $1,160.93 $0.00 $0.00 $2,552,610.05 $729,564.25 

1 10015608; VACCINE, ADULT 
    

600 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $47.83 0 $28,698.00 $501.84 0 $301,104.00 
2 10015633; VACCINE, YELLOW 

     
1000 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $437.47 0 $437,470.00 $0.00 0 No Bid

3 10022181; VACCINE, HEPATITIS B 
   

600 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $38.72 0 $23,232.00 $406.19 0 $243,714.00 
4 10022182; VACCINE, M-M-RII 

   
250 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $57.03 0 $14,257.50 $627.94 0 $156,985.00 

5 10022183; VACCINE, VARICELLA 
    

500 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $95.68 0 $47,840.00 $1,056.74 0 $528,370.00 
6 10022185; VACCINE, TYPHOID VI, 

    
2000 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $72.13 0 $144,260.00 $78.08 0 $156,160.00 

7 10022186; VACCINE, MENINGITIS 
   

100 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $104.91 0 $10,491.00 $593.23 0 $59,323.00 
8 10023880; INJECTION, VACCINE 

    
5 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $32.49 0 $162.45 $430.52 0 $2,152.60 

9 10025222; VACCINE, HEPATITIS 
    

800 PAC $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $71.04 0 $56,832.00 $745.17 0 $596,136.00 
10 10034006; DRUG, DIPHTH 

    
120 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $32.49 0 $3,898.80 $430.52 0 $51,662.40 

11 10034028; VACCINE,HEPATITIS B 
   

40 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $38.72 0 $1,548.80 $406.19 0 $16,247.60 
12 10034674; VACCINE, HPV4; NDC 

  
200 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $132.38 0 $26,476.00 $1,543.18 0 $308,636.00 

13 10034680; VACCINE, IPV 10 DOSE 
   

200 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $279.32 0 $55,864.00 $302.26 0 $60,452.00 
14 10034691; VACCINE, VARICELLA; 

   
500 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $1,056.74 0 $528,370.00 

15 10034859; VACCINE, 
 

100 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $152.01 0 $15,201.00 $760.03 0 $76,003.00 
16 10034861; VACCINE, ZOSTER; 100 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $170.50 0 $17,050.00 $1,972.89 0 $197,289.00 
17 10034872; VACCINE, TETANUS & 2 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $21.03 0 $42.06 $239.10 0 $478.20 

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $883,323.61 $3,283,082.80 

GROUP III, 340B FAMILY PLANNING NOTE: DISTRIBUTORS MUST BE REGISTERED AND PARTNERED WITH THE 340B PRIME VENDOR PROGRAM (SEE SECTION B, TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS)GROUP THREE WILL BE AWARDED TO OVERALL LOW BIDDER

Sub-Total:

GROUP IV, VACCINES NOTE: DISTRIBUTORS MUST BE REGISTERED AND PARTNERED WITH THE 340B PRIME VENDOR PROGRAM (SEE SECTION B, TECHNICAL SPECIFICATIONS)GROUP FOUR WILL BE AWARDED TO OVERALL LOW BIDDER

Sub-Total:



Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent Percent
Change Change Change Change Change Change
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Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price Line TotalUnit Price Line Total Unit Price Line Total Unit Price

City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Emergency Medical Equipment, Supplies and Pharmaceuticals for Various Departments

for
ARA, Airport, Fire, Health, Police, Public Works

S25281 - Close Date: 3/26/2015 10:30:00 AM

1 10004360; BAG, TRAUMA 
    

30 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $160.15 0 $4,804.50 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
2 10004361; BAG, FIRST AID, 30 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $46.20 0 $1,386.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
3 10022848; BAG, EMS POP PACK 30 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $175.32 0 $5,259.60 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid
4 10004462; CARRIER, OXYGEN 

PORTABLE SIZE CYLINDER  
30 EA $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid $239.24 0 $7,177.20 $0.00 0 No Bid $0.00 0 No Bid

$0.00 $0.00 $0.00 $18,627.30 $0.00 $0.00 

$20.50 $1,160.93 $9,533.38 $26,874.32 $3,435,933.66 $4,012,647.05 

Sub-Total:

Grand Total:

GROUP V, EMS BAGS


	BidTab-S25281

