City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for

Bags, Polyethylene Linear Low Density

for
Finance
S25358

- Close Date: 4/23/2015 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 7

ePolyStar
800-793-3088
118915

Unipak Corp.
888-808-5120
124103

Central Poly CorporationCENTRAL POLY CORP

908-862-7570
109312

DYNA PAK CORP

931 762 4016

Item #

Description

|Qty |U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Bags, L|

near Low Density Polyethylene

1

10032241; BAG, POLYETHYLENE 17"
X 17" BL/BR 4 GAL; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.36 Mil, Size: 17 in x 17 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 4 Gal, 1000 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed iin Box,
Mfr.: Heritage H3417RB or Equal

2000| Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$14.80

$29,600.00

2

$14.93

$29,860.00

3

10002447; BAG, POLY 8-10 GAL 24" X
23" BLACK; Liner, Refuse, Opaque,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: .36 Mil,
Size: 24 in x 23 in , Container Size: 8-
10 Gal., Color: Black, 500 Per Case;
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfr.:
Heritage D4823RD or Equal

1510| Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$12.40

$18,724.00

$13.80

$20,838.00

10005084; BAG, POLY LOW DENSITY
24" X 32" BLACK; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.35 Mil, Size: 24i n x 32 in, Color:
Black, Container Size: 12-16 Gal, 500
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr Pitt Plastics Blackstar

Dzanan | C

1347| CS

$0.00

No Bid

$14.00

$18,858.00

10

$11.00

$14,817.00

11

$19.20

$25,862.40

12

10005986; BAG, POLY LOW DENSITY
37" X 50" BLACK; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
1.5 Mil, Size: 37 in x 50 in, Color
Black, Container Size: 44-48 Gal, 100
Per Case; Folded Flat and Packed in

538| CS

$0.00

No Bid

$18.50

$9,953.00

16

$15.90

$8,554.20

17

$18.68

$10,049.84

18

10029462; BAG, POLY 24" X 32"
WHITE 25% RECYCLED;
Liner,w/minimum 25% Recycled
Material, Refuse, Opaque, Star
Sealed, Bottom Gauge: .46 Mil, Size:
24 in x 32 in, Color: White, Container
Size: 12-16 Gal, 500 Per Case; Folded
Flat and Packed in Boxes

6000| CS

$0.00

No Bid

$12.90

$77,400.00

21

$15.30

$91,800.00

22

$14.08

$84,480.00

23




Bids Received: 7

ePolyStar
800-793-3088
118915

Unipak Corp.
888-808-5120
124103

Central Poly CorporationCENTRAL POLY CORP

908-862-7570
109312

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Item #

Description

|Qty |U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price Line Total

Mfg
Note

Bags, L|

near Low Density Polyethylene

6

10029461; BAG, POLY 37" X 50"
CLEAR 25% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/minimum 25% Recycled Material
Refuse, Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1.5 Mil, Size: 37 in x 50 in,
Color: Clear, Container Size: 44-48
Gal, 100 Per Case; Folded Flat and

liad in D

10036

Cs

$19.95

$200,218.20

25

$18.35 $184,160.60

16

$18.20

$182,655.20

27

$16.44 $164,991.84

28

~

10032243; BAG, POLY 2 MIL GAUGE
38" X 63" CLEAR; Liner, Refuse,
Transparent, Flat Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in,
Color: Clear, Container Size: 55-60
Gal, 100 Per Case; Folded Flat and
Packed in Boxes, Mfr: Dyna Pak

noocn C 1

11946

Cs

$31.87

$380,719.02

30

$31.90 $381,077.40

32

$27.40

$327,320.40

33

$27.75 $331,501.50

34

10029471; BAG, POLY 38" X 63"
CLEAR 25% RECYCLED; Liner
w/minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Liner, Refuse, Opaque, Flat Sealed,
Bottom Gauge: 2 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63
in, Color: Clear, Container Size: 55-60
Gal, 100 Per Case; Folded Flat and
Packed in Boxes, Mfr: Dyna Pak

6300

Cs

$33.35

$210,105.00

37

$31.90 $200,970.00

32

$28.30

$178,290.00

33

$27.75 $174,825.00

39

10032245; BAG, POLYETHYLENE
30X36 BLACK 20-30 GAL; Liner,
Refuse Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: .65 Mil, Size: 30 in x 36 in,
Color: Black, Container Size: 20-30
Gal Wt., 250 Per Case @ 11.7 lbs.,

Coldad Clat and Daclead in D

430

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$16.10

$6,923.00

41

$12.97 $5,577.10

42

10

10031734; BAG, POLY 30" X 36",
BLACK 25% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge: 1 Mil,
Color: Black, Size: 30 in. x 36 in.,
Container Size: 20-30 Gal, 250 Per

2400

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$18.00 $43,200.00

45

$16.80

$40,320.00

46

$17.10 $41,040.00

47

11

o

10032001; POLYETHYLENE, BAG
LINER, 6MIL, 38"X63"; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
6 Mil, Size: 38 in x 63 in, Color: Black,
Container Size: 55-60 Gal, 50 Per
Case @ 47 Ibs.; Folded Flat and
Packed in Boxes, Mfr. Dyna Pak

Nnoacn - 1

235

CS

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid

$40.80

$9,588.00

50

$46.00 $10,810.00

51




Bids Received: 7

ePolyStar
800-793-3088
118915

Unipak Corp.

888-808-5120

124103

Central Poly CorporationCENTRAL POLY CORP

908-862-7570
109312

DYNA PAK CORP
931 762 4016

Item #

Description

|Qty |U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price Line Total

Mfg
Note

Bags, L|

near Low Density Polyethylene

12

10031979; POLYETHYLENE, BAG
LINER, .65MIL, 30"X36"; Liner,
w/Minimum 25% Recycled Material,
Refuse, Opaque, Star Sealed Bottom,
Gauge: .65 Mil, Size 30 in x 36 in,
Color: Black, Container Size: 20-30
Gal, Wt. 250 Per Case @ 11.7 lbs,

Coaldad Clas A Deoaliad in D

600

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$16.80

$10,080.00

54

$11.34 $6,804.00

42

13

10031383; BAG, POLY 3 MIL GAUGE
38" X 63" BLACK; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Bottom Guage: 3 Mil, Size:
38 in x 63 in, Color: Black, 50 Per
Case Enld Flat and Packed in Raxes

4243

Cs

$22.25

$94,406.75

56

$17.95

$76,161.85

58

$18.90

$80,192.70

59

$19.82 $84,096.26

60

14

10005083; BAG, POLYETHYLENE LOW
DENSITY 40" X 46"; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Flat Sealed, Bottom Guage:
2.0 Mil, Size: 40 in. x 46 in., Color:
Black, 40-45 Gal., 100 Per Case,
Folded Flat and Packed in Boxes, Mfg.

Dradiict Daf -

4600

Cs

$22.78

$104,788.00

62

$19.13

$87,998.00

64

$18.20

$83,720.00

65

$19.90 $91,540.00

66

15

10046877; BAG, POLY 8-10 GAL 24" X
23" BLACK,1M/CS; Liner, Refuse,
Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom Gauge:
.36 Mil, Size: 24 in x 23 in , Container
Size: 8-10 Gal., Color: Black, 500 Per
Case; Folded Flat and Packed in
Boxes, Mfr.: Heritage D4823RD or

1800

Cs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$11.20

$20,160.00

69

$10.20 $18,360.00

70

16

10002449; BAG, POLY LOW DENSITY
43" X 47" BLACK; Litter bags,
Opaque, Star sealed, bottom gauge:
1 16 mil Cont size 56 aal 100/cs

3088

Cs

$15.33

$47,339.04

72

$12.25

$37,828.00

74

$13.40

$41,379.20

75

$14.10 $43,540.80

76

17

10033037;
BAG,TRANSPARENT,STARSEALED, .46
MIL24"X33"; Transparent, star sealed,
bottom gauge, cont. size: 12-16, 12
Ibs. static load: dry wt.. 15 Ibs.,
folded flat and packed in boxes;
minimum 25% recycled material.

cont

368

CS

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$14.08 $5,181.44

79

18

10039125; BAG, COMPOSTABLE, 42"
X 48"55 GAL | MIL; Degradable, clear
or opaque, clear, 100% certified
biodegradable and compostable, cont.
size 55 gal., water resistant, 100/cs.
Nat ur-Tec 55 Gallon. or equal

120

CS

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00 No Bid




Bids Received: 7

ePolyStar

800-793-3088

118915

Unipak Corp.
888-808-5120
124103

Central Poly CorporationCENTRAL POLY CORP

908-862-7570

109312

DYNA PAK CORP

931 762 4016

Item #

Description

|Qty |U/M

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Unit Price

Line Total

Mfg
Note

Bags, L|

near Low Density Polyethylene

19

10040460; BAG, POLY 3 MIL GAUGE
33X39 IN., BLACK; Opaque, flat
sealed, bottom gauge, w/minimum
10% recycled material, cont. size: 32

gal. folded flat and packed in boxes,
100 /cc

4138

Cs

$23.58

$97,574.04

84

$20.10

$83,173.80

86

$19.20

$79,449.60

87

$19.90

$82,346.20

88

20

10045500; BAG, COMPOSTABLE, 33"
X 39" 33 GAL 1 MIL; Clear or opaque,
clear, 100% certified biodegradable,
compostable, water resistant, cont.
size: 33 gal, 150/cs.

80

CSs

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

2

[

10051074; BAG, 6 MIL, 38" X 63",
BLACK, 25 BAGS/BX; Bag 38&€ x
634a€, Color: Black, 6 Mil. Refuse, flat
sealed, container size, 55-60 Gal, 25

hans

224

ROL

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$39.20

$8,780.80

50

$23.00

$5,152.00

92

22

10029455; BAG, POLY 37" X 50"
BLACK 25% RECYCLED; Liner,
w/minimum 25% Recycled Material
Refuse, Opaque, Star Sealed, Bottom
Gauge: 1.5 Mil, Size: 37 in x 50 in,
Color: Black, Container Size: 44-48
Gal, 100 Per Case; Folded Flat and

liad in D

2000

Cs

$17.60

$35,200.00

93

$14.45

$28,900.00

95

$0.00

No Bid

$16.65

$33,300.00

18

23

10039181; BAG, POLYETHYLENE,
CLEAR, 3 MIL THICKNES; Bag,
Polyethylene, Clear, 3 MIL
Thicknesses, 38 In X 34 In X 78 In,
100/Roll and Bag, Polyethylene, Clear,
3 MIL Thicknesses, 38 In X 34 In X 78

100/Dall

10

ROL

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

$0.00

No Bid

Sub-Total:

$1,170,350.05

$1,229,680.65

$1,232,354.10

$1,270,156.38

Grand Total:

$1,170,350.05

$1,229,680.65

$1,232,354.10

$1,270,156.38




