City of Houston

Bid Tabulation

for
Fittings and Appurtenances
for
Public Works
525438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 3 CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
281-859-5044 832-570-2892 713-672-1472
109653 117389 109376
Percent Percent Percent
item # Description Qty _{U/M | Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price {Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total
Group 1: Smith-Biair, Inc. Clamp and Coupling Products, Water and Industrial Price List dated April 2, 2012 or the latest edition, or approved equal for any quantity as needed.
Page number for referenced item shouid be listed and item undertined or highlighted in the price list furnished with bid. Sample items are for evaluation purposes only. Total
Estimated Expenditures are $4,091,191.90
1|Clamp, pipe, d/b 8 x 10, Range 8.99- 1t EA $309.81|] -58.5 $128.57 $309.81 -57 $133.22 $309.81 -42 $179.69
9.79 Smith Blair #227-00090510-
000, or egual
2|{Clamp, pipe, d/b 8 x 15, Range B.99- 1] EA $479.20| -58.5 $198.87 $479.20 -57 $206.06 $479.20 -42 $277.94
9.79 Smith Blair #227-00090515-
000, or equal
3|Coupling, Repair, Transition, 83€ 1} EA $549.16| -58.5 $227.90 $549.16 -57 $236.14 $549.16 -42 $318.51
Smith Blair #462-08540985-000, or
eoual
4{Coupling, Repair Transition, 65€ 1| EA $396.50] -58.5 $164.55 $396.50 -57 $170.50 $396.50 -42 $229.97
Smith Blair #462-06540765-000, or
equal
5|Clamp, Pipe repair, d/b 6.0 x 7.5 1] EA $216.85| -58.5 $89.99 $216.85 -57 $93.25 $216.85 -42 $125.77
range 6.84 Smith Blair, #227-
QQ069007-000. or eqyal
6[Saddle. Tapping. 8 x A%A€ cctap, 1| EA $95.14] -58.5 $39.48 $95.14 -57 $40.91 $95.14 -42 $55.18
Rng, 8.54-10.10 Smith Biair #315-
00101007-000. or equal
71Joint, bell, 858€ range, 9.05-9.30 1| EA $398.87| -58.5 $165.53 $398.87 -57 $171.51 $398.87 -42 $231.34
clamps Smith Blair #274-00000905-
Q00, or egual
Sub-Total: $1,014.90 $1,051.58 $1,418.40
Group 1I, Fittings and Appurtenances
1{10001693; FLANGE, PIPE BRASS 2 IN] 2275 A $23.00 0 $52,325.00 $29.50 0 $67,112.50 $21.75 [¢] $49,481.25
WATER METER; Flange, Pipe brass, 2"
Water Meter, Cambridge Part
#5030390NL; or approved equal
2|10001692; FLANGE, PIPE BRASS 1- 738 EA $22.50 0 $16,605.00 $25.10 o] $18,523.80 $21.70 ] $16,014.60
1/2 IN WATER METER; Flange, Pipe
Brass, 1-1/2 Water Meter, Cambridge
Part #5030295NL; or approved equal
3]10001267; VALVE, GATE BRONZE 1- | 965]| EA $31.70 0 $30,590.50 $33.76 ¢] $32,578.40 $33.75 0 $32,568.75
1/2"; Valve, gate, bronze, 1-1/2,
Matco-Norca #503TO7LF; or
annroved aniial
Verified by: Laura A. Guthrie

08/26/2015




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
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for
Public Works

$25438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM

Bids Received: 3

CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA
281-859-5044
109653

Ferguson Waterworks
832-570-2892

117389

HD Supply Waterworks
713-672-1472

109376
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Qty

U/M

Percent

Unit Price | Change Line Total
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Change
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Change

Line Total

F

10002912; VALVE, GATE NRS FLG
END 4" HANDWHEEL; valve, gate,
NRS FLG END, 4 handwheel,
American Flow Control #2504FF FLG
RWGVOLHW; or approved equal
UPDATED CITY OF HOUSTON

REDLLIEATT S S § £ ey

200

EA

$262.00 0 $52,400.00

$339.30

0

$67,860.00

$347.00

0

$69,400.00

U1

10002916; VALVE, GATE, 12" MJ,

OPEN RIGHT; Valve, gate, 12 MJ

Open Right, American Flow Control
2812 M1 ar anoroverienual

34

EA

$1,062.00 0 $36,108.00

$1,337.22

$45,465.48

$1,395.00

$47,430.00

10002910; VALVE, GATE, 6" M],
OPEN RIGHT; Valve, gate, 6 MJ, Open
Right, American Flow Control, #2506-
MM; or approved equal

228

EA

$338.00 0 $77,064.00

$425.98

$97,123.44

$456.50

$104,082.00

10002911; VALVE, GATE, 8" MJ,
OPEN RIGHT; Valve, gate, 8 MJ, Open
Right, American flow Control #2508
M or anrroved eoual

143

EA

$538.00 0 $76,934.00

$677.92

$96,942.56

$714.00

$102,102.00

10001268; VALVE, GATE, BRONZE,
2"; Valve, gate, bronze, 2 Matco~
Norca, #503TOBLF; or approved
eral

3235

EA

$50.20 0 $162,397.00

$51.17

$165,534.95

$53.50

$173,072.50

10019462; VALVE, GATE, MJ, 2"
W/ACCESSORY; Valve, gate, M), 2
w/accessory, American Flow Control
#2502 MJ1; or approved equal

92

EA

$187.00 0 $17,204.00

$233.10

$21,445.20

$240.91

$22,163.72

10

10019463; VALVE, GATE, 4" MJ,
OPEN RIGHT; Valve, gate 4" MJ x MJ
NRS Operating Nut, no hand wheel,
onen rant

30

EA

$265.00 0 $7,950.00

$333.64

$10,009.20

$439.00

$13,170.00

11

10002908; VALVE, GATE, OS&Y, 6"
FLG/FLG, HANDWHEEL, Valve, gate
OS8Y, 68€ FLG/FLG, Handwheel,
American Flow Control, 2506-FF-
OS&Y,; or approved equal

606

EA

$468.00 0 $283,608.00

$441.94

$267,815.64

$586.00

$355,116.00

Verified by: Laura A, Guthrie
08/26/2015




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Fittings and Appurtenances
for
Public Works
525438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 3 CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
281-859-5044 832-570-2892 713-672-1472
109653 117389 109376
Percent Percent Percent
Item # Description Qty 1U/M| Unit Price {Change Line Total Unit Price {Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total
12110002841, GLAND, PACK 7101 EA $15.12 0 $10,735.20 $15.64 0 $11,104.40 $14.40 0 $10,224.00
MECHANICAL 8" F/ 8 X 12"; Gland,
Pack Mechanical, 8&€ for 8x128€, MJ
#GPOS8; or approved equal
13110002783; SLEEVE, 12X12', IRON 4441 EA $120.96 0 $53,706.24 $122.40 Q $54,345.60 $115.20 0 $51,148.80

MECHANICAL JOINT 8S; Sleeve,
12x128€™, iron, Tyler Union Pipe
AOR1982: ar anoroved eoual

14110001702; VALVE, BALL PVC 27, 195) EA $36.20 0 $7,059.00 $46.48 0 $9,063.60 $68.98 0 $13,451.10
S/FNPT X S/FNPT; Valve, ball PVC 2

sch, 80O SOC thread, Hayward
ATRI2006r: ar annrnwed enual
15110002915; VALVE, TAPPING, 8" 38| EA $556.00 0 $21,128.00 $674.13 0 $25,616.94 $540.00 0 $20,520.00

MI/FLG, OPEN RIGHT, valve,
Tapping, 8 MI/FLG, open right,
American Flow Control, #2508
MIXFLGTAPVLVDR; or approved equal
UPDATED FOR FULL SIZE CUTTER
AND DOES NOT NEED THE LIP

16{10002583; FITTING, PIPE 24", 16GA | 880] FT $21.50 0 $18,920.00 $23.73 0 $20,882.40 $20.37 4] $17,925.60

GCMP; Fitting, Pipe, 244€ 16 ga.,
GOMP Band/gasket 28€ Contech CPI
LSHC, 2-2/3" X 1/2" GMP Contech
Construction Products Inc., lock-seam
HEL-COR #2-2/38€x1/24€; or
approved equal

17110002584; FITTING, PIPE, 30", 16GA | 180| FT $27.00 0 $4,860.00 $29.92 0 $5,385.60 $25.95 4] $4,671.00
GCMP; Fitting, Pipe, 304€, 16GA
GUMP, Contech Construction Products
Inc. #2-2/3&C; or approved equal

18110030404; RESTRAINER KIT, EBAA 791 KIT $43.92 0 $3,469.68 $45.46 0 $3,591.34 $69.98 0 $5,528.42

8" MEGALUG; Restrainer Kit, EBAA
BAC MEGALUG, Tyler Series #20085V
w/accessories Tufgrip 88€; or
anncoaaerl eolsl

Veri by: Laura A. Guthrie
08/26/2015



City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Fittings and Appurtenances
for
Public Works
525438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 3 CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
281-859-5044 832-570-2892 713-672-1472
109653 117389 109376
Percent Percent Percent
Item # Description Qty 1U/M | Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total
19110002914; VALVE, TAPPING, 6" 20} EA $363.00 0 $7,260.00 $437.19 0 $8,743.80 $369.00 0 $7,380.00
MI/FLG, OPEN RIGHT; Valve,
Tapping, MJ 6w/access. American
Flow #2506 MTXFLGTAPVLVD12: or
approved equal UPDATED FOR FULL
SIZE CUTTER DOES NOT REQUIRE
110
20110019242; ELBOW, CAST 219] EA $50.82 0 $11,129.58 $51.44 0 $11,265.36 $48.40 0 $10,599.60

IRON/DUCTILE 6 IN. 90 DEGREE;
Elbow, Cast Iron/ Ductile, 64€ 90
degree, Tyler Union Pipe #121695; or
annroaserleriial
21110033442; PLUG, 12, F/CAST 22| EA $69.72 0 $1,533.84 $71.38 0 $1,570.36 $66.40 0 $1,460.80
IRON/DUCTILE IRON PIPE; Plug,
128€, F/cast iron/ ductile iron pipe,
Tyler Union #248200; or approved
eryial
22110033439; TEE, 8" X 8", F/CAST 149] EA $110.46 0 $16,458.54 $110.46 0 $16,458.54 $105.20 0 $15,674.80
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 886€x84€, F/
cast iron/ ductile, Tyler Union
074328 or annroved eaual
23110052543; VALVE, 17, 2-WAY/2-POS, 25] EA $205.00 Q $5,125.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $192.31 0 $4,807.75
N/C; valve, 17, 2-way/2-position
NORMALLY CL, ASCO Red Hat
#8210G004, or approved egual

24/10052537; VALVE, 1", 2-WAY/2-POS, 25| EA $325.00 0 $8,125.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $369.23 0 $9,230.75
N/C, MAN OP; Valve, 1", w/manual

operator, 2-Way/2, ASCO Red Hat
#812106G004MO, or approved equal

25110052606; VALVE, 374", 2-WAY/2- 38] EA $130.00 0 $4,940.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $118.68 4] $4,509.84

POS, N/C; Valve, 3/4°, 2-way/2-
position, normally, ASCO Red Hat
AB2100G085. or annraved enua
26110052538; VALVE, 374", 2-WAY/ 2~ 38 EA $235.00 0 $8,930.00 $0.00 0 No Bid $217.58 0 $8,268.04

POS, N/C, MAN OP; valve, 3/4",
wimanual operator, 2-way, ASCO
Red Hat #8210G0009MO, or

annroaded val

Verified by: Laura A, Guthrie
08/26/2015



City of Houston
Bid Tabulation
for
Fittings and Appurtenances
for
Public Works
$25438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 3 CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
281-859-5044 832-570-2892 713-672-1472
109653 117389 109376
Percent Percent Percent
Item # Description Qty 1U/M | Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total
27[10002780; SLEEVE, 2 IN., IRON 80! EA $31.92 0 $2,553.60 $32.68 0 $2,614.40 $30.40 0 $2,432.00
MECHANICAL JOINT SS; Sleeve, 29,
Iron Mechanical Joint $§, Tyler Union,
#068730, or approved equal

28110002585; FITTING, PIPE 18" GCMP 4! EA $34.00 0 $136.00 $55.20 0 $220.80 $32.21 0 $128.84
BAND/GASKET 2"; Fitting, Pipe, 18"
GCMP Band/Gasket, 2" w/CPI LSHC 2|

2/3" X 1/2" CMP, Contech
Construction Products, lock-seam
Contech Hel-COR-2-2/1, or approved

£ i
29110002582; FITTING, PIPE 18", 16GA 1751 FT $17.00 0 $2,975.00 $18.40 0 $3,220.00 $16.11 0
GOMP; Fitting, Pipe, 18", 16GA,
GUMP, Contech CPI LSHC, 2-2/3" x
1/2", CMP, Contech Construction
Products, Inc. lock-seam Contech Hel-
COR 2-2/3; or approved equal

$2,819.25

30110002586, FITTING, PIPE 24" GCMP 22] EA $43.00 0 $946.00 $71.19 0 $1,566.18 $40.74 0 $896.28
BAND/GASKET, 2"; Fitting, Pipe, 24"
GOMP, Band/gasket, 2" w/CPI LSHC 2
273" x 172" CMP, Contech
Construction Products, Inc. lock-
seam, Hel-COR-2-2/3, or approved

3

g

3 i
10002587; FITTING, PIPE 30" GCMP 6] EA $54.00 0 $324.00 $89.75 0 $538.50 $51.89 0
BAND/GASKET 2"; Fitting, Pipe, 30",
GCMP Band/Gasket 2" w/CPI LSHC 2-
2/3 % 172", CMP, Contech
Construction Products, Inc. lock seam
Hel-COR 2-2/3, or approved equal

$311.34

32110030407; RESTRAINER KIT, EBAA 551 KIT $80.26 0 £4,414.30 $82.32 0 $4,527.60 $101.43 0
12" MEGALUG; Restrainer Kit, EBAA
12" MEGALUG, 2012 PEC

wiarressories, ar annrmved eonual

$5,578.65

Verified by: Laura A, Guthrie
08/26/201%
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33

10030408; RESTRAINER KIT, EBAA
12" MEGALUG SPLIT; Restrainer Kit,
EBAA, 12" MEGALUG SPLIT, 20128V,
or approved equal

26

KIT

$120.39 0 $3,130.14

$123.42

0

$3,208.92

$167.33

]

$4,350.58

34

10030405, RESTRAINER KIT, EBAA
6" MEGALUG; Restrainer Kit, EBAA 6"
MEGALUG, 2006PEC w/accessories;

orannroved eoual

46

KIT

$32.56 0 $1,497.76

$33.39

$1,535.94

$41.41

$1,904.86

35

10030403; RESTRAINER KIT, EBAA
6" MEGALUG SPLIT; Restrainer kit,
EBAA, 6" MEGALUG SPLIT, 20065V
w/accessories; or approved equal

43

KIT

$48.84 0 $2,100.12

$49.98

$2,149.14

$64.05

$2,754.15

36

10030406; RESTRAINER KIT, EBAA
8" MEGALUG SPLIT; Restrainer Kit,
EBAA 8", MEGALUG SPLIT, 20085V
w/accessories; or approved equat

54

KIT

$65.88 0 $3,557.52

$67.48

$3,643.92

$69.98

$3,778.92

37

10019243; ELBOW, 8 IN 90 DEG
TYLER PIPE NO 072249; Elbow, 8" 90
degree, Tyler Union #072249; or
annroved enua

13

EA

$73.92 0 $960.96

$77.44

$1,006.72

$70.40

$915.20

38

10002784, ELBOW, CAST
IRON/DUCTILE 4%, 90 DEGREE;
Elbow, cast iron/ductile, 47, 90
degree, Tyler Union #121695; or

anpcrseert soal

19

EA

$31.08 0 $590.52

$32.56

$618.64

$29.60

$562.40

39

10002785; ELBOW, CAST
IRON/DUCTILE 8", 45 DEGREE;
Eibow, cast iron/ductile, 8", 45
degree, Tyler Union #072881; or

nnreased eouial

19

EA

$60.06 0 $1,141.14

$61.49

$1,168.31

$57.20

$1,086.80

40

10033488;

ELBOW,12",45DEG, F/CAST
IRON/DUCTILE PIPE; Elbow, cast
iron/ductile, 127, 45 degree, Tyler
Union MJ C153 N20-0510 099956; or

annresiacl sl

16

EA

$131.04 0 $2,096.64

$134.16

$2,146.56

$124.80

$1,996.80

Verified by: Laura A, Guthrie
08/26/2015




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Fittings and Appurtenances
for
Public Works
525438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 3 CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
281-859-5044 832-570-2892 713-672-1472
109653 117389 109376
Percent Percent Percent
Item # Description Qty 1U/M | Unit Price |Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total
41110033483; ELBOW, 127,90 DEG 20| EA $158.34 0 $3,166.80 $162.11 Q $3,242.20 $150.80 0 $3,016.00
F/CASTIRON/DUCTILE PIPE; Elbow,
cast ironfductile, 12", 90 degree, All
Flange, M), #21L129M; or approved
equal UPDATED Item is MJ
42110033733; PLUG, 12" X 2", TAPPED; 14] EA $81.90 0 $1,146.60 $84.83 0 $1,187.62 $78.00 Q $1,092.00
Plug, 12° x 27, tapped, Tyler Union
#248293; or approved equal
43110033725, PLUG, 4" X 27, TAPPED; 15] EA $26.04 0 $390.60 $27.28 0 $409.20 $24.80 0 $372.00
Plug, 4" x 27, tapped, Tyler Union
#248361; or approved equal
44110033726; PLUG, 6" X 2", TAPPED; 26| EA $39.06 0 $1,015.56 $39.99 0 $1,039.74 $37.20 0 $967.20
Plug, 6" x 2", tapped, Tyler Union
#248415; or approved equal
45110033443; PLUG, 6", F/CAST 611 EA $26.88 0 $1,639.68 $27.52 ¢] $1,678.72 $24.25 0 $1,479.25
IRON/DUCTILE IRON PIPE; Plug, 6",
F/cast iron/ductile iron pipe, Tyler
Union #24832; or approved equal
46110033732; PLUG, 8" X 2", TAPPED, 291 EA $52.50 0 $1,522.50 $53.75 0 $1,558.75 $50.00 0 $1,450.00
W/BOSS; Plug, 8" x 127, tapped,
w/buoss, Tyler Union #248453; or
annroved eoual
47110019312; PLUG, CAST IRON, 8"; 521 EA $40.32 0 $2,096.64 $41.28 0 $2,146.56 $36.38 0 $1,891.76
Plug, cast iron, 8", Tyler Union
248248 or moproved eaual
48110033435; TEE, 12" X 12", F/CAST 10] EA $220.50 0 $2,205.00 $225.75 o] $2,257.50 $210.00 0 $2,100.00
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 12" x 12,
F/cast iron/ductile, Tyler Union
#A07450: op annroved eaial
49110033438; TEE, 12" X 4", F/CAST 9l EA $149.10 ¢l $1,341.90 $152.65 0 $1,373.85 $142.00 0 $1,278.00
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 12" x 4", F/cast
ironfductile, Tyler Union #074465; or
annroved soial

Verified by: Laura A. Guthrie
08/26/2015




City of Houston
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50

10002788; TEE, 12" X 6", F/CAST
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 12" x 6", F/cast
iron/ductite, Tyler Union #074489; or
annroverd enual

16

EA

$149.10 0 $2,385.60

$152.65 0 $2,442.40

$142.00 0 $2,272.00

10033437; TEE, 12" X 8", F/CAST
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 12" x 8", F/cast
iron/ductile, Tyler Union #074502; or
annroved enual

23

EA

$172.20

[

$3,960.60

$176.30 0 $4,054.90

$164.00 0 $3,772.00

52

10048199; TEE, 6" X 4", F/CAST
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 6" x 4", cast
iron, Tyler Unlon #074229; or
annroved equal

10

EA

$68.46 0 $684.60

$71.72 0 $717.20

$65.20 0 $652.00

10048198; TEE, 8" X 4", F/CAST
IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 8" x 4", F/cast
iron/ductile, Tyler Union #074281; or
annraved eaual

14

EA

$79.38 0 $1,111.32

$83.16 0 $1,164.24

$75.60 0 $1,058.40

54

10002786; TEE, 8" X 6", F/CAST

IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, 8" x 6°, F/cast

ironfductile, Tyler Union #074304; or
noroved sogal

30

EA

$91.56 0 $2,746.80

$93.74 0 $2,812.20

$87.20 0 $2,616.00

55

10019339; TTEE, 6 IN. X 6 IN.,
F/CAST IRON/DUCTILE; Tee, F/cast
iron/ductile pipe, 6"x6", Tyler Union
#074243 or approved equal

EA

$73.50 0 $588.00

$77.00 0 $616.00

$70.00 Q $560.00

56

10033482; REDUCER, 12" X 6%;
Reducer, 12°x6", #21112R06M; or
anproved equal

11

EA

$73.08 0 $803.88

$76.56 0 $842.16

$69.60 0 $765.60

57

10033496; REDUCER, 12" X 8";
Reducer, 12" x 8", Tyler Union
#7787 or soproved eaual

13

EA

$75.18 0 $977.34

$76.97 0 $1,000.61

$71.60 0 $930.80

58

10033495; REDUCER, 6" X 4™;
Reducer, 6" x 4", Tyler Union
#Q077626. or approved equal

20

EA

$29.40 0 $588.00

$30.80 0 $616.00

$28.00 0 $560.00

59

10033500; REDUCER, 8" X 4™,
Reducer, 8" x 4", Tyler Union
077640: or approved eaual

&0

20

EA

$40.32 0 $806.40

$42.24 4] $844.80

$38.40 0 $768.00

10033499; REDUCER, 8" X §";
Reducer, 8" x 6", Tyler Union

077664: or approved equal

15

EA

$42.84 0 $642.60

$44.88 0 $673.20

$40.80 0 $612.00

Verified by: Laura A. Guthrie
08/26/2015




City of Houston
Bid Tabulation

for
Fittings and Appurtenances
for
Public Works
$25438 - Close Date: 8/20/2015 10:30:00 AM
Bids Received: 3 CPR Services and Supplies, Inc. DBA Ferguson Waterworks HD Supply Waterworks
281-859-5044 832-570-2892 713-672-1472
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Percent Percent Percent
Item # Description Qty U/M1| Unit Price |Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total Unit Price | Change Line Total
61110001606; REDUCER, BELL 39| EA $3.00 0 $117.00 $3.19 0 $124.41 $3.53 0 $137.67

GALVANIZED 1-1/2" X 1"; Reducer,

bell, galvanized, 1-1/2" x 1",

GLL2 40P or annroved eaual

62110002839; GLAND, PACK 815| EA $9.00 0 $7,335.00 $8.66 0 $7,057.90 $6.40 0 $5,216.00
MECHANICAL 27, F/ 2" X 8"; Gland,

pack mechanical joint, 27, /2" x 8",

#21IAMMIRO2; or approved equal

63110005271; GLAND, PACK 4321 EA $9.66 0 $4,173.12 $9.66 0 $4,173.12 $9.20 0 $3,974.40
MECHANICAL 4" F/ 4 X 12"; Gland,

pack, mechanical joint, 4 f/4" x 127,
gskt, gland, nuts & bolts,
#FDIMIAPS04; or approved equal

64[10002840; GLAND, PACK 665| EA $13.44 0 $8,937.60 $13.44 0 $8,937.60 $12.80 0 $8,512.00
MECHANICAL 6" F/ 6X12"; Gland,

pack, mechanical Jjoint, 6" /6" x 127,
gskt, gland, nuts & bolts,
EDIMIARSOA . ne anneoverl oouial

65110002847; GLAND, RETAINER 127, 465] EA $22.68 0 $10,546.20 $22.68 0 $10,546.20 $21.60 0 $10,044.00

FOR 12" X 12"; Gland, retainer 127,
/12" x 12" mechanical joint, solid
sleeve, Tyler Pipe #085201; or
anneoved eoial

66/10019418; SLEEVE, 4 X 12" IRON 96| EA $27.30 0 $2,620.80 $27.95 0 $2,683.20 $26.00 0 $2,496.00
MECHANICAL JOINT 8S; Sleeve, 4 x

12" iron, mechanical joint 85, Tyler
Union #081944; or approved equal

67110002913; VALVE, MJ, TAPPING 4"; 10} EA $281.00 ¢] $2,810.00 $327.21 0 $3,272.10 $277.00 0 $2,770.00
Valve, tapping, M1, 4", American Flow
Controt 2504 MJ TAP VLV OR
wjaccessories; or approved equal
UPDATED "DOES NOT NEED LIP®

Sub-Total: $1,089,349.42 $1,154,077.12 $1,260,880.47
Grand Total: $1,090,364.32 $1,155,128.70 $1,262,298.87

erified by: Laura A. Guthrie
08/26/2015



